THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2014
(As passed by the Assembly)

A
BILL

to give effect to certain financial proposals of the Government of Kerala for the
Financial Year 2014-2015.

Preamble.—WHeRrEeas, it is expedient to give effect to certain financial
proposals of the Government of Kerala for the Financial Year 2014-2015;

Be it enacted in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2014.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(i) sub-section (10) of section 10, sub-clause (iv) of clause (a) and
sub-clause (ix) of clause (c) of sub-section (17) of section 10 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2005;

(ii) clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 7 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2007;

(iii) sub-clause (iv) of clause (c) of sub-section (17) of section 10
shall be deemed to have come into force on the 13th day of November, 2009;

(iv) clause (e) of sub-section (5) of section 10 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2013;

(v) sub-section (2) of section 5 and sub-clause (x) of clause (c) of
sub-section (17) of section 10 shall be deemed to have come into force on the
1st day of January, 2014;

(vi) sections 2 to 4, sub-sections (1), (3) and (4) of section 5,
section 6, clause (a) of sub-section (1) and sub-sections (2) to (7) of section 7,
sections 8, 9, sub-sections (1) to (4), clauses (a) to (d) of sub-section (5),
sub-sections (6) to (9), sub-sections (11) to (16), sub-clauses (i) to (iii), (v) and
(vi) of clause (a), sub-clause (i) to (iii) of clause (b), sub-clauses (i) to (iii)
and (v) to (viii) of clause (c) and clause (d) of sub-section (17) of section 10 and
section 11 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of
April, 2014;

(vii) the remaining provisions of this Act shall come into force at
once.

KNPP. 1062/2014.



2

2. Amendment of Act XII of 1955.—In the Travancore-Cochin Literary,
Scientific and Charitable Societies Registration Act, 1955 (XII of 1955),—

(1) in section 6, in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty rupees for
every day during which the non-compliance continues”, the words “ten rupees
for every day during which the non-compliance continues, subject to a maximum
of fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(2) in section 7, in sub-section (5), for the words “not exceeding one
thousand rupees”, the words “of twenty rupees for every day during which the
default continues, subject to a maximum of two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted;

(3) in section 12, in sub-section (2), for the words “not exceeding one
thousand rupees”, the words “of twenty rupees for every day during which the
default continues, subject to a maximum of two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted;

(4) in section 13, in sub-section (5), for the words “not exceeding one
thousand rupees”, the words “of twenty rupees for every day during which the
non-compliance continues, subject to a maximum of two hundred rupees” shall
be substituted;

(5) in section 15, in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred rupees
for every day during which the default continues”, the words “twenty rupees for
every day during which the default continues, subject to a maximum of two
hundred rupees” shall be substituted,;

(6) in section 22, in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred rupees
for every day during which the default continues”, the words “twenty rupees for
every day during which the default continues, subject to a maximum of
two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Act 17 of 1959.—In the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959
(17 of 1959),—

(1) in section 28A,—

(a) after sub-section (1), the following sub-sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1A) Subject to such rules as may be prescribed, the fair value of
land fixed under sub-section (1) may be revised by the Revenue Divisional
Officer every five years or earlier if so directed by the Government, if in the
opinion of the Government any substantial change of the fair value of land has
taken place.



3

(1B) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or the Rules
made thereunder, the Government may, by notification published in the Official
Gazette, make an increase of a fixed percentage in the fair value of land fixed as
per sub-section (1), from time to time, before revision is made under
sub-section (1A) and the value so increased shall be deemed to be the fair
value of the land.”;

(b) in sub-section (3), after the words, brackets and figure “under
sub-section (1)”, the words, brackets, figure and letter “and the revised fair value
of land fixed under sub-section (1A)” shall be inserted,;

(c) in sub-section (4), after the words, brackets and figure “under
sub-section (1)”, the words, brackets, figure and letter “or the revision of
fair value under sub-section (1A)” shall be inserted;

(2) in the ScHEDULE,—

(a) in serial number 5, the clause (d) shall be renumbered as
clause (g) and before clause (g) as so renumbered, the following clauses
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(d) if relating to monthly deposit scheme (MDS) One hundred rupees in
similar to that of chitties, of whatever name respect of each depositor.
called, between a co-operative Bank/Society
and a depositor

(e) if relating to installation of ATM machine, Two thousand and five
between a bank and the land owner or hundred rupees per
renewal thereof year.

(H  if relating to installation of Mobile Tower, Five thousand rupees
between a company and the land owner or per year.”;
renewal thereof

(b) for serial number 10, and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be substituted,
namely:—

“10. Articles of Association of a Company,—

(@) if relating to companies having authorised capital Two thousand
up to Rs. 10 lakhs rupees.



4

(b) if relating to companies having authorised capital ~Five thousand

above Rs. 10 lakhs and up to Rs. 25 lakhs rupees.
(c) if relating to companies having authorised capital 0.5 per cent of
above Rs. 25 lakhs the paid up
capital.”;

(c) in serial number 19, in the entry in column (3), for the words
“Twenty five rupees”, the words “Fifty rupees” shall be substituted,;

(d) in serial number 21, in clause (i), in the entry in column (3), for the
words “Five rupees”, the words “Six rupees” shall be substituted;

(e) in serial number 22, in clause (Il), in the entries in column (3), for
the words “Seven rupees”, the words “Six rupees” shall be substituted;

(f) after serial number 36 and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted,
namely:—

“36A. Memorandum of association and rules and Fjye hundred
regulations of a charitable society under the rupees.”;
Travancore-Cochin Literary, Scientific and Charitable '
Societies Registration Act, 1955 (Act XII of 1955) or
under the Societies Registration Act, 1860 (Central
Act 21 of 1860)

(g) in serial number 37,—

(i) after clause (c) and the entries against it in columns (2) and (3),
the following clause and entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:—

“(d) When executed in favour of commercial 0.5 per cent for the
banks for securing loans amount secured subject
to a maximum of rupees
20,000.”;
(ii) the existing Exemption shall be numbered as 1, and after
Exemption 1, as so numbered, the following Exemption shall be inserted,
namely:—

2. Instruments executed for securing agricultural and educational
loans granted by commercial banks”.

4. Amendment of Act 17 of 1960.—In the Kerala Plantation Tax Act, 1960
(17 of 1960), in section 3, to sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that no plantation tax shall be charged on any person
cultivating coconut, arecanut or pepper and persons other than companies

coming under the Plantation Labour Act, 1951 (Central Act 19 of 1951).”.



5

5. Amendment of Act 15 of 1963.—In the Kerala General Sales Tax Act,
1963 (15 of 1963),—
(1) in section 7,—

(a) for the words, letters and brackets “clauses (a) or (b) of items (i)
and (ii) respectively, whichever is higher”, the words, letters and brackets “in
item (i) or (ii), as the case may be” shall be substituted;

(b) for item (i), the following item shall be substituted, namely:—

“(i) in respect of a bar attached hotel of and below two star, at
one hundred and sixty per cent of the purchase value of such liquor.”;

(c) in item (ii), after the words “hotel of three stars”, the words,
letters and brackets “as per clause (a) or (b) below, whichever is higher” shall
be inserted;

(d) the proviso shall be omitted,;
(2) in section 23B,—

(a) in sub-section (3), for the words and figures “31st December,
2013”, the words and figures “31st August, 2014”, shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words and figures “31st December,
2013”, the words and figures “31st December, 2014”, shall be substituted;

(3) in section 23BA,—

(a) the words “and Co-operative Societies” in the marginal heading
and the words “or co-operative society”, wherever they occur, shall be omitted;

(aa) for the words “public sector undertakings”, the words “public
sector undertakings excluding oil marketing companies wherever they occur”,
shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words and figures “before 30th
September, 20117, the words and figures “before 31st July, 2014” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words and figures “before 30th
September, 2011”7, the words and figures “31st December, 2014” shall be
substituted;

(d) the Note shall be omitted;



6

(4) in the ScHepuLg, in serial number “2. Foreign Liquor”, for item (ii)
and the entries against it, the following items and entries shall, respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

“(ii) other than Beer and Wine, for which purchase value 115
incurred is rupees 400 per case or more;

(iii) other Foreign Liquor, not covered under items (i) and
(i) above 105.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this Schedule,—

(i) “case” means, 48 bottles of 180 ml. each, or 24 bottles of 375 ml.
each, or 18 bottles of 500 ml. each or 12 bottles of 750 ml. each, or 9 bottles of
1000 ml. each or 6 bottles of 1500 ml. each;

(ii) “purchase value” means the value at which the Kerala State
Beverages (Manufacturing and Marketing) Corporation Limited purchases such
liquor from the suppliers and in case any liquor is not purchased by the Kerala
State Beverages (Manufacturing and Marketing) Corporation Limited, such value
as fixed by the Commissioner of Excise, for the purpose of levy of duties as per
the Abkari Act, 1077 (1 of 1077).”.

6. Amendment of Act 7 of 1975.—In the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975
(7 of 1975)—

(1) in section 3,—

(a) in clause (b) of sub-section (1), after the word “workshops”, the
words and symbols “or cattle/pig/poultry farms or poly houses” shall be
inserted,;

(b) the existing Explanation shall be numbered as “Explanation 1”
and after Explanation | as so numbered, the following Explanations shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Explanation Il.—For the purpose of this sub-section,—

(i) “cattle/pig/poultry farms” shall have the same meanings as assigned
to them in clauses (d), (m) and (n) respectively in rule 2 of the Kerala Panchayat
Raj (Licensing of Livestock farms) Rules, 2012, but shall not include the farms
exclusively used for the purpose of sale.

(ii) Cattle/pig/poultry farms shall have the minimum number of animals or
birds, as the case may be, as provided in sub-rule (1) of rule 3 of the said
Rules.

Explanation 111.— “poly house” means any building erected for cultivation
purposes under controlled climatic conditions.”;

(2) in section 5A, for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words
“four thousand rupees” shall be substituted,;



7

(3) in the ScHepuLk, for the existing TABLE except the Notes thereunder,
the following Table shall be substituted, namely:—

“TABLE

Rate of Building tax

Special Grade

Grama
_ Grama Panchayat  Panchayat/ Municipal
Plinth Area other than Special Town Corporation
Grade Grama Panchayat/ (Rupees)
Panchayat (Rupees) Municipal
Council
(Rupees)
@ @ ©) @
Residential Buildings:
Not exceeding 100 square
metres Nil Nil Nil
Above 100 square metres
but not exceeding 150
square metres 1500 2700 4050
Above 150 square metres
but not exceeding 200
square metres 3000 5400 8100
Above 200 square metres
but not exceeding 250
square metres 6000 10800 16200
Exceeding 250 square
metres 6000 plus 10800 plus 16200 plus
Rs.1200 for every  Rs. 2400 for every Rs. 3000 for
additional 10 square  additional 10 every
metres square metres  additional

10 square
metres




@ @ ) @
Other Buildings:

Not exceeding 50 square
metres Nil Nil Nil

Above 50 square metres
but not exceeding 75
square metres 1500 3000 6000

Above 75 square metres
but not exceeding 100
square metres 2250 4500 9000

Above 100 square metres
but not exceeding 150
square metres 4500 9000 18000

Above 150 square metres
but not exceeding 200
square metres 9000 18000 36000

Above 200 square metres
but not exceeding 250

square metres 18000 36000 54000
Exceeding 250 square metres 18000 plus 36000 plus 54000 plus
Rs. 1800 for Rs. 3600 for ~ Rs. 4500 for
every additional every additional every
10 square metres 10 square metres additional
10 square
metres.”.

7. Amendment of Act 19 of 1976.—In the Kerala Motor Vehicles Taxation
Act, 1976 (19 of 1976),—

(1) in section 2,—

(a) the existing clause (aa) shall be renumbered as clause (ab) and
before clause (ab) as so renumbered, the following clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(aa) “e-payment” means remittance of tax using e-payment
gateway by transfer of the amount to the account of Motor Vehicles Department
from the account of a registered owner or any other person in any Bank or by
using Credit/Debit Cards.”;



9

(b) for clause (e) the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(e) “purchase value” means the value of the vehicle as shown in the
purchase invoice and includes value added tax, cess and customs/excise duty
chargeable on vehicles:

Provided that the discount or rebate given by the dealer to the registered
owner shall not be deducted from the bill amount for computing the purchase
value:

Provided further that where the purchase value of any vehicle including a
vehicle imported from other countries or a vehicle acquired or obtained otherwise
than by way of purchase is not ascertainable on account of non availability of
the invoice, the purchase value shall be the value or price of the vehicles of the
same specifications which are already registered or available with the
manufacturer or as fixed by the Customs and Central Excise Department for the
purpose of levying customs duty and includes excise or customs duty levied on
the purchase of a motor vehicle, as the case may be.”;

(c) the existing clause (ee) shall be renumbered as clause (eb) and before
clause (eb) as so renumbered the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ea) “push back seat” means the seat, backrest of which can be adjusted
or tilted to the comfort of the passenger.”;

(d) after clause (f), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(fa) “sleeper berth” means a berth or a seat which can be adjusted or
converted as a berth for the comfort of the passenger.”;

(2) in section 3,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the second proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided further that in respect of a new motor vehicle of any of the
classes specified in items 1, 2, 6, 7(i)(b), 7(i)(c), 10(iii) and 11(i) of the Schedule,
there shall be levied, from the date of purchase of the vehicle, one time tax at
the rate specified in Annexure I, at the time of first registration of the vehicle
and thereafter tax shall be levied at the time of renewal of registration of such
vehicle or on the expiry of the life time tax already paid at the rate specified in
the Schedule as per fourth proviso to sub-section (1) of section 4.”;

(ii) the third proviso shall be omitted:;
1062/2014.



10

(iii) for the fourth proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that in respect of old motor cycles specified in item (1), old
three wheelers specified in item (2) and old motor cars specified in item 11 (i) of
the Schedule, there shall be levied a tax in advance for a period of five years
after the expiry of the period in respect of which tax has been paid at the rate
specified in Annexure Il and for new goods carriages specified in item (3) (i) (a)
to (3) (i) (e) and (3) (ii) (a) to (3) (ii) (), new Autorickshaws specified in item 7
(i) (a), there shall be levied a tax in advance for a period of five years at the
rate specified in Annexure Il at the time of first registration of the vehicle and
thereafter tax shall be levied for five years or for one year at the rate specified
in the seventh proviso to sub-section (1) of section 4.” ;

(b) in sub-section (5), in the existing proviso, for the words, brackets
and figure “under sub-section (9)”, the words, brackets and figures “under sub-
sections (8) and (9)” shall be substituted;

(3) in section 4,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) in the fourth proviso, for the words, figures, brackets and
letters, after the words, brackets and figure “or passengers specified in item 2 of
the Schedule”, the following words, figures, brackets and letters, shall be
substituted, namely:—

“or new goods carriage specified in items 3(i)(a) to 3(i)(e), 3(ii)(a) to
3(ii)(e), new autorickshaws specified in item 7(i)(a) or old motor cars specified
in item 11(i) of the Schedule shall pay tax in respect of those vehicles in
advance for a period of five years in lump sum upon a licence for such period.”;

(ii) for the fifth proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted,
namely:—

“Provided also that the registered owner or a person liable to pay tax in
respect of Private Service Vehicle (Non-Transport Vehicle) for personal use
specified in item 6 and Construction equipment vehicles specified in item 10(iii)
of the Schedule, shall remit tax in lump sum for 2 years after the expiry of
existing tax period at the rate specified in column (3) of the respective items in
the Schedule.”;



11

(iii) for the sixth proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that the registered owner or a person liable to pay tax in
respect of vehicle specified in items 1, 2, 3(i)(a) to 3(i)(e), 3(ii)(a) to 3(ii)(e), 6,
7(i)(a) to 7(i)(c), 10(iii) and 11(i) of the Schedule for which one time or lump sum
tax has been paid, shall not be liable to pay any periodical increase in tax
during the period for which he has paid tax for such vehicle.”;

(iv) for the seventh proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that the owner or a person liable to pay tax in respect of
goods vehicles specified in item 3(i)(a) to 3(i)(e) and 3(ii)(a) to 3(ii)(e),
autorickshaws specified in item 7 (i)(a), motor cab specified in item 7 (i)(b) and
tourist motor cab specified in item 7 (i)(c) of the Schedule shall have an option
to remit tax in lump sum for five years at the rate specified in Annexure Il or to
remit tax for one year at the rate specified in item 3 (i)(@) to 3 (i)(e), 3 (ii)(a) to
3 (ii)(e) and 7 (i)(a) to 7 (i)(c) of the Schedule respectively”;

(b) in sub-section (3), after the existing proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that clause (b) of this sub-section shall not be applicable
to e-payment of tax.”;

(5) for section 11, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“11. Power to seize, detain and sell motor vehicles.—(1) Any
officer of the Motor Vehicles Department not below the rank of Assistant Motor
Vehicles Inspector authorised in this behalf by the Government or any Police
Officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector may, if he has reason to believe
that a taxable motor vehicle is used or kept for use in the State without paying
tax, seize and detain that vehicle and make necessary arrangements for the safe
custody of that vehicle pending production of proof of payment of tax.

(2) Where the tax due, in respect of the vehicle seized and
detained under sub-section (1), is not paid within 30 days from the date of such
seizure and detention, the officer authorised by the Government in this behalf
may serve a notice in such manner as may be prescribed to the registered
owner or the person who had the possession or control of the vehicle,
immediately before such seizure and detention. After considering the objections,
if any, filed by such person, if the authorised officer is satisfied that, the tax
due has not been paid so far, he shall recover the tax due by sale of such
vehicle in the manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that no such vehicle shall be sold if the tax due is paid at any
time before the date of notification of the sale.



12

(3) Where the registered owner or the person having possession or
control of the vehicle does not raise any objection to the notice served in sub-
section (2), the authorised officer shall conduct sale of such vehicle as provided
in sub-section (2).

(4) Where the tax due in respect of the vehicle seized and detained
by the Police Officer under sub-section (1) is not paid within 30 days from the
date of such seizure and detention, the Police Officer concerned shall transfer
such vehicle to the Motor Vehicles Department along with a report thereon.
After the receipt of such report, the authorised officer shall conduct the sale of
such vehicle under sub-section (2).”;

(6) after section 12, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“12A. Interest on tax payable when tax is not paid.—Where any
person fails to pay the tax payable under section 3 within a period of six
months from the date of expiry of the prescribed period for payment of the same,
he shall be liable to pay interest on such tax at the rate of twelve per cent per
annum, in addition to the additional tax payable under section 12, until the
realisation of the amount:

Provided that the interest payable under this section shall not exceed the
amount of tax payable.”;

(7) in the ScHEDULE,—

(a) for serial numbers 1 and 2 and the entries against them in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial numbers and entires shall, respectively,
be substituted, namely:—

“1. Motor Cycles (including Motor Scooters and cycles with
attachment for propelling the same by mechanical power) 45,00

2. Three wheeler (including tri-cycles and cycle rickshaws
with attachment for propelling the same by mechanical
power) not used for transport of goods or passengers. 45.007;

(b) in serial number 7, for item (i) and the entries thereunder in
columns (2) and (3), the following items and entries shall respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

“(i) Vehicles permitted to ply solely as contract carriage
(@ and to carry not more than 3 passengers (Autorickshaw) 125.00

(b) and to carry more than 2 passengers but not more than
6 passengers other than tourist motor cabs (motor cab) 350.00



13

(c) Tourist Motor Cabs

(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the State

0]

(i)

(i)

(iv)

V)

(vi)

(vii)

Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to carry more
than 6 passengers but not more than 12 passengers-
for every passenger

Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to carry more
than 12 passengers but not more than
20 passengers-for every passenger

Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to carry more
than 20 passengers-for every passenger

Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats
and permitted to carry more than 6 passengers
but not more than 12 passengers- for every
passenger

Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats
and permitted to carry more than 12 passengers
but not more than 20 passengers- for every
passenger

Contract Carriage with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers-for
every passenger

Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers
but not more than 12 passengers- for every
passenger

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and

®)

permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but
not more than 20 passengers- for every passenger

Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers-for
every passenger

425.00

310.00

530.00

750.00

500.00

750.00

1000.00

1000.00

1500.00

2000.00



14

(e) Vehicles registered in Kerala and operating Inter-State after obtaining
permit under sub-section (9) of section 88 of the Motor Vehicles Act,
1988 (Central Act 59 of 1988)

(i) Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to carry
more than 6 passengers-for every passenger 1540.00

(i) Contract Carriage with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers-for
every passenger 2000.00

(i) Contract Carriage with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers-
for every passenger 3000.00

() ehicles registered in other States and entering Kerala after obtaining
permit under sub-sections (8) and (9) of section 88 of the Motor
Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of 1988)

(i) Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to carry more
than 6 passengers-for every passenger 4000.00

(i) Contract Carriages with push back seats and permitted
to carry more than 6 passengers-for every passenger  6000.00

(iii) Contract Carriages with sleeper berths and permitted
to carry more than 6 passengers-for every passenger  7000.00

(ii) Motor Vehicles permitted to ply as Contract Carriages and solely used as
Educational Institution Bus

(@ Vehicles with 20 or less seats including driver 500.00
(b) Vehicles with more than 20 seats 1000.00.”;

(c) in serial number 11, after item (ii) and the entries against it, in
columns (2) and (3), the following item and entries shall respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“(iii) Caravan/Camping Trailer-for every square metre
or part thereof of the floor area 1000.00.”;

(d) in serial number 13, for item “1 Educational Institution Bus”, and
the entries thereunder in columns (2) and (3), the following item and entries shall,
respectively, be substituted, namely:—

“l. Generator Van/Compressor/Rig
(@ Light Motor Vehicle 1000.00



15

(b) Medium Motor Vehicle 1500.00
() Heavy Motor Vehicle 2000.007;

(da) in the proviso to the schedule after paragraph (6) the following
paragraph shall be inserted, namely:—

“ (7) in the case of Contract Carriage having ordinary seats, push back
seats and sleeper berths, tax shall be realised for the vehicle on the basis of
actual number of seats of each kind, at the rate prescribed in the schedule.”;

(e) in ANNEXURE 1,—

(i) for serial number A and the entries thereunder, in columns (2)
and (3), the following serial number and entries shall respectively be substituted,
namely:—

“A. New Motor Cycles (including Motor Scooters
and Cycles with attachments for propelling the
same by mechanical power) and three wheelers
(including tricycles and cycle rickshaws with
attachment for propelling the same by
mechanical power) not used for transport of
goods or passengers and Private Service Vehicle
for personal use (NTV), Motor Cars, Motor
Cabs, Tourist Motor Cabs, and Construction
Equipment Vehicles.

1. Motor Cycles (including motor Scooters and 6 % of the purchase
cycles with attachments for propelling the same  value of the vehicle.
by mechanical power) and bicycles of all
categories with or without side car or drawing a
trailer having purchase value upto rupees
1 lakh.

2. Motor Cycles (including motor Scooters and 8 % of the purchase
cycles with attachments for propelling the same  value of the vehicle.
by mechanical power) and bicycles of all
categories with or without side car or drawing a
trailer having purchase value above rupees
1 lakh.

3. Three Wheelers (including tricycles and cycle g 9% of the purchase
rickshaws with attachment for propelling the  yajue of the vehicle.
same by mechanical power) not used for
transport of goods or passengers.



9.

10

11.

12.

13.

16

Motor Cars and Private Service Vehicles for
personal use (NTV) having purchase value
up to rupees 5 lakhs.

Motor Cars and Private Service Vehicles for
personal use (NTV) having purchase value
more than rupees 5 lakhs and up to rupees 10
lakhs.

. Motor Cars and Private Service Vehicles for

personal use (NTV) having purchase value
more than rupees 10 lakhs and up to rupees
15 lakhs.

. Motor Cars and Private Service Vehicles for

personal use (NTV) having purchase value
more than rupees 15 lakhs.

Motor Cabs having Cubic Capacity below
1500 cc.

Tourist Motor Cabs having Cubic Capacity below
1500 cc and having purchase value up to
rupees 10 lakhs.

. Tourist Motor Cabs having cubic capacity below
1500 cc and having purchase value above
rupees 10 lakhs.

Motor Cabs and Tourist Motor Cabs having
Cubic Capacity 1500 cc and above and
having purchase value up to rupees 15 lakhs.

Motor Cabs and Tourist Motor Cabs having
Cubic Capacity 1500 cc and above and
having purchase value above rupees 15 lakhs.

Construction Equipment Vehicles such as
excavators, loaders, backhoe, compactor rollers,
road rollers, dumpers, motor graders, mobile
cranes, dozers, fork lift trucks, self loading
concrete mixers etc.

6 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

8 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

10 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

15 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

6 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

6 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

10 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

10 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

15 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.

6 % of the purchase
value of the vehicle.



17

(ii) after serial number D and the entries against it in columns (2) and (3),
the following serial number and entries shall respectively be inserted, namely:—

“E. Motor cabs and Tourist motor cabs which
are originally registered in other State on or
after 1t April, 2014 and migrated to the
Kerala State

F. Motor cabs and Tourist Motor Cabs which
were registered on or after 1% April, 2014
and reclassified from the category of Non-
Transport Vehicle

(f) for Annexure I, the following Annexure shall be substituted,
namely:—

“ANNEXURE |
Lump sum Tax

[See proviso to section 3(1) and section 4(1)]

Sl. Class of Vehicle Rate of
No. tax for
5 years
(in Rupees)
@) &) ©)

A. Old Motor cycles (including motor scooters and cycles
with attachments for propelling the same by mechanical
power) and bicycles of all categories with or without
side car or drawing a trailer. 900

B. Three Wheelers (including tricycles and cycle rickshaws
with attachments for propelling the same by mechanical
power) not used for transport of goods or passengers 900

C. New autorickshaws and autorickshaws which were
originally registered in other States on or after Ist April,

2010 and migrated to the State of Kerala. 2000
D. Motor cabs 7000
E Tourist Motor cabs 8500
F. Motor cars having ULW not exceeding 750 Kg. 6400

1062/2014.



18

@ @ ©)
G. Motor cars having ULW more than 750 Kg. but

not more than 1500 Kg. 8600
H. Motor cars having ULW more than 1500 Kg. 10600
I. Goods carriages having GVW up to 3000 Kg.

(i) Motor Cycle trucks not exceeding 300 Kg. 2700

(i) Goods Carriages with GVW not exceeding 1000 Kg. 4400
(iiiy Goods Carriages with GVW exceeding 1000 Kg.

but not exceeding 1500 Kg. 8400
(iv) Goods Carriages with GVW exceeding 1500 Kg.

but not exceeding 2000 Kg. 11000
(v) Goods Carriages with GVW exceeding 2000 Kg.

but not exceeding 3000 Kg. 14100.”.

8. Amendment of Act 32 of 1976.—In the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act,
1976 (32 of 1976),—

(2) in section 2, after clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(ia) “Serviced apartment” means a furnished apartment available for
short-term stay for guests, which provides amenities and services for daily use
for monetary consideration as an alternative for hotel accommodation.”;

(2) in section 4,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after item (ii), the following item shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(iia) in a serviced apartment”;
(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) in clause (a), after the second proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that for the charges of accommodation for residence and
other amenities and services provided in the months of June, July and August
of every year, the rate of tax mentioned in items (i) and (ii) shall be five per
cent.”;



19

(ii) to clause (c), the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that any amount paid to the proprietor along with the charges
for accommodation, by whatever name called, shall not be excluded from levy of
tax under this clause:

Provided further that the rate of tax mentioned in item (iii) shall be ten
per cent with respect to National and International Conventions, seminars and
exhibitions approved by the Tourism Department of the Government of Kerala
as per the scheme formulated by them for this purpose. Such approval shall be
filed in the format specified in such scheme, before the assessing authority
along with the returns filed under this Act.”;

(iii) after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(d) in respect of serviced apartment, for the charges of
accommodation and other amenities and services provided at the rate of twelve
and a half per cent.”;

(3) after section 4F, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“4G. Registration of serviced apartments.—Every proprietor of a
serviced apartment in a district shall get his serviced apartment registered with
the authority under this Act along with a registration fee of one thousand
rupees per apartment. Other procedures relating to registration of hotels shall be
applicable in this case. The registration shall be for a period of one year and
shall be renewed annually”.

9. Amendment of Act 15 of 1991.—In the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax
Act, 1991 (15 of 1991), in section 37C,—

(1) in sub-section (3), for the figures and words “31% December, 2010”,
the figures and words “31% August, 2014” shall be substituted,;

(2) in sub-section (4),—

(a) for the figures and words “31% December, 2010”, the figures and
words “31% December, 2014” shall be substituted;

(b) the proviso shall be omitted.



20

10. Amendment of Act 30 of 2004.—In the Kerala Value Added Tax Act,
2003 (30 of 2004),—

(1) in section 4, in sub-section (4), after clause (iii), the following
clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iv) The Chairman or any other member of the Appellate
Tribunal nominated by him, may, sitting singly, dispose of any case where the
amount of tax or penalty disputed in appeal does not exceed fifty thousand
rupees and the order of assessment or penalty appealed against is issued by an
officer of and below the rank of a commercial tax officer.

(v) A Bench constituting of two or more members other than the
Chairman may dispose of any case where the amount of tax or penalty disputed
in appeal does not exceed five lakhs rupees.”;

(2) after section 4, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“4A. Appellate Tribunals appointed under the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963.—Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the
Appellate Tribunals appointed under the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963
(Act 15 of 1963) shall have the power to hear and dispose of appeals filed under
this Act, in such manner as may be prescribed, as if they are appointed under
this Act;

(3) in section 6,—
(@) in sub-section (1),—
(i) in the Table, in serial number 1, for the figure “20” in
column (4), the figure “22” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the fifth proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that, where,—

(a) the sale is to or by Canteen Stores Department,
Central Police Canteen, Indian Naval Canteen Service and National Cadet Corps
Canteen ; or

(b) the sale is by Military, Naval, Air force or by the
one subsidiary canteen each that may be established by the Kerala Police in
each District of the State and affiliated to the Central Police Canteen, of the
goods purchased from Canteen Stores Department, Central Police Canteen or
from direct suppliers authorised by them, as the case may be; and

(c) in case of motor vehicles, the sale is to Defence
personnel or ex-servicemen on production of authorization duly issued by the
authorized officer of the Canteen Stores Department, Indian Naval Canteen Stores
or Air Force Canteen, as the case may be;

the tax payable under (a), (b) or (c) above shall, subject to such conditions and
restrictions as may be prescribed, be half the rate applicable to such goods.”;



21

(iii) after the fifteenth proviso, the following provisos shall
be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that the rate of tax for the sale of furnace
oil to Coastal Cargo Vessel as fuel, shall, subject to such conditions and
restrictions as may be prescribed, be 5 per cent.

(b) in sub-section (5), the existing Explanation shall be numbered as
Explanation | and after Explanation | as so numbered, the following Explanation
shall be inserted, namely:—

“Explanation Il.—For the purpose of this sub-section, total
turnover of a dealer shall not include the turnover of sale of medicines sold
under first proviso to clause (e) of section 8 and the turnover of sale of goods
covered under the Schedule to the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of
1963).”;

(c) in sub-section (7), to clause (b), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that the exemption covered by this clause shall be
applicable to a deemed sale involved in a works contract executed through a
sub-contractor also.”;

(4) after section 6, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“6A. Payment of turnover tax of textile articles.— Notwithstanding
anything contained in section 6, every dealer shall pay turnover tax at the rate
of two per cent on the turnover of sale of textile articles, included in serial
numbers 17A, 46A and 51 of the First Schedule:

Provided that a dealer whose turnover of sale of such textiles in the State
for the previous year is below rupees one crore, shall not be liable to pay
turnover tax under this section:

Provided further that this levy would be applicable even if, the constitution
of the business has been changed in the current year to proprietorship, firm or
association of persons consisting of the proprietor, partner, director or persons
of the dealer for the previous year.”;



22

(5) in section 8,—

(a) for clause (a), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(a) (i) any works contractor who imports any goods
into the State from other States or Country for incorporation in the works
contracts and/or who is registered under the provisions of the Central Sales Tax
Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956), may, at his option, instead of paying tax in
accordance with the provisions of section 6, pay tax at the rate of six per cent of
the whole contract amount along with tax under sub-section (2) of section 6:

Provided that the compounded tax payable under this sub-clause by such
works contractor in respect of works contract awarded by Government of Kerala,
Kerala Water Authority or Local Authorities shall be four per cent of the whole
contract amount, along with tax under sub-section (2) of section 6:

(ii) any works contractor not falling under the
description in clause (i) above may, at his option, instead of paying tax in
accordance with the provisions of the said section, pay tax at three per cent of
the whole contract amount along with tax under sub-section (2) of section 6:

Provided that the provisions of this clause shall not apply to any works
contract in which the transfer of material is in the form of goods:

Provided further that notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, a
works contractor who intends to pay tax at compounded rate in accordance with
this clause in respect of all works undertaken by him during an year, may,
instead of filing separate application for compounding for individual works, file a
single option for payment of tax under this clause before 30" day of April of the
year to which the option relates, subject to eligibility:

Provided also that in the case of any work compounded under this clause,
and which remains unexecuted fully or partly as on 31%t March, 2014, the
contractor may continue to pay tax in respect of such works in accordance with
the provisions of this clause as existed when he had opted for compounding up
to 31 March, 2015:

Provided also that with respect to works contract awarded by Government
of Kerala, Kerala Water Authority or local authorities, the contractor shall not be
liable to pay tax under sub-section (2) of section 6 in respect of the purchase of
soil, sand or rocks.

Explanation 1.—For the purpose of this clause “whole contract amount”
shall not include the amount paid to sub-contractors for execution of the
portion of works contracted if the sub-contractor is a registered dealer liable to
pay tax under sub-section (1) or sub-section (IA) of section 6, and the
contractor claiming deduction in respect of such amount furnishes certificates in
such form as may be prescribed.



23

Explanation 2.—Notwithstanding anything contained in any other Act, a
dealer surrenders his registration and unused declaration forms under the Central
Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956), before the assessing authority on
or before 31% March of an year (including 31st March, 2014) and who does not
have any closing stock of materials purchased interstate as on that date or who
pays tax on such closing stock at scheduled rates, shall be eligible for paying
compounded tax under sub-clause (ii) of this clause, for the next year.;

“(b) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

(b) Any dealer producing granite metals and/or manufactured sand
with the aid of mechanised machines may, at his option, instead of paying tax in
accordance with the provisions of the said sections, pay tax at the following
rates, namely:—

Machine description

Compounded tax

@

@)

for each crushing machine of jaw size not
exceeding 30.48 cm. x 22.86 cm.

Rs. 80,000 per
annum

i. for each crushing machine of jaw size Rs. 3.20 lakhs
exceeding 30.48 cm. x 22.86 cm. but not per annum
exceeding 40.64 cm. x 25.40 cm.

ii. for each crushing machine of jaw size Rs. 6.40 lakhs
exceeding 40.64 cm. x 25.40 cm. per annum

iv. for each cone crusher Rs. 36 lakhs per
annum

v. for each Vertical/Horizontal shaft Impactor Rs. 6.25 lakhs
machines with output production capacity up per annum
to 25 Metric Tonne per hour

vi. for each Vertical/Horizontal shaft Impactor Rs. 12.50 lakhs
machines or similar machines with output per annum
production capacity of above 25 Metric
Tonne up to 50 Metric Tonne per hour

vii. for each Vertical/Horizontal shaft Impactor Rs. 22.50 lakhs
machines or similar machines with output per annum
production capacity of above 50 Metric
Tonne up to 100 Metric Tonne per hour

viii. for each Vertical/Horizontal shaft Impactor Rs. 32.50 lakhs
machines or similar machines with output per annum

production capacity of above 100 Metric
Tonne upto 150 Metric Tonne per hour




24

@ )
ix. for each Vertical/Horizontal Shaft Impactor Rs. 45 lakhs per
machines or similar machines with output annum

production capacity of above 150 Metric
Tonne up to 200 Metric Tonne per hour

x  for each Vertical/Horizontal shaft Impactor Rs. 60 lakhs per
machines or similar machines with output annum
production capacity of above 200 Metric
Tonne per hour

Explanation.—For the purpose of this clause, primary crushers falling
under the description of item (i), (ii) or (iii) above, shall also be reckoned for the
purpose of computation of compounded tax, and the rate applicable to primary
crushers shall be at fifty per cent of the aggregate of the tax payable on
secondary crushers:

Provided that notwithstanding anything contained in this clause, dealers
with a single crushing machine of size not exceeding 30.48 cm. x 22.86 cm. shall
pay rupees thirty thousand only per annum and those with a single crushing
machine of size above 30.48 cm. x 22.86 cm. but not exceeding 40.64 cm. x 25. 40 cm.
shall pay rupees one lakh twenty thousand only per annum as tax under this clause:

Provided further that notwithstanding anything contained in this clause,
dealers having Vertical/Horizontal Shaft Impactor machines or similar machines
along with jaw crushers/cone crushers shall pay only sixty per cent of the
relevant rate of compounded tax for each of such Vertical/Horizontal Shaft
Impactor machines or similar machines, in addition to the tax on crushing
machines, as compounded tax under this clause:

Provided also that the compounded tax payable shall be determined for an
year and shall be payable in 12 equal monthly instalments.” .”;

(c) in clause (c), for sub-clause (i), the following sub-clause shall
be substituted, namely:—

(i) any dealer in cooked food and beverages, including fresh
fruit juices and sweets prepared by him, other than,—

(a) a dealer supplying cooked food or beverages to any
airline service company or institution or shipping company for serving in aircraft,
ships or steamer or served in aircraft, ship, steamer ;

1062/2014.



25

(b) a bar attached hotel or a dealer for serving cooked food
in a bar attached hotel ;

(c) a star hotel or a dealer serving cooked food in a star
hotel ;

(d) a dealer making interstate purchase of goods, other
than capital goods or packing materials ; or

(e) hotels or restaurants using a brand name or a trade
mark registered under the Trade Marks Act, 1999 (Central Act 47 of 1999) ;

may, at his option, instead of paying tax in accordance with the provisions of
sub-section (1) of section 6 but subject to payment of tax, if any, payable under
sub-section (2) thereof, pay tax at half per cent of the turnover of cooked food
and beverages prepared by him and also on the turnover of other goods in
respect of which he is not the dealer effecting first taxable sale, as provided in
the Explanation under sub-section (5) of section 6.”;

(d) in clause (e), the third proviso shall be omitted;

(e) for clause (f), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(f) (i) any dealer in bullion or ornaments or wares or articles of
gold, silver or platinum group metals including diamond may at his option,
instead of paying tax on their sale in the State in respect of such goods in
accordance with the provisions of section 6, may pay tax at the rate of,—

(a) one hundred and fifteen per cent, in case the total
turnover of the dealer opting to pay tax under this clause, for the preceding
year was rupees ten lakhs or below;

(b) one hundred and twenty per cent, in case the total
turnover of the dealer opting to pay tax under this clause, for the preceding
year was above rupees ten lakhs and up to rupees forty lakhs;

(c) one hundred and thirty five per cent, in case the total
turnover of the dealer opting to pay tax under this clause, for the preceding
year was above rupees forty lakhs and up to rupees one crore;

(d) one hundred and fifty per cent, in case the total
turnover of the dealer opting to pay tax under this clause, for the preceding
year was above rupees one crore and above;

of the highest tax payable by him as conceded in the return or accounts, or tax
paid by him under this Act, whichever is higher, for an year during any of the
three consecutive years preceding that to which such option relates.



26

Explanation 1.—A dealer shall not be allowed to opt for the payment of
tax under this clause unless he has conducted business up to a full year as on
the first day of April of the year to which the option relates. Where a dealer
had not transacted any business for the last three years consecutively, the
highest tax paid or payable for the year during the year or years he transacted
business shall be considered for the above purpose and where during any such
preceding year, the dealer had not transacted business for any period in that
financial year, the tax payable for the twelve months shall be calculated
proportionately on the basis of the tax payable or the total turnover conceded,
as applicable, for the period during which such dealer had transacted business.

Explanation 2.—Dealers opting for payment of tax under this clause shall
pay compounded tax in respect of all their branches existing in the year to
which the option relates, except the newly started branch or branches started
during the year under option. Such branch or branches will be treated as a
separate place of business for the purpose of this clause, for that year.

Provided that this explanation shall not be applicable to dealers who had
paid compounded tax in respect of their branches started in the year 2013-2014
on the basis of average tax paid for the principal place of business and other
branches for the year 2014-2015.

Explanation 3.—Where a dealer paying tax under this clause, closes a
branch during the year under option, proportionate reduction considering the
number of business places, in the payment shall be granted in the next monthly
instalment onwards, for the remaining months of the year.

Explanation 4.—Where a dealer is opting for payment of tax under this
clause for the first time and had only business in the previous year and the tax
payable as per return or accounts during such previous year is less than the
output tax payable, then the tax payable for the year under option shall be
notionally re-determined on the basis of output tax, for determining the tax
liability for the year under option.

Explanation 5.—Tax payable as conceded in the accounts includes the tax
payable on suppressed or assessed turnover also.

Explanation 6.—For the purpose of this clause, “branch” does not include
any place of business which is exclusively engaged in job work, manufacturing
of ornaments/articles or polishing, and where there is no buying and/or selling of
goods,

(ii) save as otherwise provided in this clause, the
compounded tax payable under this clause shall be determined for an year and
shall be payable in 12 monthly instalments.



27

(iii) a dealer who opts for payment of tax under this clause
may collect tax at the rate as shown in the Table below, but where the tax so
collected during the year is in excess of the tax payable for the year under this
clause, the tax collected in excess shall be paid over to Government in addition
to the tax payable under this clause:

Provided that the tax collected by dealers at the rate not exceeding
1.25% during the year 2013-14 shall be deemed to be validly collected.

TABLE

Compounded tax payable for the year Percentage of tax permitted to be
under option of the tax paid or payable collected on the sale of goods
under this clause for the previous year/ covered under this clause for the

years in percentage year under option
103 103
104 104
105 105
109 1.09
112 112
115 115
120 120
125 125
135 135
150 150

(iv) The assessing authority, for valid and sufficient reasons,
such as shifting of place of business, furnishing of false information,
suppression of relevant information, failure to furnish such information
demanded, may refuse permission to pay tax under this section and cancel the
permission, if any, granted:

Provided that no orders under this sub-clause shall be issued without
giving the dealer an opportunity of being heard and without prior approval of
the District Deputy Commissioner.

(v) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 55 or

section 60 of this Act, orders under sub-clause (ii) shall be appealable only to
the Appellate Tribunals.

(vi) In case where permission has been cancelled, the amount,
if any paid based on the permission, shall be apportioned against the output tax
due from the dealer.



was rupees ten lakhs or below,

28

(vii) Where a dealer had paid tax under this clause for the
previous year, the tax payable,—

(@) by a dealer whose total turnover for the previous year

shall be at the rate of one per cent on the

turnover of sales in the State, during the year under option; and,

(b) by the class of dealers mentioned in column (1) of the
Table below for the succeeding year under this clause shall be calculated at the
appropriate rates mentioned in column (2) or column (3) of the Table below,
whichever is higher.

TABLE
@ @ ©)

Compounded tax payable for percentage of the turnover of

the year under option of the sale of goods covered under
Total turn- tax paid or payable under option within the State, for the
over of the this c!ause for the previous previous vyear, payable as
dealer Year(inper cent) compounded tax
opting 10 |f 5 dealer If a dea- Others If a dealer If a dealer Others
pay ta_x had paid ler had had paid had paid
under this ¢ o mpo - paid com- compounded compounded
clause, for unded tax pounded tax under tax under
the pre- y nger t?_x ulnder this clause this clause
VIOUS YEar this clause E(:Sniia:]uj(? continuously continuo-

continuo- for last five usly for last

ously for

usly  for last three years three years

last five years years
Above 103 104 105 103 104 105
rupees ten
lakhs and
up to rupees
forty lakhs
Above 109 112 115 1.09 112 115
rupees forty
lakhs and
up to rupees
One Crore
Rupees One 115 120 125 115 1.20 1.25.”;
Crore and

above




29

(5A) in section 10, in sub-section (1) for the words “the fifth day of the
month”, the words “the twentieth day of the month”, shall be substituted,;

(6) in section 12, in the second proviso before the word “plywood”, the
words “rubber latex, rubber wood” shall be inserted:

(7) in section 18B,—

(a) for the figures and words “30th September, 2013”, the figures
and words “31st August, 2014” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the first proviso, for the figures and words “1st April, 2013”,
the figures and words “1st April, 2014” shall be substituted;

(c) the second and third provisos shall be omitted;
(8) after section 18B, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“18C. Special provisions for hospitals.—(1) Notwithstanding anything
contained in section 6 and section 18B, hospitals run by charitable institutions
shall be exempted from tax on the sale of medicines, laboratory store items and
consumables to their patients during the course of treatment, subject to the
following conditions, namely:—

(a) they shall, on payment of a fee of ten thousand rupees,
obtain a certificate from the Commissioner for an year, based on the orders of
exemption applicable to charitable institutions under the Income Tax Act, 1961
(Central Act 43 of 1961).

(b) the hospitals availing exemption as per this sub-section
shall purchase only medicines which had suffered tax on the maximum retail
price as per clause (e) of section 8 of this Act and with regard to other
laboratory store items and consumables, only from dealers registered under this
Act:

Provided that for the period up to 31 March, 2013, the exemption would be
made operative only based on the certificate issued by the Commissioner
considering the orders of income tax exemption:

Provided further that such charitable hospitals shall not be liable to take
registration or file returns under this Act.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 6 and section 18B,
hospitals not covered under sub-section (1), shall be exempted from further tax



30

liability on their sale of medicines and other consumables subject to the
following conditions:—

(i) all the purchases of medicines shall be from dealers paying
compounded tax as per clause (e) of section 8;

(it) all the purchases of other consumables are made from dealers
registered under this Act at the maximum retail price; and

(iii) they shall file option for availing this exemption before 30th
April of every year:

Provided that if such hospitals pay the entire tax assessed/determined on
or before 31st March, 2014, they shall not be liable to pay any penalty and/or
interest under this Act.”;

(9) in section 20A, the existing provision shall be numbered as sub-
section (1) and after sub-section (1), as so numbered, the following sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) With respect to works contracts awarded by Government of
Kerala, Kerala Water Authority or Local Authorities, the Commissioner may, for
valid and sufficient reasons to be recorded in writing, condone delay for filing
of option under section 8 up to the date of filing of annual returns as
prescribed under this Act. The application for condonation of delay shall be
submitted along with the order of rejection of the option citing the reasons, of
the assessing authority.”;

(10) after section 25B, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“25C. Special provision regarding assessment of dealers paying
presumptive tax.—Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (4) of
section 11 or sub-section (2) of section 12, if any assessment or other
proceeding is initiated by the assessing authority denying the eligibility of a
dealer to pay presumptive tax for the violation of conditions enumerated in sub-
section (5) of section 6, such dealer shall be granted input tax credit or special
rebate, as the case may be.”;

(11) in section 30, to sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that notwithstanding anything contained in this section, no
dealer shall collect any sum by way of turnover tax leviable under section 6A.”.

(12) in section 31, in sub-section (5), after the words “twelve per cent per
annum” the words “and in the case of tax collected by dealers from persons



31

who had purchased goods from him, at the rate of thirty six per cent per annum
shall be inserted ;

(13) in section 42, in sub-section (1), after the existing proviso, the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that the Khadi and Village Industries Units shall, in lieu
of the Statement and Certificate mentioned above, submit copy of the audited
statement of accounts and certificate issued by the Kerala Khadi and Village
Industries Board.”;

(14) in section 55—
(@) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words, brackets and figures “other than those under
sub-section (3), sub-section (8) or sub-section (9) of section 16, sub-section (8)
of section 19;” the words, brackets and figures “other than those under section
16, section 19, sub-sections (8) and (9) of section 44, section 49, section 67,
section 68, section 69 and section 70” shall be substituted ;

(ii) in the first proviso, for the figures and words “48, 49, 67, 69, 70,
70A and 727, the figures and words “48, 70A and 72” shall be substituted ;

(iii) after, the second proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that where an order of the assessing authority which has
become not appealable with effect from 1st April, 2014 by virtue of the Kerala
Finance Bill, 2014, is pending in appeal under this section, such appeal shall
stand transferred to the appropriate authority under this Act and such authority
shall consider the same as if it is an appeal filed before it.”;

(b) in sub-section (5), after the existing proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

Provided that the power of the Deputy Commissioner (Appeals) to remand
a case is limited to ex-parte orders only.”;

(15) in section 57, to sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

Provided that the power of the Deputy Commissioner to remand a case is
limited to ex-parte orders only.”;



32
(16) in section 67, for the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

Provided that in the case of item (c) above, a minimum penalty of rupees
One Thousand shall directed to be paid.”;

(17) in the ScHEDULES,—
(@) in the First Schedule,—

(i) in serial number 4A, item number (2) and the entries against it
in columns (2) and (3) shall be omitted,

(i) after serial number 18 and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“18A. Flour, Sooji

(1) Wheat or meslin flour 1101.00.00
(@ Maida falaiaial
(3) Sooji folakaial

(iii) in serial number 35A, in the entry in column (2), the words
“paper cups” shall be added at the end ;

(iv) in serial number 42, for the entry against it in column (2),
the following entry and Note shall be substituted, namely:—

“Rice issued from Central/State
Government depots or sold by Food
Corporation of India for sale by
authorized ration dealers

Note:—This entry shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day
of April, 2005”;

(v) after serial number 42A and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“42B. Rice bran oil kK



33

(vi) after serial number 54 and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3) the following serial number and entries shall respectively, be

inserted, namely:—
“54A  Wheat including broken Wheat 1001”.
(b) in the Second Schedule,—

(i) for serial number 2B and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be

substituted, namely:—
“2B. Chillies dried 0904.20.10™;

(ii) for serial number 2C and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be

substituted, namely:—

“2C. Flour other than those specifically mentioned in the First Schedule

(1) Rye flour 1102.10.00
(2 Maize (corn flour) 1102.20.00
(3) Rice flour (puttu podi and the like) 1102.30.00
(4) Other cereal flour 1102.90.00.”;

(iia) after serial number 2C and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3) the following serial numbers and entries shall, respectively,

be inserted, namely:—

“2D. Washing soap bars and cakes

manufactured using coconut oil; falaiaiaie

1062/2014.



34

(iii) after serial number 5A and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“5B. Orid dhal powder okl

(iv) serial number 7 and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3) shall be omitted;

(c) in the Third Schedule,—

(i) in serial number 3, sub-item (j) of item (1) and the entries
against it in columns (2) and (3) shall be omitted;

(ii) after serial number 7 and the entries against it in columns (2)
and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted,
namely:—

“8. Bakery products like cakes, halwa, mixture, il
laddu and jelabi

(iii) in serial number 30A, in the entry in column (2), for the
words “bar attached hotels and star hotels”, the words “and five star hotels”
shall be substituted;

(iv) in serial number 36, to item (27), the following Note and
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Note:—This entry shall be deemed to have come into
force on the 13" day of November, 2009.”;

Provided that the tax, if any, collected during the period
from the 13th day of November, 2009 to the 31st day of March, 2012 shall not be
refunded”;

(v) after serial number 37 and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“38. Edible oils
(1) Soyabean oil 1507.90.10
(2) Groundnut oil 1508.90.91

(3) Olive oil 1509.90.10



Q)

35

Palm oil

(@) Refined bleached deodorized palm oil

(b) Refined bleached deodorized palmolein

®)
©)
U]
®)
©)
(10)
(11)
(12)
13)
(14)
(15)
(16)

an
(18)

Sunflower oil

Saffola oil

Cottonseed oil
Babassu oil

Refined coiza oil
Refined rapeseed oil
Refined mustard oil
Linseed oil
Maize (corn) oil
Castor oil

Seasam oil

Fixed vegetable oils of edible grade namely,

mango kernel oil, mahua oil

Other edible oils

Other partly or wholly hydrogenated vegetable oils

(a) Cottonseed oil

(b) Groundnut oil

(c) Castor oil

(d) Others including Vanaspati
(19) Vegetable edible oils excluding HSN heading No. 1516

(@ Linseed oil

(b) Castor oil dehydrated

(c) Other vegetable oils edible grade

1511.90.10
1511.90.20
1512.19.10
1512.19.30
1512.29.10
1513.29.20
1514.19.10
1514.19.20
1514.99.20
1515.19.10
1515.29.10
1515.30.10
1515.50.91
1515.90.40

1515.90.91

1516.20.11
1516.20.21
1516.20.31
1516.20.91

1518.00.11
1518.00.21
1518.00.31



36

(20) Palm kernel il 1513.21.10”;

(vi) in serial number 69, item (27) and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3) shall be omitted;

(vii) in serial number 79A, for the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following entries shall, respectively, be substituted, namely:—

“All types of lamps using LED as the source Fxk
of light

(viii) serial number 82A and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3) shall be omitted;

(ix) in serial number 93, to sub-item (c) of item (1), the following
Note shall be inserted, namely:—

“Note:—The entry shall be deemed to have come
into force on the 1% day of April, 2005.”;

(x) to entry 98A, the following Notes shall be inserted, namely:—

Note 1.—For the sale of Domestic LPG by Indian Oil Corporation Limited,
Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Limited, Bharat Petroleum Corporation Limited
and their agencies, no tax shall be levied on the amount of subsidy granted by
the Central Government to such Corporations and passed on to the consumers
during the sale of the same by the said Corporations and agencies;

Note 2.—This shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1% day of
January, 2014.”;

(d) in the List A, after serial number 135A and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“135B. Rubber spray oil falaial

11. Amendment of Act 29 of 2013.— In the Kerala Finance Act, 2013
(29 of 2013), in section 11,—

(1) in sub-section (1), the words “including that of dining halls” shall
be omitted,;



37

(2) to sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that cess shall be levied only once for wedding and
connected celebrations in respect of the same bride and bridegroom.”.



