PrblisPos) em 236,15

Thirteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly
Bill No. 356

i e — s

THE MINIMUM WAGES (KERALA AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2015

©

Kerala Legislature Secretariat
2015

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS.



Thirteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly
Bill No. 356

THE MINIMUM WAGES (KERALA AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2015

582/2015.



Thirteenth Kerala Legislative. Assembly
Bill No. 356

THE MINIMUM WAGES (KERALA AMENDMENT)BILL, 2015
A
BILL

Sfurther to amend the Minimum Wages Act, 1946.

Preamble.—WHEREAs, it is expedient further to amend the Minimum Wages
Act, 1948 (Central Act 11 of 1948) in its application to the State of Kerala for
the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and comrﬁencement.—(l) This Act may be called the
Minimum Wages (Kerala Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Kerala.
(3) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of Section 20.—In section 20 of the Minimum Wages Act,
1948 (Central Act 11 of 1948) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “or any officer of the State
Government not below the rank of a Labour Commissioner” the words “or any
officer of the State Government not below the rank of a Deputy Labour
Commissioner” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “one
thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (5), for clause (b), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(b) if the Authority is not a Magistrate, by the Authority, as if it
were arrears of revenue due on land, without prejudice to any other mode of
recovery.”.

3. Amendment of Section 22.—In section 22, for the words “five hundred
rupees” the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

582/2015.



2

4. Amendment of Section 224.—In section 22A, for the words “five
hundred rupees” the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

As per sub-section (1) of section 20 of the Minimum Wages Act, 1948, at
present the claims under this Act are to be heard and decided by an Officer of
the State Government at the level of Labour Commissioner. As there are practical
difficulties in enforcing this provision in different areas of the State, Government
have decided to appoint officers of the State Government not below the rank of
a Deputy Labour Commissioner in the place of Labour Commissioner for deciding
the claims under the Act. At present the claim petition of an employee under the
Minimum Wages Act, 1948 is decided by the procedure prescribed under section
20 of the said Act. As per sub-section (5) of section 20 of the said Act any
amount directed to be paid by the authority can only be recovered through
Magistrates. This procedure causes unnecessary delay in recovering the amounts
due. Therefore, Government have decided to amend the said provision in the Act
in its applicability to the State of Kerala so as to enable the authority to
recover the amount as arrears of revenue due on land from the employer or such
other person who has been directed to pay the amount.

The rates of fine prescribed under various provisions in the Act have also
become obsolete and need to be enhanced for the effective implementation of
the provisions of the Act. Hence it is also decided to amend sub-section (4) of
section 20, scctions 22 and 22A of the Act, suitably by enhancing the amount
of fines prescribed under these sections.

The Bill secks to amend the Minimum Wages Act, 1948 in its application
to the State of Kerala, to achieve the above object.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Bill, if enacted and brought into operation would not involve any
additional expenditure from the Consolidated Fund of the State.

SHIBU BABY JOHN



3

" EXTRACT OF THE RELEVANT PORTIONS FROM THE
MINIMUM WAGES ACT, 1948
(CENTRAL ACT 11 OF 1948)

*k * % * kK * %k

20. Claims.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in the
Official Gazette, appoint any Commissioner for Workmen’s Compensation or any
officer of the Central Government exercising functions as a Labour Commissioner
for any region, or any officer of the State Government not below the rank of
Labour Commissioner or any other officer with experience as a Judge of a Civil
Court or as a stipendiary Magistrate to be the Authority to hear and decide for
any specified area all claims arising out of payment less than the minimum rates
of wages or in respect of the payment of the remuneration for days of rest or for
work done or such days under CL (b) or CL (¢) of sub-section (1) of Sec. 13 or
of wages at the overtime rate under Sec. 14, to employees employed or paid in
that area.

* %k * % *% * %

(4) If the authority hearing any application under this section is satisfied
that it was either malicious or vexatious, if may direct that a penalty not
exceeding fifty rupees be paid to the employer by the person presenting the
application.

* % * Xk k% * %k
(5) Any amount directed to be paid under this section may be
recovered—

(a) if the authority is a Magistrate, the authority as if it were a fine
imposed by the authority as a Magistrate, or

(b) if the authority is not a Magistrate, by any Magistrate to whom
the authority makes application in this behalf, as if it were a fine imposed by
such Magistrate.

* % * % *k * %

22. Penalties for certain offences—Any employer who,—

(a) pays to any employee less than the minimum rates of wage fixed for
employee’s class of work, or less than the amount due to him under the
provisions of this Act, or



4

(b) contravenes any rule or order made under Sec. 13, be punishable
with imprisonment for a term which may cxtend to six months or with fine which
may extend to five hundred rupees, or with both:

Provided that in imposing any fine for an offence under this section, the
Court shall take into consideration the amount of any compensation already
awarded against the accused in any procecedings taken under Sec. 20.

* % * %k * % * %

22A. General provision for punishment of other offences.—Any employer
who contravenes any provision of this Act or of any rule or order made
thereunder shall, if no other penalty is provided for such contravention by this
Act, be punishable with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees.

*% * %k * %k *%




PMM.:&L’ e 206-0- 16

al@Tl0)Mooe CH0E Tlonmue

snfled maud 356

e

—

2015—5)@ aQano M)0som @)eil (cang ceawml) emilad

S S

©

coE MOAMIES SIVBEsTIg]
2015

a8 mloame (nllaflod LI




al@ila)omoo 608 dloame

enfl@d maud 356

2015-921 agggano @)osom @eil (caog ceanml) milod

930/2015.



al@IMMIo GHO8 Marue
enilod_maud 356

2015-0e1 agQos}o a,;osmt‘? &)ell (a8 ceanml)
- 6

1948-0e1 aggane @)osom @ell @] afleee cesuo
DalQM@IMBS

80)

enfl@d

al101e,—1948-001 agQaio @)0som el @G (1948-001 11-00 Go(®
AREG) @O GHOB TVOMUOOMANT  ERIOWEA0S)ITISCOMOZo ATKN)EWNMo H:IEMIAD
A ERdaencd] aflnzle eeawmsl OGO VOBV B0 H WG ;

200® Oloenfleslong @ro}aIomil@ande MLOAIENLOOTIE MOHPeOW)o (aldd00
M QAX)ENBILN)M)—

1. ane)eesajolo (asodo8aRe—(1) @D apdaglal 2015-081 aBQQljo H:)0ATIT
aell (ca0g CeOD) ERESG )M Gaid Al0WIo.-

(2) DOADS GHOZ MouNoMo @PIUB Q1YdaiGH 2o GlH6)M@OsTT.
(3) @O} PSM (nI0EnILIL@TNEE YIS,

2. 20-%0 Qid)aflm)gg GRBNMI.—1948-081 afQ0ljo &0 an)erl
anpagloa (1948-021 11-00 GH(M @dg) (OG0 (alom @REG ag)anoe)
110023 UB1En6qS)@), 20-00 Qldxaflad,— :

(o) (1)-00 atumlafed “omoiod @anlaemoles airalloiod moaewepom
agemelage oqRg wasmeand £GRLONANEMEWO” af)ID AN WBHS ald:0
“awaiygl 00o¥Iod @alaemoles aBalalcd COHYWROGN eqpg wasmeanglon:
ABOOO0) DCAIPNIVOBMEWO” af)M AIGOBD GaldeonsmEmOoY;

(nf) (4)-00 Dalaidn)aled, “@Rdad O)IBIEE” agam QD) BUBDE aldh@o
“aroioo 0w’ af)an QOSa)EA G alBConTRmOE);

(1) (5)-20 @aitudgfloal (enfl) QM AOTIM] alddo MIOY lOWIAD
alsNiWo GaldGHNMEMOENS, ERMOVWOI—

“(enfl) @RUiS00TLOIMo @) esflmicisy @RegE:IT, 2g ogemsslene
2l e @Dsoeo)malal Bovo WEISO®, @Mdm] @)81@ld af)Mealoeel,
@RWle:00aSLOoMm@DIEM.”



2

3. 22-00 aidlaflmag GEBO®]—22-00 QAIB)afled “@ReTS 0)aicwOS
DOMIARAD” )N AUIBBUBHS aldOo “@RYOIWVIB0 0)alECWOBROMOARMN” ag)m

Q0EN)HB Galdesneramoe).

4. 220p cimafimss ceaV @ 22:4)' ad)aflcd, “@peomd O)aic@os
22HOONM” af)M QUOBN)BHUWBHE aldbo “@RQOwI00 mguc@ogm&am;m ng)cm
QU0BN&WB GaldeonerEmoen,

DCFUIHI0MEEROS ailaipemo

1948-601 agQano )0 @jell m&Flens 20-00 Aldla] (1)-00 Palaid)a]
(ni000 M0l @D AYESG (aGH000)88 TPAIGOU MASHEBU TVoMUDIM
mndeoosloal emolad smlaemoes acallwlengs 80) 966400 MO
eauicanemEm)o ™I0)@OMo OO HOHICSBMRM)AO6M. af)NOGI, MoMOIMEIeg
afloflweovanglel @D QIO MSajoeoMGIT (al0CWOUlde: enavle) 5)88o)
OBOME (aINO® ERSFMD @1en8s @A®Iw MR m‘lm;monﬂm;mm‘m%
Muomuoom mudenodlenl awalysl s®o¥lad ®amlauemo)ps aidalaicd @)owoom
2e3100M0OM mI¥IM @®elauemoes muooman mlwaleeymalal qudseod
cm'lcg-acm%u mleinil@d, 1948-081 agQailo @:)0smm @)eil @R (aldh000 S0)
omo¥1englwps @I MmAE 100D (alTSm® @pagloal 20-00 Qld)q lod
mdspalafig)es msasisaovieneswosn ®10)2003lee) M. (IrSo® @RS GO
20-00 Qudkla] (5)-00 Dalaid)a] lalmote @RUNBOEMUNOMO Wldequilen)am a@e@mOn)
M@)o aeflmicsQeod MeIoTiloe 2R AITJENEIMB MUoUilee)&HW)BN). oD
MSaiSlde SlS0MBE B ANNRIVSH)MEGIAT @:0IMmOBTVOTIS EDS QD)@ M).
@@l mocd, @D @y gleal (am oo Ald)af, HOE8 qomOO M OW]aF
MWL) MISeEmOgo OmIFleysawicd mlemo @ragslod e @rsdeeond
adegutloneg)s apgicd aflleamo @lsomps &aike)oil )Slydld: ag)iMealonel @Ry @)
Lsose)mailal mwleoemuoomooilel @slmpailwo, erANGI Hakgam® Tudenod
o lo)Boailay)).

mm@‘ﬁbmoh&umémnmmgmnﬁkmmmw
@IRINO0MaSIBAM)0 DD ERSFORI AIAKTLOMUB B0 BHAR0W msa flansn)
Mol anoo) aidadlefleses=o) @yakayanac’. @eoilmons oo mag’lee: 20-00
m&gsﬁ (4)-20 anm&;m 22, 2204) afom mﬂ.gwa.cﬁ (aldh000 m‘ldsmmglgmg alle

O Adalalaf0mE @D ka3 ERMGORIZOV] RN aiganaila’ o)
20 a)).

G2MOSm @RS WIOCUYPMDIMO] 1948-0e1 aBQaijo &0 &)eil
@R, CHOZ MoMIMOBIT SIOW2)MISCOmIge Ge3L@I I)Em)mMEilal
263WWlaped:0meaamoem oo anikol.




3
WM HAGANIOIENE0

oo milod MO0 ®D)e (oML EITE H@:0ME]AIdle:W)o @ aldmocd
momunom mueriodlwialcd mlam)e WIemon) @RUWle: HalLia)e DEMEIS)IMMEG.

aadlens) ceruenfl GER06Md

(domdema)




4

1948-001 aggane @osom el epsGlcd (1948-6el
11-00 GH(MB ARHY) WIMMBS (AITVAMEBINEBUS

Lo % Lid *%

20. mraisowansaBw—(1) cuaalmwasmdeadglc, avesjoule nauglod
aflfemonimo a¥l, a@om®:lale dmI¥lengl Mo Snldland0 @9 a M e0c®O,
AEOOBIRN0 (ICANEOMES B0) EMOFITinalaemoow] anamexsud adqadleayam
agemBslene Ga(Bualmeani ©6sOMUNEMEDI, emoFlod @:alaemoes aisal
o3 ®oPPVWROOm somBslane GIRE VMO0 SEAL0VINEMEWI, B)
mlaficdeseosmloion; RUWEHIWOSWO WMZo aIQ)aD 2&HIMIGSSOCWO alBlaiWo
milaslay acgemEslene PEEIVMMNGMEWO, agameslele almilddlais (aleausomes,
@ (alGBOY MIeWO W L0 O S)HEWO &)l O&:IS)ENNR|S]HEWI OalG)aD
ce0elenddes agQalje @osum )eldlosdiene @)0emm @ell §@:0s)ea)mMailcd
mleand @reg®l@d 13-00 aid)afleal (1)-%0 Raltid)ae] (&) mmi‘a.um‘lamo
(1) ausmwaonilemoa1¥lod alllwadlaaaERBesnd @REBHMD)BS dlaumveasglmd
02T® (aIQOONES90 CAIMMER 14-00 Qldafldal¥led aoudesse losslonss
Mellewd §HI5)80)M®) Mominwles PAcONHO)IN o0 ERAIGINAOGERS)0
e HWIo ®I0)2oMI9)&B@le NalPIMB8 @RWlGkoomuOImaIw]
mlodlssoaymmamos.

ke ok ok ¥

(4) @® as)oflda19lcd .gom®lene @RGaIdYH G Udsn)am
@RUWHEMOIMA@TIN), @) @RCAIGH B)0)GFD}AI0AOWEMO ULLYA)ENEIHH)MNEMO
@REEMS GENIOALINSIMOUBIIG, ERWIBORMLOONMIIK, @RGALM GenUlalkoa)mm
@R lewoR®:} ERMaIm)0)aID0d ST 80) BFMWMAM)E: OISO
eam mldegulencanmmosny.

(5) @D ald)afladaliod mmsg.aeoaa mldeguwleman ogeomBilene @)H—

(&) @rwle:onmunome asflaiesQoosmesim, @R @)@ asdlalesg agom
mlewlcd ey Grwlsoemunome anaO®I@ afle @R Wlo)MonLIMMEaldnal,
@RWIS00MUOIMMTIGMmO;

(1) @mewlasomundimo amlave(sg @OQH10, @R ®)d HO)
asflmie(sglmocsmo @Wl®0mMOoMe MOENGRIEN0W] EREAIHH §@IS)He)MaY,
@REBOM@BS ogomBilene asflnics) aleomio olly EROVl0)IMONRIMGEIRL], ©Y

asflndesglemo,

QUTV)EIOBHOAR MTETT).

*%k ok ok *k




22, allel @)0aBBen@s BeNLMEBUE—aRgDm) HGWORMMIEENO,—

(o) cpoo®lene cRoellencod) @p cR0LNSHICNNG (wMOTIwOs ®eo
(nlayEniled MiReqs)onlalges oggane @ostm el dlesesgiels #3006,
@egs1cd @D ape Qe ayamosded &191od, ameowes @lsomaes
m@Olege G000CWO OMIS)HNHEWI, GROLIB:IT3

(1) 13-00 QUA)afldai¥lod PEROLOHAYS)M aFO@BIENe 2ISCE0 POMOCALD
9ejonefloa)Hcwo,

QalgIN, @y CleWIRAM, EROJAITVETNOIZAIHINNIN  HILICONEN] IS
MSANWSHEVI, @RETN)0)0]ICWIBAISINM afleuTlaHeWI @ROREICE 0TS0
@)Slewo madasl UBleadlenaa S MMOBaN):

MO @D Ad)efldslvleas 80) )gE0I0 ogom®mlelo afle
aeomm@1@d, (aoed @100l 20-00 AUd)afldaldcl ags)onlg8s
go@®leno Mmsalsleglad @aodl oaud o @vlaoomlges apo®®:1e1)0
MiSAIBIA000Om)E: CmIST AlBlNEMMIGE g)S)EENETRMOB) ). '

226, ageQeme)es WlouUTONSs MOROMIAIL0IMO—DD EREHCRICDO
@RegdIcd @@MH1¢I08 PABISOS IS} aBO@®IR0 21SOMIGRICWO
pOmEAaceIcDO aBe®Eslee QMO 28Joelee)m g®) MleWoRMM)o,
WRABOMW)BS PO LINOTIS, MY ERE] agAMIALMe QAT H2IGOTMalsio,
ARETM)0)0}AICWOBAOBANM allPublens Mmeiss] UTlatilaneqS)n@aE:)am).

o ok ok : o



