
Uncorrected/Not for Publication  1

 

\nb-a-\nÀ½mWImcyw 

 an. kv]o¡À:  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÃpw 2013-þse 

tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) _nÃpw ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]tabw Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡mhp-¶-XmWv.  

 (1)  2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÂ 

[\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-̧ p-a-{´n       

({io. sI.-Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÃpw 2013-þse 

tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) _nÃpw ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.  

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hI-̧ p-a{´n 

({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p.  

an. kv]o¡À: -2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÂ ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡Sp¡-

W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p, _nÂ ]cnK-W-\-bvs¡Sp¡p-¶p.   

hIp¸v Xncn-¨pÅ ]cn-K-W\ 

2þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ 

{]iv\s¯  



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  2

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` 

AwKoIcn¨p 

2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-ambncn¡p¶p. 

3þmw hIp¸v 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendment: 

In clause (i) of sub-section (2) of section 4 of the Kerala Money 

Lenders’ Act, 1958 (35 of 1958), proposed to be substituted by sub-

clause (1), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “six thousand 

rupees” shall be substituted. 

 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 3þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  3

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 3þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 3þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ 

`mKambncn¡p¶p. 

4þmw hIp¸v 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendments: 

(1) for sub-clause (3), the following sub-clause shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

“(3) in section 29,- 

(a) in sub-section (1), the following words shall be 

added at the end, namely”- 

“or on the fair value of each such separate part 

and value of all other properties therein including 

building, if any, whichever is higher,”; 

(b) in sub-section (2), the following words shall be 

added at the end, namely”- 

“or on the fair value of each such separate part 

and value of all other properties therein including 

building, if any, whichever is higher,” 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  4

(c) in sub-section (3), the following words shall be 

added at the end, namely:- 

“or on the fair value of the property and value of 

all other properties therein including building, if 

any, whichever is higher.”.”; 

(2) for sub-clause (6), the following sub-clause shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

“(6) in section 39, in clause (b) of sub-section (1), for the words 

“five rupees”, occurring in both places, the words “ten rupees” shall be 

substituted.”; 

(4) in the Schedule to the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 (17 of 1959), 

proposed to  be amended by sub-clause (7),- 

(i) after item (b), the following item shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

“(ba) in serial number 17, for the entry in column (3), the 

following entry shall be substituted, namely:- 

“One rupee for every rupees 
1000 or part thereof, of the value 
of the share, scrip or stock, as the 
case may be.”; 

 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  5

(ii) in serial number 21, proposed to be substituted by item (c) of 

sub-clause (7), after item (iii), the following proviso shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

 “Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of 

undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to 

the construction of any building or part of building, including flat 

or apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part 

of the building shall also be included in such consideration, and the 

stamp duty if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be 

deducted from the stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”; 

 
 (iii) in serial number 22, proposed to be substituted by item (d) 

of sub-clause (7), after item (vi), the following proviso shall be 

inserted, namely:- 

 “Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of 

undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to the 

construction of any building or part of building, including flat or 

apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part of the 

building shall also be included in such consideration, and the stamp duty 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  6

if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be deducted from the 

stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”; 

  

   “(ga) in serial number 44, in clause (f), for the entries 

against it in columns (2) and (3), the following entries shall, 

respectively, be substituted, namely:- 

“(f) When authorising a person 

other than his father, mother, 

wife, husband, son, 

daughter, brother or sister to 

sell any immovable property 

or giving authority or power 

to a promoter or a developer, 

by whatsoever name called, 

to make constructions or 

develop, sell or transfer (in 

any manner whatsoever) any 

immovable property situated 

in Kerala 

The same duty as a 

conveyance (No.21 or 22, as 

the case may be) for the fair 

value of land or for the amount 

of the consideration, 

whichever is higher or the 

estimated cost as certified by a 

Chartered Engineer of 

proposed construction or 

development or such property, 

as the case may be.” 

 
 
 
 

Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A -̀yÀ°n-¡p¶p. 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  7

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXnIÄ AwKoI-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 4þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 4þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 4þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-

ambncn¡p¶p. 

5þmw hIp¸v 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendment: 

For section 69A of the Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act, 

1959 (10 of 1960), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (2), the 

following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “69A. Refund of court fee in case where the dispute is settled 

under section 89 of the Code of Civil Procedure.- Where a suit, appeal 

or other proceeding before any court is settled by recourse to section 89 

of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (Central Act 5 of 1908), the whole 

court fee paid on the plaint/Memorandum of Appeal or other 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  8

proceedings, except in interlocutory matters, shall be ordered by the 

court to be refunded to the parties concerned by whom the court fee was 

paid.”. 

 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn AwKoI-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 5þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 5þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 5þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ 

`mKambncn¡p¶p. 

6þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 6þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

6þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  9

6þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-ambncn¡p¶p. 

7þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 7þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

7þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

7þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-ambncn¡p¶p. 

8þmw hIp¸v 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendment: 

For sub-clause (3) by which it is proposed to amend section 6 of 

the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976), the following sub-

clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “(3) In section 6,- 

  (a) in sub-section (4), for the existing provisos, the following 

provisos shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “Provided that all assessments relating to the years upto and 

including the year 2007-08, pending as on 31st March, 2013, shall be 

completed on or before 31st March, 2014: 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  10

 Provided further that in cases where any investigation or inquiry is 

pending under this Act or where any assessment cannot be completed 

within the period specified under this section, the Deputy Commissioner 

may, for good and sufficient reasons, extend the period of completion of 

the assessment including escaped assessment under sub-section (5) 

beyond the period specified in this section.”; 

 (b) in sub-section (5), for the words and symbol “hotel/house 

boat”, the word “proprietor” shall be substituted. 

 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ       

`mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ 

`mKambncn¡p¶p. 

9þmw hIp¸v 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  11

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 9þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

9þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

9þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-ambncn¡p¶p. 

10þmw hIp¸v 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendments: 

In section 8 of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 

2004), proposed to be amended by sub-clause (2), before the item (a), 

the following item shall be inserted, namely:- 

 “(A) in clause (b), for the letter and word “M-Sand”, the words 

“Manufactured sand” shall be substituted;”; 

(2) in section 18B of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 

2004), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (4) of clause 10,- 

 (i) in the first proviso,- 

   (a)  in item (c), the word  “and”  shall be omitted; 

(b) after item (c), as amended, the following items shall be 

inserted, namely:- 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  12

“(ca) other dealers referred to in sub-section (1) of 

section 6; (cb) companies; and”; 

 (ii) for the second proviso, the following provisos shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

  “Provided further that hospitals run by charitable institutions 

which avail exemption under the Income Tax Act, 1961 (Central Act 43 

of 1961) and purchasing medicines from compounded dealer after 

paying tax under clause (e) of section 8 shall be exempted from tax on 

their sale of such medicines and on the sale of laboratory store items and 

consumables to their patients: 

 Provided also that, with regard to such hospitals which were liable 

to take registration under this Act, but had not taken registration till 31st  

March, 2013 shall get itself registered on or before 30th June, 2013 to 

avail the concessions as per the forgoing proviso for the period from 1st 

April, 2005 to 31st March, 2013.”; 

 
(3) after sub-clause (7), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

 “(7A) in section 48, in sub-section (1), the following sentence shall 

be added at the end, namely:- 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  13

  “A fee of one hundred rupees shall be payable to 

Government on each transit pass so issued.”.”; 

 
(4) in sub-clause (8), in item (c), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-

item shall be inserted, namely:- 

 “(iiiA) in serial number 93, in item (1), after sub-item (b) and the 

entries against it in columns (2) and (3), the following sub-item and 

entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:- 

  “(c) Edible soya chunks manufactured               *****”. 

         from soya bean oil cake/meal 

 
 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ       

`mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  14

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ 

`mKambncn¡p¶p. 

 

 

 

 

11þmw hIp¸v 

 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Shri. K. M. Mani): Sir,          

I move the following official amendments: 

For clause 11, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

 11. Levy and collection of cess on wedding celebrations.- (1) There 

shall be levied and collected a cess to be called Mangalya Nidhi Cess on 

every wedding and its connected celebrations conducted in hotels having 

the classification of three star and above or in auditoriums with a seating 

capacity of above five hundred including that of dining halls, at the rates 

specified in the Table below, namely:- 

TABLE 

(i) Hotels of three star and above Rs.10,000/-

(ii)  Air conditioned auditorium situated in 
Municipality area 

Rs.10,000/-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  15

(iii)  Air conditioned auditorium situated in Panchayat 
area 

Rs. 7,500/- 

(iv) Other auditoriums situated in the area of 
Municipality 

Rs. 5,000/- 

(v) Other auditoriums situated in Panchayat area Rs. 3,000/- 

 

 (2) The cess shall be collected from the person from whom the 

charges or rent for such celebrations are received by the proprietor of 

such hotel or auditorium, as the case may be, and shall be remitted to 

Government Treasury in the Head of Account of Mangalya Nidhi on or 

before the 15th day of every month. 

 (3) The proprietor of such hotel or auditorium shall file a statement 

in such form as may be prescribed and submit the same along with the 

proof of remittance of Mangalya Nidhi Cess to the assessing authority 

under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976) having 

jurisdiction over the area, on or before the 15th day of every month. He 

shall also keep a register containing the details of remittance of 

Mangalya Nidhi Cess in such manner as may be prescribed. 

(4) The statement referred to in sub-section (3) may be filed and 

the amount of cess may also be paid electronically by the proprietor 

through the website of the Commercial Taxes Department, Government 

of  Kerala. 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  16

(5) The proprietor of the establishment entrusted with the 

collection of the cess shall apply for obtaining a unique identification 

number to the assessing authority under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 

1976 (32 of 1976) having jurisdiction over the area where such 

establishment is situated, in such manner as may be prescribed and the 

assessing authority shall allot the same to the establishment. 

(6) Where any proprietor of a hotel or an auditorium as stated in 

sub-section (1) permits any person to conduct a wedding celebration 

without the payment of cess under this section, such proprietor shall be 

liable to pay such amount of cess as if he had conducted the wedding 

celebration and such amount shall be recovered from him as if it is an 

arrear due from him under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 

1976).  

(7) The Government may, after due appropriation made by the 

Legislature by law in this behalf, utilize such sums of money for the 

purposes specified in the Mangalya Nidhi Scheme framed by the 

Government. 

Explanation.- For the purpose of this section,- 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  17

a. the word “proprietor” shall include the person who for the 

time being is in-charge of management of such hotels or 

auditoriums, as the case may be; 

b. the word “auditorium” shall include hall and 

kalyanamandapam also; 

c. the word “prescribed” means prescribed by rules made by the 

Government in this behalf. 

(8) The provisions regarding the assessment and recovery of tax in 

the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 shall mutatis mutandis apply to 

the assessment and recovery of cess under this section.  

All other changes are verbal or consequential. 

 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 11þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 11þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-

sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  18

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 11þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ 

`mKambncn¡p¶p. 

H¶mw hIp¸pw  ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, I 

move the following official amendments: 

For clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

“1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Kerala Finance Act, 2013. 

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, clauses (ba) and (ga) of 

sub-section (7) of section 4, sub-section (7A), sub-clause (iiiA) of clause 

(c) of sub-section (8) of section 10 and section 11 shall come into force 

at once and the remaining provisions of this Act shall be deemed to have 

come into force on the 1st day of April, 2013.”. 

 Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXnIÄ AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw  ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  19

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw  ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw  ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mKambncn¡p¶p. 

 [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-̧ p-a{´n       

({io. sI. Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÂ       

]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.  

B`y-´-chpw hnPn-e³kpw hIp-¸p-a{´n       

({io. Xncp-h-©qÀ cm[m-Ir-jvW³): kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p.  

an. kv]o¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-

Whpw hIp-¸p-a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy _nÂ  ]mÊm-

¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ..................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p¶p. _nÂ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

(2) 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) _nÂ  

 

an. kv]o¡À: -2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) _nÂ ]cn-K-W-

\-bvs¡Sp¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p, _nÂ ]cnK-W-\-bvs¡Sp¡p-¶p.  



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  20

hIp-¸p-Xn-cn-¨pÅ ]cn-K-W\ 

2þmw hIp¸v 

          (t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-ambncn¡p¶p.  

H¶mw hIp¸pw  ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

[\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-¸p-a{´n       

({io. sI. Fw. amWn):  kÀ, Rm³ Fsâ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn       

Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p. 

_nÃnse 1þmw JÞ-̄ n\p ]Icw Xmsg-̧ -d-bp¶ JÞw       

tNÀt¡-− -Xm-Wv, AXm-b-Xv:þ 

“1. Npcp-¡t¸cpw {]mcw-̀ -hpw.þ (1) Cu BIvän\v 2013-þse tIcf 

[\-Im-cy (2-þmw \¼À) BIväv F¶ t]cv ]d-bmw. 

(2) CXv 2013 G{]nÂ 1þmw XobXn {]m_-e-y-¯nÂ h¶-Xmbn 

IcpXs -̧tS-− -Xm-Wv. ”. 

Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  21

an.- kv]o-¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn AwKo-I-cn-¡p-¶p.  

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ {]iv\w k` AwKoIcn¨p 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ H¶mw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

_nÃnsâ `mKambncn¡p¶p. 

aq¶mw hmb\ 

[\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-¸p-a{´n       

({io. sI. Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) _nÂ 

]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.  

B`y-´-chpw hnPn-e³kpw hIp-¸p-a{´n       

({io. Xncp-h-©qÀ cm[m-Ir-jvW³): kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p.  

an. kv]o¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-

Whpw hIp-¸p-a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 2013-þse tIcf [\-Imcy (2-þmw \¼À) 

_nÂ  ]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ..................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p¶p. _nÂ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  22

[\-Im-cyw 

2013-þ14 km¼-¯nI hÀjs¯ _UvP-än-te-bv¡pÅ                 

D]-[-\m-`-yÀ°-\-IfpsS NÀ¨bpw thms«-Sp¸pw 

 

[\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-̧ p-a-{´n       

({io. sI.-Fw. amWn):  kÀ, kwØm\ \nb-a-k` F¶ Iþmw \¼À [\m-

`yÀ°-\-bp-sS-bpw kwØm\ `c-W-¯-e-h-·mÀ, a{´n-amÀ, BØm\ 

DtZym-K-Ø-·mÀ F¶ IIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw \oXn-\ymb 

\nÀÆ-lWw F¶ IIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ImÀjn-Im-Zmb 

\nIp-Xn-bpw hnev]\ \nIp-Xnbpw F¶ Vþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-

sSbpw ap{Z-¸-{X-§fpw cPn-kvt{S-j\pw F¶ VIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw hml\ \nIp-Xn-IÄ F¶ IXþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

{Sj-dn-Ifpw A¡u-−p-Ifpw F¶ X -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

PnÃm-`-c-Whpw ]e-h-Ibpw F¶ XIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

t]meokv F¶ XIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw A -̈

Sn-bpw aäp `c-W-]-c-amb kÀÆo-kp-Ifpw F¶ XIVþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-

\-bp-sSbpw s]mXp-a-cm-a¯v F¶ XVþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

s]³j\pw ]e-h-Ibpw F¶ XVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

hnZym-`ymkw Imbn-I-hnt\mZw, Ie, kwkvImcw F¶ XVIIþmw \¼À 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  23

[\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sshZy-k-lm-bcwKhpw s]mXp-P-\m-tcm-Kyhpw 

F¶ XVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ip²-P-e-hn-X-c-Whpw ipNo-

I-c-Whpw F¶ XXþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw `h\ \nÀ½mWw 

F¶ XXIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw \K-c-hn-I-k\w F¶ XXII -

þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw hmÀ¯m-hn-X-c-Whpw {]N-c-Whpw F¶ 

XXIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sXmgnepw sXmgn-emfnt£ahpw 

{]hm-kn-t£-ahpw F¶ XXIVþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

]«nIPmXn/]«nIhÀ¤/aäp ]nt¶m¡ \yq\-]£ hn`m-K-§Ä F¶n-h-

cpsS t£aw F¶ XXVþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw {]Ir-Xn-

t£m`waqe-ap-ff Zpcn-Xm-izm-k-¯n\v F¶ XXVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw kl-I-cWw F¶ XXVIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

]e-hI km¼-¯nI kÀÆo-kp-IÄ F¶ XXVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-

\-bp-sSbpw Irjn F¶ XXIX -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw `£yw 

F¶ XXX -þmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw arK-kw-c-£Ww F¶ 

XXXIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw £oc-hn-I-k\w F¶ 

XXXIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw aÕy-_-Ô\w F¶ 

XXXIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw h\w F¶ XXXIVþmw \¼À 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  24

[\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ]©m-b¯v F¶ XXXV -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw {Kma-hn-I-k\w F¶ XXXVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

hyh-km-b-§Ä F¶ XXXVIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw Pe-tk-

N\w F¶ XXXVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sshZypX ]²-Xn-

IÄ F¶ XXXIXþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw Xpd-ap-J-§Ä F¶ 

XLþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw KXm-KXw F¶ XLIþmw \¼À [\m-

`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw hnt\m-Z-k-©mcw F¶ XLIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw \jvS-]-cn-lm-chpw Ah-Imi ssIamä§fpw F¶ XLIIIþmw 

\¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw kmaqly kpc-£n-X-Xzhpw t£ahpw F¶ 

XLVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw t]cnÂ 2013-þ14 km¼-¯nI 

hÀjs¯ D]-[-\m-`yÀ°-\-Isf kw_-Ôn¨ tÌäp-saânÂ {]kvXpX 

[m\m-`yÀ°-\-IÄ¡p t\sc bYm-{Iaw ImWn-¨n-cn-¡p¶ XpI-bv¡pÅ 

D]-[-\m-`yÀ°-\-IÄ A\p-h-Zn-¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bw Rm³ _Ô-s¸« a{´n-

amÀ¡p-th−n Ah-X-cn-̧ n-¡p-¶p. 

 

Sl.No Demand 

No. 

Title of Demands Amount 

(Rs.in 

tho 

usands) 

1 I State Legislature 1 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  25

2 II Heads of States, Ministers and Head Quarters staff 8604 

3 III Administration of Justice 21,483 

4 V Agricultural Income Tax & Sales Tax 2 

5 VII Stamps and Registration 1 

6 IX Taxes on Vehicles 2 

7 X Treasury and Accounts 1 

8 XI District Administration & Miscellaneous 403004 

9 XII Police 23361 

10 XIV Stationery and Printing and Other Administrative Services 10003 

11 XV Public Works 277852 

12 XVI Pension and Miscellaneous 97601 

13 XVII Education, Sports, Art and Culture 442657 

14 XVIII Medical and Public Health 2525 

15 XX Water Supply and Sanitation 3 

16 XXI Housing 3 

17 XXII Urban Development 707508 

18 XXIII Information and Publicity 2 

19 XXIV Labour, Labour Welfare and Welfare of Non-residents 18854 

20 XXV Welfare of SCs/STs/OBCs & Minorities 10 

21 XXVI Relief on account of Natural Calamities 1930698 

22 XXVII Co-operation 5 

23 XXVIII Miscellaneous Economic Services 131452 

24 XXIX Agriculture 43632 

25 XXX Food 450003 

26 XXXI Animal Husbandry 155005 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  26

27 XXXII Dairy 13501 

28 XXXIII Fisheries 307335 

29 XXXIV Forest 60001 

30 XXXV Panchayat 7 

31 XXXVI Rural Development 9138 

32 XXXVII Industries 28984 

33 XXXVIII Irrigation 250020 

34 XXXIX Power 1500000 

35 XL Ports 59330 

36 XLI Transport 250207 

37 XLII Tourism 4566 

38 XLIII Compensation and Assignments 1373481 

39 XLVI Social Security and Welfare 31509 

 

 

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hI-p¸p-a{´n  

({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, {]ta-bs¯ Rm³ ]n´m-§p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À: kwØm\ \nb-a-k` F¶ Iþmw \¼À       

[\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sS-bpw kwØm\ `c-W-¯-e-h-·mÀ, a{´n-amÀ, BØm\       

DtZym-K-Ø-·mÀ F¶ IIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw \oXn-\ymb 

\nÀÆ-lWw F¶ IIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ImÀjn-Im-Zmb 

\nIp-Xn-bpw hnev]\ \nIp-Xnbpw F¶ Vþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-

sSbpw ap{Z-¸-{X-§fpw cPn-kvt{S-j\pw F¶ VIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  27

bp-sSbpw hml\ \nIp-Xn-IÄ F¶ IXþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

{Sj-dn-Ifpw A¡u-−p-Ifpw F¶ X -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

PnÃm-`-c-Whpw ]e-h-Ibpw F¶ XIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

t]meokv F¶ XIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw A -̈

Sn-bpw aäp `c-W-]-c-amb kÀÆo-kp-Ifpw F¶ XIVþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-

\-bp-sSbpw s]mXp-a-cm-a¯v F¶ XVþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

s]³j\pw ]e-h-Ibpw F¶ XVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

hnZym-`ymkw Imbn-I-hnt\mZw, Ie, kwkvImcw F¶ XVIIþmw \¼À 

[\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sshZy-k-lm-bcwKhpw s]mXp-P-\m-tcm-Kyhpw 

F¶ XVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ip²-P-e-hn-X-c-Whpw ipNo-

I-c-Whpw F¶ XXþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw `h\ \nÀ½mWw 

F¶ XXIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw \K-c-hn-I-k\w F¶ XXII -

þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw hmÀ¯m-hn-X-c-Whpw {]N-c-Whpw F¶ 

XXIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sXmgnepw sXmgn-emfnt£ahpw 

{]hm-kn-t£-ahpw F¶ XXIVþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

]«nIPmXn/]«nIhÀ¤/aäp ]nt¶m¡ \yq\-]£ hn`m-K-§Ä F¶n-h-

cpsS t£aw F¶ XXVþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw {]Ir-Xn-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  28

t£m`waqe-ap-ff Zpcn-Xm-izm-k-¯n\v F¶ XXVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw kl-I-cWw F¶ XXVIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

]e-hI km¼-¯nI kÀÆo-kp-IÄ F¶ XXVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-

\-bp-sSbpw Irjn F¶ XXIX -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw `£yw 

F¶ XXX -þmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw arK-kw-c-£Ww F¶ 

XXXIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw £oc-hn-I-k\w F¶ 

XXXIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw aÕy-_-Ô\w F¶ 

XXXIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw h\w F¶ XXXIVþmw \¼À 

[\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw ]©m-b¯v F¶ XXXV -þmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw {Kma-hn-I-k\w F¶ XXXVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw 

hyh-km-b-§Ä F¶ XXXVIIþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw Pe-tk-

N\w F¶ XXXVIIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw sshZypX ]²-Xn-

IÄ F¶ XXXIXþmw \¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw Xpd-ap-J-§Ä F¶ 

XLþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw KXm-KXw F¶ XLIþmw \¼À [\m-

`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw hnt\m-Z-k-©mcw F¶ XLIIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-

bp-sSbpw \jvS-]-cn-lm-chpw Ah-Imi ssIamä§fpw F¶ XLIIIþmw 

\¼À [\m-`yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw kmaqly kpc-£n-X-Xzhpw t£ahpw F¶ 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  29

XLVIþmw \¼À [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-bp-sSbpw t]cnÂ 2013-þ14 km¼-¯nI 

hÀjs¯ D]-[-\m-`yÀ°-\-Isf kw_-Ôn¨ tÌäp-saânÂ {]kvXpX 

[m\m-`yÀ°-\-IÄ¡p t\sc bYm-{Iaw ImWn-¨n-cn-¡p¶ XpI-bv¡pÅ 

D]-[-\m-`yÀ°-\-IÄ A\p-h-Zn-¡-W-sa¶  {]ta-bs¯ 

  A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................. 

  {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

 D]-[-\m-`yÀ°\IÄ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. {Kmâv A\p-h-Zn-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

\nb-a-\nÀ½m-W-Imcyw (Xp-SÀ¨) 

2013-þse tIcf [\-hn\n-tbmK (3-þmw \¼À) _nÂ 

an. kv]o¡À:  [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-¸p-

a{´n¡v 2013-þse tIcf [\hn\n-tbmK (3-þmw \¼À) _nÂ AhX-cn-̧ n-

¡mhp-¶-XmWv.  

 [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-̧ p-a-{´n       

({io. sI.-Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\hn\n-tbmK (3-þmw \¼À) 

_nÂ Rm³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n-¡p-¶p.  

an. kv]o¡À:  _nÂ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¨ncn-¡p¶p.  

 [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-̧ p-a-{´n       

({io. sI.-Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\hn\n-tbmK (3-þmw \¼À) 

_nÂ ]cnK-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p. 

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hIp-̧ p-a{´n 

({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p.  



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  30

an. kv]o¡À: 2013-þse tIcf [\hn\n-tbmK (3-þmw \¼À) _nÂ 

]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡Sp¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p, _nÂ       

]cnK-W-\-bvs¡Sp¡p-¶p.   

 

hIp¸v Xncn-¨pÅ ]cn-K-W\ 

2 Dw 3 Dw hIp-¸p-IÄ 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 2----þDw 3þDw hIp-̧ p-IÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡mtam-sb¶ 

{]iv\s¯  

  A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

  {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ............... 

 2þDw 3þDw hIp-̧ p-IÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡Wsa¶ {]iv\w k` 

AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p¶p  

2þDw 3þDw hIp-¸p-IÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p¶p.  

]«nI 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

 an. kv]o¡À: ]«nI _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

  A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................. 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  31

  {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

]«nI _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡Wsa¶ {]iv\w k`       

AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p¶p  

 ]«nI _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

(t`-Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã) 

 an. kv]o¡À: 1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡m-

tam-sb¶ {]iv\s¯  

  A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................. 

  {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................. 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡Wsa¶ 

{]iv\w k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p¶p  

 1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 

 [\-Im-c-yhpw \nb-ahpw `h-\-\nÀ½m-Whpw hIp-¸p-a{´n       

({io. sI. Fw. amWn):  kÀ, 2013-þse tIcf [\-hn-\n-tbm-K (3þmw \¼À) 

_nÂ ]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.  

 Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hI-p¸p-a{´n  

({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, {]ta-bs¯ Rm³ ]n´m-§p-¶p.  

 an. kv]o¡À: 2013 -þse tIcf [\-hn-\n-tbmK (3 -þmw \¼À) _nÂ 

]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯  



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  32

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ:.................... 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ: ..................... 

 {]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. _nÂ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p.  

 

apJy-a-{´n-bpsS {]tabw 

 

k` A\n-Ýn-X-Im-e-t¯bv¡v ]ncn-bp-¶Xv kw_-Ôn¨v 

 

apJy-a{´n ({io D½³ Nm−n): kÀ, Bh-iy-amb [\-Imcy _nkn-\-

kp-IÄ k` ]qÀ¯n-bm-¡nb kml-N-cy-̄ nÂ Pqsse 18-þmw XobXn hsc 

\nÝ-bn-¨n-cp¶  k`m kt½-f\w C¶p-sIm−v Ah-km-\n-¸n-¡-W-sa¶pw 

k` A\n-Ýn-X-Im-e-t¯bv¡v ]ncn-b-W-sa-¶p-apÅ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-

cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.   

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hI-p¸p-a{´n 

({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, {]ta-bs¯ Rm³ ]n´m-§p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À: {]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

Ah-tem-I\w 
 
  
 

an. kv]o¡À: ]Xn-aq-¶mw -tI-cf \nb-a-k-`-bpsS H³]-Xmw- k-t½-f-\-

amWv C¶v Ah-km-\n-¡p-¶-Xv.  Pq¬ 10þ\v Bcw-̀ n¨ kt½-f\w Pqsse 

18 hsc \S-̄ m-\mWv Xocp-am-\n-̈ n-cp-¶-Xv.  F¶m-Â -A-kp-J-I-c-amb 

kw`-h-§-fmÂ C¶v Ah-km-\n-¡p-I-bm-Wv.  CXp-hsc 12 Znh-k-amWv 



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  33

k` kt½-fn-¨-Xv.  Cu Znh-k-§-fnepw ]qÀ®-ambpw k`m \S-]-Sn-IÄ 

\S¶p F¶p ]d-bm-\m-hn-Ã.  

 {][m-\-am-bpw [\m-`yÀ°\ NÀ¨-IÄ¡p-th-−n-bpÅ Cu kt½-f-\-

¯nÂ 5 [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-IÄ am{Xsa NÀ¨ sN¿m³ Ign-ªp-Åq. tijn-

¡p¶ 40 [\m-̀ yÀ°-\-IÄ NÀ¨ IqSmsX ]mÊm-¡p-I-bm-Wp-−m-b-Xv.  

[\-hn-\n-tbmK _nÃpw [\-Imcy _nÃpw k` ]mÊm-¡n.  4 _nÃp-IÄ 

k_vPIvSv I½n-än¡v Ab-bv¡p-Ibpw sNbvXp.  

 10 ASn-b-´nc {]ta-b-§Ä¡pÅ Ah-X-c-Wm-\p-aXn t\m«okv 

]cnK-Wn-¨p.   

 630 \£-{X-Nn-Ó-an« tNmZy-§fpw 6258 \£-{X-Nn-Ó-an-Sm¯ tNmZy-

§fpw A\p-h-Zn-¨n-cp-¶p.  k`-bnÂ 34 tNmZy-§Ä¡v a{´n-amÀ hm¡mÂ 

adp-]Sn \ÂIn.  

 10 {i²-£-Wn-¡Â t\m«o-kp-I-fn-eqsS hnhn[ {]iv\-§Ä k`-

bpsS {i²-bnÂs¸-Sp-¯n.  45 k_van-j-\p-Ifpw k`-bnÂ Ah-X-cn-̧ n-̈ p.  

an¡ Znh-k-§-fnepw {i²-£-Wn-¡-ep-I-fpw k_van-j-\p-Ifpw Ah-X-cn-¸n-

¡m³ Ign-bm-Xn-cp-¶-Xn-eqsS P\-Iob {]iv\-§Ä k`-bnÂ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨v 

Kh¬saânsâ kXzc CS-s]-SÂ t\Sm-\pÅ Ah-k-c-amWv \½psS P\-

{]-Xn-\n-[n-IÄ \jvS-s¸-Sp-¯n-b-Xv.  

 N«-§-fp-sSbpw Iogvhg-¡-§-fp-sSbpw ASn-Øm-\-¯nÂ am{Xw 

{]hÀ¯n-¡p¶ sNb-dnsâ \njv]-£-Xsb k -̀bv¡-I¯pw ]pd¯pw 

tNmZyw sN¿p-¶ Xc-¯ntebv¡phsc kwLÀjw F¯p-¶Xv P\m-[n-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication  34

]Xy-¯n\v GXv ktµ-i-amWv \ÂIp-¶sX¶v FÃm-hcpw Btem-Nn-¡W-

sa¶v sNbÀ Hcn-¡Â¡qSn A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p.   

 kwhm-Z-§-fp-sSbpw NÀ¨-I-fp-sSbpw thZn-bm-tI− \nb-a-k` 

kwLÀj-§-fp-sSbpw Akp-J-I-c-amb kw`-h-§-fp-sSbpw thZn-bm-Ip-¶Xv 

{Inbm-ß-I-amb P\m-[n-]-Xy-¯n\v F{X-t¯mfw `qj-W-am-sW¶v `c-W-

]£hpw {]Xn-]-£hpw Nn´n-t¡-− -Xp-−v.  

 [\m-`yÀ°-\-I-fm-bmepw \nb-a-\nÀ½m-W-am-bmepw FÃm `mK-¯p-

\n¶p-apÅ AwK-§-fpsS A`n-{]m-b-§Ä kzcq-]n-̈ mÂ am{Xsa 

AhsbÃmw AÀ°-]qÀ®-am-hp-I-bp-Åq.  P\-§-fpsS hnImcw ]qÀ®-

ambpw {]I-Sn-̧ n-t¡− thZn-bmb \nb-a-k-`-bnÂ AXn-\pÅ kµÀ`hpw 

ka-bhpw FÃm-hcpw tNÀ¶v krjvSn-t¡-− -Xp-−v. C¡mcyw  FÃm-hcpw 

HmÀ¡-W-sa¶v Hcn-¡Â¡qSn A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p.   

 FÃm-hÀ¡pw dwkm³ Biw-k-IÄ t\cp-¶p.  

HmÀUÀ......-HmÀUÀ..........k` A\nÝn-X-Im-e-t¯bv¡v ]ncn-bp-¶p.  

(tZ-iobKm\w Be-]n-̈ p) 

(k` 2013 Pqsse amkw 9þmw XobXn D¨-bv¡p-tijw 12.13-þ\v 

A\nÝn-X-Im-e-t¯bv¡v ]ncn-ªp.) 

  

*********** 

 


