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Adv. U Prathibha MLA

Project . , , Estimate Agreement No. and
Sl. No D PRICE D Project Name Financial Year amount AS No. and Date Date
REAMDHIN YWINaIRRDEN TSI DAISEDHIE
1 7559 2018/135263 ennLel @ afl.apmy” ~ 1mslanol o o @l 2018-2019 50.00 d6'36603gzgé?9dat9d
acrgloe R
A 215 DH@EEI0 WIB TR anday 20
> | 7463 | 20181135268 219 BN ] Fondw S S 018-2019 | 24.00 |96/3464/18(16) dated
anenleigs” @oanwlei frouTaual goday 15.07.2019
D 251H@FND WIDAIIIINICT § a15laHgamma d6-3464(15)/2018
3 7462 2018/135266 COMDo HMEINTS-a .agy4f- M0 Goas 2018-2019 26.00 dated 25.06.2019
a,mcg“lm” EINAITUIDNF chO1IBBoUT oo™~ d6-3464(13)/2019
4 7460 2018/135260 e ficionsar emony 2018-2019 28.00 dated 25.06.2019
A 1R WIBnseAS anda” 15,16- d6-3464 (12) /2018
5 71459 2018/135259 S 2018-2019 12.00 dated 6.03.2019
Al QA YIBAISTRIIRTH” DIB 0o dhio as’ d6-3464(11)/2019
6 7458 2018/135257 2900 (o Dodgo admutis THOICEEN e ) 2018-2019 28.00 dated 25.06.2019
AJIHIGE LHODn ITRUINWWAN ARYD afIV’. @AYo d6-3464(10)/2018
/ 7457 2018/135254 Sad. 0l aprta il ATy A oD@ Bdhglse 2018-2019 50.00 dated 25.06.2019
. 18/EE/LSGD/MLA
~ 1o | 0! 1 el & € 1l -
g | 7456 | 2018/135251 | “¥W oemeneoltiansio 9000l | o610 0019 | 21.00 | 98:3464 V2018 1 Apgi19.20 dated
GmAled TN outalmi-amIa flel ayg’ eniny dated 6/03/2019 07.09.19
@h BTN Y00 (DIn ISTUID IR Chadsl aldC o d6/3464(8)/2019
9 7455 2018/135247 el af 9 2018-2019 35.00 dated 16.08.2019
3IWakgds MU T3 MEW 8 Huoa” sy ' d6-3464(7)/2018
16 7454 2018/135241 o A G 2018-2019 20.00 dated 25.06.2019
Wouhed E 9 Ga 21 G )k -
11 | 7453 | 2018135239 | 7T TR T immameand 2018-2019 | 13.00 | 96-3464(06)/2019

B 19EON I @ISO FIVEINDT 6305 MU I

dated 25.06.2019




Name of Contractor

Status of Work

AS sanctioned.soil test
needed for the work.
additional fund for the
test is requested

AS sanctioned

TS sanctioned

tender invited on
02.09.2019 no bid
received

tender invited on
29.07.2019, retender
invited on 02.09.2019

no bid received

tender invited on
02.09.2019 no nd
received

TS sanctioned

Muhammad jassir,
Theruvil House,
Payikuzhy, Gchira. P.O.
9526123455

agreement executed

AS sanctioned

tender invited on
02.09.2019 no bid
received

AS sanctioned




SIDodhgio M qua anat’ 32,33 apmilapm’

d6-3464(10)/2018

12 7452 2018/135238 DMUTTSET el 99a06 4 6 1T G 2018-2019 45.00 dated 25.06.2019
S&HIWoadhBo MUDTUR I 17 enomsrl gas- d6-3464(04)/2019
13 7451 2018/135236 msanior o 2018-2019 25.00 dated 25.06.2019
@ ModnBe MR aue ancrw 43 d6-3464(03)/2019
14 7450 2018/135234 gy 200584 DE OB ETT @95 TSI 2018-2019 28.00 dated 25.06.2019
SHIWod@o MNPV IFW=37 - afo. ATV Afo
-~ ‘oo . ) d6-3464(2)/2019
15 | 7449 | 2018/135232 e IRTE afio.nDAV 0o, A o :n DT 2018-2018 | 23.00 | 5104 25.06.2019
enas{ angoaaom” gnaal’)
9 +12)hesmn YWIdamRn@ors sy 10- D6/2656/17/MLA- 60/EE/LSGD/MLA
16 5674 2018/21333 . . u 2017-2018 26.50 ADS /KYLM dated ADS/18-19 dated
ASWMIP NI BHEIHOPIT EOIW 52 03.2018 6122018
I WouhGo TN TUR-MIMICAHTT EGINN D6/2565/17/MLA- 74/EE/LSGD/MLA
17 5548 2018/8391 R 2017-2018 11.80 ADS /KYLM dated ADS/18-19 dated
eoanw 22.03.2018 22.01.2019
- - 30/EE/LSGD/MLA
A DR (WID RN - B AN kG0
18 | 5477 | 2018/4964 I (D28 ! Tlceeme | 0172018 | 27.00 | DORLAB/Mated i ang)18.19 dated
D20 T 208 gn 1y 220Uty GRYW 23.03.2018 23.07.18
- 72/EE/LSGD/MLA
) WochEla MUNBMTUE §o KBEMICS - HAPGo
19 { 3182 | 2017/130400 e e T s 20172018 | 25.00 | D6/363/18/dated ADS/18-19 dated
oo AT GINCADIS COIW 17.03.2018 15.01.2019
A TONYE @Ine eI onsau 15 - D6-1362/17 MLA- /5/EE/LSGD/MLA
20 3179 2017/130476 2017-2018 15.00 ADS/KYLM dated ADS/18-19 dated
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05.12.2017

22.01.2019




tender invited on
02.09.2019 Sunil
Chandran quoted the
lowest rate

tender invited on
02.09.2019 no bid
received

AS sanctioned

AS sanctioned

K.Suresh, Sailam,
Kallumoodu,
Kaymkulam

50% completed,tarring
work In progresss,
complete before
September 30 2019

Sree Vallabhan, Sree
Bhavan, Mannarsala

ongoing work

KS Anzar, Kinaruvilayil,
Pooroorkara.
Edappalikotta,
Ponmana.P.O,
3895402660

wark completed, final
bill submitted to EE

K.Suresh, Sailam,
Kallumoodu,
Kaymkulam

work nearing
completion, both work
and bill before
September 30 2019

Sree Vallabhan, Sree

ongoing work

Bhavan, Mannarsala
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D6-1361/17 MLA- | 101/EE/LSGD/MLA
51 | 3178 | 2017/130384 | aismiome gos - apriapavage.@aiagns | 2017-2018 | 20.00 | ADS/KYLM dated ADS/18-19 dated
(s,m(;\:‘m“ EDIDAIGRRI I - Aanday 3 -aandlod D6-1357/17/MLA- 111/EE/LSGD/MLA
22 | 3174 | 2017/130402 | ayerer asiemmanaine aggesaomonion ate | 20172018 | 10.00 ADS/KYM dated ADS/18-19 dated
oo 26.12.2018 05.03.2019
—— D6-1356/17/MLA- GO/EE/LSGD/MLA
23 2017130141 [Keyamiulam Municpality Word No- 211 2017-2018 | 35.00 |  ADS/KYM dated ADS/18-19 dated
01.01.2018 6.12.2018
o Chettikulangara GP Kunthalasseri D6-334/2018 dated |8S/EE/MLA/ADS/18-19
PO RDIEE: -
24 AL mukku - Kadavoorkulam road 2017-2018 | 30.00 23.02.2018 dated 29.01.2019
A D6-1359/17 MLA- |01/EE/LSGD/MLA/ADS/
25 2017/130144 pau53323"Ef‘éﬁffe'(?i??i?%c?lo 4| 20172018 | 20.00 | ADSKYLM dated 18-19 dated
9 a 26.12.2017 06.04.2018
Bharanikavu GP Ward 19 Construction
. D6-1360/17 MLA-
26 2017/130330 of drainage and concrete slab from 2017-2018 15.00 ADS/KYLM dated 02/EE/LSGD/MLA/ADS/

Kattachira thiruvikkal junction to to
Kochuvadakkathil veedu (wards west }

26.12.2017

18-19 dt 06.04.2018




Shihab.5,
Parayantayyath
Thekkethil, P.V. North,
Thazhava. P.O,
Karunagapally

ongoing work

Gopalakrishna Pllla,
Uthradam, Muthukulam

work progressing,

south P O, Alappuzha WMM Done
K.Suresh, Sailam,
Kallumocodu, RE needed
Kaymkulam
Ramesh.S, Sreebhavan, contractor
Thuilamparambil north,| accident,work not
Harippad, Alappuzha started

K.S Anzar, Kinaruvilayil,
Pooroorkara.
Edappalikotta,
Ponmana.P.O,
9895402660

work completed but

nameboard was not
placed, final bill
submitted to EE

K.S Anzar, Kinaruvilayil,
Pooroorkara.
Edappalikotta,
Ponmana.P.0,
9895402660

work completed, final
bill paid for Rs
1270511




