Uncorrected/Not for publication
1

MamMIA206mM HI0 Yo

(1)  avenid®” gl 016a R3S @alQaldmoonss  2016-ee1  coHos

@RE1RIaHUD: UMW (8RALMI) MNME A IBIVEM MW HANSANMHAAN

(@JCOOJo BRMANOCLISEBBRSBO

alSIHRI®]  alSlHaIdy  alleIMISHVAYBIW  EHHUAOJ, MIVAOo

MVIOMITTH 0o aldBRIOAMOTB:00 0o Qloeygd@gm (W af). O, MIdLIN):
aqud, auenid’  »olgl  01¢aPds  ©alQeldoonzss  2016-ee1 e
@RE1RIaHUD: GHUAMIW]  (6RARLMI) MN@ alBlNIMMWHBNTHNEMHAAM
(@JCOWo 6N BRAIMG1a{lasan.

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo moeagd@’l (@awa. Sl. af)o. BMINAV" OV, ):

MA@, MIM (JECAWHOD aflad@®IEBZAND.

9@)lan. @RYMIE" 200OTVAB M6BBUY: AVA@, VNI, HAIGT 016a]ods”

021QJ»0088 2016-0e1 6508 @PE1RINUG: cHUAMIW] (6R3WMT) Mmilad
9a10@ZRMIEN@JIWo EMSIN@IMOIWT MVBBRBELIY” ©.21QeMeaa 1(ag) maud
¢RI aMIM BRAIMO]q 18801, B3UdIMIEBUBABAMal” QGO JOIBNOID

D@0 HOMBHWIV]IBMD BREIRIAHUS: YODIQo BRMINMG (JAUBDMEBBSo.



Uncorrected/Nozt for publication
MO  WBal LAV O@JaNaHMI@ DalBlAIGNO®IE MIMSS
@@ggoeaua DO@AIEM” @BRY: o166 ]SITBAN®)., @RO1MNVEUAHANIGT DD
coalelvlcel)’ AWINIBNHNIMBo  BIMIM  ®IOYQRS @RYBBHBONIOHE)
HSMAUMIBBAN@. GAI. af)M. @RYA. AIWAICAEMIM @R) HhILILISEBRE 13
ngleleavy ceoe)@"]oe)m%i@oe;om“ MSOMIQW  alOMOMIGE A lOQIN@®, @R)
30e1021563BS103 GREIRINUMSMAS (@ JDIAITV QAUMAIMo aBdhe3uwo 1500 @al
DMO@26M” ©MRIVIGBAN®. LANT SjoanavMIsel 5 wmadme amad 10
O@RIMo NIPOQYS ERYSHUS BPONIVMIMMEIY] @IGIIY” MSEDHQo S0
O@AIMECOMIBO (m@goe;cfa @QYAICNR” Alawlod ©oweBrRs1Md MIaeHE>I6NS”
@RI MSODHWQo, MISH1QYBS 40 vom»momo @YBHBo QAUBOO DAY
Mleiled MIan” AGBRIMo  LIE1aE:IMElRSBSIM 8@ GRAIMUNWIEJAdEM
@E1RIaHUG: GRAILIGSI0 DBBO). @E1IBIAUSHMOS  BAHUAOTIMIW]
1L H U3 (GRENENCEeDIaplolile g ol @RE1RIUHBHS som@MIan”
@532J@IV]  @RYAIWVIAVAIM@NOM alvanemelemIas 1976-77 micwmglad

@RALIGHNQIV” HAIBBANVWA anE” (BallHOlo8HQo BR®IOA3 MSOMIal

aJd@®Eel  MVoNIM MDA dHYaBaVlelom a@o{lenomd  MIBG3Uo



Uncorrected/Not for publication
3
aele@aeol.  1980-81 miwmRg’  @TMo@®I@  @RALICHNY IV
OMIManlg” anms” Mil@3 MQINISHOWELIEjo MWATVE A ll@l2jalS@IMOE3
@R® L1900 Galdd:dh@o, L1010 milelload MNIMOED ol mie3
@RAI®OIa{l883000M0  EROIW2|®1OA3  GRSINOIMODITE  BREIRIAHGHBHS
CHHUAOIMOIW] 8@ HAUGINHANVWAB anMe” @BalldOla] Ma MIGaIemo
MSODTOIM”  GHOB GRALICHNQ MV HAIGINaNVWAB  aNNE"  ARYL1HAT
alUDIOmElo. @R® MADIOOIVIOD @OAN  af)LId  MVoMNIMEBBUIHE0
DIQYHIn 0NV (@ GRYER GRWIGBAM af)AN” MAOBNLIIBIBEBAOTWIo.
CHOB CHIABS oIV’ @BRYAZ” AV ég”cm” Qlel <bczcuosncﬁi @Rgzlorl 76-00 Qlda 1o
@®1a10Blaj@)®H000  eAV@  omIMladly” anme” @Bafldolaf @ROIGDY
QAIYQIn00BIRHUWBHH AVAWMIW  AVORMIMIVWA MVa0IWo  MD@IHHIMo,
@PEIBIAHUBAH TVIPaOIIYOBHI alRLD]HBo MSa{lLINEHNME NIdW O WQo
efloumd  ominlacly” anemElend afla0l®o  GREIRIHUDHABD  LIS1EBGHQ0
GQIMHRAM  ©C30cOMINSWIM” 1980-@3 5080  @RAWIGHHGIV

OQIDINANWA aDNE” @R alddVIBSD 1. enM Q0IWeEBRBIW

HOLILISEREITE  AUIMIMNIEBRIQ  TVOWEBSIT  B8@BaldS” GREANGHANG



Uncorrected/No; for publication
A@om]ignmesslejo  @REIBIUD®MOS  ERYAIUIIEES0  BRAIKRIVIEBBBO
ad@6mMMIQo AMAVILINED] RN ERADIVOD DUIOSHINZONHINZBS B3T3
@ROAMHAMY MEajogo MIBCZUWIBNITD BT GAIBHONIW QAUIY® MAOS
QMBall@d 96ne. @REIBRIAUMHMHS CGHUAMIMIW] BRE1BIAUGBHS B3
M1aMo EGMAIFo BRAIGHNY HAUGIANWA qVIMI™ gelnje el smiMlanlg”
aNMRBIWT MHMSIABAN Dd  BREIBIAUDHBHD aDLIEJ300W] AllMIEWIo
£21QAN®” MVoMITW]af’ MVACHNG @SEHo MOAD aloQI®, * An Act
to provide for the constitution of a Welfare fund for the payment of
retirement benefits to Advocates in the State of Kerala.....” aganoem:
MO  BREIRIAUDHMHS  CAHUAMIWIH®W  TLoNITWIa]” MIacG3
015030203 HMIMIaL]Y” af)am M alla{lESNGY, MO GRYH1H ERAVTVOMY)
@M  Al@BRLAIVWDIN” af)a  AYalla {60008 M3 MM  ALVMBGEO
QANMICWIUN A3 BHWIGIN. OV HAIMONVWAE DM @R, G@POIH0]
LI 1 qWial{of 0.0]600 SO WO nel@len BRX@A0W]

EITWEQSOD0NZBS LM SHORIW ERAINVD BREIRIAHHADH” MBI QYSS.

MOIMNIOM]H  NOID]T  ©0a|9q|OMIMWB  ERMINE  ABRLMANMS8E  af)Lld



Uncorrected/NoSt for publication
O MV2a0.210)63BSB0 enaMn’ mlelallejms., momilelo
ABaHdHaladIdO®Iejo  00Q0  ATBO®]  AIWBAIMo &5l Mlelollelss
@RAIBH® alQla00]HNIM @RYAUUWINIW MSalSIhUd MVI1HOIEHNMEMI.
06Ul atomm 14125-@3 mlan” 25000 @a1owe, 5 eleuom@d mlan’
ILILISOMIMMMVA] 2] D2lRIW B@ AUBRLMAT VNRIBHHIND HY1YWHROAN”
(@O AU HBBHWIEM . MoMNIMEMINNG  H1¥1M8  (@JAIBODIHB30D 210
630a010V@MI8, aflAwdMIB ag)aMIAIB HAICINaNVWA@ AN al®la{lassaniel.
MO  BSlABHCWI,  MAIAABEAUME] AVABHHI@  @HAN MM Db
@RSQIIABHHEWI §21Q0®3 O®13 Gal01e|8s QI@AOIMAJo
AR [le9H00JaMm@Iem”  ag)a  yallo {88356, af)BE@0IU3en03’
ANeolmo®@ 150 @Gad oD@ 306LN2NMm20W] 100  AUBOM] @R
MO Lo QI@AIMo AIBRUa[1e9H00Jam@Iem. @RE1BIaUDHHD
M0V HBINDTNIW] DaleWIWTHNNASAN DD NG MEMINSIajo @AM
LIWINEM BNINO 9alBaNesmmM@ 1Mo D206 GMIBHANMBDENS,

@RMZeljo QdRUIa[lASME®ISESIMOHI MMV MG HaldDRMEBBUILN

mlasLANOMIM” LIS1HSMN Dd af)FODHSYAN DHAOMIG3 @)W 1L8S50



Uncorrected/Not for publication
6

of)aN” eMIM  MYalla[ld83HWIeM. MIYATV0IVMTWIWIGIMIao  QIGAM
D HQYOS 70% cHUamIwl]ceiRo 30% DOTVIBOS

carnmlwlleaiaramn” M1es10lafllesmm®. 0mME1HadWo ald®)” MAIMo

QY QIO THUBHE @RSIruNIm VDB YOAITHNIND
AUNMICRIVTENNAISHRAN” alOQANENE.  af)IMI@  AVIWIVEMLNIBHS

MYACIVAMODTM” @& MISolAUYM@IMa8 alyaiTuo @ emileflefel.

MM 1EI88 M1WACTVAIMHAM AUISBOHAN BSE1QIIBH1OHHNIMNRBIGM” HM
enflel” eI LI EYN G Eeizleppl) 2010) @RI HDOHUI
al0ln0GIGHNMBMIWIZME.  a)NI@  D@CA Ml  EIVAMADIM

@DHWILNOD  GRAINNY”  alGla0I0NIEs. @R@IMININD NI  MOQ6BBUD

A@BO®OIMB M  Mmefled al®00®  MIQ@BUWE  AIBOEMOAIN
@1RYQIUD O |SH QI

@ODEa L] @RIV ©21QIOD GBRYSHUY EAHUAMIWIWIGE  BSaD



Uncorrected/Not for publication
7

SIMD® al0leUIWIEB®HQo  MOODIEBHWQo  H2IGQRNBMIWIMS.
2g)@3.0§)@3.NI.-OWGOWo  af)MBEOIUY 621Qo ailalwenRsIw csoe;o@qd(eog

OCS(T)%@Q%CB)Q@S ®191ejo 1G9 GRAILIGSEIEHNINGD (@)1 621Q)d:Qo,

PRIV 921900 o JOTWEA VW] GRILN  EMISBHQONINDBS  621QaD
@@goe;gma“. alfiGaogo BROMOo @@goeacra CAHUNMTWIWI@E Mo IfWSaf

@YV 633UI moamganm(oocc»’lgggmmoam‘i HOIMWV] af)sMo BHEMENIB]

QAUSNILIAD HHIFHBANAUNO AI@GA MY CHUAMTWIVI@ DU |SABHAUIAN”

®@B20MHH0)IM@IEM. @RYABS1HU8 21-@3 MO H® MW ag)LIN0IdHEB0
2Wla 011admlane M@ ~I1EHIMHAIN” al0QMNeOMEE;1RJo alfiGa]dgo

alel csoeaquoea@ep GREIRIAHUMHB  GHAV MSAMAICMI  QAUSHILIOD

M@3H:QUIEMI @@000@00’!%, BREMINSIa [o®HAM 6NI0A
SHDeMMU1elwiGa]or)o 2lelGaq [0ud aflel CHTYHS1@3 T6313U3

200K 1NLIMM” al0QHWo al@E@JIPIAUM MSADH QYo @gj@ﬁcm@” MUl

HMNZORHIMENA1HBHWIGM . OO0  MVAWBBRSIG3  BRE1RIUSHMBOS



Uncorrected/Not for publication
8

cornomlmealnsl oM il ERAIMOlo{lasemI®ean @RAIAG

MUY OCOMISSS *Sa0ST  DOBNIGIBTILHIMINIU AW M1elaldSHHud

cmﬂoexoks(ﬁs)ma@omﬂ%mg”. GHOS8  MVoLNIMOD eI (GTO(U)J(S@S)%O@
@RAIMOS CHUAOMIMIW]T ol (BalldHRlHHNMeOAMM” aloQaN MM

enfeNod BOH0QWldho C_RUM 1 U3 QWlles ODIEMINSIalo
@RAI® 0o {16633,

OMVHHUM 9-@3"(gh) ERE1BIAHD:ABHN” @BRAENIAWI G Ma0IWo MTI:d:"
af)aM’ aloQMOME. @Y @RHHIAATH: TVa0IWo MOBIB:HAAN alOoQANISOD

af)aWIMIHEMEBIMI, af)(@ MVaOIVWHAGINI alOMBISIEL.  &HSIO® @PE1BIHUD,

CAHUAMIWIYIGIMNIM00  aleMAIaM AVaNIWAIW] M@IHIMNODEND  af)(®)
@Bal@Iem” MBSHMO@AN  AYSMAIBBANILL  &SIOD®  af)dOMLI00
aI@1aNSIHWENIEM” DD  TVa0IWo M@H:Ma®aN” mileflaad 9 (gh)
Dal Al I3 QAIEMAISBHQo e alQflglel

0090@  ¢e3w™l 9 (gh)-@d ®@emm GREIRIMGAHH” ©OIYAIG’



Uncorrected/Not for publication
9

M@HMD@TOMa |G1WIem. @E1EIUD: coalellerly)’  @ONENO8

BRYHBaUHNIMBB  @JED D alFLD]  DQYINICHNMNE® @R OV §RNIW]

AM1G1E83H@IM. MYa mimBo HY1em alel QOl GREIBIAHDHTGo AQ

CORILIHU  GMSIGOH:ON  H00Jo MAB AMAVILINGHIM  HYIQaTMS.

DAINO BRYHBaHIHNIM GAUME] (JEDM D HABMIRL®] BRYAUUD NI, 63T

LIGHODIM™ @IOY AUGBAIMABBOIBHS NI@ED HOAVA]1F MDIZEHAIAMIOM

el olomMmm.  MaN” MO8 MomIMWlaflSeamogo  0fl30E0aM
coRlel 9Ud0a|RS 0L caaleldhglejo & 1A1OrIWO1TIGaloeje @RYO” LldHo
@alano MR SOMIWIBlEs30M  UOI]Hs ST LldHo (@al af)IM@”

AdaLla{lal o JOIO®IV]  HSANABAN  CRBSHUWEBZES]  OOTRA|G

ODHISABMMD@ 1M, GAIMEONE 1@ QLA DHWQo BREBERHMDMAN dHISHNIND®)

GLNEMIV]  HHIFODO®HIME @RAIOO MV  @REIRIHS: ®elomieely

@Y HBaU1HHIMINIU NIV MLlaI0GHU3 TUIB:AT1HNIOIIN®IEM.

290N, @RI MIBODLNBBEMIIUB  anME1@IMIMMDo  aleMo



Uncorrected/Not for publication
10

DHISHABMMDIMEAUMNET HAVAHUW 16-@3 al@Imedi” QIBaHOHOD DSB2jWOW

@Ro®Io  aJBOMIWIGH]  @JORHTITV MIBOHEMIIWB  BOoWOMIM”  BIGOI

aBaojo 14,285/ @al MOBHI@ HD0OMo @R6MI LldHo HBal elEldso.

@R D@l 1YV 100 (@BalQ)o IO EIdHo (B lQnow]
aIdetlaflenemo agmgs®oem. 2008-e0em” gmi” aidrvmal” Mmsem o).

EPOMIMIM  BH:0a):S] ABRLMAT EPMIVNINIMIEM.  (@JIG1MY" DSTBIM

TLOVED B0oWo  AEMORSI@  EMIAIMIBS" GROLIBICE  GPRWIBHS
@RAUHIWIHH JAN” LlHHo (@Bal, oJBOMIVWILBAMN  BIGOI  AUBGHO (0o
14,285/- @1 Mo1@3 ©000mo @6 LldHo  (@Bal  af)IMIBS]

AdrU]o {leanmemoam. MHDAW]  MITWH.]S HHOCWHO  CRARNMIMHUI

al0GUMEBMIWIgHMEesleje  MIEOAIMIMI®  AY1HNQeS  BREIBGNM
DOM 2 B06NE" 2 BHBSHWIEM.

O®IOLl  0OQITW  HI0Jo auém«s% ®0MIBaH1aloMaq |G1oem”.

00a0CHNISDHSBelo 09" BHISDBHSLJoGa 0] anucaosa’lg;lgg @’@goeauﬁ



Uncorrected/Not for publication
11

O®OMER0af aloan@;, ...provided that if a member is having
membership in two Bar Associations, one of the Bar Association

membership shall be given up. agoNesewslee 8@ coaleiIcaIg

20@20W]  H2MIBHIa] 2JBHNIMT  HEIQYANDIEN.  ERDCa NI

@RE1RIAUD OO MoMITW1 2 {1ISEGOMIs0 GJoallawad’ anene’
(@Bl ]e)88®6M” GHUNMTW]. BRDEHIME’ @13 1o
GLIIHIMSANINDB BRADNIIBoES] MD@IBIQIAN DI .

DOHQPI@ MYJWIMAIW HI0Y0, HOEIOMEMWIIAI" Bal’ GHOB, MM’
8@ @EPUIMIcTRgIal 50019100 MAl4fIgmE. @163 BT O(@JIGAJITVM3
OVEHM 4 (g)-0 BT aJNY GHITY C2I3TWOH0ME @M@ a member

nominated by Kerala State Legislative Assembly agamosel@ocd eom

Mam1donoem meWIGMINMSENe 8@ JDTINIWIH®W GR®1OHA} INMNIWI

QGO NVLIWIHBANDIGM.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
12

M G_BRUILM] enilad @AM Do {lE8IMNE®INSIa fo DM E)O10)
(MN2a0210 @M@ MARHS MIWAMIB2MEM MVEWIG3 MEEBOHMHWIT MI1G3

@am@(o”loiﬂ%i@oe)oma” MVoMVIM BB HH o MSHa ISHH Qo @mc%cm@”
@RE1BIAHSHMBOS  GHUACIM CANEIWINEMAN” af)LI00IBSBAGTWIo.
2f)OMIM@  @REGAVAWo@HAN AN CHASOMINLI GBREIBIHUD:, MW

GOaILIG SR8 @RAINVNOWABO ] aj MAOSHLI0A0TWIOJAN G
DOWMEBBSGo @REIRIAHUDHMBo MMLIBS  H1SAOTVO0  HI06Mo MMM oW

GOAILIHB103 MSA3AN QAllalWweERsIWw CHMHOS MoNITWaf” Hald®RMo

@ROIGMED® @GRAIA  GBROTWIND Galdd:aN  630QITVNINIGUAUNIENDBBO) .
Maflos RWlaHy@ @Yl MSEBMMHAIIM” DAVIWOS (@J1VWOq]S

@Vlawad” @eaM @PREIRIHUMNHGBOS BT MVEIASMOMIB30I] A lOATH®IW]

@RS QO™ AN,  GRDHHIME @R GG BWTaU| @3
@Rlallave MeIN@EBHQo  @GROTVWIMSS RMEBBBOS BB TN

(Tﬂ(ﬁoﬂd(lﬂ_'ﬂ@tﬁaOGn’%(goJOcﬁam) B00INVNINNGUaHo MIOT DANEDT HDEWIT



Uncorrected/Not for publication
13
M0l @MI@3  AVIWIEM  2MAIBINEEBUWIBBE:S]  BREIRINUSLTINS

OMQIW MLl NgHO8 2GINIAAMIMINININIW 3@ AVAlalMo e ldD

COAIRIRHBITI MIMOBCAIORIYSS «;@ggoeaua cmﬂoeamksoe@mg@omﬂ%m”.

OOQNHOS MOV BH01EH06MI  EREEISIE3 GROAIW]  MINWO|SHB:06NS"

OD®QL] af)aIM” alOWIGMI EHATHBAM BOAUIMVNINNEUIAHUANBIHGBD®. G 63T3
@Balo®]lcd  Oo®FIOM OMQPIWVT  HNZOHDHIMZDOAN  BR®  NOTVEI
af)MaloWOIM88 &S@  Mlelalds oM mleoamldomden  aqvewlsel

DOMONIIBNS @@goe;@’l@“mﬂmo OMBIZHMHAAN BRE <5<8m1g4laoe;omg" 20100)
milefloel af)og ce3LM1H:U3 BRAIMAI {l4]ed:0Ms” MIBTA.

Wla®l aflemo cRod2Imn gl Il ofl. GRWIaHI  Galdgl:

aquenimday” Hmilgl 016ajods” ealQal®ionss 2016-0e1 cHog @PE1BIUG
couamIw] (ee301) milad aflngo @RE® TLMIRE, GHAFIQOS AlAlWeMMYY’
@RPEMOHRAMM GRRVMT ERAIMA]q {1860,

MU0 l0amITd B@  G@REIRIHUD: of)an  MlelYiad  amoad MM



Uncorrected/Not for publication
14

MVAHHIBIHM QYo NIaONIMAa g NI WSHHABS af)R1001HOQ0o
@RRIMBBBHWIEM . @RERIRIAHUDHBAS CAHHUAOD IMIWYBB HAIGInNWD aNeNE”
@103 @RAMGHA3eM” Mailes mmﬂ%ggm". MOIOS af)MIBBMI” MVoVIO] 2
@Rowo MYalla(lo|@Galdnel alnE” @REIBIUMLE QAUSHO 00NN,  alGCHH
G003 WINIBo @RE1BIHMD®HAG AUMBANME. BRMIB AUSHO 2J6BBIW VDMAIMo
@REIRIUMSHAHD  MI@GA  ME] AUTBRIMASS. @RAIOIGE ald®1WIT3 IO
QABMMAIG ®1OO 6al01W QAUGAIMASBAIOIGM. @RE1RIAHHOOMN o l0WQEMIIUI,
@RAIAOHHL0  anldlGRl  of)aD”  GaldBlEs30;  @1B2JOIYWo  DSHHOH©I
@REEBYWONOM  @JWOMVo  @RMEANAIG0.  @OKIN”  9alQ  @PAVEAI

Ql)d06N806M° MM M(JH0o alOQYM®. SG@ GREISIH®HM  @OOEIE; 103
@E1BINHUBWIWVT af)MBEOIUE §2IYPEMINUT ST AUBAIMOJo WMENOD @RE@MIBo

al0la{laflsom@eaam aflengo @RYUYWa] 21aNCHNME BOAITVN DENBIB:0TO af)AND
WIOLNOBMNOYMIEM.  GIMIM3 M@ IMZHMYo JIR® QflaH®@o MomMITW]a]” VeNIlaHad

Qmmﬂ%ﬂgm“. @AM LIE1HNIHOMIT $HI0Yo MEa 0Ud @’oaom(s”lgd &151. @P®1G3



Uncorrected/Not for publication
15
af)M1HH MLEANIaHIMNE",
GNIVA3 @REIRIHUMHABH YAV~ AlBGaHBNILIe QAN OO |IF HHIFHNIN
®1@BROMN] 2| aBQ0Jo TLGANIHUDHONIW 0006 @RHNI Y0

al0@I®10189H208 M1BQJ2a001El.  ERDEAIIOLIMOHAM MG U3 HAIBIANWA aneme”

of)2Wene” @R eldHo @al  af)MD® alAD LldHo (HolWIHR]. MHNIOLo

HYlOD  1NAINOAZINAM  HILIOD @YU YO OS]0 WOOHDOIM  MOQOJo

QMNROWNEL.  NIaOMIMAQIS BRANOID) m@(g‘d@’] MAOSQME. MG |0Ud af)S’

QGaHo  HYIO @@  QIME oW B3 oﬂc;cmoamoesam%ﬂo ™Qo M 0lles

1@ am. af)aMOWILjo  MIeIafle|88 MolWIMS T QoJcs@ombd@oe)om”

@R®  MOZIVWISNIMBB ML TVAMAV” HIMIEBH Qo  (E@MNIVA EREIRIHUDHO
al@1eM1BEB Qo 921Q af)M® BREEBWY0 TVEINICUYBS 3O JAIEM.

SO HAUBIANWAB aNNEIGZ @RONMD 1o af)SANIAT MVIW]BNHICMAUIRHS 33

@PAINVEo &SI @D VAINOAA mmme’l% af)ON®’  BREEBWVQO

@REINMMIVAM. aBY Ql@aHo (@JORHTITVINWELILJo MBI G2l  EN6EBBUI



Uncorrected/Not for publication
16

Q156a0OWMMo BRI AUFIQENBISHEMHAATOO altl  GRADICHHQRITo
af)BMIS  MYalla {lEB3HQENBOIW].  af)MIWILle @EROMINGH MDD  NAINIHAY
@m%oe;gﬂamg. alom Ql@aHo QIHOWBS HILIVWSOIG3 63@ @RoWo BRSW BANMNS
D3HQo BI®INM §aIMIGFIwIw 2000 @GalQo 69600 AIdaHOjo OdGHISOMIGI
@RoUNAIEHINDIND QISHO @IRYUDIITVEOANIET.

MO®I® 015WAOHNF” HMIMTaL1Y” af)aM  (@JEWIWOo VVAIVWLIHVWIM” af)M 1L

QM MVoMI@1a] @RoWo MYalla [lB3HQMBOW]. @BR® @1B2]WI0 HHHIFHNEMo.

MUALPOD®  (@JOHKHT1V” MIBEOMMNE] AUBINAIBHS™ DODONAIB ANNZENEH13

@O Qe 9aldhd0MI6m. IO (mcmqug@ B8® (@JCWIWo ®MHANWIEM.

BRDGOLICIMOHIN  BRYD allB  @JOKHIM”  MEPEMAIGHS MV enIMlanly’
DDHIFAN@BOMMMo  MYalla lEBHQM2OW].  ODINHEDDOAN BRG1OM BB o)
W1oanm oalQIgems’  "@Rdal@ @01 af)INIGE S @RE1RIH®EO

Yool msegeMm®o 1961-0e1 @REIGIHS: G@RYRHIG AVINIWAE @PEIRIAHH?G

39105HQ88  GREIRIUDHMBOS MoV  aBQaje  BHOMOO® GREAI



Uncorrected/Not for publication
17

AUSNLITD®HOBEn]EJo  @J®]AUBaH0 2NV ©2IPISBBDo  af)MABMOAIS:AT.

DEPOT™ MOIDIWI@  OHIFHENIQYIM  af)BI0  HO06EBBo  GBBRVMIWVIEOS

aoeaomgmcm"lgm”. GRD G DOLIMOAN  aNME1OLI  BRoUEEBUIA0  BRAIMES

@RYUWI®ABBRB0  aflldlo@o  AlBJORLOIV  AMVDHHOIERUISBA0WY]  aload0lw]
@RYIWVINo  @al WMAVaOIWo MBI W @AD. R® DH ST EldHo
(B3al@I9] af)IMDo AUBOHO ML GHOQYA06M .

MOMOS afLld &HIOYOMIMo  @RoWIHICAIWT )N eI  alo@amlel
aleod SMAILNOD@IGMIMMo M@EVWHO HID6ERUT BQWSIHS MTIH1VWB M3

@PE1RIaHE:  VGPaOo  BREEBVY0  MVEIMIHOMILIOEMAN” al0WINB M3
@RYWa0lEBHWIAN. MEMINSIalo MIaOAIMA]g AAD] GHIAS anlaV’ @10
@603 021Qlgms. @AYl Melalleimeo1@an GREMIRENBS” aldln000@dG:0.

@BR®o QIBNO dTLEADIAHBHONI cGaO(OAOﬂT)U. OOJOQ%(T)@?’@@&U MUDBH0)\o

D HIFANIEMI @ROL1E; 113 QAYQIa0ITTHUWBHS”  @RSIVNIM VOO0

DHIFANIMBB DHWIGLI HDOHINE" BH0NJAUBOAIN” af)M1B®” e®IaTANILL.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
18

CHO8 MVAMa00® MIWles 70 @maIMmEDIM” DENNIY D GCHOS

@RE1BIaHS GHHUAMIWIEsB0 30 MAIMONIM” DEIYNIVW D> CHOSB BRALICHNQ”

HBHHM  AUAMIWIAB0 MIHHIAUQPM@IMWe  @R(EJHI0e  M1HN1QIWHA ]S
oV 663 £0)

@S0 Mmoo 10 vom@dMo aflmo AIYAIA0IR1G:U3HH  @RSITVLOIM AVDB:QY0

SOABINOIM” MW@ MO 1WEUdaHo RO D anMRHS1eIQ)”
OGN0 aIQaIdMe G IBRIM2fIgMS.  QAIBHO MJOVAIWVIZBS H00 006"
DGR  021QISB8®. a9  GBREIEJOVOMIG  AUSHILIBAIB  EMZYAD'

@@;O%O&GCMOU& mammmocrg MU0 Hoell@d MIO3HHIM aloldnemMo. MIWNo

alOlal  a0BLMNNIBH]NBNINE  DHHHUlHUBH MY2Wo  Q163B1OENIFHNINT

MIW1BBMM  OIDIWI@ GHIV MANMOIW] aEleNeMo.  2a00BW~ QIdHN1L)OS

21V aflSla)dh@00ad &YIQID  ofQojo GRIDNLSS ®(@JIaDaHMIaM’

@REWIHHFICRD®. BT 0eMILBAQ GHAV QB1EHEMHNH1M D@ l® 06eM1L3A@

Ao al0la] AMAVILNGHMOAMMIN ™ af)Odd MVINIVAE alNE” ag)EBIMIS’

mom1§§§@“. @RODELI00 MMM .  BREIOD af)aVo MEBEBHM HAIGINWA



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19
aDMEI8 MIMo ) OW” OBHISODOBIMNEI01H9H0M8 TVIWlHHlel.  HAUTINWAE

aNMEIB3  @RoNAIWAIBHBo  af) QW™ @RYAININIWAIBHB0 BRD  OBHIFHNEMo.
el CHIYss (m'cmmcsoes)go@oes)” OAIGINVWAB  anMElDLl  af)dVENE’

@RYOINYASLIE 103 MDD B(@JoaNaHMIB aNME”" BRYAINIASS NG mamcsoe@ggoe;cfaoe@”

MN@HHEWI  EROLIET3 HaID@RM GIVAIMAMIMIVT M@BHHEVWI &alQeMo.

af)AMOLJo MV afeNE” GBRAINOS DNBIGHIMOHAM® BT MVoUdWOJo  LIOD
306N, BRMBaOHBINVo M IMEHHOM HSANGSINSBB WIHDIT AMVIW W0
SHoemaniel

AIleS @E1BIaUHTBo MIW 3268380 @188 @JUYo alOWGHQNBOW], DB

af)©03 QYD1 I000® GRElEJIWo MI@E, cncumisa)ago MNIaONIMAa|g DAD 1o

QYOO 1QOALI00 JaY® QllaH®@o  MLoeNITWaf @RAUMOS @RE](EJIWo
QAUYSORIBH V@M. EREIRIHMNSMo  MIWIAEBEBo @MLI88  Oleelatad  Mmel
MUDa0IBZOHIB@OAN  BaldheMo.  BROMIW  TVoUdVAIAILIIDD  HIVIA6EM .

@ROTVIMSBS @ERAIGRHIW0 af)RINIBERBAMNE.  MEa0Ud VDALY AIWEHHIV1HT



Uncorrected/Not for publication
20

ARBOMI@ AN B8@ Gald3jo MYaflo CHIS®T GaldBla|CGaloUd @RG  RMEIBUI
@ROIIMN®”  al@/3U0 00w 6B G3LBS1WIEM'” HDMVoMITW] )’ 21@a)

MSOMI3, MIOWIM{IWEBBHB QT MoMVITTHHING, BOEMLISM BPRADUINSIBEBAM

@O 1@3 MMEBRUIAN” MVoIR1ASM 108383 @RAIVOO QIOM@®@Y’
al@/ 300 20w N6BRE1G3L8STWINM”.  @132|WIWo MIWIAEBBRBOHS AUOWSQYIMB B3

$H06MAINDILJ0  aldslol. BDHISTNDHBOS  MSalSlGHNBBUT  DU3R|OS

af)LNVISODo HWOT BRAIBHS™ MJIVWAIQo MaYHHUNIWo O16a 08T 6.21QIMSS
@RAIGIUD0  ODHIFHBHOAAN  GAIMo. DOHQIMMBBDY, DOW §M6BBBO

DENIOJOMIT  B01H9LJo BOMIQ HSHNIMW  aldSIel A MNBBGIEM.
@DEEEBOSAIEEBRISAS  MITWo  af)Galdgo  MMIVIAlSBEMIIPIEM”  ME]

OI®WeI88 2MIWlal®io aJeIBINDo RMEBBBOS @RAIGIUEBBUI MVoQBIH] ]

S5 Do. af)MMOWIL)o HIGENAIMAIW M0Qo MEl MIAIWIGE AIaMIgEssd

af)anolvlecislejo  AMWH»LIEBS10 OMRIVIBIMMIECNHENIWB  DOSIWIGH]
20gQllgene.

@REIRIHUHHOF MIG1HLI CAVAIMNE:LI0 BREVIAUBHOMIT B:001096Me;103



Uncorrected/Not for publication
21

aDNMEIGRIPBS 010Bat]d: QAUTITVoRIY EMOHO® A0 (B lWIV WMD) GRERO’
(B3alWIOH Qo @BRDIAIBHAJ0 BRI ILIWIGHEAY  af)AMI@3  ald  QAUGAHOD @3

H00NOIMBIT o) YY1 @RMWal® Bal af)N®  GBRYWIC0 (B lWIBH 1Yo
adelo{la). DO MIPWMIWISBS  H00YEBBBEM. NI HIMOLIAO

alo@amlel. 2M63BUICAIME] mlno Q1014 0M1H60H03 200100600
M0V 2JO@06ME" RMEBBBHS GRAIGINEBBUS MVoABHBBHQo MV JIVMLAIW
HOOYEBBUT  EHISDMIBHOB  CMNIOWINSADHWQo  O2IYPAN  aBQ0jo  BaOOMIW
9@)afatB  M1BQa01BBAM  BREIRIHUDHBHBEAUMNE]T DB 0Ud CBBLDM] §alQ

@RAI®Ola [la] MM MG EREEBWAR0 MaOIVWEHOAINEMAM HIQ O3 WIH®MIT3
®ABH00jalel. HNIQY OB AAD]OVWQo  WAITMOAMFIECN Qo  BB1HN TS|
@REINAB] 2O B:06ME" )3 AUIBBHUY DalTVoaOR1HB.

alg1ah RO al1S10I18W) a1GOMIGEHAMVABIVWBHHNOJo MIn0jo

M0G0k 10Be1nARG1:0050je Ald |A@] (WY, ag).0dh. mIoeImd): aua,

3-11-2016-moem” ™ 6T)_I'](§_|Bo @RAMIMLAIWY]  BHOB GHIABY anlayo

Q1§010000aVEIQ0  (683VDT) Mgl @RAIMGEIafla|o. @AM MMM



Uncorrected/Not for publication
22

OOMIBNIAB  21B2|W1@  AlOBSODO®HIMNE  alosm  @ERE1EJIVWEBHBLI0

DUIDBNINZOHINB6M VNI, HANIGT MO al@lNeMMPEAIME]  TVRWYHS
AMOOD:  ERAMOIAlESIM@.  MIaONIMOq]s  @RMIIB" 2000V  @6BBSBo
@RDCa DOLIMOHAN BRAICHNY all. GRWIaHI GaldQIQ0 IO 006880 D
niellond 820X  aBHOBROO Iamlgens. GHOBOMIOL!  BRE1BIaHUD:

MRaoomIM”  @REIAIMIENQJIMN 8@  dlmademlan. MO AVALHIA

@PW1HI0OMIT UMD IMVEUaHe TVPaOOMI® @RELIOMa]" 21alesaN  ag)olo

A_IVEBUHB0 @ely MIm] @ogm@@cm@’lm@g; MSalSldha86m” MUf1d01a|o).
@RAMOOMIT3 MMV TVEWYAS G@RYEY MIVWAMIBANIEM  TVECIASMADY T
@PE1RIaHD: GHHUAMIW] MR MVAWAIWVT aldlaydlaf @REIRIAHS QYO 1WIm3

DURalg KGO0 Gale)0LSBS] @RYMLIJ O IMm” @RAO0IBBH Yo

@RYMZLIN OO  c®I®  DosloleiWldo  aldrUlq (lesa@o amc%oe;@oam".
@RE1RIAHD:  GHHUAMIWIWVIG DB 0Ud  OHHIMNZAUAN  EBARVDINHSIT  aBQ0Jo
@WIMMIV®” MNIaOAIMIWIV BRWaHI Galdgl ayallafla]@Ealdeel @)ooy’

@YOoclesMM @Al GREIRIAHGHAHD OO @YMZLIYo MDA



Uncorrected/Not for publication
23

¢eBLMIWIM.  (@JIRIN @BRYEoEla]" YAV’ AUBHODIMHAM” DD @RYMLIYo
RISl All3§08100MV0 HY1EM® aJO@MI0ERAN YEINIBN MVABIWOMIBINAIS
0100105018080 allEGANIAH TVABRIVAN]WNA]SAUBHB0 HaIdDANTI A IS1HHRO]

alg101dy  aNBIWEBE1M3NqSIMAIRHBONINGS MDD  H(@JIaNaUH0d RINNIW]

@ooaled  epISOMIG3 oJ']S’Lg,JO?’](?SﬂoG&OO@ roowleslel. @RAIBH (@JO1MIV
MLOMIGY 1> MaOIWo M@3c»1 @RAINHOLSBS] @RE1BIaUBHQYOM QYOS

@omooesﬂoc(gceonoua MI@ECA  a@Q0lo  HYIQIBBOIB MDD H(@JIaNaHIMN B3

coaILIYERIQ)” &SN’ mmoem@%;. @®1903 BIWAIVIS" @OAD EHISHHBOS
@@(@(oomcgoeacoocm%gé OBBSAN0 VOAM 6 |FHWIGN’ @gjc%cm«»”. ODIEMINSIa o
MM VWG @REIRIAHD: MWD @BHNo MoMITWI ] DWAMAIIN NVOAIAIW
21@2]dhBo MVABHHIA DUIDBNISBHWIEM . @E1RIaH O @»0AS”
830a01V@M0I6M.  MIYRo  ER@INAG  @INIB®O  MIMeEBEIM3  AIYIINOM] o]
MNP OCOM QYo BHISO1HEBWYo Maon1H0l GMOIW QIS1He”
MWIEHNMBAI6M.  @PAId  VINIAMOOMIGE  M1BQJa01CHNME  BDD OO
@aow%e;mad@oe)omom” MY MVAHNIB  @RAIRHBB8  BSMAIW]  AVIYaT1H

MIOBRHUPOWVISBS  alFb@]HUBHH MRAEJIMILIjo M@ @R 1BHA1ABM@ .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
24

MABHNI@ @Y  AVPaOAA®  BRoWIHBIABANDCaIINL]  AVINRINIHNIV0
@RE1RUMHAB @Bl AVPaO@MIEMIGo  MIWAQIAIMVNGWIFe &I @I
@JDIMIRLD HIMTHBHAAMIEM” HD AVE ANUYdINVIBBMMD).

W] OIBAUMYE IWIGHM: 0Ng fl_on@BUd O®MIEI88 @A

aL10ERININ&HNIWo HNBIEo, MO @I mmmﬁac@m“ 6303 (eooglcs%; @m@@mn@”
GYWI1 GPMIM 633 OCTUOEI%QSHCT@ OMBIBGBMMNM @ 10 GAINE] csoJO(rmgﬂmoqmg@g

af)a0B;EJ0 MSalS] 1aIM3EAglHad BINOM MIMDEMBIG:E6NS?

@Wl. af. Odh. MILImM:  afLldaldasse  GROIWIQIIM@MIE, DO 1M3
MNIa0M0MAalS AUIDAD]  IDSOHAIS®IM, WAIGMAB MSHAISDIEM, AN YD
Qemlem@  @mlawadlead  amileciolo®iem,  dQaflo  6HIS®1  aflal’
2o amileciomlo®oem:. CHalLlo 8@ WAlBeaad M@0
Q121001 9)5916MI@ (@Jugo al@1a0R1IBRHWIE] af) M@ O3 H@SINIEMEEI0 DD,
@RDEBIMNS” NAUMIHATF af)BBOM  All21001 5] E10MIEJ0 DOMOO B0 Y6BBUY
al@1a0@1EB8M®I@,  @JEOI®la  BWIlaHI0IQMIW]  MINWeRISBBMIM
af)MBSBDOHINE al0lNIDIQME"  af)MOBB® MIaONIMO|S  GBREEBBYoO

@ROTWINJAMNDIIMELIN; HIVEMo  EHISTIQYAOW]T MEl MITWASS BRYSBIAMGLIO



Uncorrected/Not for publication
25

@6ER. M1EBBIM  BAIABIMD af)BH1MCal0rjo MV aldlal®m] @M1 MIem.
waledeaadlm” aG3 og)o%%e)égﬁm“ B800WA OISO al@laOG1EHING 2 IQ00JaMN
@UQOE] DD, BRI MO aldl .

@Wl. ofjo. 9003: MAMIWo aldBHINVNIMWo  OMNLIBB  @JUWQo  Galdrjo

2182]021Q)" al@la0G1HBMMVEMNE.  MIYOS IRV INHOVBS  (@JAINIW  O6NE”
MVoPRISME U  af)AN” @OAN al0®Wlo. M &SMo TVPaOOMIHG  @RANBIRY
0RISHHEEBSBIGM. @B o l0NMDECalINA] MNIa0NIMINIW aV1HEHAE, QaIyOE@D],
@Yo I®] o) MIAUNRIOGH  DSOlg; alddH  GROMENC  afdhaldH VAW
DSHaISLIHB06eM. ©M" QBIVEOMWo BBALIBOD] 8@  2l@2|Q" Mln
moe;cgd@”l a)mM88  Mlely”  @RemBY” GO HYIQearn”  emod
QA20E1E83HWEM.  AMe" AllBdNEOOWo BGCBAlIBOAMT  af) MM’ M1EBBBOS
@dQo, MRS CWIHIa] GaldHGIR af) M AIOIVI@ S@  2lQ2|Q, S
DB HLNM” @R6ER BMA1S" QMDD af)FHN6Mo. ANQLId0 EMEISEL BRODEId0
@MAIMNSHU  GalIHLIYBBOIWIAM. @B CMAIS ®ICYHN]06BEIR2jM” D
@@o al@la001H9H0M UYA12JdT GR® @IWBOAMD” MM (IO AU HBHWIEM.

@63R° AR IM” MOOD: af)SABCAI?7



Uncorrected/Not for publication
26

Wl of). O MILINd: VB, DD AMWOND: af)SEHIOD (@JUIRE]. D®1H0J

TUELIBIMN®HOS  TVoNITWI88 ME] GENIWYo  NAITMHAAFINVENS". &390 {1Q@3
al6M19aHF” OBH0FHHID alQim B3 caIZIWoeMm” 2WlaHy0]. @GREBHNWYBS 633
BOWWOW 03 QISHO mlgfleowlsss B33 @Jugo al01a0O159HI
HE1IQIMILI0OVIMBSB®” B@  al0lI®IWIM . HP1OOD  MAlosnIA - caos
960a0600s®IQes  60-00  AIBHIHODIT  NIaOMIMa ]S afl.awemiy.awl.
moeag:l@’l@go MO0 alHHGOMIGBaN. ©30loel B@W GHIBS GHIoaldrlnnd
93LISMOMIMo aldEHSOD. MYaflo BHIS®] aflan” RAVIAV” Sl o). 00£84,
MYeflo EGHIS®] RWRIN0EIWIS88  RAYIaV’ 9alelenuld, KAV @040
GROMVa0; VAUV @REUID (BaHNM &ZSIOD® 0Oa0CHNISM] aflal” RAYIAV
WIAHM  WMAWA af)MIQUMWo MO N aNEB U0 A lRELSOMAINIGM. QISHD
000 10000 1506M" 2l B3040 G220V n’ 633 ®00)0
al(@-3UD0WINEBREBIS al0aM®. M1EBRUIODSHNINE]Ll0 (JUIAOMBELTT @R
@RAM O la (86000083 czmrﬂco)oamcs%o RWlau 01, @R 1HM M163BU3
9aleINIEHEME; BRMIM™ aldh0o a)aBIM" MIaO0laHO1HB0D. MDD @ald3)o

@G3a00 6210B1a). D2]Q GUAHO af)§OD2JMB AJOTVIVNYRIWT NIMTWER]SO BN



Uncorrected/Not for publication
27

eMOM 1. MUl EIWIG YO AfIFIB3 CaldWI@BAN. @REAJIUd A l@EHIB af)GIMIS’
alOaO®, OMEBROG MV aNBaHM” AHM12{lLIOHWANIEM . BRE|IUd I M®'
MNIa0M0MAals VANV H0JM  GRIMVaflO®  UHRLWITINE|FOD].  BREZaO0
alOSIM®  BRAINA GHM1aISME" af)aMIOM. OME" (WAUCNIGE MITISBSHWIE.
O®INSHH QIO BOAINNWIEM. AMIM HEIMT HI0JBRSICRIY” HSHNHID
@RYWaolasalel.  2lwlwd  GRGIANV0je @ERVEOL!I @O  BALTaHYO3

@gglaflavaje Mgo MONUB HBGHINZEAIdB:6Mo.

ol.  aylend: BWIlaHI0l @RE@ MITYa0IVAIHEMANICEMI  @BR6EE"
aloQano?

WL af). Od. MIOLIND:  @REL MITMVANIWAINHEMANE] GIMIAT  alOGIID) .
[Q¥) av [QV)

@ugo al01a001H9»I03 qoowlesanlel. MOOS BWlaH 01O
VoMW1 2[ISEGOMIB0Jo af)dild: <égalm’l@m TMVoITWlaflscomosajo eerlleaglal
Mo QIWIMOHOD MoNITW1 2 [1SEGOmIBOJo M msam Mo RAIEBIRUI
@R INIMHOAINEMIMNBB® WIOMI@W  ERAMOUEHYo  MSWILIOm ®OOMI®3
al0@IM H¥1Qo. D al@la0BIEBM@IMS8 AIFlH03 MM waledeandlead

IO MMM Ds0.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
28

ol. 1H993:  BWTaHI01IWHS BIWO® MI1MMDo DENBIHEMo.

@1 ag). Oh. MIRING: MIaONIMAalS ANYAA@D]T @HAN BRGIM™ MDD lo

ODHISHG30. DD ceamng% 9alQOM MRS alglel. D M AllBINCODWo
N0V ODOLISODOHIMNZBS B TVATa INAW]TIEB0 VAIMBOAFIHZ ROV
M1ANZI Bz .

Wl ®I@BAYIE  @IWIHHM: V@, DONeS @U@ BAWlaHUOIQo

o l@@JOIBOMH@Bo M@0V  MYB®.  BWlariolwlel,  aVEI0NGHn0W]
@PALICHHQMII@3  allel @@g@agm". DQaIHHODo  BRDCAlINL]  OANWQ6ENS.
6D68136) (N Y6363 303 Do) QIAN0&A 1S0®3 @@  ®1AHBaN@I0GAIMNE]
@u@@magocoﬂ%@g 8@ ML 1MIQYM2081886Ss? @@ IM” q}go%gcﬂ @RWI1HhI00
&S] OHISOVZOS? BRI’ af)O0 @YBIOOM EaldBlo. WAINMONT GRS,
§21QEMOAMM” alOME2 U3 DDAUNO @RS, OalPlel af)N@IM” @ERAMONAL].
QRIDAD] DSOAISIGME, MIONIMO]S AYVIHNE HOM  O®HIFOMIFNS, NIOGH]
NINWOS af)elo @RYBBHBo @ROY1©3 @saug’lgmgi D Ga 061D
MoRAIYENZIWIMB @Y TVoRAUNAD HNEL] GHSlel af)an” MSla] MIBIEBSIM@IM”

ald®0o  @O® 2l8s] O2AQPM@IM S LN QMBIBN N LBHS ? cnellod



Uncorrected/Not for publication
29

GHOBOMIO3  ODCaNHLINM  @RARAINMBIGHG®.  GRPOIM  GAIMEIYss
a1@1a0202003\o NAIEMOHRF CHFERI?

@®alda el (Wl ocaw” aalmmlomel): @GN OO

a3 6HIS®MIVIG aAMI®™I MWD  (@JAUAOMHA  .2I0MNGEA]ILMB0W
MoRAIHOM MoMITWIa MO MHANeELI RRUINAD LS BT HAD OHISOM 1TBAN.
CMNOAO@® aMIM MIYWANVRWIG MHNIVJe MW MION. @R TVAWVOID
DRINAQ)T D0a] N@HTIWI@BIN @RAIGOS GalAlRI88 CHAV al@lCUIWIlajdm’
GUaHo ollBaIelenInaam. MECaldgo @) @cﬁ)%cﬁ)(ﬁ aflddale aflsieno@an”
D@Ll @RAIAHY" HIMT HSIOD  (@JUIEBBUS  DENBIOIHWIEM.  ®HINWVEY
99a0CHNIS®IQOS A1WIVWI Qo DOHHTWOANIEM aJB1W MLl 1S, MO0
Mallo{lE80N@° TVIQ@)HAIW MWD  (@JAUBCMMo  MARHS  AVEMVNIM B
@RAVIWIANIB:O  af) VBB waledenad”  &00LsS] NMOQIOWYI @3
BNV JOMIT  MSHAISMOAMMIEM  af)HMF  QAUISMAIV  @RE1EJIWo.  AMIND’
@REBWNS UHRLWITINA SO HWIE.

Wl o). OB.  MILId: DY  GBREEJIVEBOHGBLI0  AUBOO

@OWIMICOMIFEZST @OANWIM” DAUMOAMF HIMAND. af)IMNITI  aldlA1®]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
30

af)HAMM@ MVoNITWla]” 6NN EMAHOM Tyallafla). BPDOE:IMS” 6NN MM]
@y OfllaHOO®ICRIY HSDD@  HSHNIMW  BRYWaslasmmlel.  EHs8OW el
@REIRIHDHMHS CHUAOMIMIW] 1980-2106m” MIWMIB MVABHHIB @REBIHD:
CAUIMIW] @Y OMHINBAUMD. MY MIVA@JHI00 GREIRIAHHBHD BT
M1®  $HePAUWIDNT  @JIR1N oo 16012003 CHUAMIW] @RYMDLELIYOJo
al&1ONI MVa0IWAje MMV, Mlelofloel MNEJ;hI0e J RldHo (@3al
CHUNMIW] @BRYMELIYNIWIZIeM” M@BBHMM@. M1RIN@3 218100 TVa00WRIW]
MDS:IMG®” BRQYIVI00 (Hal®IGN. @REMINSIalo afld:1Erd Wmavandwoe 5000
@ollod Mo 8@ elHHo (Bl  aldeUlallaflolesan. GM D
smomlafNes myaflafla) 20Q0@ @JWIMeRlS GBEO®], af)MBE0Ud ealgan 30
QAIIIN®IHYQBB QYOI GREIRIAHGHGHH” YA QlGaHo QIOO HOAVANG” MELIIMSs
alRL® WM. S LloHo (B3alWI@3 @IHY  QAUGRAIMABBAUIRHNIEM” JIR®
OOIVaNA LISlHBSIND®.  HOAVaNAF MG HAIBNVWA anens” SOV Hong]
MVOWITVAWEBRE 13 MUV B33 Qo @R waledenadlend
@RoW1HIOEOMIGES] MSaflendsdQo falgo.  almlae 3000 Galoweslejo

DENBIBHEMHAMMIEM” NAUMOAAZ Al21001HBMD.  &HSIO® 8 alel GRoeildrs1od



Uncorrected/Not for publication
31

Mmoo A543 641’ 5000 @Galt 0IOO MIVAI@ HalBaH0d LIEHBM (@I’
.21Q)aM aflel @REIRICHUMSHM@MS. GRAIGHH CHUAMTIWIYHS G@RYVZLINATIM’
@RAO®QMBIV @AMl  BRAIGSBZS] @RYNZLINERUD LIBJNISNIMNT  D®1H]
BN DBRUIIABBWIGIM'. MHDAUNOW0 HAUDIANWA aNENSIT3  GalIOD)
@RE1RIHBH BB HAUMNWA aNNEITI Gal@BINDIM” o JHIW AIJAITVN GAIMHAM’
D MING3 ERAUMOa{la] ,LISOMIG BEM (@)@ laldH GREHAGCMY BT @PRE]EJOWo
A 10610) 1@aN0. @R®o &Sl @RoU1BHO1HBHWIGIN. QMH»Hoel  avdaflav”
@RYMLOMIM” &HeMBNIBSBEMIIR  @@1Bato 2000 @at aflmo 680
@PSPYHWVo  Gal@BAN  HILIOD @RSV EHNMNE Db GHMANIANT )@
QAUBHEODPM” MDD  HODLIHOTV amc%cm@” @R@ODHIMNE" AU ]
92191388 DHWIWVIAIAB0  OHRHIFEANMETAUTBAND. af)aMI@3 (@ JHHOM0o
6alB90algMAIBHS”  @2lBB9eqlgm @lo® gom@d eesom 10 adauo
OAIMaNWA aNNE"  BRYMZELIJo  MVICAW®I  allBaIelHndmd  HY1QHOIel.
D(@JHo0o CHUAMIWIVI@  CaI@BINAIBLH  BRYMLLINEBBULNIW]  aloRdQIW]
@RAIRHIUOQ SO0 ad:oel audalay” 10 oB:0emo@1 MReqjgomlwIgems”

OIEMINSIa]o GHUNMIW] @ H QYo alld oMo @RYMELIY63BSB0



Uncorrected/Not for publication
32

QI@RU1q {lasma@Imn” @YD H20W]  EHUAMIWID]ELIPBS  AGOIMOJo
AUARUIa[16636HI6m”. 2Q CAUAMTWIRHS1@d MIM0o AU ITYAIVT af)oGa oA
csce;omﬁ@mréoamﬁ o330 |SOMIM 2l ST CORIRIWIMMI®.  GRGIMIG3
OAD0WAB  qOMIEOSQo  €HIAS  a0IQes  s8@ MIl®  ®AIMo
CAUIMIWIW]CLIH MTIHIQAIM” aNNE" HONMBODIM®. @M1} aflvoaIoUdo
OO M3  aldIYOWEWaHo  EMRINOOD  MIILIPW  6H3S  a0lYo
QI§QIe000aVEIQ0 (¢e3LMI) Nefload BT ayafla{ldndo.

. 9. AUl GROMVaO: VG, GROBIG  GRALIGHNQIEM. @633

D@ 1WIVDOHIMNE” BREDI” ODIEI0  (@JIH TV ©21Q0M MVIW]ABHWIL]. @R681R
[QV] S [QV]

MOMYE"  ERYB:HWIEM, @] ODHILlo  HYleom  @es”  aflengo o1m<§
@mgoea@oam“. @]  ODHILIHILIo  BREEBRY  QISHILIOD  HHIFHNI]
MLIWTHENITND  HIO6Mo CNOHOTOWQBB  af)BEOIWHANG" B0V

Galdd:CnI, BRMLI @SB’ ceﬂgcso?

@Wl. af). Ok meind: aqud, TVEMNE §alQ)  GHILILISONILIBSI®Y

HIgHWIEL allaM1S” @RIV 21QmM@IM” msaualel. OAUGINWAB aN6NZMIWS]

MINWOS" HRHIFONIZSS D d1g0. DM’ WIOGITW GSAVAYANBIOYSHWIE].



Uncorrected/Not for publication
33

). . avl. eRoaVan: auvd, 25 OD»Llo (@JRIMN ©2IQ @RAICHNY”

21OV ABAN. alloaN @RI OBDHICIo (@JOKHTINV HalIad qmvowlassanlel.
GR@1MEUaH0 G1MY §2IQYPE, U3 QA3 HILIOC @oq 103 @114 3156007

Wl of). Od. moeind: avd, 20 o3:eIcomYSS® @150 WIHG®IT

snjevlggalel.

Wl @lmalemid ©IWIR)U: aua, @PRELYIAIH 0o

CHIGBRAELY I IHMONINBD  AVAQSIIVILNGIHBEMIIUB af)o.af)@.af). @RYWIDTI
@RAIGHS OalMat  eIElHB0.  alddH  DAOS M@0 GR® &IgMMIE]
o) MBB®IM” (@JUgo.

W af). O, NIDLIAG: AVAE, GBRVMI af)FHREMINNT MDNIWT MIMWHAIS

SSM@ 3»0036ES16RIQ” :SHndo. 2000 @al Q12J06M” o JDEHHEMBGY. TVHAYZ’
921QIN®°  MINAG  HVeMAVILNM.  AVOIYAG  alQAN  HOLIPLIgo  MI@o
@Y OM1@3 MM Y10, NINHNTQYBB 500 463BUIHE)” mgrw’log%maoceﬂ%.
GHUAMIW] D HHWQo a2l 1Mo @RYAOLIEBBSB0 adeulaflesamom”
@RYMa I NHAIW] CAHHUAMIWIWIGRIEN88  AMGAIMAJo  QIBRUIABHWIEN .

QIHNILIOWY I @3 Al 1a630M OAUGINWA momilead D nelallod



Uncorrected/Not for publication
34

0920CHNISHIVIBR 15 @alQo 1 @HHISTIVIT 10 @Baliaoem. @@ 50

@alQo 25 @Galno] aldruleso. @REBOM MABH &SN ERYMZLIYo
DHIME HOIANAY DBHIFHNIMo @emjeldHo @Bal 10 eloHo (@HBalwods]

ARV (186000 MVIWIH0.  BRDGAIIGEAI 15 OD»ILlo Bl @RYIZLI o
caIeMEaM” aesemowd 14,450 @Gaiwowi@mmm  @rBje  (J@10I@ao
>1510008103 6 @& 25,000 Ha1wien]l adetla{le8e:@iem”.  GRMIV®
CNOO M3l @H MOIOA  BINAIW] ceﬂgo. 60000 OAIMANWA anmz’
CAINMEAMIM” 963w lesMeme 13 15 m@osu(mﬂm%dm af) @WIGMI DBBD®
@M’ 25,000 @ol alaf’ S1gM@I0Gles0. DO addaRAHEMAT” AN
alo@aMIel  af)ANI@ aJO®IVW] OB caaleIVIcelQ” AUMBINAUIBGHB0 (@JEDYdslal
QAU@BRIMALIOD AE1LIMIBEB0 RTONOOM]IM BT AROHHUID®Io OHHIFHBAM
MOEIN@ MIEINMI®. DD Daf)dHEaPIM @RYR0W] oc(gcmasﬂm” af)R100IBOHS WV

BOWAMIAMNBB MVaNIWAENEBIHENHAAIN” @REAGO1H630M0.

o). Weed: Wl @yMNE" 2000TVM @RS, @PEBWOS 1(ag) maud

- g
GR_BULMI @___j% G)QJQ(TTO(SGT’@O !

©l. BRYMNE" 20000V M6BBUY : MVAE, @JTY @mc%mﬂ%.




Uncorrected/Not for publication
35

o). 1eed: @l @RME" 20eeaTVM MBS GRAIMAlaflal 1(ag) maud
GR_RLWM1 MR M1RIMA]2[1G1H630M.

@I afl. GRYIHI Galdq), @PEBQES 2(mil) mmId 6EEL®] JaY’
621QMDEEN20?

@I all. BGRWIaHI Galdgl: MVE, (JUY OalQanIel.

ol. eed: W] afl. EGRWIHI Galdg] GRAIMAIaflal 2(enl) maud
GRBLM] MVRWAS BRAAMICWISEES] alladalell aflelasamn.

qenier” HoIGl 616a0dS” ©21Q J»oass 2016-0e1 cHH08 @RE1BIUG
caHamlwl  (ce3w®1) MM  alBlWEMMUHANSHNINHNAD (@ JECAWHDTD

@RMELAs3aMAId

@ 1eilasanald

@JGO®o VR BP0 1@ 2flA1HE3ND.

Mil@3 alBlWaMMW B HHFHBD.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
36

AU |D1019)88 al@1NEM®

Q6M2do Qldal”

Shri N. Shamsudheen: Sir, I move the following amendments.

108. In Section 2(a) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 2(1),
the word® actual” shall be substituted with the word “ real” .

116. In section 2(a) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 2(i),
after the figure “ 27 add the words “ and list maintained by Concerned
Bar Association” .

127. In section 2(a)(b) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(ii), substitute the word “ effective” for the word “ efficient” .

130. In section 2(ga) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(iii), substitute the word “ real” for the word “ actual” .

108-20 Qo lad  VOIWIV  (EIGITY"  af)MOSS@OM
@Y all® (@RI af)MIM”  alOEOMIFSI®.  GRMIGMHEHIUY
@M’ @BRYaPWIS88 AW Ol (@RI GRYEIMIMES
92101 GBROMIWITM’ af)M1ERBB®". BRDEAIE! 116-00 Qld:a(I@3,
NI0B HVeMAVIG HAVTIRWINM OalQan £la¥ledeqe s GRE1BIAHG:AQ
ag)an’ aloQan. @REMINSIa]o BHENMIGAVENIAL” Q01kIG)

@REIVINVIGW UM ONIW] anIWla{lassan@laealens]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
37
ap®lmewaro 'and list maintained by Concerned Bar
Association’. og@” MDA  @REIVINVICWUMILINEEMI (@I,

v

H2IQAN® @) 6NI0@ @REIMVITVICWaHO ] eflay 5]
a 1016 Wlendo. IO @REIVITVIcwaem Bar and bench is court
allos Mmoo  ayalla(la|DEaldnLIWIea. E@WlaHuyo1Qes
B0WMIeM” @REIRIHUDHMBo. @P®OIeE” 'and list maintained by

Concerned Bar Association' «f)@amo@ @)oo MaMIIalsasso.

@R® BRALTaHMELINW] &S1G2|BBHNHME®IGM.

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments.

110.  In Section 2(a) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause  3(1),
for the words “ at least” substitute the word “ atleast” .

126. In section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principle Act by clause 2(ii),
before the word “ efficient” add the words “ proper and”

Shri Anoop Jacob : Sir, I move the following amendment.

112.  In Section 2(a) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause  2(i),
for the word “ five” substitute the word “ ten”

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

113.  In section 2(a) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause  2(1),
for the words “ five vakalaths per year by an Advocate” substitute the
words “ five vakalaths per year by a person” .



121.

131.

Uncorrected/Not for publication
38

In section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principle Act by clause 2(i1),
() for the word “ providing” the word “ imparting” shall be
substituted.

(2) for the words “ to enable them to give efficient legal service to the
people” substitute the words “ for proficiency in their legal service” .

In section 2(ga) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 2(ii1),
substitute the words “ actual practice” with the words “ the legal
profession.

13

131-00 aimafld  2(ga) eaveumlod 'who 1s not in actual

practice agan®” who 1s not in legal provision' agamn” @BV

0 21QEMAAIN” BRE AL HBHWIGM .

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

115.

In section 2(a) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 2(i),

b

insert the words “ of Kerala” between “ Bar Council” and “ in

Shri K. C. Joseph : Sir, I move the following amendments.

117.

119.

129.

134.

In section 2(a) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause  2(1),
add the following proviso:
“ But this shall not have any retrospective effect” .

In section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 2(ii),
for the words “ Advocates Academy” substitute the words “ Judicial
Academy” .

Delete the section 2(ga) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 2(iii).

In section 2(gb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(iii), delete the word “ practising” .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
39

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

118. In section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 2(i1),
the words “ Advocates Academy” shall be substituted with the words  and
symbol “ Advocates' Academy” .

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment.

120. In section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principle Act by clause 2(ii),
after the words 'Bar Council' the word 'Kerala' shall be added.

Shri. K. M. Mani : Sir, I move the following amendment.

128. The section 2(ab) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(i1), shall be recast as follows
“ (ab) 'Advocates Academy' means the academy established by the Bar
Council of Kerala for providing training to Advocates” .

alSlahe0m] alSl®HaIdW  allGANISHTVAYBIVWEHHUA0Je  MWANJo
MVOoMYIATHH0Jo 2 103eIHAMRO13HI0 0jo m@H@’]

(W) o). O MLI®M): aVd, MOMEIIo m']@)OJ&HOCQﬂ NINWES’

MA@ aldaf 1Y BGaldqlgomlwigssmoem. 108-eel 'actual practice’
a)M@ MmNA  HDIMBAVIEE  MaUBaHISBAN  al3moem. @@ real

(13

af)MOBNIM alglel. “ at least” substitute the word “ atleast” agomo”
@108lo1@ W 2al QlOM®IEeM.. DD OOQHOBIOH) BHNZal1S19]00IMmss®”

el I MdeMm:. GERUVM1HO8IMo TUfldh0olasamlel.

o). e93: . ag)M. aHomy31m™ GRAIM@lafla) 108, 116, 127, 130 agyam?



Uncorrected/Not for publication
40

MMIB RV 1HU3 MR MTBIB01afld1As3aM.

W ago. 2003 @AU®Glalla) 110, 126 agyaml maud 6e3L®I®HUW auve
M1EIBH0] 2fl@1Hs30M.

@) @Ml cReomi’ GRAMGIafla)  112-00 ®maud eV ave
M0 01 2f101H6300.

@l all. afll. wRIBB GramGlafly 113, 121, 131 agaml ®maud
GRBULM1HU3 MVR MTRIM®1afldlHs30M0.

O@Joan. @RYMNG" 2000VM @B @RAIMGla{la] 115-00 MMId ee3VI®I
VR MTEIMH A1 aflalH630.

Wl o&. aUl. @RIMVan” ERAIMGlafls) 117, 119, 129, 134 agam1 maud
GRBVLMIHU3 MVE MBI A1 2[1@1HB.

. 0eom8lod:el @oell ERAUMGIa(la] 118-20 maud ee3L® ave
M1EIB0]2fl01Hs30M.

@l epBAd aqLIBE GRAI®Elafla] 120-00 ®maud 63V ave
M1EIBHH0] 2fl@1H630M.

Wl od. ago. @M1 GRAMAlafla) 128-20 mmud es3L®1  avE



Uncorrected/Not for publication
41

M1IB0]afl01Hs30M0.
@620 Qldsa| Mol BIVAISHIMHAIM (@JUIOHOID
@RMBLNH83aMAIA. ...
@J®&elasamald...........
@aN2J0 Qldzq| MIIENO3 BINMIGHEMHRAM (@JUo TVE BRoW1B:@]).
©6N2J0 Qldha | milefloa) oW1 d@lesm.

QaM0 Qldhra |

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments.

137.  In section 9(2)(gh) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 3,
the word “ Advocates” shall be substituted with the word and symbol
“ Advocates” .

150. In section 9(2)(gi) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 3,
after the word “ rate” the words “ and period” shall be added.

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

139. In section 9(2)(g1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause (3),-
(1) for the words “ three” the word “ Two” shall be substituted.
(2) For the words “ thirty” the words “ Thirty five” shall be
substituted.
(3) for the figure, symbols and words “ 1,00,000 (rupees one lakh)
substitute figures, symbols and words “ 1,50,000 (rupees one lakh and
fifty thousand)”

149. In section 9(2)(gi) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 3,
for the figures, symbols and words “ 1,00,000 (rupees one lakh)”
substitute with the figures, symbols and words “ 1,20,000 (one lakh and
twenty thousand rupees” .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
42

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

151.  Section 9(2)(gi) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 3
shall be recast as follows:
“ (gi) to provide stipend to advocates who have less than two years standing
at the bar, who have not attained the age of thirty years and who have an
annual income of less than rupees 1,00,000 (rupees one lakh); at  the
rate determining the Trustee Committee from time to time, and  approved
by the Government” .

o). aVleed: 142, 143, 144 a1 omid ce3ud&ud 141-00 maud

eeBL™IE® @elyoje  145-00 mmud eerw®l  146-20 MM @RV’

@eI0INIO@IMIGE @GRAI BRAIMG]q {lesoemzmIol.

alS1H R0 al151018WY) af1GOMIBHAVABIVWEHHAOJo MmN
VOoMYIATHH0Jo 1082190030100 §0Jo m@H@W

(W) o). O, MILIM): VB,  GRENGHABIMMo MVI1B:GlosaMILL

W BeMEBI03:¢] @Rell ERAIMGIa{la] 137, 150 agiam1 maud ee3L®1H:u3
VR M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.

@l afl. afl. WRIBM GRAIMGa{la) 139, 149 agyam1 maud RV &:UB
VR MTEIMH A1 aflalH63M0.

9@Joan. @RYMIZ" 2000MVM ®6EBUW ERAIMGIa(la] 151-00 MIUB GERV®I

MR MRIMH 01 2[1@1H680M0.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
43

BN Qldsa| MIElO0d BONMISHEMHRIM (@JUIODD
@RMZLIAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®&zelasamala...........
QAMIo Al MIBlead BINAIBHEMOAM @JUo MVE BRI 1E:@1a).
QMoo Qldsq | Mmileflond fonmowlalesm.

MOELIdo Aldsa |

Minister for Welfare of Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes, Backward

Classes, Law, Culture and Parliamentary Affairs (Shri A.K.Balan): Sir, I

move the following official amendment.

240: In Section 15(1E) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 4(c), after the existing proviso the following shall
be added:
“ Provided further that an Advocate who has been admitted to
the Fund under sub-section (1E) shall be eligible to claim
only up to ten years of his previous actual practice.”

o JO®IW]  @ERAWICHHY” CHUAMTIWIWIG  @aI@BAN  QIE1LINIBHS

aadsoelajomielyo 10 AI3a1000 a1d121®q|s@H@em”. 10-25 aldauaowlge

Galdamlsenzoxlel. 10 edoelo oNILILG  ADISHBIMD MEIIWI01H630.
[\ [\ [0



Uncorrected/Not for publication
44

@@ BeIem” 15(1E) eapd cauamIuI@ oIl  GRrownEBREIw]

Cal®BaN  @BREIBIHUDHABHS alomoalw]l 10 alBao a®@® 0MBHoel  audaflay”

(20O M@EHAMN@TMIEM 2 JDHTHWIT H(@JINHAUGCIVI HEHIMZAUTBAND.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

152.

154.

156.

168.

169.

172.

188.

192.

In Section 15(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause
4(a), after the words“ in any court” insert the words “ tribunals, and
other legal authorities” .

In Section 15(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 4(a),
the words “ Secretary of” shall be added in between “ apply to” and
“ the trustee Committee” .

In Section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause
4(b), insert the word “ pension” after the words “ if such pension is
eligible for”

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), for the words “ five thousand” substitute the words
“ ten thousand” .

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), the following words shall be added at the end,
“ or on the trustee Committees unanimous decisions” .

Section 15(C) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause 4(c)
shall be recast as follows:

“ (1C) A member of the fund who is not in actual practice shall be deemed
to have been suspended from the fund” .

In item (i) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by
clause 4(d), for the words “ Five hundred” substitute the words “ One
thousand” .

In item (ii) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ and five hundred” shall be inserted after the



197.

205.

200.

Uncorrected/Not for publication
45

words “ One thousand” .

In item (iv) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ Two thousand and five hundred” shall be
substituted with the words “ Three thousand” .

In the proviso to section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (d), the word “six” shall be substituted with the word “ten”.

In Section 15(13) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act, by clause
4 (e) the words “ two thousand rupees ” shall be substituted with the
words “ the amount as may be fixed by the trustee committee” .

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments.

153.

157.

160.

184.

202.

207.

In Section 15(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause
4(a), after the word “ court” insert the words “ tribunals, appellate
authorities, Lok Ayukta” .

In section 15(1A) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(b), the words “ kind of retirement benefit” shall be substituted with the
word “ pension” .

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), the words “ five years” shall be substituted with the
words “ nine years” .

In the proviso to section 15(1E) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by clause 4(c),

(1) The word “ ten” shall be substituted with the word “ five” and

(i1) The words “ or unless the voluntary cessation of practice is due to any
permanent disablement” shall be added at the end of the proviso.

In the proviso to section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (d), after the words “ senior Advocate” the words “ and
who is a member of the  fund” shall be inserted.

In Section 15 (13) proposed to be substituted in principal Act by
clause 4 (e), the word “ suspends” shall be substituted with the
word “ withdraws” .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
46

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendments.

155.

171.

175.

186.

189.

193.

206.

208.

In Section 15(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 4(a),
shall be recast as follows:

“ (1) Every practising Advocate in any court in the State and being a member
of a Bar Association may apply to Trustee Committee for admission of
the fund in such form, as may be prescribed” .

In section 15(1C) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), the words “ of Kerala” shall be added after the words “ Bar
Council” wherever it occurs.

In section 15(1D) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), after the words “ Bar Council” the words “ of Kerala” shall be added
wherever it occurs.

In item (i) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by
clause 4(d), the words “ Five hundred” shall be substituted with the
words “ Three hundred” .

In item (i1) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ One thousand” shall be substituted with the
words “ Seven hundred and fifty” .

In item (ii1) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ Two thousand” shall be substituted with the
words “ One thousand and five hundred” .

The proviso to section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (d), shall be recast as follows:

“ provided that an Advocate designated as senior Advocate under the
Advocate Act, 1961 (Central Act of 25 of 1961) shall pay an annual
Subscription to the fund at the rate of eight thousand rupees” .

In Section 15 (13) proposed to be substituted in principal Act by clause 4
(e), for the words “ Bar Council” substituted words “ Bar Council of
Kerala” .

Shri. A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendments.




161.

191.

Uncorrected/Not for publication
47

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), the words “ five years” shall be substituted with the
words “ ten years” .

In item (ii) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ and two hundred” shall be inserted after the
words “ One thousand” .

Shri. K. Muraleedharan : Sir, I move the following amendments.

162.

187.

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), delete the words “ retirement benefits” .

In item (i) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by
clause 4(d), for the words “ Five hundred” substitute the words “ Six
hundred” .

Shri Anoop Jacob : Sir, I move the following amendment.

165.

In the proviso to section 15(1A) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by clause 4(b), for the words “ five thousand” substitute the words
“ eight thousand” .

Shri N. Samsudheen :Sir, I move the following amendments.

170.

174.

194.

In section 15(1C) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause
4(c),

(i) Insert the words “ is not in actual practice” after the word “ who” .

(i1)) The words “ and no annual subscription shall be levied from him
during such period of suspension” shall be added at the end.

In section 15(1D) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), for the words “ included in the Ilist” substitute the word
“ enlisted” .

In item (iii) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ Two thousand” shall be substituted with the
words “ One thousand and five hundred” .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
48

196. In item (iv) of section 15(5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(d), the words “ Two thousand and five hundred” shall be
substituted with the words “ Two Thousand” .

200. Initem (vii) of section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (d), the words “ Four thousand” shall be substituted with the

words “ Three thousand” .

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments.

173.  In section 15(1C) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), after the subsection (1C) insert the following proviso:
“ Provided that a member of the fund may opt retirement benefits at any time
after five years of his admission as a member of the fund, but shall not be
eligible for re-admission to the fund”
“ Provided further that a member of the fund shall have the right to opt for
lumpsum amount up to the limit of fifty percent of the subscription paid by
him after the completion of 20 years of membership” .

176. In section 15(1E) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), for the words “ a member of” substitute the word “ joined” .

182. In the proviso to section 15(1E) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by clause 4(c), for the word “ ten” substitute the word “ five” .

185. In section 15(1E) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4(c), add the following proviso:
“ provided that such member shall have the right to pay the amount in four
instalments” .

Shri. Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

201. Initem (vii) of section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal ~Act
by clause 4 (d), the words “ Four thousand” shall be Substituted with  the
words “ Four thousand and five hundred” .

Shri. K. M. Shaji: Sir, I move the following amendment.

203. In the proviso to section 15 (5) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (d), the word “ six”  shall be substituted with the word



Uncorrected/Not for publication
49

“ five” .

o). a1eed: 166-00 mmud 63w 165-00 MMIB ceBV®1LN D@ely0jo
167-2%0 mud eesw™l 168-00 mmB 6e3L®ILS @elynjo 178-00 maud
¢eBW™1 177-00 mmud ce3L®es” ®@eljnjo 181-00 maud ce3u® 182-%0 maud
6eBW®1ee” @elyojo 190-00 maud esdw™] 189-00 MmMuUB GEELMIGS” @elyajo
204-00 maud eesw®1 203-00 mMIB GREOLMIBH” DEeIynInIeam”. 0g° GRRUNM!hU3
@PAIM0lq [lesnadIel.

alS1HR0®] al151018() afleGOMIBHAVABIVWEHHAOJo Mn0jo

M00aPIE1::0f0 2 0GEIONFANBH000j0 Aldq |A@] (W), af). . mioeIm): auad,

@1 . QOSIWEM BRAIMEa{la) 162-00 mauB a3V @RoUIH,E1BN0. 0
CRRLMIBU3 MV flHo0 00l

ol. 1H9Had: MNIa0MIMeals QD] BRAMAa(la] B8DE3JWIH: CRRVMIW.
. 6. RES1WOM BRAIMOIA(la] 162-%0 Mmaud eI aVE @0 1h@1a).

Wl al. afl. RI@®B @AaGGla{la) 152, 154, 156, 168, 169, 172, 188,
192, 197, 205, 209 agam1 mmid O IdH0d ave M1005012{161Hs30M.

Wl nemmBIod:¥]l @pell Gramalaflay 153, 157, 160, 184, 202, 207

ag)am1 MMIAB G_RBLMIHU3 TV M1BIBGO 1 2f1A1HEB3D.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
50

9(Jon0. ERMINEG" 2000VM MeEBUW BRAImGla(la) 155, 171, 175, 186, 189,
193, 206, 208 ag)am1 mmid ceEOL™IHHU3 MVE MI0IHE] 2{Ia1Hs30M.

Wl af). ofl. GROM@BH208 GRAUMGIafla] 161, 191 agam1 maud
GRAULMIHHU3 MEB M1OIM0]2[1B1H630M0.

W od. RES1WAM BRAIMAIafls] 162, 187 agyam1 maud ce3L®1:u aue
M0 01 2f1@1H6300.

Wl @l eRevM GRAUMOIafla] 165-0%0 maud ee3L®1  aUE
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.

W ag)®. atomy31d @RAUGGa{la) 170, 174, 194, 196, 200 agyam maud
GRBULMIHHU3 MEB M1QIM0]2[101H630M.

Wl afo. 23 cramadlafla) 173, 176, 182, 185 agpaml maud
GRBVMIBHU3 MR MBI A1 2[1A1H63M.

@) @PMAUd qLIBO  GBRAMGlafly] 201-00 Mmud eeBLY®1 ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.

Wl O  afo. o]l @ERAMOIa{la] 203-050 MmUd  GE3L®  aLE

M0 01 2f101H6300.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
51

CRBLM] §alQ (@JHIABB MILIo Aldsaf MLl BIVAILHEMOAAN
(@JUROOD
@RMBLNH63aMAIA. . .. ...
@J®&elasamala...........
CRBULM] §alQ @HIVAYBS MILNo Aldal Milefload BIWAIHHIMOHRAM
(@Jugo VB @0 1h@1a).
¢RI ©2lQ (@JHIABS MILINo Aldsq | MileNlond BOVAIW1TI8sM.

@ReMIJo Qldsal’

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

215. In clause 5(a) for the word “ twenty five” the word “ thirty” shall be
substituted.

221. In clause 5(b), for the words “ ten” the words “ fifteen” shall be
substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

13

216. In clause 5(a), proposed to be amended for the words “ rupees twenty five
thousand” and “ rupees ten lakhs, the words "rupees thirty thousand" and "rupees
fifteen lakhs" shall, respectively, be substituted.

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

219. In the second proviso to section 16(1) of the principal Act, the words “ fifty-five”
shall be substituted with the words “ fifty-six ”

. aeed: 222-00 maud  ee3u®] 221-00 maud  es3w®1es”




Uncorrected/Not for publication
52

@PISN0V@IMIT  ERAIMG]q (Ieapmz@lel.

alS1aH R0 alS1a0I8W afleGOMIBHAVABIVWEHHAOJo Mn0jo

MVOoMYIATHH0Jo aldBLIOZOTB:00 00 moe;%;]@"l (W, af). O mioeInd): avad,
¢ 1HO800Mo MVfld:C1asam1el.
o). leed: @l all. all. WRIB®B @RAGGIa{la) 215, 221 agyam1 maud
GRBVMIHU3 MR MBI A1 2[1A1H3.
9(@Jon0. BRYMIE" 2000TVM ®6EBUWB @RAUGGa(la] 216-00 MM ee3LMI
VR M1EIM 01 aflalHs30M0.
W 2eMB0B%:Y] @Rell ERAIMGIa(la] 219-00 mMd es3L®] ave
M0 01 2f101H630M0.
@600 Qldsal MIE1O0d BONAIBHEMHAIM (@JUIODD
@RMBLNA68aMAIA. . .. ...
@®GBelasamald...........
@610 Aldq | MIENH3 BONAIGHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE @MU 1H@].).
@R6Id0 Qldsal mileflond conmowlalesan.

®@Y0lo Adsal”

Shri. Anoop Jacob : Sir, I move the following amendments.




Uncorrected/Not for publication
53

225. In section 18(b) of the principal Act proposed to be amended by clause 6, for
the words “ three years” substitute the words “ one year” .

226. In section 18(b), for the words “ five thousand”  substitute the words
“ ten thousand” .

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :Sir, I move the following amendment.

[13

228. In clause 6, for the words “ or for cancer treatment and other critical
illness” substitute the words “ and Two lakhs for cancer treatment, heart
surgery, kidney transplantation, liver transplantation” .

13

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

230. In section 18(b) of the principal Act proposed to be amended by clause 6, the
following proviso shall be added:
“ The category of major surgical operation and other critical illness to be as
prescribed by the Government™ .

alglah R0 alS1 018y a1GAMIGHHAMVABIVWBHHAO]o MIn0jo

MVIoMVITTHH0Jo A ldBRIDAMROTHI0 0o moeaqd@’l (W, ag). O, mioeInd): avad,

CRBNMIHOBIMMo TVI1BHalesamol.

o). 1eed: @l @Ml cenmi” @AU®Glafls) 225, 226 agam maud
GRBULMIHHU3 MUEB M1QIM0]2[101H630M0.

9(@Jonn. @RYMIE" 2000TVM MEBUWY BRAIMAIa(la] 228-00 MaUA 6E3LM]
MR MRIMH 01 2[1@1H630M0.

W 2mm8%&:¢l erell @RAMAlaflal 230-00 maud cesw®1 auve

M1IB0] afl@1Hs30M.



233.

234.

236.

237.

238.

Uncorrected/Not for publication
54

®@Y0do Qldhsal U003 BINAISHEMONAM (@JUIODTD
@RMZLIAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®&zelasamala...........

@000 Qldsq| MIE1O3 BINAILHEMOAM (@JU3o VB BRI 1B:014).

®@Y0do Qldsa | mileflond fonmawlalasan.

o} ©%0 Qdsal’

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 23(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 7, add the
word “Honourable” before the words “High Court”.

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 23(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 7, for the
words “twenty five” substitute the word “twenty”.

Shri N. Samsudheen : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 23(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 7, the word
“subordinate” shall be substituted with the word “other”.

Shri_Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 23(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 7, after the
word “authorities” the words “other than the Family Courts” shall be inserted.

Shri_ M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 23(1) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 7, for the



Uncorrected/Not for publication
55

words “unless it is so stamped” substitute the words “unless so affixed with stamp”.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim : Sir, I move the following amendment.

239. In the first proviso to section 23 after the word “Government” insert the following :
“and on behalf of a person below poverty line and a victim of endosulphan”.

alS1dHR0®] alS1a0IdW afleGOMIBHAVABIVWEHHAOJo Mn0jo

MVOoMIATH0Jo  a108eIHAGOT:00 0)o mcearg;l@ﬁ (W) af). Od. mioeind):

¢ 1HO80MMo MVfld:G1asam1el.

o). 1e9d: O@Joan. @RYMIE" 2000V @BV GRAIMGIa{ls] 233-%

MMIAB GRELMT VR M1BIGHO12{1A1HEB3ND.

W1 af). all. @GAMIGE &208 GPAMGlafly] 234-00 MIUG 6E3L™] aLE
M1EIB0]afl@1Hs30M.

Wl  af@B. atomyzlm®d @AUGGlafla) 236-00 maud ec_V®1 aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W) 260M8%0E:¢1 @oell @RAMGlafla] 237-00 maud eV auve
M0 01 2f101H6300.

Wl  afo. 923 cPA®Glafla] 238-00 ®maud e_3L®]  aVE

M1EIB0] afl@1Hs30M.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
56

@1 sl all. wEYIaolo @RAUMGIa{la] 239-00 ®maud eerY®1 ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.
a@3$90 Qldal MIelload BOMAILHEMHAIM (@JURODD
@RMBLINBBINAUAG. ....c..eeeeeenee.
@ ZLNAsaMAIA@....................
a3®90 Qldsq| L0 BINAILHEIMONM @JUQo TVB BROV1d:O14).
a0 Qlgsa | milelload sowadwlolsesam.

80MJ0 Qldsalo all0ldhQo Gal@3o

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendment.

106. Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows: “It shall come into force on the date notified in
the Official Gazette”.

ol. aYleed: 107-200 mmid 6EEL®] @WIM GBRGIOLI GEEND]

M1BG3U1HHIOD Qldha [INIV@IMIT (MMM AYD L.

alS1HR0®] al151018() afleGOMIBHAVABIVWEHHAOJo Mn0jo

M00aPIEI:0f0  al0BeInnRA1::0080j0  Qld]AD] (W) ag). . nioeIm):
LM 1HO80MMo MVfld:Glasamlel.

o). 1eed: @l ail. afl. VRIBMB BRAIMEa{la] 106-00 MIUB ceEV®I



Uncorrected/Not for publication
57

VR M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.
63MI0 Oldhq o afl0l®Qo Bal@o Ll BINAIBHIMOHAMM (@JUIODOD
@RMBLINBBINAUAG. ....c..eneeenen.
@JZLNABaMAIA@. ........ ...
63Moo  Qldhq]o af1015Qo Gal@o MIENO3 BIVAIGHIMOOAN @JUQo VR
@001 @1).
63M00 Oldhq o a 1010 Bal@o milefload c0nMIW1GlHsM.

3aMJ0 QWM

o, 106 a@: NIaONIMH ]S alS1eHR0m] a 1510180

aflGANIHHMVYBIVEHHUA0Jo  MTVWA0Jo  AVIMVIBIH0fo 2 ldBRIDAMFO]HI0 0o
Qs @68 VeI’ ®oilg] 01€a0ds” §a1Q ()08 2016-021 608
@RE1RIaHUM  GHUAMIW]  (6e3w®™1)  enildd ald0QVIBHEMHAMM  (@JEOWo
@AM @la {IEHIQJaN@®IEM.

21513201 alS1a0I8W a1GAMNIGHAMVRBIVWEHHANNJo Mmoo

MVOoMYIATHH0Jo aldBLIHOBOTB:00 00 moe;%;]@"l (W, af). O, mioeInd): avad,

quenidy” »oalgl 016a]odg” 94l @)do0nss 2016-0e1 o088 @REIRINUD,



Uncorrected/Not for publication
58

coHUAMIW] (ee3Lw®1) miad A l0AVIBHEMHAMM (@JEAWo DI BRAIM T {lesam.

2e10fleql m&%@ﬁ (). 20y Sl. E®IAAV): VA, MM (JCAWHDD)

aflamosaao.

eJadaecn®oal” (o). o0caw” aalamlomel): avd, 2008-enem”

D®1MAMI” AIGRLMAI AUGBOD]IV®. DERPUWB af)gaIdGato BHEINTN B HBT.
@@eOHHME" ANeIRMEB0laflad 15 eloto @ai@ioe 35000 @aliwoxpo
2BVl {lonemenan”  @aluiealSI@BaN®” amoad  aflengo  MIa0MIMeq ]S
2@1QHS AN AUYHQIEM.

@1 8. af)o. MM V@, M mielm” aflel aldlI®]e:gemaeslejo

MO8 ©ald@®HA TVNN®o OaIQYHWIEN. GRALICHNT  HNIGIOWA aNMZo
@RAICHNY HIBBH T HMNINTaC]” afNZo HHIMNZAUMM” DAD 1R800
CHO8 MIVATVERWIIM MM MIVWAe AldMVIABIND®. @P@IM  CMT)D o
DNHIFHNINM HEIMMDI@E ag) ML 21001MIRMNOYAYME. MAD W@ @RY3 Y A0W]
@REIRIUMBAB0  HIBABAIBABo  CAHUIMIW]  HSHINZAUAD  HIQ O3
@RE1DOMAYMNET @R MIVMIB NAIBHAAFING  BHILIOMINMELRj0 O3

@RAN”  WMIQY Qldxq [nIH]WIVITBMHAUI 0080 D1 of). Oh. IO



Uncorrected/Not for publication
59
ANIYOISOB® a)MDAI@EA af)N1H al0WO0S8S.

a IS0 a151H018() allGAMNIBHMVABIWEHHUNOQJo i [Whlelle

MLIMIATMH0Je A 10BLINAMFOTE:00 00 O.Io@arg‘:!@q (. ag). . MIRIN): aVAE,

1980-@3 . o&. MIMIB Qe ly@Y)] ERWIGIBRAD BHILILISOH LI DD
OINZAUMD. @Y GHILILISHO TLoMITW]a] ACGMIAOONIY  @REBBWYES
B230n M MVERWIB3 BaNE:S] @YADY ] 21N QAIsH® MBIWME".

@) O. af)o. @M MVA, HWOMAMHUB alllGqa|dgo DMRIWITIBs0.

@AM M. O MIVMIGCOINSIafo  (@JAUBOMIa|  HOLlo  QAUSNO
MUEODIHBHOMIWI@BM, M1EBOBEAIOLIVE], af)@EWI MLl alB1Y)RLAIW
QM@ NGB @REZOCNICWD. af)DaN ' GHEORAEM]  af)Moo DI
@REZAONO® MIVMIAB' af)o ANSlaflman. M A1V aMeERUd ®G3
Q8OO MLl GRS |AIVI@IN.  BREZOOMINMG  B0CMNHUISBAMNT  af)ead
(@JOBMOM B UI.

=einfcal O_lcea(?d@f] (). 20 S1. EMINAV): MVAB, ME@WVo ANYYELAVO

MEJNIMAOVIGBAN  MIVMIOO  BREE" o) MDIMIAM” DG ldH] oG I0VG

af)aMgS] al0W6Mo.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
60

Wl Odh. afo. MM AVAE, @Y Mo WY D@ Sl. G®IAMVIEMIS’

a0V MW al0®WIo. alOAVIMNIW] MANOS alOQYIM®  VAIWEl. GRAVICHN]”
9AI0320@AB aneme” 1980-@3 Mwanow.

9ald@N0IAOMo A]GIYaH0 O_Ice3(g;l@f] (1. 2. YWIHOM): V3,

@REERQES® QAIBHO MoBAIMIaOLI0j 313°LINMIW a1V =Nallmademeaio.
@633 «;Taqﬂom“ DTBMDOBHIME B TYQAUBNSHILIRISo Maldalg af)am
enJeU1nSg” EGMIMOMDEMEI?

@) 0. af)o. MM AVA@, MYAUGBEM HILILISOJo HMdh HIRIMLISOJo

AU HILICLISOINME. 6306000 TMo BIGOI (@JEDIHOWAMS. aMIM af)lles
H@ANILJo af)M 1B @R ATVEAMIAHAIYIMN. )OS MHTBANILjo aNIAD
af)OM HSAHUW  aJEOWIWISHIVI@BM0.  af)M1HO” MIBHITY" 210851V
@RV JUOJ®HWINMo MPO]. alCHH BINONME. ERDOHIMNE” MANU af)GalIgo
S9HIONMS @RAMONLL.  BO1HHO3 @%gsl @R®1OA3  BRADRAIOAIO B
AMMIILIME. BR® Hald@0IdW] 218a] HaIEQRNE HIVJATLL. 0aOMVINIW] 2l@4)
®21Q00JaN $HI0Y6BBSI6M.

1980-e106m” @OWICHNQIV”  HAMBaN@B  aNME”  aldTYIB:MOY.



Uncorrected/Ngtl for publication
$0898300mes®” 2003-£106m” al0qRIBM®”. @aYo, 1980-@3 013wa ealgam
80600 @pabIeanglave 80,000 @t &Igm  mvonilwommw@an.  @ean”
M998 RNMHnIBHs0 80,000 @el1woI@mmm 0lgwdeang” aeumlanly’
aflamls”  aude9Id  21IMENIdHe”  Olgwdenad”  emimlaclg”  2,80,000
@Bal®Ie] QWA @REAUWd @RALICHNYIIVIM” 3 fldtio  (BalWIH]
030 afllanls’ 5 eldHo (Balwow], ®Meajoud e 10  elemo
B IWISBHWIEM.  BR® ML ®HOQIAEM, GRGIOHM  TVRNND®O  621QaT.
DAUBGBOS af)ME00WOnd" atlay” 900 @altwoam” af)@B.ag)@.mil. 0TI
GUWoHo  GRIQOWT  of)MBEOIU  B2IQANABSES Gl oanl e, GAI0
mdaflnilamlan’ dlswad eaigaimm ergagladmlan” 40,000 @at @owle
o011 AINYLNEsMME.  MI0B BV  aflolesm @aes 20
D@AOMo HABINVA aNMEIGLIY” MIEHHANEHEMOHRAM AIJOINVOWQME". @RAIG
@y QIO e P anelaganiel. 900 @aies 20 w@adme @@o
O®@M. 6Ll aN1YHSEWI @RWIH: aflNlee®d aflad0l®o  GRALIGHNY

0A@Ban@AE anaElcely” m@de:amlel. @wls: anlav’ 40,000 @Gal, celg” an,

q@gﬂmﬂ a0, aVASla01eng" a0l @serl aflloflw  mmeBglenl  oflolw



Uncorrected/Ngt2 for publication

QUGBAIMEBBUY MIIB HDMAVILNMME. NIa0AIMHalg MW AAHIWo 6mMIIA
HDeMaV1elmd samioeel. allollw 1®1WIRIBs AIBOIMEBRU3 AlBH1LIBAI®eS
Gall@d B HDemavlelm” &lgmene’ @e@load 20 womadmoe  miad
HVEMIIT  ®O6Mo.  GR®  GRAIDOAHNINE  @RSa{leNeMo. o)A} B
¢e3L®1 MOIMIW] HBHMZAUMIGENE". M@’ @RSq{laj®1MEWHo afllanls” 10
OMAIMo  MMEJITRB2IOTM” Q2O B0FHNEMHRAN” 2 lOCWENE 00 A1E].
DB @OITYE 210108S 10 vom@IMo @RYBYCE G:02|DIMEUIaHO MIVBH1WYBS
Afla01®o  QIHH1LINBMIBo 2Qo ANoeajsomomd  oxl. 10  womaomo
HOQEMINUE @O J@oes)godoee)” 63 vo@@IMOYo IBHBBIBHS” 27 LMMIMAOYo
af) MBSO oego%gs’l 500.

ISl R0 alS1:018y) al1GAMIGHMVABIVWEHHAN]o mlnnjo

MLMIATH0Je A ldBLIOAMRNO1H00 00 O.Ic@sqd@f] (. af). O MILIN): a3,

@GO mileflenem” @R AIGBIN®.

Wl Odh. af)o. MM aVAE, aMID XRMOLINW]  al06) af)GIMNYSS.

RIBBB00AHD D &Sl AUQEMo e MBB®IEM  af)O  GRE1EJOWo.

@TOQDJGOG@%O@CG@U 55 L@IMaje IBeBMIdHs” 35 vom@amae ellglnagmilm” 10



Uncorrected/Not for publication
63

@AIMOJo O] af) NI’ af)HA QAUYED ] I0NIW BRElEJIWo.

o). aleed: 2016-e21 6508 @REIRIAHUS CHUMIW] (ee3Lw®) miod

A ldAVIBNEIMOAMM (@JEAWo @RV 1HA1HHMOAIN (JUIODD
@RMBLINH83MAIA. . ..........
@J®eilasanala.............

@JGRAWo TVB aBBHHEPIM @0 101210188300

enfl@3 mo%omﬂo’lo@@m.

2. 2016-0e1 6508 533" atlmnyo Q1101a000IVLI0 (6_BLMI) mN®3

2. V1E98: alSIHR20®]1 alSldaldy) alleIMISHIVYBIVWESHUN0je MIWA0)o
MVOMITTH0fo 2 ldBRINAMZOTHHI0Y0Jo moeagd@’]oeo“ U, o191 016 ods"
021Q @008 2016-0e1 ¢5H08 EHIAS anlayoe AIJNIN000IVEIR. (GRBLMI)
N3 aIBIWEM MW HENFHNMHAOM (@JEGAWo BRAUMTa (18020JAN@IEM.

alg1aH RO o151 018 a1GANIGHAVABIVWEAHHUNNJo MIn0jo
MVOoMYIATHH0Jo 2 103e19n03015:00 §0Jo moez%j@pﬁ

(W), af). O, mielnd): aud, quamid;” »ax1g]l 616a 083" ©a1Q @jdooass 2016-

el GHOS @03  anlayo QI}0In000MVAIN0 (ceL®) enfl@3



Uncorrected/Not for publication
64

a1B1NEMMWHANFLNEIMHAM (@ JCAWo BRAIMG1a{las30TM.

2e10fleql m&%@ﬁ (). 20y Sl. E®IAAV): VA, MM (JCAWHDD)

aflamosaao.

o). 1693 MNIa0MIMSals AAD], @REEE" TVoMVIG]BEAVEM2I?

alg1aH RO al1S10I18W) alGOMIGHAMVABIVWBHHNOJo MIn0jo
MVOoMYIATHH0Jo 1082190030100 §0Jo moea%:!@”l

(W). af). OB. ILIN): VA, AVoMVIBIBBANIEL.

@1 @MV’ eRIMaslmealmsl @yl afo. Q0@ V@, VNI,
SH1gl  016aodg" 021Qa)5Ho0ass 2016-0e1 6H8 ¢33 anlayo
QIjQla0200VeIQe  (6BRV®T) MM ald@RMICEJIWo  BMSIM@IMIW]
MABABERIY” 6 21PN GRBNMI MO BRAIMG]a {l8s3aM.

1959-021 6308 650385 01V @RYAY még”nu” QLIEOIHND @Ry’
Do) DHICHOBOMIOL] @Y3Y MVI@IVWI® 2aYINV” ofl. GRYA. &HaHQYA
1958 2084f 29-0" 08 M@ameRI@ @aI®Glaflal. 1955-0e1 a@omy”
€033 a0y’ @A’ még“m" QLIEOIHMD B, 1125-021 ©001038:3-

OHIafl AV ég”cm” QLIEOIAHMD B, 1125-9e1 ©2018&3-03:0af1 @HIBS N



Uncorrected/NgtS for publication
@ af)IMIA BHIWIH0la] 8@ aBH1H® NMIWN0 OBHIMZAUGBANGIMIEM”
QIR® MRR0 2 LAV VGY. @SB’ 1969-ej0 1976-e)0 1991-gj0 2003-
elo  aflaflw  6e3VDIBHUT  O®HIMZAUMIFMNE.  EPMIMVEUaHe DD mMil@3
@RAI®TIa{la] 2RIV HoaHQPAB @O  ¢eld  0lGaNloV”  Ho0laUOH (]
9210320MIVNBMEAPUW TVABafls] 016a}0d51@3 (alddg” 2) G_EL® MU

2lGQ)MS mﬂ%oe)ga)s oISl 6-050 MMIEIWT ™ 61).“%0 eclelfplo

021QMEOAMM” oJoe;Tmﬂgsna”. al011®1HUd WINIBAHMNBAMNBBD® OO MIlG3

Oalely” ©alQ), @RE1RIaHUBSHMIW0 2 R1WIW0o @) 1WIWYo
GIVAIMAMaY] o 2adlay’ HaHQA @AM @REZ00N 1003
al012100» 100 @nolalleadwe @RS1AVNIM @Y1 @3 Moo

al01aY@1BHEMOAMM” QBGAUEBBUBABEUAHE alOQHQMRIW]. MVABWED
DENBIG:AN WINIBo (@ JWITVEBRUT BV 1EISBDE)BHHINZI6M. 3HIGEI) 2RI W]
al0laH@1HHIMOAMM”  BREZa00  alO®  MVIBAEE1HMIW]  AADIYHS
UORLY1 B3OSO AW @RE1RIaHUD:  CHUAMIWIWIGRIHD  aleMo
MIBallSSM@IN”  263UW190E:0MZR0@206eM”  Maflos 8@ Ge3LGI

ODINZAUMD. @R GBI 0I@ON man’lg@%a. OO  Helldndwl



Uncorrected/Ng'g for publication
al0lalO1GHHME VAo B (G 2] 2[lG1EBMDOHAUMBB  H*HO® Jo QORI
ODMMa |0WINT BRYWaOlBBIN. WINIAMNOMIT AW HMINTanly” anens”
aidetloflesam  eraivyomlealandem” 2016-0e1 wmeoey mielad 4-2
QA I 2UBDISODIV®.  WMBHIQY MGl OUdRqISOm] BT VVAIMo
SO AUl {laflgens.  So” AIBRUIa{12]Gajoud aLI0EIANG:RIWe D™1Ha]
BO0HAADAMND  HAHUIHSIGLIANIM . 630600 BHMGLINB0  HAHIHHUY
Galdd:GMINUY BRAIBH B VdODMAIMo aNlaV” &S1HWANVAINEMITI GAIBSIA
Q0aO0M  BRYHIAWY ohWlaleje aUlall@d  @5odS1ejo QAU@o. MECa|0ud
NIaONIMAa ]S (DmoeaO(OéO_loGagd@’] af)oal]d’ 0219188 al0@glauad
@RLRIO™ A18HAINQ0 af)Lld Mo 1dElejo BROTVWIODDOAN  &HAhH]HE103
@RWI1HEIM0 QAUAMVGaI@BHIeM. M@  @RAIMCI{lE836MINUE  alel
H U HUIB630 WOV OO amavlenasaniel. BHH IS 1WI@3
am%csauospoam” @PWIHRI00  AMAVILNG:M®. M BHIS®]HS1®3
QPDAINGAIUM  AlyGMIWT  MIGIRVIHNO]S, DWW H2IQAD  af)LI0
qUé%cBo@1EJO alglatHGelo GRafleleglele GRYe O_IOeIé@O_IoSd@(Tg B33

W@®RIM0o A cgoeaquoeaglasa 100 @t @d000j0 G008 eflnad aenimladly’



Uncorrected/Ngt7 for publication
OMO®ID  EHO8 eflvwod eaminladly’ anmeleely” @RWIGHNIW] Db
DVSIHBHWIGN. 58 QI@ato MI” HD @Y, HHHITFAUGBEMIOUS GRGIM” B3
Dal0D@PIGHUIAMNRIVTI@BIN. MDD  GRY  (@)*HI00  alldlea|gasam @R
OOAIMo, @IV 45 w®mAIMo Ddh  Hald®|MEEBUWIRS” eNwGd
Va0 WEBBEBoO @RSIAVNOM MU0 }68380 I@r1o {legmam”
MDA [IBM®6M. IQ(OL! MBI HHAIG:EGIMAo QAUHO BdHIS® 163103
021210191H536MINUE HAHIHUBHS DO1HNHIMBB MVDHO0 GaldLJAMI el
GDHISOIHEI03  @PSITVOIM TVDHOYEBUY  DOMBEIEJo  HAHUIHBOS
eminTaclglmealenslo csoeaquomﬂ NI SN @BRYBHBOS
omimladlglmealnsloe MDD  TLoRly  DalCWIW]HBOHAMIEM™  AMI”
m1moem1_oz|1§§§@". alGdH, alflGalogo WINIAMNONIAE HAhUIHUBHH MO
D DaldHalasanlel. avlafl©3 BHISMIWILIDWILjo n=leans’
CHISMIVILINWILJo  HAHUIHUWBHD MOTIHHIMNBB  MUOLIoGa DLl DD
HOLIPLISOMIMMAVCI88 2F"  TVDB0 68303 BOINQHMH;1ejo

AUHHTRIMIB  CHISDT MSalSIHUd  HYIGMMIG3 BRAUMHOS  TVVBQ YO IM”

0g)§EIMQGaldso. @REIRIAHUMHMIMWAS  GalMIQH:EIRjo  AVDHOYA6NS.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
68
@afloel @@  OOAUG:EIMOo  QAOOQo  CHAV  AQ1AIYIMND IO
@ARANOSWIDTHEBAMN  HSHUIGHUWBH  G@RMIOAINY  HIOYEBRUE  MSOMINBS
MUDHOJo  Galopjailel. @REIRIAHUBHMIBHH @RAUMOS  GalMIQdhE1ejo
BRDCa IRl  mMIIAQAILJo  GaldWIM @RAIMAS (JOLNATD:  3HI0QY6EBUBL
TUDBHOYAMNE. BT HHUIOW MVonITWaflscamogo, 11 aemles” s
Gal@BAMNDE HI6NE” 10.30 mem] @RYB:CMIID® @RON®S
$HIQMIBCHNIBDNE.  CHAV AS1HNIM  HHABH TV YEBRHSBI0
OMRIHOMOAMMILL.  WI0IBo  DOHRBB  BHISTINHS1®3,  AGSB3aNEY
0 JOODBHS1OLIB1T BRI QAI0ME" BRYOJHWIM. VLNIBMNOHITI HHHIHW
MoMITW]2[ISEOMIBo  BHISMIVINL! TVDHOYEBRBOS alBlA®]  &H0deMo
algloasan o aJOOIY) MN@HBAOMAIA CHGleL1H 13 U]
QANOMEIMIOWINIHWIM. oflaN1S’ AI0me” alldaleleanaz MSalslo
GaleMo. MM anmMl@d  mlan’ csoe)osmﬂoe;g@smgo @RE1BaHUH @S0
eominlanlglooealens] M1E910UPMME®INSIq o DHAHIHBOS

omimlaniglmealnslQo  @RSINVNIM  TVDHHOYEBRUE  DMNBIGBIMN@IMIW]

M1EH1AIPWEMODN” (@JEDYHho aloOMIGNE.  @eEafoud MIBslaigan’ 70



Uncorrected/Not for publication
69
WOMRIMo Loy  @REIRIAHBG»MIASBBo 30  vo®RIMo  EREIBIAU®:
HBABRIBHBRI6M. M MO MIaMo QAUMAN ST YOOAIMAIGIM’
MAIBBBEAIMNE]  MIHH1AUPIMNM@. EREMIVAWo @OIMHIM AUGBEMIIU @RYB Yo
70-30 ag)amato@mm®1Maldhoo 60-30 ag)aalosomls’ 10 vomaomoe D

M1691012008  A@IWIVI@MD. 0go  @&Slwls” 10 vv@maomeaamoem”

a10QMN®. WLNIAMNOMI@3 60 oMAOMo @REIRIUBHMIBHs30 30 VuERIMo

cencwylmo 10 vommomo GOV MOAQRNIW] NINWeS
GDHISOIHEI03  AUMBAN®HEAN HAUIHBOW  BRYBHUIHE avlail@3d
BHISO1WILIDWIEL)o & 11N @3 BHISO1WILIDWIL]o @RAIMNS

CAHUAOMIMEAIME] M1EH10IPIMHAMBB®IEM” WLONIBMOOHILIBS DEZUD Jo.
@RE1BIaUH MBS UMM TWIWIGRIAS” aleMo MeelaI@mMm@Iao
@RALIGHNQIU” By  cHHUAMIWIVICRISD aleMo  M1E91AUYMM @00
SHHHUIHUIHH M1BH1AUYAD 2 leMO®IG3 Mo HAIBHANFABMOHAIAN” @HAN
al0CWMEIVITIEBM. BRDO®IME" GREIRIHUS GHUAMIW]  ilefleelss
CRRLMI  OIMNZAUAM  GBRD®  aldAISHIV® @R YINIUDININEIMATSS

00 0@ Tuovdwalel. 10 eldHo (BalIW] 2WACHIV® GREIGIAHD,



Uncorrected/Not for publication
70
QWnlYelw1lepl MYOGHQMNBIBBOAIN Do MEID®OHAM. @RE1BIHD
ROBABAIWOS  HI0J0Jo  BREEBOMDOMN. alGhU MV MoaliWlod mlan”
QLOIADOM NG MN1H Q1] D DEMBRIGMISHBIW cm'@ggoeauﬁoes)" LIS1HHIH

GCald:0106)61N=0aM @)OLDO@@DAO CT)(Tq\g]EIOc%%TT)O.

@1, af)@. aHoaF1M: aVA@, LAV HMIMa0I]” anmE1B3 BRWIB00W]

@PSYMM DHWIGMIM” 8@  Aflad1®o oemeﬂﬂce)ge)s GAHHUNO 10 GOINE]
M1B91QIPEMOHRAMIEM” 2 lI0QAND. HAHIHUF BHISD]HS13 @RI LM
@JOOTVEBUS  MNI2OMOIMAG]g  GBRoWo  MAMleS  ayallafls).  DE1GHOT
MOLINILNOM®o  @JoLNA]ld:  BRYAINDIERUIGHSE VDGO IATLIODDAIW
NYRAUIRNFHUB BHAHIBHUE  @PMBANSBHWINM. DD aNNEIG3 MIAM” aleMo
M1eD1Ala) CHOSOMIHEAI AQAIM  EHIS®dEejo, OanMIILNGloTVaM
HM@OITPH 2IQOAMMo  ARYRIM 2 lOQAN @00 TVVHOYERUB  B@BHHIT
Mo  QAIBaHUBBHSBSHS30. MOMI@  alello allaHndwlaenens”
MIAWRGIBODMOAN  @YAININIW D AU TBOD] (809308@1@3236)5
MAN&HOMOMIM UYHAICGHHND MDD  HILILISOMIT HAHUIHOS

MVoMITWa[ISCOMIBo QAISHO @R JIQIUDIA6M. QUAHILIMINO MVoMIMW )’



Uncorrected/Not for publication
71

%

@RAIBH” le) alel mlelle|ss VDB Y63BB6ENS .
HGoMICHISDHSIDLNOD af)@DAN AYIHBHS $HI0Je QILNW B oM.
MHO1HNIMBS  TLOLIGAD, &S1HHIMBSB HAUSBEND, GSOWBRIY
oanmilellglewd  smoalgloom  @eairunoem. quomilad mlan”  &lgam
ANa0l®oHHIMS"  af)Lldo  MANIBHEMHNE;1M3 QIBaUEBBRHBSHB3HDNOBS
@E1lJOWo @REERASICE]?

@l. all. ofl. auR1@m®@: aqud, aqVPeoomI@d mel aldolloleiss

MOMIMDIVIW  BRYBHUT  BHISTBHE3 MOBSHIHBIW] ) DEMIIUY
@DAIGHBNBIBHAN  NYRUIPSHUE  QIBOHO  AUBJMIM.  alLlGajdgo  GRAIA
@& 101N @3 @O 1HEBIOSIa o M @ICHENE (N2a0.210 Y AENBIBHM6NE.
QI2a0MIa I S6EBRS103 alBIGa 0o mlalomaowl alel@o
cmooeﬂﬂceagocsoeamamcm”lgm". SO  TVIHUIHBIW]  BHISO 1363113
Galdd:0N BRYBHUY allMIeSIB1enEjo MVIGHIWIWV] EBHISHIVIT Galdd:0d
@RYWaslevlel. QIO WDOARBS  HO0JAEM Ul af)ad.  aHom3I3
alOOM®. MANIQY OB BRSIVWANO @ 1TAIMAMBIHMo.

Wl af)o. OONA: HD@OANWIGMN GMIMo A l0NRAUIN®.  M1633UI




Uncorrected/Not for publication
72
QMZBaIMWo A lNMDIEGMIS I MRYQUIDMAIMOJo CWIRIHS3a.  UYL. Afl.
afl. 1@ a0 ®1@3, @D 1HOSMVAIOQAN D@ @&Qo
@YBEIaHPNQISANAIIEM,; HQONS1HBLl. GRAIA TVIGHINHOBSHHIUD 8330

GDIUOBNIOE]. GMOEDID) @(1]16)5(5061’5@@(80_]06)&] &3%06111(806308@1083216)@

SHO0YONOHD  AUBOO  HaHAEM.  0(1oLel  BHIS®]  &HSIVWITE  BRGY

allelmMm®™OInH® M@ICHNNSQUTAN @RAINLOWQENS.,
(@JOLNA 1500100 | 63BUIABBH MUV 0 68B3U3CA IR0 OMBIHHI01E.

aJ®1O®IV] MIWRIIB D AUSHVTBADMN®  GAUNODHIVY0. BHAHHUIHBOS
CAHUNOMIMVEAIME] Da IGINNQ |SODHAAN” BRYRITI B AW al0QYEMIIUS,
afla]alS101@3 Moo 51500 af)Ma I0QYINDGa DAl
aleMengasHwIem. 70-90 30-90 vom@IMo @REIRIHUDHBOBo @RE1BIHD:
9088300863000 20g1012fl5" @@ Mlan” 10 vo®@OMo af) MDAl
af)M1ee” amMIenE:mMIel. @emy®»n0w] 10 madmo @RAIGHSIW]
HBOI0IQPeMo.  @REIBIAHMHEVIF0 HAHUIHEBIF0 OBB ®ITa|0jo QAUBO®
MEIMIEM.  BRAIAHH D ]HWIOD aNME" VAIMIHANZ” NIWERY” MVEa 0350V

DD ISHBHWIEM H2IGQYMED. WINIGNOMIG3 O BIM0 MENZo 2JABBAND



Uncorrected/Not for publication
73

GHMUIHS06IM. @REIRIaHUG: CHUAMTWIWIGLISS &HHIGHSCIMIaN Dds
QAIEBBGBOOAN” HOINIW]  alOMD]ZeMNBE103GA0Rje  BPRAITVIMAOWT @Ry
@000 QU@BAND® @RAIQ1GIODMHANWIANM . BRDGAIHLIMHAMN I
MIgOMIMA]g WMHIVY Ak |AAD] BG VMAIMo SIg” QIBEVIa{lajo0Iam
alOaO®. BT OAIMo  AIARU1a{laBEMI0WE alel csoeacrtpgoe)@e:;o
PISHHANIMANTM” (@Bl AUGIHWIM. @RGa[0Ud Malles ayailafla|@Caldsel,
CHISMIQYHNS BRAINEBIRYCLISH:AAIN” al0QAN® WLNIAMNOMIG3 GRAINSH@D
AflgloGIVI  PEMERISMIGHEBD BRYW] AUBAN  HAHUIBHBIEM.  af)aIMIB3
MOIBHS” WIHDIT3 @RSIaNoMm MLV 0Jo CHISmImglelel.
@REIRIAHUDHOO  MVoNINWlaf, @REIBIAHBHAHN M@0 af)IM” (@JCD{HAIW]
af)§®10la) MLOLIEBSENBI 0. SHHHIHUBHB00@0L] af)L10018H830
@QAINIABR8  BRSINLOIM  TVVDHOJOMIMEAUMET  M1EHHTIUPIN D>
QANMICWIN1AB3aTDEN3D af)MgsS] Qo%;lm@moqa @6813°
WHA1HHEMHAAMIOM af)M1H 2 l0WIMBBD®).

@D CaHLIMHOAN BN MAIOS alODMDCaIIGEI, ommosgm’lm”

CHMV DHIGABHWQo Mala IT1a00000@]1  06M2" @S] Bal



Uncorrected/Not for publication
74
@RYAUUVIA|SHQo OIS afloan 20 eldtio, 10 eldHo af)an 1@
2JBABIMND®, MIBRINT HFIVWIOD CHIABT all PLINIM. OMNZEHNHIS] (HalQ'
2IMMaYODIM” o l0OMIS” af)aDIEM” 10 ploto (@BalWIBH] 2B QOGN
221853 31BN G21031860Qms". OO DI ailel
GHOMOMDODHIMELL,  CHIBS afl OBHIFHNIM  TVIW]HNITD DO BHINBI6M) .
CHIABS anl OHIHEBIM@IM” 8@ aVlellowalel. 0" alel®lMo  SOdy
OHISHBEMINUE S@ aVIellow)” MUUWIHHNIQNS. D@ BT OAIMHAAN’
alOaomMI@3  af)Ll00IBEB0 BT VOMAIMAIGM.  GRELISITE BT  LldHo
988080 ERMINAZ GRO VODAIMOAGINI cm'o@1mq:!00 QUBMAURHS 633
WO2IMHAMM  aVleflocwd  @moalel.  @noe308  ERYEIWY  ORWIn1o3
Galdd:M HIEJo ®Qlo BSINTNAUBONINGD DUINAINS af)BIIAUTO ABHIFHEAT
C»HIAS a0l BT VOROIMAINM. BT CHIS] (BGalQ AHG1eOeMEs1Ljo 3@
W@AIMAEM.  BRDOGHIMNE aBQQjo HIMT Dd> HHNHIFABAN BIRYBHUILS”
BT  ORIMo  aRBdalgOmIWIg” avlellow)” 96MBIGHEMo.  MIa0AIMe]S

WMDY O_lceaq‘;l@f] @1y enflod a 0SS 1 Y1ammeQles1e)o

2182|HS1TIMIHANINGS MEBBOMWBSB GRAVMIGHUY QAUMEMIIUY BRDE:S]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
75
HEMBHOLISOD” EHIBS a0l af)LI00IBHB0 B@ VOAIMo af)IN® SF1010H]

8@ avleflow)” AWM $HI0J0 UHRUIENEMO af)aT0alOaDROBINE” IMID af)H 3

BBV BRAUMG]a [lHEHHWIEM.,

@l. nil. w@ad: aud, avmid;” Halgl 016a|038S" 921Q (@JG000SS
2016-021 6508 6323S° anlngo A1Y0Ia000aVLIN0 (6_EV®I) md@3 aflengo
@RE® VM| H1QIYOS aldlNMMEY” GRWPEMHAIN GREVM1 NI
@AM @ o [lasa0.

Do |DTIMIVTECOMIBo  AUBAN  @RE1BIHDHOOWQo  BRQYIVWIREOMIBo
QABAN  HIGHBAIGBAIOOWYo  AVOMITWIHBAN  HOOIEERBIOM° DD
A 10QIM®). MM MOATV00® MIWIRIGMIan” 70 eRIMo Db
@E1RaHS: caUaMmIwlwIceldse 30 LumaoMo D& BRAIGHNY EGEEDN v
carnmlwlleelsso @M 10 vo®aomo @@ AYAIN0IBBUBEBS8S
@RSINOIM MVDBHOIOAIBABM @10 MTBH1AUPMHAMIEM” GERVD® 11 ®3
alo@m@. 1980-0a1 coHo8 GRWICHHIIY cauamIW] @r@lonl 3-2o
Qldholo GHOG GO 1GHNQ” RGN MU BHHAMIW] BRyH1eel 3-% moeg%logs’l

CRRUILM] ©aIQYIM” MEROHMOWITW MIQo  AUBODAND.  @RYBIAW]ZIeM”



Uncorrected/Not for publication
76
QAIYQIn0B1RHUBHE GAIMEIQBB @RSITVNIM VDO YEBRABIGBANIM BT Ddb
M1SH10IPWHIIINO@ANIEM” MO AMAYILNBBIMN@.  d:02f &Il B3
@EIRIUBM  af)M MeIYIGd HISDIHSIG3  QlYAIa0I0EBSM0W]
MITWOQS" GaldWlges 8000888 MIeIwIcs, MAles OaHVAE 621Q)
$OOCWHO  5HI0|633U3 mog«mru(ooam" af)ANOM” af)OMBWQo  @RElJIWo.
CHISMHSIORl  @RAINVN, CHIAS (EOINVWISHHUW  Oa0CHNISTHIWNS
MO@MO®IGE  ABON®IEM. HlAInod RAYlay”™ 8@ BIWQo
BRDCaIOLIMHAN  GadINo @a(zmcsmosaoaumm%m@m BHISMIQNIW]
MNINWHA]S MI@HBAN  BINOQJo  GaIlBAN” N BIWAIWT MIWNe M3
moeag;loe)@eloooﬂ QIG1HWIEM. @RMIG3 B@ BINMD  MSHAISANDIM MAHS
alOIWIQEME. MBI BHISM]BHBOS MSOMIa (@, 6HIAS” (E@ 0TI M3
af)MalOQIN® HHaNBCANISO®] AT @MIHYOMSICRIA BT aOWOIRHH]
MIIQRA6M”. HNaOCHNIS®] D@ MYHS AWMl BHISTIAUOO AUTBAN®
BT BINQJo PSoNI BHISM 1KUY AUBAND® GAIHOIM BIWVOQIAIWIEM.  6IMID

TMyallafla]j®” O®IOLILI0 8@ BINAM A1Y0Ia0IQ]HBOW @@goeaua QIG3AM6NE,

BRDCaDOLIDOAN @093%\)3093%0@)’] MNWORS  HaHlBBo  (JD]HBo



Uncorrected/N<;t7 for publication
QAIB1HBORIOSH QAUGBANENE.  DAOO BT TVPaOROW]T HENBIGE 10 VSS.
8@ 0ATINaNWA  CANT" af)aD  MIeIWIGd  AVIRINNGHAIWe  MIES
MomundM@™” Aflaflw  casalelsElmd  allalw  Alle:Tum  (@JAUBCIMMEBEBSo
alRL@]&H8006100  GRANNYCIABEMUIgo  EMHISDIQSS  AllarWEBS13
DSOHAIGIMD@IM” aflel alGlAD]HBME. EHIST] O>H31SER8OS M1BamdeMo,
CHISMIHEIM  @RSITVOIM AVDHOYe  BWABD: ~ @SEEIW  af)Lld
00)68BS1eJo al012D]HBME. 9a0CHHISTIWIM BRE1BINHZR:GH630 QAUGAT
AU HU3HGB0 0af TV DB 6BBEBAO |30 IWIgMS. alGnH
@IDPOMSIEIBS GHISHBHBHNS @RAITLO AUBHO BRMTVWAEM. Oﬂ(‘é(ﬂ)oﬂﬂgﬂo
AMBMV]al’ GHIST]dHBo MVMNIBHISD B0 BRAWTaHEM@3 22E10 EBHISTdbBo
Wil OTVaHMBIV”  63HIASHBo  aflel AVBAREBBSIOLNOHGH  AUSOO
(@JQIMNVaJBeMMIW @AV EREINOIHHOISBMDIV]  &*H0eMIM  »HY1Wo.
@GGZa0o MRallaflaj@Ealoeel 8@ GHAVIM MWV AUGBAD GRYBBHUY
@1 B0 lHNEFANAIOIOM” af) B U0l @RAN®SAla)

DDHIFHNEMOAIM”  alOWIMW  HYIVILL  alodH  alfl®Bo  WV]HHVSHNO

QA268R1GAJB:0N @RAITLOWIEM” )HIAMINM HEIWAN@Y. TVIGH] aI0WIMIW]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
78
GHISOMIWIT QAUMAN S0I03  CHAV ASIABIMNMDo  HIOD  FHEOTVAWo
MWBEBHWQo CHAV"  aflgla)” afleiGa]oud 0GOS0 921QaM  BRAITLO
BOMIWA6M. (80930(})8@306 20010IPYIND@HAN  B@  DSAHHLOWINEMAN”
af)L1001BS830 BRO1WINIIM mnga»oo)om)". V1R MO0, MIBGRIAHNIW],
V@ VAR HIQYEEBUT BHISMINW  GENIIWIH SOOI MVIRHIWIQo
@RIV VONINENWIW] oﬂ@aﬂm@ma%ﬁmﬁ BIRYBBHBENBIBs0. BHIS 1A’
@YOOWo oﬂgbdm@momgg @RAIHHIVDAMNE.  BRBROHMOWINAS  QUGAN
@RYBHUWHH  BHISMIGWIFo BRD HOBDHI0V 0 92190 |FMNAUECDIZ0 M1
M1BQaO0MBOMIS®HANWQo G®OaAM @RAOGaHO GARINA|SO AN
alRlGa oo NIaOMIMa ]S BHISOM1HEBIS’ n@ael,
MVABHNIATEMIFL:S1WIEM. B:S1H0IMINIUD YN HAUSBCNO
@JOLDA1HI0IN OB AVDHOJEAI  DLINOH® a@%e;u%, 61010068130, 2Q
(@J@OIMVAMRAIABE3aM @@ggoeaaa, ANABRLIABB0IA DSERIVWAIR CHIST WG
QAU HalgEaldWIT  EPMERANSBAN  WIGMMIaJGINAIW  BRAITVO ML

6MIM H¥1Qo. emIMIAfes Myailaflaj@;, 10 vo@®20Mo @®BH0@:06NE" M@0

300463803 alB1a0@1HHIM HYIQYEAD af) ML) ld] ST Db mﬂces)”lmga)%g



Uncorrected/N(;'g for publication

af)IN® B8 0Ll $H00§00eM. MO Aldio @] GRAHIO YOG
‘ﬁ)oam’lglﬂ§§§ ©BIAAMM®HVW MDD TVBBROMIM3 GREINWBBHWISM”. MM
aI0OQMNDCa DLl HIQYEEBU3 QIBEMIIUE &GO ogmgmo&sﬂao@go@mqﬁ
®¥1Qo af)MDHGBD@AND.

caUMIWIWIEelss” @& 20010IPNaISEMINU G D @RAITVIMO
QAUMC2UBIMNMD®  HSHHUIHSIWBOMHOMNWIAD.  QAIJQAIn001HB0W]  QIGAM
@RYBHBOS @LIY]GIOMHANWIEM” OH® 1603 6NIAALAD Q@AM D).
waledeaadlm” eMElgT  MDWI®HWIMMe AGBAMIEL EROMOOH B3
MR IEM0W] CUAIGIENNAISAN DHQOS MI1BQaO0MHOD®  MVoMINW ]’
206mM1 MVOA@ BMEGOM MOflOS Myallofla). alLIPINOWIENV]  HaOWIGEIBS”
QIGaM alemom 1903 allmlcwIvomlejo msomla(lejo aflamls’
NSO ISIMIB:ERI af)dANMIHHOIVILL GHISHTIWIM” BT MSOA ISAND.
nalles GBHISM B0 BOEMBHOAMIINSB0 B WlaH{01Q0
OLIZICMN) 2|QONIOBHQME.  HLIZRIEGIN |8 Mae MIBo1es0M, @P1ON3

MsO®la ag)%%eaégﬂ(mmom“, MOIYHSOHWLI00  Aa] GWIW Galdeel

GHISMT  MITHBAD.  BRERIUWB  MOMENO  HalQPHEINTMIBje  BRMIOAF



Uncorrected/Not for publication
80
MSOM o | 92U |HSYBB HIO6EBOS m)oe;mcrw’ladgg Q@”oe:e;rgcr»omﬂmoe@o
alel @RoweEBgo MAeS Myallaflajo®an” MO8 AMAVILNGBMMD. BDEa]IUd
WIOJIBo  @RAILIMGHUI  MSAMIQME. GM1WIKHSIB3  MSOMH SO
@RRILIODHUY, CHAV @180 0BNL)HUB, MG PWBOMHAN afllel (@ JedYd:
3lairuesgled nilglow” AR @SEEIWAI MSOMIQENS”. GGoMICHISDHOS
MVoNINWIfISEGEMIBo @ROINSS HIVAT BWlaH LI0eM . @RANOS aJBMA0Wo

BHISMI CT)SOJS']@O GaloOLIWEl,  @EIN60) @®6MMAYBS3 @S@OJSQJ@)%O

2180  B9H  MSO®IWIM” @18 |HUd  H@lEBID®.  CR

Me1wee1d6 B QITEMIIUT &HCOAs3S] M@ ROV, elles
A 106D B O] 6NnIo@ @REIMVITV]ICWaHNDDH D GalderIYss
cmoaﬂwomemgmg", @R NINHHWIW] Gal@am’ HY1QMM©)

MUVa)Bal0NIW] $HI0L6EBUY HHIMZEAIIHIM H¥lWemMo. QB0 (@J®1W0o
a)am  MEIVILIEPNO® B@ @S0 ERBMHUW AMWMVlal  GHISG YOO
00a0CHNISMIN0 aflafl @RYAIYdEEBRUIGE AU, G@REBBHM  QIGAM
ARYBHOB  ChlLlo cgoe;acpgoeag’l@el JONHOBCAIOL] OO0 6aIQaN

UICOQIOMIGRILH  QAIBANV  af)dM  HIQJog:sS] MM  AVMBARBROMIGI



Uncorrected/Not for publication
81
3032210 {lEB3HWIM . af)AMIWILJe MV al0WH|FINDGAIINA] @RSIIVNIM
MUVHOYEBBU BBINNDRHIFABH: af) N LJald]l @RANSS QAUGBINMAIBLH B3
alninoe HAIMHNWAB  D0PBANIMW  HFlWeMo. B@BIND@  DGBLINAVOBMI
&0aj a@"]oeacggo DMQIOOBILIEN  QIMIB  BRAIGOHNI@W  015WOlow)” Qo
Galor|sg almino aflel VDHEL6EBOH8H: 1e)o .21QOBZHIGHNOMBS TLVDHOY0
Galdfjo MOMOOWILIBS QIR BHIS®T MU0 2|WEBSEIM3Gq [0Rjo ME] af)an’
20180) VBB 1@3 Qwllen) 630080210 {1883 HIeM. MOEBBOS
af)BGaNIYHNF D0q|IS8530N al@1GUOIWMEHU3 MLl MIWERY” @QPINIHBI,
QalWeEBSIW AlL®]d:80 BREEIIGHNAHMHBo QAUGBAN, AlGHH alFL®IVOS
M1BQYa0MO@®  TVoMITWaf alBIBUIWMHUE MSABINILL. BHISTIQYHS
M1B2RMalONOW  &HIOYEBUE  al0leudWlendmd aflel  afleoweEBRgMs.
06020CHNISMIWITBOMHM D@IMIVT 8@ aYeJmelow” af)eIMIWOlow)”
Qfleowo ©HM2AMIEM” aMINB AMMITLINEBIN@ . o)LI0OH]1MVABS MoQNWIMo
allosQems. alod, 00463303 almimilal”  MS@AN@ICMI

@RO 1CRILHINIUD § MO m®£a®56mgmooe®1 OHISABANIEMI 0383

MoIWIMANEL  aldBH  HHAOBHNISDIQYOS  EPEEIETT 2M®IVIS8a



Uncorrected/Not for publication
82
@RYBHBOS  HaldDAOW ANaHWEBBUY  HODHHIV 0 Ha2IQIECMI  BRAIWIG3
DSOAISIGMI  UBAl2eMISHTIWIG  @BRANNS ®1B2]WIW  MSHAISE)HUD
QI@o. EPMIMo GaldBYo ©aIQRIM aldSlel af)an Mlel @ERANeS AGBM®OW]
M&06mMJo. 6O BRAIMVIMIaflesmo. 2016-6e1 &8 63033  anlmyo
alyalandeaveloe (ee3u®l) milellgms 70, 30, 10 vommaomoe aflme ™
anMElGRIB®” MIGI0IPS  of)aN  GEBRVMT MIBGERUHED  MINB  MVIVN®o

6.21Q)a. Mo 1H 0 1463aM.

alSla0m] alSl®Haldy) allEGaMIGHAVYBRIVWEHHUN0J  MIWA0Jo

MVOoMYIATHOJo al0BLIHA3OTE:00 0o m&H@’l (WD) af). O, MIRIN):
@, eniwmglead  cWMWVT  @RAIMGlafla]  anlMom@aV”  mileflead
®SQ2|WIWISIM” BRWIE: GHIAS anIIV @REUIMAIMo  BTUdAIMAIW]
QIBRU1a {loJ®. @REBOM QIGRUTASEMIINE @RAMEEBHM WIHHAIW” & 21Q6Mo
af)AN®IEM~  MBV  GHICS a0l GRE  GRAVDIYOS  RIVAIWI
MABQla01Hs8aM®.  AMI” EREUAIMAIVI@MM  MVEO® 35  E?MIMo
@RALICHY HAUMNNWAE anmElceldso 30 LVMMIMo BRAIGHNY AL V"

OQIBIaNWA anemE1celHso 30 ODIMo DR TVH]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
83
MUV 0 Y68BU3HBoCAIMEIWIM” Al ]|, GRMILIS3 @RAIIG:® CMOE DD
I3 aJeNE1HHIM | 2JDIEM. ERMIV® BRALICHNQ” HABH TU1HM af) @GV
OS5IV’ BRALIGHHQ U, ML W1REOMIsBo BRALIGHNQ”
RHBHBNIBOM2E,103 DGBa IOMYIVTOEOMIBo BRALIGENQIU” ONBIG:0. D
(OF:) Wloealw”  §21Q6MIdUI a@®iene’ @elmolgoem’ e
QRIOMIAIB80IBH30 Galdd:MM®. @@ aldladd1H8dE: af)INDEBHINBI6M”
DG 0w 70 L@@IMo BRAWICHNG HAUGBNWAE anmElceldse 30 vommOMo
@RALICHNY RIBHO M HAITIAOWVWA aNMEIGRISB0  GaldB:AN®.  HEBROHM
GalddaN DHWIT af)§al® O@AIMONINM al@Do Aa|DU®AINMOHH0Y
al@®o 2f) SO HINBI6TN’ DH AU HBOS HAUGINWOIMGAIME]
9alLINIFlEBAN@®.  @RGEJOUd  MalNGRITE  GRALICHNY  OHAUBINaNWAE
anMElcelss” 63 o@m@IMaje  @PAICHNY" IBLHTY anmElcelns” 27
w@20Maje 10 L@2IMo HOGWBIHG HAIGBNWOIMEAIMEIQo Galdd:o.
70  @2OMODIGBNIAM” IO ONIMo CaldI®d 63  vumAIMMIM”

OENBI0]. Aa]|® VODAIMONINMW A lOD DAIMo Bald:EMIIUB alloam 27

Uo@AIMMIGITO6NEI Qs @6ERMAUDTEMIIUI (GTOQOJ(OTGY]@CTV)O @@M@’Oﬂ(‘é@)&go



Uncorrected/Not for publication
84
2:51 O@IGNOIB:0. aflda A IODUO@AIMAIM” AUAIH:. HAIAHANINAZ IO’
O@AIMAIEM.  EMAHOM  MYallafla|DEalIOL!l BGHISTHIHBNS AlURDOME!
MUVHOYODIN” MY afME” DalCRIWISBINILL. ©OHIFMYAIW] MINLOAIS
BHISMHSIO3  QUGAN cmooem”loe:.g@soqgo oemem’loeag@scqgo MUV 0631303
AURRUIa 1AM @IMIEM” al@DUW@AIMo Db DalGWIWTABIMND). BRMIVD
e¢SoWHLI, @lsmlowy algd eanmUlellgl @SBl 2ag" AVDE:0 683U
BMWASBAN1MEAUMSTIWIM D Ddh AUTMICWINTABINOY. csoe;osmﬂoeaggas
alUDDODEl  AVDHOYODIM  B8@ @@  MIWRQO]  AVEq0AS
@RYAIYDIMIEM. @RMIGM  MANOLI MNIaOMNIMAalS ANOQAD]T dyaila[lajoy.
CHOBSOMIOMW  MNIWRY (Baldqa|gEMIUB  §9a0eHNIS®]  021aYIQo

mmmﬁ@qgo ®221@3  @RYELD2IM MSOM]  CHOBAMINL!  CHIST]HBOS

HAM O alUROmEl MUV 0463303 Q8OO al@lal®ndem”
af) MBBD ) HIMZOHAN @O aIdcUla[lesemo. BN

TYallofla]@DCaldnel GhHISHIHSIT 19 EYISlad" BoeM MVoNNWIMOI3
5191eI88  MSEEIY  QO1HBMBB®.  al9® AV IVWAB01GlMss1OL10M00

MDGa|0Ud HAHUIRHUWEHN) TVIGHUIHUWICHNI AUHHTRINBMIACHNI  DATHHINT



Uncorrected/Not for publication
85
SHYlolel aee1eIdndd MIMIAN” 80003 GalddI0d GalME] GRSOMWIUT
IO 101 HBHQWIEM . AMIM@®HAM BHISM W13 QU 1L1001g0
MISHIWIVIZo (JDIWIWIFo GalDWISME. B01EH@  MIRI1OLIB]Sod:6Ns”
eMIM @PANOS MBINDo 8@ @®OWIM MIRIYIT afean aleans
af) M@ flal. @Y MVAVOD (@EJDIBHUWE af)TMVAIOQYMD® SHQYQSNIVRIGEI,
$006Mo  WISHISBAMILIGLI0.  @REaOUd  TMVIHHIHOBEq [ORIMOIMNQYSBS
al@lweamm &156MB. dH¥lamm 3lalo ojl.aua%lxé.(uﬂ. Qo] D@D aHIMo
0Da0CHNIS®IVI@  Gald®  LAVOD  GRANESYEs  OR1TYIQRIW]
MoMVIBTABEMIOUT  @RGZaN0  alOH®  MHDHWIT  RBIWo  M16BBUI
UPHRUIHHEAMHAANIEM . BRI’ wmaﬂ&n@zoqﬂ MNITNWOQISOBHINZSS 633
eDROISUMB e, OO®IOMR  RIVAIW] csce)osmﬂceag@s A U100l
aflld:rvmomow] MNINWSAlS AVDHOY6BBUY BOAN6) 5 ISABAN @3
arle@oem” VoA [lBlASMN®. @R® aldla0dldneMo, GBRMINOHBHBITB
MoNWIMPMBIBHEMo af)aM” ORI MYallaflal. @GS Maflos alam

21082|QOS BOUMIW1 @) B33 0040 MU 0WMOAINIW]

alG1GUIWICHNMEMIM . D  al06D  HORBIVINW  TVDH:0 O IMIW]



Uncorrected/Not for publication
86
m"loesﬂmg’l%g@ A IODHUO@AIMo  alUROML! MVVEGHOJOMMEAUMEIQYSB®E.
M@ GHO8 GH»IAY  anlay” @rad” cm(gg“ QLIEOIAHMD @R, 76 (3)
683L®] 21QBH@IeM. Mlelnflal efln@d amIMIacly” aNmMEIGEIGE GH»IAS
an1Qes 3@ MA@ AIMo MDIBHEMOAAN” BHIA] a1V’ OJOEI%CSOJOSHG?S
@Ry’ 76-20 Qo alyainun ©21QaM. DD D @RE1BIaUBHQYON W1 @3
o}336a|S101E83MAIBOS MVIPaOld MYOSHHYO 2Qo ANMNCWINHBHHWIEM .
(@)oo LAV HMIMIaL1Y” anmeleeIQ” 76-20 Qldha|@)H000 AUTBAD D
@E1BaUD: G mlwlwlcelssso @E1BaHUD: RBHO MV’
cHHUNMIWIcrIHs DaldDRMEBBUIA M1WAMVaOIWo
af) O ABM@IMB8 G0GaHLI 76(3) 6RARVLMIOMIME" MIBQYaO1BBE:WISM
DD oGl l®R0VISSS LIHHULA@DOE” 76(3) cereLOs88®. MLInNGd
@E1RIaHD GHUAMIWIRI@ 22302 @RowE@B8e HABs  EHUAMIWIWIG3
4329 @RowEBRanIMMS8®. @RGa0Ud @REIRIHS: coMamlwlwlas 2015-
16-@3 1,70,63,900 @l (3@ G»IS] af)al®”  eleUOm]

@RQA IO NEOD] H®ISBIV 00 @Bal) GHIABS  anl HMOMII ele’lgd.

908D CHHUAMTWIWIGLISS aB@IMNE" M@IIAVAIMAIY DBHIM” LIS 2|



Uncorrected/Not for publication
87
@®® 1,46,76,000 @a1 (8@ 6®2S1 MO OO0  LIGHOD]
af) €alomI000100  (@Bal) e1gla).  BRoV@IMIOGH1M  ERaRIg1WIeIWI ko
@RoWEBBEBME” BPE1BaHUG: GAUAMIWIVITI. AlGHH QAUTBRIMo GMIBBEMIIUI
" CAHUAMIWIBH8o ®al@3  ay@OaVAlEl. DD TVIA02l0 OT]L6EM
GOGaHLD aM:(@GAHOMo MSADIMN@.  WIOMIT Moo GAlNE AMI
H1SIODTOMSHIT B H00je BGBANRINME®IMo AlGlel. Qe 1eITBAI6M
HSOLIBBD o) MBBDEHIME" BRYMaldD|HAIW]T QUSHIRIBAIMBOS CHUN

mlwlwleelY” emon MES1 @ Galddso.

UD. af)o. ®ONA@ : VA, EMZANBINEN]IMo AUBAN D af)@WINMAN’

aloen®.  09HWBMNIHG  HMIMIALIGIID  HHIFHBAMN D af)@VINEIMAD
alosomIel. GRAIGBHS MAIM (@J&d00 HARMIVIN” )@ Db Qo ?

U1, af). O, NILIM : VA, HRIOMo D aFMINE” MILIBHISIGWIBO

@Bal QlWo. BRDDIMHOD B@ GCHIS] af)Qal® ELlAHUQJo  B@ GHHIS]
M@ O ]WIO" RIGHUAJo H¥laf MNIDBHTAUBIN aFHCEU00 BBBEHRHISICWISB0
@a!  ooHaVImems]  M1E91AIBM.  EHISDIHBOS  alURDOMEI

MUVHOYODTMVCAUMEIQYBR  @JEDYd  TVoAWIMOOMSs301a]  WaleNdenad”



Uncorrected/Not for publication
88

WOEAINWT  alGlEVIWISSMM@®IeM. @M alell  mievlas” alelel
D16 ]00d mHowgg;m@oeao @HO@Q@OX&B@O enyeLIngIe O™
(BalO®I@3 BaldHMAGEID.

ol. aW199d: @ of)o. 2@, @REBWES 1(ag) MMIA LG JIY’

@mcggmb@mgo?

@91 af)o. 200A : AVAE, MIM (JTY” O2IYANIE].

o). 1e9d: W ag)o. 2003 ERAUMGIaflal 1(ag) MmMUB GR3LMI VE

MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.
@ . auomyad, aeeaB®es 2(mfl) mmid 3L JaY
621QMOEEN=0?

©1. mil. V@K : VG, ANOM (JTY O2IQADIE.

o). aVleed: @l mil. avmym@ ERAMGlaflsl 2(mil) mmId ¢_EL®I

MERWAS @RAVAMICWIANS alladalel]l 2 [le1as3am.
el &gl 016a 083" 921Q J0ass 2016-0e1 ¢H08 ¢HIAds
a0 lMyo  QAIYAIa020MVEIQL (GRBVLMI) MM AlBlWEMMWDENFHNEMHRAT

(@JGOOHDD...



Uncorrected/Not for publication
89
@RMBLIHA6B0MAIA. . .. .........
@@ 1&Belasamala@............
2016-021 6508 I3 anlmyo QIjAIn0d0IVEIQ0 (6BRLMI) Mmil@3
alRlWEM MWD BNFHNAMHAAN (@JEGAWo VB @R 1@ 1.2{1R1HEB3D.

Mil@3 allWEMMW D HHFHBMD.

Adq]” ®1014J88 al@1NM®

Q6220 Ald:al”

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments.

113. In clause 2, the words “ Court Fees” shall be amended as
“ Court- fees” .

115. In Section 76 (3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2 for the word *“ seventy” substitute the word
“ thirty” .

125. In Section 76 (3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, after the words “ The Kerala Advocates
Welfare Fund Act, 1980” the symbol, numbers and word
as “ (21 of 1980)” shall be inserted.

135. In section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, after the words, symbols and number “ the
Kerala Advocates' Clerks' Welfare  Fund Act, 2003” the



Uncorrected/Not for publication
90

symbols, numbers and word as “ (27 of 2003)” shall be
inserted.

138. In the proviso to Section 76 (3) of the principal Act proposed
to be substituted by clause 2, for the words after “ equal
to” , the following words shall be ~ substituted “ forty
percent of Legal Benefit Fund collected for infrastructure
facilities to litigants and legal service for the People of the

State” .

152. Section 76 (4) of the principal Act shall be substituted as

follows:-
* (4) The types of infrastructure facilities to be provided for
the litigants, and The mode and manner in which legal

service to the people shall be as prescribed by the
Government”

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

114. In Section 76(3) of the principal Act proposed to be substituted
by clause 2, the word “ other” shall be deleted.

121. In Section 76 (3) of the principal Act, proposed to be
substituted by clause 2, for the words “ seventy percent” the
words “ the ratio that may be fixed from time to time” shall
be substituted.

123. In Section 76 (3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act

13

by clause 2, after the word “ collected” , the words in
every Financial year” shall be inserted whenever it occurs.



124.

132.

133.

134.

146.

Uncorrected/Not for publication
91

In Section 76 (3) proposed to be Substituted in the principal
Act by clause 2, insert the word “ financial” in between the
words “ every” and “ year” .

In section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, for the words “ thirty per cent” the following
shall be substituted,

“ the ratio that may be fixed from time to time” .

In section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, the words “ under sub-section (2)” shall be
added after the words “ Legal Benefit Fund collected” and
before the word “ shall be” .

In section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, between the words “ set apart” and “ towards”
insert the words “ every year” .

In the proviso to section 76(3) of the principal Act  proposed
to be substituted by clause 2, after the word

“ infrastructure” the words “ and other facilities” shall be
inserted.

134-03  “ set apart towards the Fund” agamgsoe” “ set apart

every year towards the Fund” agamossemo.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
92

Shri. N. A. Nellikkunnu: Sir, I move the following amendments.

116.

126.

142.

In Section 76(3) of the principal Act proposed to be substituted
by clause 2, the word “ seventy” shall be substituted with the
word “ sixty” .

In Section 76 (3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, the words “ thirty” shall be substituted with the
word “ twenty” .

In the proviso to section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the
principal Act by clause 2 for the words “ ten percent”
substitute the words “ twenty percent” .

Shri. M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments.

117.

129.

In Section 76(3) of the principal Act proposed to be substituted
by clause 2, the word “ seventy” shall be substituted with
the words “ Seventy five” .

In Section 76 (3) of the principal Act proposed to be
substituted by clause 2, for the word “ thirty” the words
“ twenty five” shall be substituted.

139. In the proviso to section 76(3) of the principal Act proposed to

be substituted by clause 2, for the word “ ten”  substitute
the word “ five” .

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, [ move the following amendments.

122.

In Section 76 (3) of the principal Act proposed to be



Uncorrected/Not for publication
93

substituted by clause 2, for the words “ per cent” substitute
the word “ percent” .

136. In section 76(3) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 2, shall be recast as follows:
“ (3) Not withstanding anything contained in any other law for
time being in force, an amount equal to Seventy five percent
of the Legal Benefit Fund collected under sub-section (3) of the
Kerala Advocates' Welfare Fund Act, 1980 and an amount
equal to twenty five percent of the Legal Benefit Fund
collected shall be set apart towards the Fund constituted under
section 3 of the Kerala Advocates' Clerks Welfare Fund Act,
2003 provided that the amount so set apart shall be transferred
to such Funds after retaining an amount equal to ten percent
each from the amount set apart to the Funds specified in sub-
section (3) for providing infrastructure to the litigants” .

Shri. N. Samsudheen : Sir, I move the following amendments.

147. In the proviso to section 76(3) of the principal Act proposed to
be substituted by clause 2, after the word “ infrastructure”
substitute the word “ facilities” .

DD l0 OMAIMo AHINE  alUDIOOML! TVVHOL O 1H03

ANBHTVMONINE] af)IBEBIMO@AN” al0R.  MAIOS (@JEWIN4[IS8I®

infrastructure  agamoem”. @@ 1Ml  algoenz®”  facilities

af)aMIEM.  HAHUIHUWIBBB HanAV1LNGIAV"  HHIFHENIMIOM” OV IO

WORIMo  af)FAEBAMOO@OAN” A lO0I). @EER3HMWINEIME; 13



Uncorrected/Not for publication
94

infrastructure agam@lavaldo facilities agamoseemeOnMIEm” ag)ead

GR_ALMI.

149. In the proviso to Section 76 (3) proposed to be substituted in
the principal Act by clause 2, after the word “ litigants” add
the words “ and public (including witness)” .

ol. 1698: 09 ¢eROIHUE @RIl lesnMIL). 118, 119 agyam
ce3O®1HUW 117-00 mud ee3w®Ies30 127, 128 ag)oml cerzw®®ud 126-20
mnId ee3®dse 130-00 mmId ee3L®I 129-00 MmMIB e eso 141-20
mnId 63w 140-00 mmIB ce3w™ese 143, 144, 145 agamT ce3L® 1503
142-00 maud ee3L®Iane @elyNIV@IMIT  @RA GRAIMAoleHnmamIel.
af) MI@BANILJo GBI MBI TWAIRHH MVoMVIGTH 0.

©l. al. 9l. mednde: 10 vommomeamss®” 20 vo@aomens;1ejndHs]

QI3RV1a{lH9HMOAMMINM.  af)IMIBE AIDECD HAXHlHUIHH BN BT LMo
el(g%e@oe;cpg@%s.
alg1ah RO al1S1018(W) a1GOMIGEHAMVABIVWBHHNOJo MIn0jo

MVOoMYIATH0Jo aldBLIOABOTE:00 00 mceargd@W (W, ag). O, miorInd): avad,

O@Jonn. @RYMIE" 2000V ®EBU BRAIGMGIafla) 122-00 MM GeBVEIWIGS



Uncorrected/Not for publication
95

76(3)-@3 percent of)MMBS® BQ QAUIBHIT  af) EEDMBGIG. BRG]l 00
per cent ag)aNIMBID®. @R GRBLMI  @RoWIHHAIHNINIANDIEM'. 2Q
GRBVMIHOBIMM0 TV13HIQYDE.

N.a1698 ' O@oan. @RMIEG" 200HMVM @6EBRUS BRAIMGa[la] 122-00
MMIAB GRELMT VR @RoWTH:®12{101H63aM.

W 26MBI0@&:1 @R eRaImElalls) 113, 115, 125, 135, 138, 152 agam’
GRBLM KU VB MBIBO]2[lB1H63aM0.

@l afl. afl. vRIB® Gramalafly) 114, 121, 123, 124, 132, 133, 134,
146 ag)om? ce3O®&Hud e M0/ 1T1es0m.

Wl of@. af). omellesan’ @ramalafla] 116, 126, 142  agaml
GRBLMIHU3 VR MTBIBO12{101H63aT.

O@Joan. @RYMIE" 2006V MBS @PAUMOlafla] 136-00 MMUA GERV®I
VR M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.

@ oM. aom31d GRAI®Glafla] 147, 149 agam1 ee3L®B:08 ave
M1EIBHH0] 2fl@1H630M.

CRRLM] 0alQ @MHOABB M0 Qldsq| Mo BIWAILHIMORI



Uncorrected/Not for publication
96

@O
@RI B530MAIA. .. ..
@J®gelasmmald.....

¢RBLM] 9al1Q @JHOABB M0 Aldsal MIENOE BIVAIGHEMOAI (@JUQo

MR BRoW 1B 012[1G1H80M0.

¢RBLM] §.21Q) @JHIVABR N0 Aldsa| MLl oAW1 TlesM.

80MIo Qldkalo al101HWo Gal@o

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

107. In the preamble, for the words “ further to amend” the
following words shall be substituted “ to substitute

subsection(3) of section 76 of”

109. In the preamble for the word “ appearing” substitute the word

(13

mentioned” .

111. In clause 1(2) for the words “ at once” the following words
shall be substituted “ on the date notified in the official

gazette” .

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments.

108. In the preamble the words “ Court Fees” shall be amended as
“ Court-Fees” .



Uncorrected/Not for publication
97

0D 6e3V®I mefload caload” @RYH;1®3 Court Fees agam®” a@
hyphen Q1afl506M”"  af)g@101S88®): V10BN &HAOWY0 Galad’
@RYRINIIVO12J0V1TlEDEMo GRROLD] @RI QBB BHBo DalICWIN]CHNNED) .
@®Iem” 108-00 cerLMI.

110. In clause 1(1) the words “ Court Fees” shall be amended as
“ Court-Fees” .

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal. : Sir, I move the following amendment.

112. Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows: “ (2) it extends to the
Whole State of Kerala” .

2. aVleed: 106-00 mnId  c_3L®]  UVIBAHUHED]NVBBEIGHWIDI

@20MM®2Ll.  ERAIMOIalleanamzmIel.

alS1HR0®] al151:018() a 1AM BHAVABIVWEHHAOJo Mn0jo

M00aPITI®:0f0  al0@eInnRA1d:00 0j0  Qld]AD] (W) ag). . enioeIm):
LM 1HO80MMo MVfld:Glasamlel.
0. a1e9ad @ Wl ail. afl. AVRI@®M @AU®GIafla) 107, 109, 111 agam

GRBLM KU VB MBIBO]2[lB1H63aM0.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
98

W 2B @RE ERAUMGIA(la] 108, 110 agaml ce3v®®:WB ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.
OJonn. @RYMIG 2000V MEBUS ERAIMGIa{la) 112-00 mMUB 6_E3L®]
VR MRIMH012[1@1H6300.
63M00 Qldhq o af1015Qo Bal@o M908 BIWAIHHIMOHRAM (@JURODTD
@R BRI B83aMAIA. . ...
@J®&GeNasamald.....
BMoo  Qldhq]o all0l&@o Gal@o NIEfloag BIWAISHMHAAN (@JUQo VR

@01 012 [1@1Hs30M0.
63M00 Oldhq o al01&Qo Gal@o nilefload connIWIalesam.

al1S1H R0 al151018() al1GAMNIGHAMVRBIVWEHHANNJo Mmoo

MVOoMYIATHH0Jo aldBLIOABOTB:00 00 O.Io@zg‘;!@'] (W, af). O, mioeInd): ava,

2016-021 @®H08 €AY aflmyo  QIAe0lIVEIRe  (6RRW®I)  mildd
A ldAVIBNEMHAIM (@JEAWo DI ERAIM®@q flesam.

0QIMY0)o _AIMMIB2mIeaMOjo mcea@;j@W (W M. 213CUAIOM): G

(@JGLWHOD aflamI6aaM.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
99

o). 1eed: 2016-621 6308 €3S afIMYo AlAIa00IVLIR0 (CRBUWDI)
N3 aDTVISHEMONM (JECOVODD)
@RM BRI H63aMAIA. . ...
@ gelasamald.....
@JGRAWo TVB Dag)dhGPIM @oU1B:012[l01as0.

enf1@d mo%oqm(zﬂoeam@.



