Uncorrected/Not for Publication
1

MNamI322I6M HI0 Yo

el 5191 0160083 921 J»0a88 2017- oel 508 21008

cnAIM Me1 @3

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%!@’l (@aw9. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV" eIV ): VB,

quenidy” Hoilgl 0160 |ddg" §21Q @»ass 2017- eel ¢HO8 21086  GIVAIM

M@ NG alBIWEIMN MW HENFANMHAAM (@JEAWo NI BRAUM@a {lasa0.

DIV moea(g;l@’l (1. eIV’ 2106m21): VA, AMIM (A JCAWEDD
aflamosaao.

1. 19938 @ qvenid;” Ho0ilgl 016 0dSIM” AleWIRMAB0To | M@B:1WIgS:
@RoWEBRUBHE MVoMVIM]HBHNINIAMN @I

@W). Sl. af). @Ra0W3" HNAAB @ qVd, eMIM ool oflcwolq |

GARINA|SODAN. QI8HO MOMaV1 s (@J@ITVEOMIFES1WIEM” M
AlcIMEB0la | COAINASODIN®. oJ®IW qVE  AUMDIMERaHo  AUBHO
ODEAMENIWT MSEHNMEIVIBAN S 2l@a] MWD MVBWIM Msanlel. HYlanm

glaime  a@1  EP®INM  SOMEANEI®I0  aBOYIOWIZME.  af)MMILje  AUBOO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
2

@JWIMD|HF0@  MIAMIBANIMo  EIRIOD  MSa|IABEMNINUE  an,l)300W]
MSHAISIND CUAHIYBB MOYHS TLOMVOIMOD 3@ AMWHGBDCLID  2184|GWI
omz00lel alddepand  aldMOHH1® Moo MIYAIMIYDo  MlEAIW]
MUoMNIMEBBUS @R 1B:012)B Y1601,  BRDOBG:NFMOAN  WOMITW  CdHAIEI
2IS683° MO(@@I6M. @REEBBOMOVIGW  FBIVAIM]T  CHESO®IM AUMND®
MBIV HORIM. (@JED Do MDY AlaH@OMIGE (@ JoReM1HA0W] @REIEJIWo
al0@OM CUIAHIYBB B0IU3 D Aldsal OO HI0Yo @mgcgcmouﬁ N6B36)MEWIT
arfle AMm®  GEAIWILINEIGMORMMNDOIMNE  AX@AION AWM O
aleInrmes0la] @GRAI®Ga{lesmM®.  MlaMId0eMOMIOag  AMISS
2l@sJ01@d monuwd  ofly aso®]l.  MIAMIAMIEMo  GH@3  WAINIOAY
aldQVIBH1V@IMEWAHO MSOHAISINB H1FAN BRAITNVONJe MAYHH aldPIV]. 8@
@RI NG AN MLoMNIMADBB®. AVIWINEM  RMEBBUI  QAUSHO
ANt H835HoeM. D MIAMIGANIEMo aldTVIWILje MeLissleje  MG]
ABM®IG3 QLY H00Q10MMV0  AUGTILIIOHWHINI@ @YU INAVAM” MASBBIB® .
MAflOs  CMOOODQSBS  GAYIBD  af)ID  HalQEMOAIN & a|AISHNIBEHNI

QI6BRAMAIBEHNI DEBLONNNAEHHI EROTWILL. HF1D HE0HHIRINIW] Malles



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
3

MVOMIOD TS QWA @RISAHALINVYWIEM”  HIMIM®.  AWIIIBMaH
€ald103l@d MIG®1 AUBINDO®HNE B@  DalERIW) TVoTLOIMHAMM MIeI”
CHOBOMIM™ ME| QAUBAIMANRIGHEHAAN S@  QlI3OAIF12J003 DD INHOD B
CAIBWIMICa[0Rjo  BRAEWIRIMNICNIEMo  MSHaISIM  HYIVWIO®  Gald®
MVoMNIMo Q8o  AIYAND®”  aJAISILINEEMI  af)N®  A@206M  MAlles

@MVEMAIW  GaldBjo. GBR® QIOIMW aldSILPWI@aD. VMG, GHe1G1W1o3

NDMDOAUDONIHWIT3 21@a) msomllel. »006Mo, @P® 1603
@RIV 01HLIMBBDOGHINGDOHAN. A lodhH OOMOANE1MIGMIIWASS  BO3

@@lalayornan MmlelQ” ameEBud AIgeo aY1e9lod® 8@ &0lal @GRAN” AVMIE,”
SH0191 MIeH: BRAI®GIa{l2flaBan. @@ MM Mmlellondees alolaQo 0alQ).
6D6IBROS BOWEOMIMM” MVHVITW  GBREIEJIVo  alOQWHWLIO®  CAIOHOIT
Mo 1QA1LIC MO 1WIENMBB D) . ®I8HUI aloQAON@®  HHDIDT3
MIDHNILI D (@JDIRIATVAIHEAMAMIEM. AlDdGH BROMINMNo MIGEBRE N IBHS’
M MVoMLNIMHDD AVIWIVEIM LMEBBUIAS QAUO@IWI@AN. MM o@D QAT
ANgBH86S ERSITOIMOMIGE F13°LINIHWIM 2182] MSADIN®IM QM IW]OLlan

630 HIVEMOOHHINE MO MV 21B.2] MISIOBHINZEaIdB:IMIL).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
4

@l. ofl. al. W10 : V@, MV Mmileflead GRAIMEIMEASWIBE AISHO

3132LIMW]  TVoMVIC]o|DO®INZo  BREBBQOS  BREIBMOM MMl  aMI
aflvoBMIOWIMDo  MoMVIGTAEBMMILL. eI alcimezsdla|  malles

GO |STD.

ol. a1e9d : Wl afl. @RWIaHI GaldQles” 2017-081 ¢H08 21066

carvalm  MIG®1  mil@d  aflngo GRE® VM, HNGIQNS  al@lweMMYY”

@M 2(enfl) MMIB EEEL® GRAIM® A flaf TVoMVIGIBHINJIN@IE.

W@ all. @RWIaHI Galdgl @ V@, VMG HAIGl 016e|0dS" ©alQ
@J:00088 2017-0e1 ¢»08 21066 carvalim M&®1 mad aflinNgo GRE® VM|,
SHmIQes  aldlwemmy” @reemeamm  2(mfl) maud  6_sL®]  amId
@RAIMGlo {1H6a0.

2.a)U.Sl-0@ MoMITWla| QAI8H0 alldEMIW  al@a] aVRWIEJo
HINILONIOSEH MSAN M0l DB OQ" BRoWEEBUY A l0TMDEAILIMOAM
emMI0o ORIV 21B2|WERIY" GalddaMlal. &1.ag)au.sl. MSalod91WEq]oud
goemMeeIsm  afl’edalm .21QaN HanNWO®3  MVoONWIMOMIOLIN@  MIQo

QAMISOMIMBB®  al0@IMIBIH90M  HYIVIEL  eH@  eflaylejo  MVouNom



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
5

eNaylejo (@Je@my»bno@] alsflaan @y muonllwimeasas nQlasndens” 101 -
BOEMALISMO  GBRVMIWVIEHSWIIM MAN” Rl.af)aV.Sl. MSa{leNen1lISss™.
O®1OMR RIWAIWT MIB®] BHOWHAMN™ alOQAVOMEE;1ejo QIBo TVOWEEBRS1G3
@D BMIBN 1HIBAMEND IO . aflel Qa3 QISHOCWEO
(@J®1BaHWAMBIWIgME".  (WleavumiludaowadHnass o,Q)cGa%oJUO(Ti(Q)U(TquU @I
D@DIMo  SIgzo momIgol  MoaliBIMavi” 12 vomaomo SO0 BaNISO3
cademomIN” 12 a3 18 wv@mmomoenin® SO¢po B3B3 |SOMIO®”  ATVLIWPEM
2OEBUSS B0 MRUIYGIMBISHIVIgMS. qYlHUd @M 001N R0W]
9 lGWIN1H3aM MLIWMEBBBOS aflel A8V Wldo gshzﬂ%ma“. 2. o)V sl.
SHVMIMVILNTE MYHH AW &:001006M&1TIC|0RJo  MEBBHMHWIN AN QYBS
$00468BE1@3 ENIOMIMIMIW WMEHIOY Qo@D TVASHIGe ME] M1LIW1@3
NVEMAOW]  DSOAISDINMG  anLINW]T  6e1501  GRalRIVICE MR MEel
MOQANBISHIM MVIW2|OAIIMBI®  UYGRLWAIEM. HY1WIOYAM MSEBRSINLIEI0
mel My’ MSeals®Inad aneindW1giem’ @y HVeMaVleled WMoY
moe;(g;l@"lmgas MSAHaISOI GBUIW UPHRL BMSIABNIMNE" GLINSOTH &].ag)aV.Sl.

dHMeavleled  @eedl” u@AIMo  Udlald@ud 6)_01%1«5301) M) 12



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
6

GO@AIMAIABN QYo @PMY  TLoLOIM  GegOlee 28  LO®EIMAIWo
IBROMIBHHMET AMD®. @RI OAIMo MG MU ) 6el50]
20a010HW Ma0IWBHIMB MSODIW YYNEBBOHBWINES MABS MIQId m)ouﬂgd.
DEJOUd GH@M@  NAUMOAG BOEGMALISM  CEBNM]  HaIPSHIMNE HaNOTI
MVLANWIMODIM” ©2I01W  @HHIgo @ghd. oMl @sAan’ @E68BIF0 IA
TMVoMNIMEBBSBOS @RWI1d»I00 ag)68BeM sl loler BGalddaeQIaM”
$HIGMMNEIVITIEBM.  GR@IOM®1OO MIOALI0  RIV(BHOIV]TIGHNMNZDNE".
@6N300 @.all.ag). VWAIMOAFIHG HILIOMIEM” 'B8G0O IR0 BGO MM ' agf)am
MU0 QIR0 2. ag)aVSl.-WleelQ)” QAIMO®AN  *HIQJe A0HHIM  HYlwlel.
@AIQ @sm’lmgﬂ, MaI@ aleillw CMIMIGI odém“]oeam%. @6BBOM  (@JUQEBRUD
OMBIBH].  CH@Bo aldMIABIM MVACHIONDIOO MRS~ HF®LINW] 6000
al0®oad Sl MoMNIMEBBUIA” M1YRIMIYDo @R@CW
@)@1@@)@@%6)0]83)19‘]0 MO HVMNIeled  MEaloud .21QINDEaNLIMEAM
Mlelneigs @JRREBO8 aldla001HNIMBS VDASMAIW MSHAISLINZIMHEMo. BHOS
0aIMEAE  HAIQE®  EMISHW]BBBHWINEMAN” alo@mm@  wocloel. 101

OMEEBGOS  AeIYITd af)EBOMm  QAY®IOTVo  AUBOAINDAUNO  AVBHHIAB



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
7

@M1V B®012f1gn8°  @1B2j@IQo  TLOIWINIW  AIMIVI@  ME! WS IS3
lelpulolleny QGO ) DHENZOB0ME” @SN’ @E6BBIF0
MVoMOIMONTOA A lEROW]HHO00j0 RMEBBBHS GAUAOYo HEMES 1HLIGTIDEBHIME”
MSB®]  HOQYEBABLI00  &HGOD@  HDaloals MeIYIcel”  af)Om]HnoMss
al0lUyNo DSOMOAMMIAM af)MN1Hs al0WINIBB®).

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo O_lceu'{)d@f] (awa. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)VH): VA,

0l1oS MSOMIW «lEINBUIEEBHBLI0 MHAN BRAIMOIMEASVIM3 DNV 1HB3H V0o
21@4) 92190 021 $H0QL63B8I6M. MWNo (@ JomIelyam1@3 AGIM@IM” AmI’
eWIG  @RAIMOIa 199008 HFlVIGIBIN®” 8@ @JWIMHA|S CGaldOIQYWIW]
MM @OHIM HY1eD MVBWIT MVIAD 2N alddHH H@IOG aNLINIW]
@YD BROIRDHMININEMIAN” alOQINO®IMVo  NAIVE]. VLOIAMOOHI03 B3T3
QBN O®OAF @@oaoggﬂc@;cﬁ MIMINWONHITG MSHBHWINN .  @BRYUIW
5968303 V10BN BH00QMBIGMN®6M . VAT Msajoenlweqajoud somdavlauad
alelw” 8@ IGUOAGODIGBAN. S  QAUGAHOONHIMNE BR®INHY  (@JUR6BBUD
1BHHIND HF1O0).  (QJWIAVEBBHBINGD (@JICWINTHAIW] oJ(zﬂoo(o”Iad. af)aMO @3

@RSINVOIMA IO  (@JRODIERIHD QoG  oJNZHWIEM, @™ Mld:®]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
8

M1BMWISBM®IMo R3O  AUBADM@IMo  AIQo  AUBO@DANIVAIEM,
932a00MOMIM, allegmid MG Galdwl. afllemid Ml gJoaﬂg)ﬂ
alBa |l ealmnElWIWI@OME1G3  M8A” HBHISHNINOWIMMD. MAN” BRGIM’
HYllel.  HAN” MRS~ §21QPIMW HE1IQWIN®” MAYOS Aflad1®o @1(01346)@;05096)(68
MOEIVSS.  MEBOMQYIS 2101@ HI0QL63BSTC0RJo MAYOS  @RWIHI00
QAUBOOCWHO  alTINIDO|SAN  BRAINVNQME.  AMNBIACD®, OflelgHWQo MAN’
©ILNIGMOYMO@T MIOTWIGME.  MANHOD® 01Ea2B5MaVEA1af afler 2.13 vo@aomo
QIBRV] 2 {10188 H@IEM. @R® @ M0MVo MM ITBIN®IOMANIUY S
Galo1eadogo Ad:EIenem. aflelga®Qo WILNIBMOIMIEM. EIMIHA]  &HI06Mo
MG MEABHUW  VWIMINIW]  &HS1IVDOHIMNE. 00laj @®IM’
@Y I®1H20X] aflel S0YMMIM” MQYI0IWISIOLIMND®IaM.  @R6EBOM aflel
SH0QM@IMEAUME] K001a]” M06EBINS GH@30Jo MQYIOEL. @R ANlMBUdMo MANUT
WBAMRIW] aIOQMMME. MIM HElam TVRWIM A IOANNDCAIINELI (JUWIMSa]
O aliMEBBUINBNLI00  M1elnflejn20 @AM ag)o. BRYA. all. GOQHOBANINETHV0
@RYBIOOD CGANIGS 19" HFIQEMINUD alloam ABM®IMES flLIHWANIHM IV

@OOMAIPISOD]  BH@MB TVBBHIBIM” HMVAiGomid 9-00 @IV TLVAWNIW



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
9

0162033 M@HEMDIMN”  @1@BAIM2flA1EBHWIEM.  aflel DY alINEBBUIHS

@200V MBM] &SIVIZMNE. ERG EHOBHTMQYo NIOWIABAND@IE.

©l. oll. al. w®1Ka@: aVE, aflelEHVWIHDO MoMINWIoI88 (@JUWIMEq]]
@Ugo ENE" HOVEMEBBUY HBHINIEM  AUMIBIABIND.  SAV, alO HODEMIIUD
QY HAISMHAUM ATHIVI@  OM:aBaiRnow] oﬂeloe;@ggmo. al9® Sogno SO [\)
so‘g@o QI6BB1AB3aAD. ENBIAM, MD  af)6dBREMWINT’ 9.21QAMNO®AN
Ml éosumma“, NAIMOAT” 2 IT1UHA1 2003 DI HIB1QT AUBOMIM HY1Wo.
BRYBLHDAM HIQJOMIT AUBHO HIBLNUJ o MO MLl NOSIHNEMo.  Ch(@
WAIMOAFIM” MM  CJoanlglolow”  MVoMITWIaf HHD@IN0W Mo
NOLIB1T3CA JoRjo MeLNIM walemenaglead a 10111 U3B38831@3
M1MeOHIMs”  GRMIV@ 0], amM:addqnow] afleleegl  alle3es®Qo
QABBIBBHQo  21YMABHHODNO0  Wla]o8500a3IM”™ ag)am)” MSaISIHWFHHIN
HY1QenaN’ @T@cselom’lgzﬂgcsmgo?

GAWI. Sl. af)o. BMIDMV" Haf)MVd:: AVE, Wlajodgeaadlm” aufle@1H69ad

&HY1IQAN MSalISIWIEM’ 6IMIMD A lOMD® . MANUY @3 HENIORIMIBHS af)o.@RYA.all.

ONEJIV  9ARIABIN. MIGH®IQHS  MABAVIAWMAV  af)@  GHOOROAUAN’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
10

MAGHO1W0.  EPMIMROSINNINODI@ af)o.@BRYAB.all. af)@WIOM” BHOCWMNRD.

@1  GIYIBD QIWEMIIUE  H0MWISIOLIH]T GR® G@)Ia0lglwolowoem.

VWAV @1(;)861130096)1 GHhH((3 MVABHIBOHMHBENHINE”
MSalSloWga lasm@Imass  avondgdo  VAMMIW]  &alejOo. awoQ

DIMBIABHOQIMN®  QAUBOO  (@JWIMPISDIGM.  BICVI  OAVHRQo  aB®INV0
DEBLINIVNZINIA a1016UOWlaf e|1q,1%6ngocesacrn@1m@mm1 @P®1ea3
DIQOICIIBIE (T @QDOJ%‘:{] HON1aUMABRIBHH  HOYMIW]  M@LHAN@ M8
M1BG3UWo  MDHIVIGMNE.  aflel 2D alMEBBURHBEE MB:®]1  HORIMDIM
WAMNIW MUINB30 DS@o.  SOIMo, aODAVEMIIG, @RYVABGAIB ATATHUI,
99 I0JA” MERHMQBSOL. aleIIN” Ho01af1EHNHMIV”  AUTBECODNZDENE"
afler &»00468308 MW AMAVILRSBM®IN  @JUQOJAME.  &HI06Mo VIGO0
GOQM” @RYSHINM HYIWILl. GREBOM @YSHIWIBZ MAB MMM oo
MG®IWINMSILjo @By O alNOMIMNSSI03 DaIGWIW]a) TMLIWMEBBBOS
M 1Qms., @ MlGB®IE MBI HISIEl.  af)ANIT  DOBBAD 1HBEAD3
DM ellowy” cwég”l QIYOoMo  HY1W1el. BREBHIMWBS allel 300 Y6EBRUD

MEN03 AMAVILNESOMBDME. af)tsleje  TVBRSSlEjo aJ0@Do AIMMIS88 allel



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
11

MG AUGRLMOQNS HIVYEBU kb0l B8Mal®lo @1V®]
MSHBAN 2].af)aV-S]. HOaRAV1eod oM 1H630.

@l. ail. al. avlvoad: av@, @PRONES PMVBNe.|ESME aBQOJo (@JWIM

@UQo ©2IQH1S QILOAINVIW ] DD alMEEBSBIEM. WIVIBo Haf)QoaVIM” EM DD
DHIFODODHIMEIBAN  SIRIOAG  JANTOG]  OHIFEHNENS  BRAITLOWM.  AU3S]
MIaUEM@3 HMIMIBHBHS @YWV’ Haf)QoMRIWT EH0allg” §21QIM alQIOD
OIS0, HPleom 310l GRINGH1HM OBIa0MEMo  al0eR). M@ 1MAMI”
@6 VMAIMo HHHIFOMIGBIN®” MEa W8 18 vommommoem”. alelle nodHnQI@3
Mmoo AIGBM ALY 2 alMEB8AWT GHdoallg” ealceme quOl®IWoem.
@ROMO0 HI0BRSEI08 MAINO O@JISH, HalQINBS af)AINHB:1LIPN0 ellenIds],
o) 1ejo  Muoallwomaleeisl@d  alell® VeI B0al” aHg  AWDeNd
OMRBIHRHIMNEBS  MLOIG 1QENEISs0. OD@EBBOMWIEMN DAUTBHAAZ OO HIOY0
§21Q0M 963N !

GAWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV Haf)AV:: 0] HIOMIGAN QANUIBAIW 21Q2 QYOS

@RSINVOIMOMI@  BOMIONSBH  OAVRQHSILEM”  MEBBOM  AINIZ88OG AV

CMIBHEMo. EOM1HAF @ERSINLOIMODITI ERANFHOD MHMIVI@ af)OIOE1ejo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
12

mQo  AIBOMING  HYIQYEAIOVWIMVBB®  alGlEUIWIBN0.  QMNRIACTDO),
NDEAUNW  (JDIICLIDMEBBBMNBIB:MN  GAILIHESIG3  TVoMOIM  TVASBHIGBIY
MlE®] Alla0l®o  @RAIAH aqueniailawlwow] all@la] MDBMMHDOMBEO]2)
MEWIM3 2182]QHS BRSINVNIMOMITE MIERY” AIMBEMIIUE DTGBAIMOAFHBHWQo
§21Q)20. MHE@AI@ECA 6MIM @RYARINIW] MVoMVIAHHINT Q(}a@crcﬂoes;mg%

Wl ail. afl. au=1@ad: ava, Zl.af)aUisl.  AIM®IMEUWaHo  af)eld

TMIWMEBBBHSYo  Allel  H0WOHRAN™ BREEE" al0aTMEGAIU8 MAYHS  TVEAMIaHo
GOIAM].  alddH  LIWIVEMAHNINM  a® qLVIWMo  QIIERIAD  GaldWILjo
2.a)aV.SL.-QOS  Galdl@d @RWIaHMEINW]  aleMo  H;ISEHNME TuOId»]
QAMITIEBHQIEM . af)o.af)@.af). Ga0dqRE(OLl BHIanl a0DMNI@  Galdw]
BHAHMo H¥lajoejo 2].af)aV.S1.-QOS Gal@lGd BRAVIaHOM@E aleMo 0I6831H830.
@0631R" ald16U0dW1ENd0, TVMINVIAW] @101 4]ad:038HORAN” AlOMIEJ af)EId
coalellejo 2. af)MV . S1.-QeS BGalQ1®3 @RALaHEM @3 aléeMo
Q1068310 H9IMEIO1HBHWIGM. @R6EE°  21.af)aV.Sl. HMeMaVlellHel @GRow:adam.
@REEEBRYY)” MG 0Ud Al AWV’ G060 1Q1HBHWIEM.  ANIN alOD Ql@aHo AMI’

@REEBHN KHINANDICMBENIVY BREEBWHS Aalo MI0L. Zl.ag)au.sl. AIOMEUdaHO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
13

@636° §21Qa]|HNIOMIW]. )hI06Mo IRMIAICRIAN  BHISIHIMANIM (Bal BT
aleMl@o §alQIOH® AU@AN. Allel &0Qo  GHOWHAAN alosomlg @BREERWQAS
®21Qa o el(©]En) H060NSS. 303 afleio el [=Tk @633
§21Qa |EHIOMIVDLINO®  BHOSOMIB BT MVIWMON1OHMWWo aflel Soevmlglel.
AMOM  BHoaOl a0MAVI@ mlan” @aM” ©dAlleel BdHeMo  »h¥laGa]ogo
2. af)aV"Sl.-Qo G213 Galo1®3 nilglsla) AN Q1 HBHWIM”
C»H0a0la0DMVI@  21.af)au.Sl  MOIOD®  afOADELICJo  TVIWMAYCMBIHWAN’
¢ald312JGa 008 S@ MLIWMAAIEL. B300LIgIeCaldele aflel &osmmIgiel. @3
AaloQOM@  aVmMIaUIAWIWT AI@HANIGM.. aMIAD  BHhIanlaOMAVI@ mlan’
83000210° &H¥laJ0@ aleMo  AVMIMNIIAWIWIW]  ASHHTDEIMBS  af)OMEs 1o
MUolWIMAEMRI, el B0I08 aleMle®” Aflglajo@ GRWIUT  alOQYIMD”
2. af)V’S.-Qes aflalooe GRO1IWES GRMIMVEUWHo aleMee” alodaamaem”. 500
@l &,10106831639NEIBIMAIB@ HEa|0ud 600 @a1woem” Q16ERlEBM®". QYO
@al &Sl GRAIG Al0QMM®, GRAIG aJOOIGAIIWT TVIWMo AIIBBIHBEMINUI
2].a)aV.sl mileloeemaniem. @RAIG @RYEOIS aleER1HE0. GRAIG QIIERIMND®”

LIWINEM HHIVIW @T@goeagmﬂ MMM @emM1  @RARIGSBAMN® IMIWILjo @M



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
14

OHMN1E1YISIM@IMIVWILlo  ASIOHAISIMIWILlo  2].af)V.S].-Qens. eNnI0A@enIA
caoafloel emudu@ 15 @aiges qmuoomom’ ®eajod 20 @Galwoem”
$H00MMNIW]  alOQAN®  R].afV.SL.-IEM.  MOMO0  HIOLEBBUINHNINTVO
NN  aleMo  O®HIFHNIMB B lwlel. DHNIQYOMI@  af)ANIGN’
92100  HYIQIM®?  CHOSOMIOL!  )YAINS @YBHB0  af)IDa I0EOMNILJo
2. ag)arv- sl af)aMmoem’ aloQaNOY. aNWEJBHUY @REM JaH]1.2)Ba 10D
MABANIBEBOVAVNMo  MGaoud  .af)aV.SL-H@ANIM  alOQM@. o’
& 1a0NN1HWANMIM aloaMI@BIN®. 22].0f)aV.S1.-QOS Galdl@d GHO8o 7Y
MoE12fl01O83HWM.  @REEBRY°  MENIVIOMIM  af)PDBIJo  ©21QOD
HE1QEN?

GAWI. Sl. af)o. GMIAAV Daf)Mdh: aB®IWILJo Hhlaltnil AHUNISELI0.

@633 af)O8 MLl 1dS1om H®FIRLA]2]0lHBHWIM.  2].af)aVIS]. QlaMI@3 oflel
SHoQeamMel;  Zl.ag)auisl. almI@d M@ HABAVIALMBAV” &0WQo.  BR®1H]
Qo1 eIFIMA6M.  HICAVWIloWw @O Galdd:an.  EI@IN®HIN  alellw
OlAWAHM  QIG3o. @RadBQfo  af)MEa MM’ @RAINIENIW] m(o"lcemggg.

2].af)aV’Sl. AI@BAIMo ABRUIEBMND® SOy’ GalCLY HIIMDODHIMNZo GaldBa)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
15

SHOQINDOHIMNZAEM.  alddH af)OA MILlaldS; DAMIM AVMUBPLISNQYOS
U1RdAIo  Alaf’ MG &HoemmILlo aflel &HOWEl  af)MDBSB®IeM'. Qkle]
alo®d:gOm  2lagauisl.  HmvemMleload @By INOMIG a3Qole alellw
QIWI9B0 MSAN®o &N emIeem”. FICCI-@es @J@Imlwl avereio &>06moad
QAOM® @RAMIGM. 6mIM  62103laflg0  EPAIR ST ERAUINMWAV” I3
@QIOOVIEL  EHIMIQIaHad :0lel, ;oremo Oligopolic markets structure
@M. @REBOMWBS TRH 210103  aflel MUAVTENOQGIMD” BHIAY" ooV’
@R1506m;  @Yoadload aflel @RAIG  aloAN@®IEM:. BRO®OMIMNE  aflel
SH0QOAMMEL, A0laf" aflel &SIN@IMNS8 MVIRL I QYHMNBANIEM” af)OA3 MLl IS’
GRINGHOOMMINSAS8  MLOIGYANGUAHAT®IENM . afloan  agadlmoem” M1d:@]
BSOQHOAAN” alOQMM®? BR® aI0QIN®” 9a100NIWISL], BREBOM al0QEMIIECY
@ 1Wo  adBNMOWo QUTBMOSS. OMSOHO®  HEMISOWINZ  MVIBINIOHANDY,
(806)0(3(5(80806326)5 AN 1HW DY, @R 1HMD 100 mcﬁglm) alm@uomo
QOB GHOBo  af)a®)’ 9.21Q; @3l B@Joan1q0low)”  BHIAV
HHIMZAUBMNDI@  EHOBOMINW  MSHaIST3  QAUBOO  (JWIMBQS®IVWIGN.

@@ MAYOS GMSMIWT @REINIMLBEMIOWBAMHAM CH(@3 TVABHIB@ MSa|IHHIND



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
16

®Qooel. Gr®Iead alladuomoe Al EHEDMEl almoe. @l all. awl. cv®1voad
A l0MDE0OL] BH@Be M@ 021QY1HLIE103 GH080 0f)AD6 21QYOAMOBS (@JUgo
@WIMMIWo QIWo. MDA MIMINUWEBBOHBHBON 2" @D ]a1031E86MIUT WY1
ail. afl. VRIBMB a@BOO®s1ejo BEANSOD BRI alOaTN®  af)MVa IO IGI
O™lLl, alodH GRX@AI@AL] alOU®. M@ aflel GROILIGSEI03 CHOBOHO
@@LV MIdWlaflgms. @@IHLNAT” HOGIRIOMFIEM.  @PDIM” &IM6Mo,
CHOBOMIM BAHUNMUILIHOB MGH®] AleWONISHTIVI@MILl. MMMV
@O OAIMo MIG®T  AVIB BaDISLIHUBHS  AI@ANMMBIVITBIND. alddH,
OAMYO QIR  CMOHO @AM MIG®]1  mlelollejms. o)A@ 0L,
BHOBOMIG3  VAQIN” soo%momﬂ@am%. auadaflay’ so%mowi NINWR S
CHIV” HHIFOM LY H1S1OVWAN” alOQMD.  aB@IVWILjo BHOSOMI® TVAQIaV”
SO0 aNelafimaniel @RAesS  GRUWIW  VOIVABIHVWST  MlG:m]
MU HEB3EMIDUT BHOBOD 103 af)o.af)@3. ag). & 0a31mlejo
MNIGH1OVLINWISODo MGB®] AUBAN.  CHOBOMITE MH@IVILL, ERDOGHIMNE
CHOBOMIM” af)dhoaloHM GAIEMOAMM  alOAOMIT DD MG QljoINNW1G3

@ROIM”  &»¥lolel &»H006Mo  MMICMHNIW  AlLlY  HIOYEBBUIHRCIIR]o



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
17

af)goalat® OHHISOMISIEL  9BIa00MOAMIM,, ALIGWIO MoMNIMEBBUINBNEII0
af)OORMIG MM’ oJdem  MSBONRIVIGBAN. GBI &HNRIeM alellw
QIOINIVUDILIGUE  @BRAMNOS  Gald®] eIy’ 6)31(9)@1%@@“. 2. ag)arv-sl.
QAMEBOUB  OaldgAN” MV  af)dhoalaHB QLA  MEIN®IV]TIBBHWIEM,
HWOHAUNBHAG" ©2IQAIB  af)aDIEM’ @gj@gcm@‘? @PO@Wo el (@JWo
M1eIM@EseMIdUd  Maflos 2100EHSVWIEd MG:@ 1Yl Iamaniel, GR@IMm
af)RoaiaHB M@HEMOAIN” alOAIMIT @RY@o AllelniYlel.  MEBOMWES aflel
(@JUQ6BBUT  WILNIB®O A6 AR 1ejo  COAILIVIGE QA8HO  WDOAINIW

@J@lavawl (B 10OBHIBBMOHENBAT AMAVILINWIM  MIWERQJIEIONS ER@IMSS

alld®em  M@3HIGm M cmow%esaoemggg. @O @mgacm” 90a |
M @3FHHWIEM .

Wl . af)o. MM MO @ITVaW]  LRMOLIdEM. MG
enadaulavadmy’ 0GIMIL)o aflel G0 6L18,103 @R®1OHMHO

MSaIS1IHWSOHHENE” Aflel $:0QI TVeMLNIM NAITMBEAIM” GoWwWlk:00aee)?

GAWI. Sl. af)o. GMINAV Ha)MV:. MAL  @RAINLAITY MTYAOMIHM alllo
o ©] 0 oy

MaI0jo GaldW1B1BBHWIGIM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
18

@Wl. Od. af)o. MM @Y MILIaIIS EDQIM.  AVEMVNIM WAIMBOAZIM”

& 2lQ)0o0.

GAWI. Sl. af)o. EMIANV” Daf)TVdh: §alQIMW EMIHHTVELI. §alQIMW YN

MSOIWVG  &0a|®EICLl. 0@ HOIMNAIW G0, MO@Wo
HOQQ1a |0@IM ol2S1el a)MSB®IVI@BaNELd afladuoMo.  TVRWIGE ol06amD
MERHMNMWYSBB AIAGUMEEBHSBLI00 DUBOHHIBBIAY @QINIEM”.

©l. all. afl. auRI@®:  @MIMVomodm  ¢e1golds” 28% mla:m]

030 |3OmeMeORaN” @REE" &R1.0)aV.S1. &HDedaVlelad ancla). @@ MOY6S
MVoMLNIMEIM” WM HONIGM . HDMVoNIMWa] S@ GHAV MINS
0aNCANISOIWIT QIOIM Galdd:dH@IEM. MM CGHAU MING HNaDCHNISOI
aIB1WeMIEBEMIU3, MADJWIeel HRIOMOMILIB8 2].af)aIU-Sl. MTVAGMIT AdQo
QAUBGBODIM al0S1HLIAN alOMIMIBZ MYHS” ag)ad) MILIaIIHSIHNIN HF1Q0o?

GAWI. Sl. af)o. GOMINAV &af)dAVdh: GHIS]  afAMIM aloQaNH®AN’

af)M1B®" alo@oad avaWleslel.  aUlaslo, MIoIWB af)IMT MVoMNIMEBBRS]®I
BHaYENS, MGa0Wd  GHOSOMITE  AIEIM  Caldd:MDHAUI o l060).

D MoMINW ] BH@ TVAHHNIMRIWT MAN” IANOLIQL MINTWHAISIBD. CH(@B



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
19

MBHNIB  af)IABAM  HaldMVaHM  af)ANIHEMNAVAILJIB  ODIEBBOHM  BIGOI
CHISOIW]ejo al@a] ©alQIMW alglol, B@W CHISOIWIERIY” M0g6emMo, @PAIG

MYaflo BHISHIWIEM” a100ABUIHBOHAAN” o lOQMND®.  aBQ0Jo ML &HI0Jo, H®

ad@6eMM0Qo Wlanag’ ©.210)0003 CH(M MLABHHIA
QEMISAUMMIBIHGBMOOAUMOBB®IEM . MOV alOMOHIMEIBAN 3@

WIaYloWaHmeNE.  @REEROM au’lq)glocoéosa“ 921QIN®°  WOICWI  HDEQI
af) MBS’ G231 . S@ MB:®] BRYWIB1ABEMIIVBOMHAMN &alBa(lom
alleiges @RSITVNIMOMIGE @O0 @ 1O1H63006ME. @™ aflealalmmIeeman’
al0WINGLI. @eMIWNS  HIQYOASOMIB  BRYWIVo  (BalWI@ IO @I
aleiI8ss®Im” a0 Modse GRYWIOOMITGE MINHYWBBIM” GAINO MOBS3QMNE.
EEBOMYSBS B@ AUGYTHOEMMAIEM” BH@3 MAHHIAINAM MLInIdS. BRDOHRHIMNE
CH@B  TVBHHIB  QAIBOO  VVAMAV]IEMOM  Kl.ag)aUiSl.  HDeMavleload
@N1@B2IMOO® UWlanG" §219008 ®IWBROM]afIgeMNs. SV Me:®]
@PW1H000m  Wlandd  oalPleclslcd HOemMadlellm”  aflloan afa»”
@MVEMWINMBB®. BRDOGHIMNE” MIOHBQYENIB:HANN B |GSNBD L.

@ al. al. W®1VM3: BRI MVoMLNIMEEBUY MSTMAN ¢LIIg01es” 12




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
20

WOAOIMOJo aBRMAV] Alaf MSEIN@IM” 28 @RIM0j,  GREBOMWGE]
WIYloWaH@  QlaflFlE8M®; @RI @Y GREVMIWIALlI  AIy®OMVo
a0

GAWI. Sl afo. GOIDAV Haf)dVd: @RAIG MAafles alam’ aVNIalMOjo

WQOHEOIORGII0 MuNdafla] GMAIT MSADHWINEMEIBI M@  AUaOldNlo.
@RLIO® aBR0F AUYIWIM” MSCDIMOME1M3 GO0 MGH®]. @Y WIaYlow aHd

Qlaflg06m.

@Wl. afl. all. WRI@®W: @ 62RIW] OalBa| QI0EEIVWITE AI@ED SOy
DHIGEHNTROSS. 8@ 60a1WBa| 010ERIWIM3 SO HHIFEHNENR  %HoO ALl
HMDEa W] 8@ 62I®Bq | 0106381015 MIOSB CaldW] 1OQIW ©alWa | Q106BB1WIM3
SO OMIFEANME HOOYA1El.  MBBOMQSS MYEUIRSHUd R.af)autsl. mileflad
aiamlgens.

eAWI. Sl. af)o. BMINANY DRV af)af:af)Vaf)M. eowIed a pair of

chappels agamey chappels am20@ER l0amIGBS. BO@OGME’ BB 62101
QI6BRHWINEMELTEjo BRI IM” 2. ag)aVU.S]. QIBo.

o). a1693: @@ alfl. ERWaHIC1]] @RAIMGIafla] 2 (enfl) mmud




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
21

) 9
Jclelhlo]! @JaV @mggmocgmgo.

W11 all. GRWIaUIG Q] VA, I @0013” @mcggcm’l%.

o). 1eed: @WIad afl. GRWaHIEC G GRAIMGIa(la] 2 (nil) maud

GRAULM1 MEWYHS BRMADMIGWINS alladalell o[1a1H63m0.
quenidy” Ho191 016aj0ds” 921 300988 2017-0e1 ¢HO8 2I0SBETLAIM
MG MING3 aIG1NEMMW OEANSHNMHAAN (A JECAWE DI
@RMB:LIB3aMAIA. ...
@®1gelasmmald.. ..
@GO VR BRoU1:012{lB1H6300.

Ni@3 aldlNEMMOHBHSHBAND.

mceacyczsﬂ(zﬂazj@@ al@lwemm
©6N800 Qldsal

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments:

112. In clause 2(1)- substitute the word “ Actionable” for the word
“ actionable” .
113.  In clause 2(1) delete the word “ as” .

117.  In clause 2(4), substitute with the word “ authorised” for the word



121.

130.

137.

138.
148.

165.

174.

176.

177.
179.
185.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
22

“ authorized”
In clause 2(5), the word “ agent” shall be inserted after the word
“ arhatia” .
In clause 2 (8), for the words “ or authorised to hear appeals as

<

referred to in section 1077 substitute with the words “ under
section 99 of the Act” .

In clause 2 (14) substitute the word “ authorised” for the word
“ authorized” .

In clause 2 (14) delete the word “ Central”

In clause 2 (25), substitute the figure and symbols, “ 168 (2)” for
the figure “ 168" .

In clause 2 (48) insert the word “ Parliament” before the word
“ Legislature”

In clause 2 (69) (c) substitute the words and symbol “ Block
Panchayat, District Panchayat” for the words and symbols “ a
Muncipal Committee, a Zilla Parishad, a District Board.”

In clause 2 (69) (e) substitute the word “ Fifth” for the word
“ Sixth”

Clause 2 (69) (f) shall be deleted

Clause 2 (69) (g) shall be deleted

In clause 2(75), the word 'recognized' shall be substituted with the

word 'recognised’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
23

189. In clause 2(81), delete the letter “ a” before the word “ State” .
193. In clause 2(95), word and symbol “ Board,” shall be inserted

before the word “ Government” .

mua@, 6mI8 DMOMW IR I3 Q) d0M383 GRBUNM 1HEBI6M”
DHIFODISBB®. S @%ad‘ 0Twoled ATMIWIGE N3 O] EP®EAILISS
021010 MIBMWalGAUNIW GBI IGH:EBIAM. ®@RE1  alRlGUIW] | 1M0EUdaH
VNSO o). 117-00 mnd cerv®Iw1a@d 'authorized' agan aose|8s
oaueflow” alleauanoem’. 130-00 mMMIB 6EEV@IVI@ @R|ERIY” GREMININIQHS
oWallMlauad 99-00  Ald:aflenen” M@H1VIRlesM®.  Mallos H®mQIWI’
D HISOMIRANABM®. 137-00 mIB ce3V®IVI@3 'authorized' agam ansesle|ss

(Y]

aaueflow)” aeauandem’. @oen” Z' @M aldhoo 'S" auN&Elaj®aem’ 148-20 mmid
ce3w®Iwled Commissioner in the board agam@1oag OWabIMIaumd coH@3
moaomlseel 168 (2) enem”. @r@adome” 168 aganasse” 168(2) e1nem” wuolosoe
aIeEmMz®. 165-00 mmMIB cerrV®IWI@3 existing law agyanomd Parliament @S]
a10VIB91® MM af)aIMIEM’. BRDOG:INES” BRMVMIIWOS KI@AL] 'mo@eloag"

af) oSl Galdsnemo. 174-00 maud 6e3LGNWIE  2-%0 Aldafloel 69-20

Daldida] (C) GHIMIG 920 OMIWVICIHBMM. GH@o MIWAo  BREMaIS]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
24

a1V 3HIMB06m” AN lad  »omilgl  Zlepaldlatom/  alayle,”
GNIABAW” af)aM” alOQM®. MV OIDIWILIB8 GRIGHT @REMINIGT MIeS
MoMuOOME® Mlelafleflel. MERHS  MVoMLOIMOVBS  GNIIEH  aloIOVW DY,
WlYld,y” ale@OOD af)MBS® GREMCEaIINL] DUIDHNISBIQYIM®IEM”. 110
al@laHOD” o)A’ GAUIMOAH]IM 2 l0WINAMOSB®OM.  GNIOBH  alfRIIV@D,
WM aleROQOD af)MBSB@IEM” WO1WIVIS8I®. 176-20 mauad

ce3®IIad  sosmepcisml@d  Regional Council or District  Council
af)MIAIOWEB0N 2] a10203UWIEs3M®” @RYASIesW 244 (1)elo 6)094(11)%03 5- e
@Rem. malles @oaacwéu% 6 2f)aV HHRHIFOMIBTIBEBIMM@ HDQIEN. BRDEBHIENE”
6)094(1%08 5 ool mogemo. eusmwo 177, 179 agyam’ oene” Dal0ldhq|dhgo. .
@351 ud 371 agansso” 2a020%ayW1ejo PVROIOWILJo MINILAFIEle AI@o
NIOWHRIWISBBI6ND. @R MOYOS enfenod ) HINZNIGO6N
@RYAINIANLIWI@BIN.  Ma0IBIHYo  MIWILINAFIMo  MIMLAQISD AI@AIEM.
JaR® MVEMOIMNOMINM  BRYRILIEND DUBINQIFEOMNZ®.  TVOTVLOIME DI
MomITW2flSeEmI8o ceNen@d @Re®alg] Clause 2 (69) (f), Clause 2 (69)

(g) apamlal 2uleqlgHel. @R 9UWeq|go@d interpretation of statute-ead



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
25

ejusdem generis of)aM @B IGIM°  af)@106M”.  GRX®OHRHMNE D®
MV N&H1EHMHAANIM” af)M1Ee” al0oWIMS88®. 185-00 MmMMIB c_3VLGNWIGI
recognized' ogan  anssloel aauellow” aleauendmogs®. 193-00 mmid
¢e3W®IVI@  Hl.agauisl. sHvemMavlelloa MIBE3UEI:HI00 aJoaqlgallasm
HOYELIAHMIV” MA1OS MIDWHAIEM. CHB MVWAOHIHG @ERSINOIM O] E3
HOYCRIHUMAV 2 JoRa|SANHBaN@  GMIdIAALIM. @RYWDIMI@  HOYGLIHNI
af)OaN® 193 M1BQ 2 IO ]G3 OISO walendenagleel G6NIAAW”
200 |SAE8MM HOYELIHM &S] OUBAAIOMEMOHRANIEM” 2-00 Qldsa {103 )93
CRRLMIWIAIOS BIRYNIUd MA|SAND).

Shri Abdul Hameed. P: Sir, I move the following amendments:

114.  In clause 2 (2) the words ' registered person' shall be substituted
with the word “ Tax payer” .

119. In clause 2(5), the words “ sub agent” shall be inserted after the
words “ commission agent” .

120. In clause 2(5) the word “ co-agent” shall be inserted after the
word “ commission agent” .

122.  In clause 2(5), the word “ proxy” shall be inserted after the words

and symbol “ del credere agent,” .



126.

127.

135.

149.

171.

191.

115.

125.

134.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
26

In clause 2 (7) after the word “ family” add the words
Co-operative Societies”
In clause 2 (7) after the word “ family” add the words

legal person”

or any

or any

In clause 2 (13) for the words “ the registered person” substitute

the words “ a registered person”

In clause 2 (26), substitute the word “ common” with the word

113

online”

In clause 2 (68) after the words “ another registered” add the

words “ or non - registered”

In clause 2(87) the word “ prescribed” shall be substituted with the

words “ as prescribed” .

Shri K. S. Sabarinadhan : Sir, I move the following amendment:

In clause 2(3) for the word “ available” substitute the word “

recorded” .

Shri K. M. Mani :Sir, I move the following amendments:

In clause 2 (7), the words “ or a Hindu Undivided Family”
deleted.

Clause 2 (10) shall be recast as follows:

shall be



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
27

“ (10) “ appointed day” with reference in any provision to the
commencement of this Act means the date of coming into force of
that provision” ;

169. In clause 2 (49) (i) for the word “ children” the words “ chidren

including adopted children” shall be substituted.

aud, alemwo 2 (7)-@3 HBaUBHM af)dm MIBQYaINOD@3 @GN &)aH]
O21QaM  ERAINBEM o010 &:GomInje'  9U3ea SO VGY 0Oloel. @R
DURBOFEOMENE HIOJANLL  CHABHOM MVoeITWlaf 1977-@8 atdanosslw The
Kerala Joint Hindu Family System Abolished Act @aau@laf’ @palesm aola3
&GoNlo  af)AN  MVoANWIMo MIAGMEINBBHQYMBIW]. MIeINTd  BHHOsOM13
@@ ol a1 @RONBHD 0113 ;gomialel. That has been abolished
by law. GR@e M @Y alB(JEWINo MIQEMo.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment:

128.  Clause 2 (7) shall be recast as follows:
“ (7)) “ agriculturist” means

(a) by own labour, or

(b) by the labour of family, or

(c) by servants on wages payable in cash or kind or by hired labour



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
28

under personal supervision or the personal supervision of any

member of the family”

Shri P. Ubaidulla : Sir, I move the following amendment:

132.  In clause 2 (10) after the word “ force” , add the words “ by
notification in Kerala Gazette”

Shri Parakkal Abdulla : Sir, I move the following amendment:

136.  In clause 2 (13) after the words and symbol * input Tax credit

availed,” add the word “ waived” .

Shri T. V. Ibrahim : Sir, I move the following amendment:

139. In clause 2 (14) after the words “ Central Government” the words

(13

or State Government” shall be added.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :Sir, I move the following amendments:

1477.  In clause 2 (24) the following words and figures shall be added at
the end “ and includes the Commissioner of State tax referred in the
Central Goods and Services Act 2017 .

183.  In clause 2(75), after the words and symbol “ money order,” the

word “ voucher” shall be inserted.



I51.

155.

156.

175.

188.

192.

195.

196.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
29

Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer : Sir, I move the following

amendments:

In clause 2 (27), for the words “ or the Government” , the words

(13

or the State Government” , shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments:

In clause 2 (31)(b), the words “ a State” shall be substituted with
the words “ the State” .

In clause 2 (31)(b), the words “ a State” shall be substituted with
the words “ the State” .

In clause 2 (69) (c) for the words “ any State” substitute with the
words “ the state”

Delete clause 2(81) and renumber the remaining sub clauses
accordingly.

In clause 2(95), after the word “ by” insert the words “ the Central
Government or the State” .

113

In clause 2(112), words and symbol “ or “ turnover in Union

Territory” 7 shall be deleted.
In clause 2(112), the words “ or Union Territory” after the words

(13

within a State” shall be deleted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
30

197.  In clause 2(112), the words “ or Union Territory” after the words

“ from the state” shall be deleted.

V@, GCH@Bo MIVWA BRDGCaINL!  CHIal 921QEMINEI 2101w
@H00QH U0 peneowlgens”. “ ....but shall not include any subsidy given by the
Central Government or a State Government;" agyanoem” egoay” 2(31)(b)-ad
@RAIB alOQMMM®. LIIRINNHAIQo BN mmaﬁaq%oeacf& WOIBAME.  MOAUI
moflos Mlwao aldqIHBeMUWd 'a State Government' ogamel ‘the  State
Government'  af)an”  alO@MOAANIE” o)DM BTG CREODL.  afBHGBEU0
@RMIGMIS  MINWASS®IEM” DO88  HV0OYEEBGo. @RMI6M” @OL}J@S’]
MEIOH@ANIM” af)M1HH” EGDIMOAND.

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment:

157.  In clause 2 (31)(b), delete the letter 'a' before the words “ State

Government” .

Shri Hibi Eden : Sir, I move the following amendment:

159. In clause 2 (33) the word “ three” shall be substituted with the

word 'six’.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
31

Shri C. Mammutty : Sir, I move the following amendment:

160. In clause 2 (34) add the following at the end “ or any mode of

transportation” .

Shri A.P. Anil Kumar :Sir, I move the following amendment:

162. In clause 2 (41) the word “ or” shall be substituted with the word

13 2

and

Shri V.D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

164. In clause 2 (47) the word “ nil” shall be substituted with the word

(13 Zero”

Shri Eldose P. Kunnapillil: Sir, I move the following amendment:

168.  In clause 2 (48) add the symbol and words “ ,sub rule” after the
word “ rule”

Shri P. T. Thomas :Sir, I move the following amendment:

186. In clause 2(77), the word 'fixed' shall be substituted with the word

'permanent’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
32

Shri Roji M. John :Sir, I move the following amendment:

194. In clause 2(110), words 'radio paging' shall be deleted.

2. ae9d : 133-00 mud eerw® 132-00 MU ERAVL®IYMIW.

178-90 mmid ce3w® 177-00 maud ceew®IQmoo 180-00 mmMIB cR3L®I
179-00 mud@ ce3u®Iaoe 184-00 maud eesvml 183-00 maud
CRELMIYAIWe DLIYNIVMIMIGE ERAIMGT]q {leasmzmIel.

HWQo WMHIV\0Jo QAo @] (GawI. Sl. ago. EDINAV” Haf)TVH ): VB,
S ™

¢eLM1HO80Mo  MVfl&HE1E90M@  M1AQPaoalel.  eayvellowy”  1BOM©I
af)IDOBINE" AVl @.2J&:SIOWANIEM” MIaONIMO]S af)o. D00A GaldBla o).
@J151a” ©YLNoIGMI BREAGIEHME HAVLNoUIBIMI DalEIWTIEHHMZOH@AM’
MonIWla]  MVAaI000® @130 j00o MASHILL. alddH, consistent
@RWIG1Hn6mMo. Authorize afam aNe @ 8@ quoeIom 'S’ Do NOQYITW MLOLICIR”
7' 90 9a16INEHIMB aldSlel waflos al:aly MwacmIasIad caIe0
af)NeseWss1el 'S &1SEsBaMEMRINWN” ;hiNga 1103 MIRLINSIVDEE:6ME”
mlelo@d consistent @RWIS88 MMYo 2aleWIN1/lAIE8M@” EPEBOHM@EM

@SOS  af)MIM  AflaldG1HBIND®. QMRBIOD, GCH@ MIWNo GRDEGAIINEI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
33

alhBOMIWE oUW  Qlam @@%@)OQQT)U al0s}  alfl@o  ofNElendemlaflgens.
DENIVJo  MIVAOMINAG  ERAIMEIMEAUSVIG3  @dem]1  TVIB  BMNISHHUMIWV]
MV 2fIBAND. alody, =]af)aV.SL-@OS AVIBI0I0 MAAUWY AMAVILIGHEMo.
HMAINO MANHS MISIEIB8 MB:MNOVWHS30] 2] NI@ECH MAAUY 2l@a) 6 2IQMOSS.
2Q" MVEMOIMAD OBHISABIN NGBS Mallos @aal” maicsmmelolmanleal.
@ROOHMNE MIYOS HIAYo MI@o BMIBHIWIGE AW, eHE8emIed Undivided
Hindu Family abolish 021Q. CHOZOMIM” ajoom” e21QlsiEl. @pallosmlan’
ARYABOBNB:;1Jo HEGWIQ” HHHISHNIMHMEE,1G MDD MWACMIGE MANUF EEBOM
QG| al. HOD®OMN VI Z1LI0 al@laHOD 100 ploilzt Gal@load Qly®0avo.
BRDOHIMNE MV Cal®BHUW PJRIMIVAOMIAIS8DCaldnel  MI1AIMIBOmIMIW]
@IBRIMTEBHWIM” O 2lQD. HOMOANWIM  MIaONIME]S  HOMIA
DEOMSBI0d:¢1 @oell alosmm 'a State'-ea3 @Jugoje. 0Q” EIRQHOBBI00 HB0FHBAD
aqUENIIIAW] - MaRWd  HEMEOLISESHMEDME.  Dallonowlggs®” 'the State
Kerala' @oel, 'a State' @rem. Any State in India erem’. GR®OG:MR06M” 0D

6830M1HU3 MVM1BHA1EHIM H¥1WIO® AUMISBB®.

o). aV1e0a: W ago. 2md GRAmGla{la) 112, 113, 117, 121, 130,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
34

137, 138, 148, 165, 174, 176, 177, 179, 185, 189 193 agam1 mmid ce30L®1HH03
aVE M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.

W «me;m@uﬁ a0013” afl. GRaImGla{ls) 114, 119, 120, 122, 126, 127, 135,
149, 171, 191 agam1 mmIB O IHU3 e MEIG®1a[1G18saMD.

W O&. ag)aV. WMIEIMILLM ERAUMOIa{la] 115-00 maud 3L aLE
M0 01 2f1@1H6300.

W . afo. @M1 @Ramalafls) 125, 134, 169 agpan1 maud
GRBULM KU MVR MTRIME1afld1H630M.

OJonn. BRYMIE" 20060V @EBUWY GRAIMAIa(ls] 128-00 MM 6REL®]
VR MRIMH012[1@1H6300.

Wl afl. 900mEes8 @RAMOlafls] 132-00 mmud eces3L®  auve
M0 01 2f101H6300.

@ ald0LH@I @6NISS @RAUMAlafls) 136-00 maud ece3L®1 ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.

@1l sl all. MEYdadlo GRAUGGIa{la] 139-00 maud ee3L® ave

M0 01 2f101H6300.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
35

@l a@B. af. omelesan’ Gramdlafla) 147, 183 agam1 maud
GRBULM KU MVR MTRIME1afld1Hs30M.

W Sl ag). @03 HMAB BRAMGIa{la] 151-00 mauUd 63V aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W 2emBI0 B¢ @rell @raImalaflsl 155, 156, 175, 188, 192, 195, 196,
197 agam1 mmid eV 1GHU3 Ve MIB:0){lB]H6smD.

W) @PMBAUd TVIBEL @AUMGIafla) 157-%0 ®maud es3L®  ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.

@1 ee0mil mYWM @AUMRlafla] 159-00 mmB eV ave
M0 01 2f101H630M0.

Wl @l  2gsl  @eAa®Glafla)  160-00  moud  ee3Lw®  auve
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W af). afl. GRM@ #2038 @RAMGIa(ly] 162-00 mIUd B3V ave
M1IB0]afl@Hs30M.

@1 all. Al awdlmd GRA®Gla{la] 164-00 maud 6eL® avE

M0 01 2f101H6300.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
36

W af)@3e30aV” afl. B:aMa 1881t @RAUMGIafla] 168-00 mMUB GERLM
aVE M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.
@1 all. Sl oV @RAUMAlafla] 186-00 mMud e_BL™  aveE
M0 01 2f101H6300.
Wl 0O ago. 6RO @BRAUMGIafly] 194-00 mmUd es3L®1 avs
M0 01 2f1@1H6300.
2-%0 Qi@ MNefload B0WAISHEMHRIN (@JUIOOD
@RABBLIAB8MAIA. . .. .............
@J®Zzelasamald................
2-00 Qldsq | nilefload BIWAISHEMHAA (@Jugo MVE @U@ 1),

2-% Qidhaf mieeoad cowmwl.

QAOMo Qldhaf

Shri [. C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

198. In clause 3, after the word and symbol “ notification,” insert the
words “ in the official gazette”

Shri Parakkal Abdulla : Sir, I move the following amendment:




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
37

199.  In clause 3(f), delete the word “ and” and insert the new sub clause

“ (g) Goods and Service Tax Officers; and” and existing sub clause

(g) shall be renamed as (h).

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment:

200. Clause 3(g) shall be deleted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment:

201. In the proviso to clause 3, after the symbol, figures and word “ (30 of
2004)” add the symbol, words and figures, “ ,the Kerala Agriculture

Income Tax Act, 1991 (15 of 1991)” .

WMHIO\0Jo HWQo Qo |a@)] (GawI. Sl ag)o. CMINAV HafMV): VA,
S x

GRBVLMIMHUI MY j‘]oea(o%eacm’l%l).

ol. ae98: @l @ag). AUl MIdLIGHHM @RAIMGIala) 198-00 maud

GRALMI] VB MBIBO]2[1B1H63aM.

@1 al00so@  @PMIEl  EROIOGI 2 199-00 maud eerw®1 ave

MIEIHH 0] 2f1a1H630M0.

O@Joan. BRYMIE" 2000V MEBBUWY EPAIMATa{la) 200-00 MaUA GRBVLM]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
38

ME MIEIB0]aflalas3am.
W) 0OMBoo:Y]l @rell ERAMGIa(la) 201-00 maud cesL®1 auve
MIEIHH 0] 2fla1H630M0.
3-%0 Qldq MeNead BINMIGHEMHAM (@JUIOO
@RABLNA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
3-00 Qldaf MiElOad BIVAILHIMOHAM (@JUo MVE GRoU1H:O] ).

3-20 aldaf mielload 8owmwl.

MOoLIdo Adsal

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment:

202. In clause 4(2) the words “ The Commissioner” shall be
substituted with the words, “ without prejudice to the provisions of
sub-section (1), for the Administration of this Act, the
Commissioner”

Shri S. Sarma : Sir, I move the following amendment:

203. Clause 4 shall be recast as follows:-
“ 4. Jurisdiction of officers.- The Commissioner shall have

jurisdiction over the whole of the State the Special Commissioner



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
39

and an Additional Commissioner in respect of all or any of the
functions assigned to them, shall have jurisdiction over the whole of
the State or where the State Government so directs over any local
area thereof and all other officers shall, subject to such conditions as
may be specified have jurisdiction over the whole of the State or

over such local areas as the Commissioner may, by order, specify.” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_Iceaqd@f] (). Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,
¢_BLMIBU3 MV lBHalesanlel.

o). aVleed: @l 0ems8led:9l @rell @rAImElafly 202-%0 maud

GRARVLM™1 MR MTBIBO1.2[101H63a0.
W) oV v0dm @RAMGlafla] 203-00 mMUB 6BRVLM™] TVBYOS
@RMAMNCWINS afladalell aflalasamn.
4-00 Qlda| MNeload BIVMILHEMOAMM (@JUWYOOD
@MLINAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®1Zeilasamald..........

4-00 Qldsqf Mielond BINAIHAMOAI @JWo TG @R 1kh:G] ).
QY ] m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
40

4-%0 aldof mNefload cowadwl.

@R6MIJo Qldsal’

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali:  Sir, I move the following amendment:

204. In clause 5 (1), after the word “ as” the words “ the Government
or’ shall be added.

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: Sir, I move the following amendment:

205. In clause 5 (1), for the words “ as the Commissioner may impose”
the words “ as may be imposed” shall be substituted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim: Sir, I move the following amendment:

206. In clause 5 (1), after the words “ or imposed on him” the word
and symbol “ /her” shall be added.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment:

207.  Clause 5 (2) shall be deleted.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments:

208. In clause 5 (2), after the words “ under this Act” the following the
words “ or the rules made there under” shall be inserted.

209. In clause 5 (3), after the word “ delegate” the words “ or
distribute” shall be added.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo m&(g‘d@j‘ (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication

41
¢_BLMIBU3 MV lHdlasamlel
2. aVleed @ @) 2am80::¢l @pell @RAMOlafls 204-00 maud

GR_RUWMT MR M1RIMH0]2[1G1H6MD.
W O, MYERaH &Qaj @RAU®GIafla) 205-00 MMUB 6E3LMI TVBYHS
@RMAMICWINS afladalell aflalasamn.
@l sl all. ®wE2adlo GRAMGlafla] 206-00 maud ces3L®1 ave
M1OIB0] afldlHs30M0.
O@Joan. ERMIE" 2006TVM MEBBUS BPAIM@lafla 207-00 MIUG GREVL®I
MR MIOIMH0]aflalas30M.
W ail. ail. WRIB®B GRAMGIa{la] 208, 209 agam1 mmud 6B3LGIE:U3
aMVE M1RIM 0] 2[1G1H6M.
5-%0 aldaf Melload BINAILHEMHAAM (@ JUYEOID)
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
5-00 Qigaf mefload BIVAISHEMHRAM (@JUgo TVE @oU1d:12).

5-%0 aldaf mnileflond cowmowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
42

@)00%0 Qdal

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment:

212.  In clause 6 (2)(a), for the words “ proper officer” substitute, the

words “ authorised officer” .

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendment:

214.  Clause 6 (3) shall be deleted.

a3, 8@ oMY OMQPINEIMAN” @REEBRY" GMIIRLINA|SIMGa|0Rlo 3@
OIVMST BaNIMNW allSIfalg GaldnrIWIM. BT HMVElow)” HMFPIWITIGoLjo
CHh(@Bo allSlasenInMMss B@ GaNIMIW @REBROHW allS1ealS®ed:IeMME’
a)©03 VAWM G 1TGAIME] QO HO®EII0 pai’ 6.21QaM.
Q031 @1EHIMINEMES 1M WIVIBo BHIOEERABMNE. MM WIIBo @@((g@)gmg”.
AlGHH al0EM1S’ 3I0JATEI0NDHGIME’ MEILI0 af)DMF GBROMI Al §.21Q)aM.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment:

216.  Clause 6 (3), shall be recast as follows :-
“ Any Proceedings, rectification, appeal and revision, of any order

passed by an officer appointed under the Central Goods and Services



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
43

Tax Act, 2017 (Central Act 12 of 2017) shall not lie before an officer
appointed under this Act” .

. aeed:  212-00  mud ee3w®l  213-20  moud  eeru®0e

@LIYN0O®IMIT BRAIMT]q {I@HoME@IE].

WML 0Jo HWQo Qloeyg:j@ﬁ (awa. Sl. afo. EGMIDAV” Hag)aVS): AVA,

NIa0MNIMO S HAMIAB af)o. DINA alOM® NOIVEL  BI60I CRERVMIYL NSO
ol smansel @] B2a0TTVAAIMBAIW]T  al@a) 021Q.  aBODIOSEE
CRBVMIHUB  AVIHO1EHIMW  HYIQEDd GBREMLI0  MVf1HE1EHIMIV]  an”
daileel af)g’ mem] @3 MEBBUT BMIBEBHWIGI'.

@) af)o. 003 MMIB OEDJIV® GITBEDANDIM” BH@o BaMWo aloWlel.

¢e3OMIHU  NVflBHOCIEDIDIVTIABEMIINB  af)a@OHMNE"  TLflB:OlasmMmleelan”
@6aR" l131H@1E8300W@AD. MHEa 203 EREO@IMDo @REEE” aloQaNIAL.

2. 19 @: aflayt...qflavt.... 1. af)o. 2003, al@ajOlel.

GWI. Sl afo. GOV 9afVdh: V@, MIEBUW  @RAUMO]o{lal

MVoMIAL|DTOMEI0 aMIMW AQalST al0eR. MG IQYBB®  M16BBUT  HOH:

owadom1 gal’ 6.21Q)a0. @@ 630600000  ANWBIHE12J0T  0f)Caloud O



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
44

ONABHIMW HY1WYo. @RDEHIMBI6MM 6IMIAD ANUOBTHO1HHICID) . m%zmga)s
Ee3LMINW  respect §.21PHB:INZ®OMNVE” aloQaney, later you will
understand. @P®" @R ODEAUODI@ @O  TVADEafIgME.  CRBOGIHUI
Ll @lasanlel.
o). aVed: @l @RMBAIE MVIBED” BRAIMGIa(la] 212-00 MmMIA BV
MR M1RIM0]2[1G1H6M.
W)  agfo. 93 @RAU®MOlaflal 214-00 ®maud es3L®]  auve
M1OIBH 01 afld1H630M0.
Wl MBIl @rell @AU®Glafla) 216-00 maud eesw®] aue
M0 01 2{101H630M0.
0-20 Qldaf mNeflond BIVAIGHEMHAID  (JUIHOID
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
0-00 Qldsa] MNENO BIVAVBHEMHAM @G0 MVE @RV @ ).
6-%0 Qldaf mNefload 80naWIal.

a3 ®90 Qldal”




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
45

Shri S. Sarma : Sir, I move the following amendments:

217. In clause 7(1)(a), for the words “ in the course or” the words “ in
the course of” shall be substituted.

218.  In clause 7(1)(b), for the words “ in the course or” the words “ in
the course of” shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, [ move the following amendments:

219. In clause 7(2)(b), for the words “ a State” the words “ the State”
shall be substituted.

220. In clause 7(2)(b), for the words “ a State” the words “ Central
Government or the State” shall be inserted.

223.  In clause 7(2)(b), after the words “ notified by the” the words
“ Central Government or State” shall be added.

Shri Roji M. John : Sir, I move the following amendment:

221.  In clause 7(2)(b), for the words “ State Government” the words
“ Government of Kerala” shall be substituted.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments:

222. In clause 7(2)(b), after the words “ a State Government” the words
“ or a union territory” shall be inserted.

225. Clauses 7(3)(a) and (b) shall be recast as follows,-
“ (a) a supply of goods
(b) a supply of services”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
46

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_Iceaqd@f] (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

GRBVLMIHUY cmfloea(o’loe@cm’]@_lu.

o). leed: Wl agaV. wdm @RAIMEAlafly 217, 218 agam1 maud

GRAVMIHHU3 MBWYHS BRMAMICWINS afladaiell {1e185300.
W neMBIE:Y]l @rell @amalafls 219, 220, 223 agan1 maud
GRBLMIHU3 MR MBIGO12[1A1HBD.
W) 0ol agf)o. GRIM @RAUMOlafla] 221-00 ®mIUd es3L®] avE
M1OIBH 01 afld1H630M0.
W ail. afl. WRB®B @RAMGIa{la] 222, 225 aganT mmId ee3L®1E:u3
Ve M1RIB012[1a1H80M0.
7-%0 Qldaf milefload conmIBHIMOHRIN (@)UY
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
T-00 Qldqa] Mieloag 2onMISHMORM @Ju3o TVE BRoW1d:@4).

7T-%0 Qldaf anflefload cowmowl.

af)§%0 Qldsal




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
47

(eezvlel)
8-%0 Qldq Mo BINMIGHEMHAMM @JUIOO
@R BBLINAsB3MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZGeNasamala... ...
8-00 Qldaj Miefload RIVAILHIMOHAA (@Jugo MVE GRoW1HO] ).
8-20 aldaqf milelload cowMOWI.

B0 al®0 Adsal

Shri Abdul Hameed P. : Sir, I move the following amendments:

227. In clause 9(1), the word “ twenty” shall be substituted with the
word “ twelve” .

232.  In clause 9(5), the word “ electronic” shall be subsitituted with the
word “ online” wherever it occurs.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment:

228. In clause 9(1), the words “ twenty per cent” shall be substituted
with the words “ eighteen per cent” .

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments:

230. In clause 9(1), for the words “ twenty per cent” substitute the



231

233.

234.

235.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
48

words “ the rate” .

In clause 9(1), after the words “ recommendations of the Council”
the words “ from such date” shall be inserted.

Shri Eldose P. Kunnapillil : Sir, I move the following amendment:

In the first proviso to clause 9(5), for the words “ person
representing” subsitute the words “ authorised representative” .

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments:

In clause 9(5), after the second proviso the following proviso shall
be added:

“ Provided also that every notification under sub-section (2) in so
far as it relates to levy or increase of such duty, shall be laid before
the State Legislature if it is in session as soon as may be after the
issue of the notification, and if it is not in session within seven days
of its re-assembly, and the Government shall seek the approval of
Legislature to the notification by resolution moved within a period of
fifteen days beginning with the day on which the notification is so
laid before the legislature and if the legislature makes any
modification in the notification or directs that the notification should
cease to have effect, the notification shall thereafter have effect only
in such modified form or be of no effect, as the case may be but
without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done there
under” .

In clause 9, add the following sub clauses after 9(5):

“ (6) The State tax in respect of the supply of taxable goods or



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
49

services or both by a supplier, who is not registered, to a registered
person shall be paid by such person on reverse charge basis as the
recipient and all the provisions of this Act shall apply to such
recipient as if he is the person liable for paying the tax in relation to
the supply of such goods or services or both.
(7) The Government may, on the recommendations of the council, by
notification, specify categories of services, the tax on intra-state
supplies of which shall be paid by the electronic commerce operator
if such services are supplied through it, and the provisions of this Act
shall apply to such electronic commerce operator as if he is the
supplier liable for paying the tax in relation to the supply of such
services.”
@, M®IM ONE" aldOWIANIM. BB HAVL[oW” MITBOMIO™ BREEBEWIS
O® aloaomIg” »H0)AIel. D@ HY1aM@IMVEUaHe @633 O_IOCQ)’]%(S(T)O@G)GT)O.
D MVBYOS BRI 2WAOM I {ISIE8IM ERHIMVINI®. ER@IMEAIMEIWIaM
DD GREWMI aMIM HHIMNZAUMD.  af)HAF MVAIWINTHIMEAUNE]T BT AIIB
10N OLIENTE af)H1d AMIVIBGHIEWIS™ 21QAD OGN, BRDOD0ME’ 234,
235 a1 6ERLGIHW  BEMALISHQNS GBRADIV OV a [1S1esam
6E3VMIVWIVDOBINE” AMIMI®” JOI” H2IYPMD. @REE D@ ALI:A1EHMeOHRAN

amId ArleNgo BRGAIRHIHE3HWIEM.

WMHO0Y0J0 HWQo Al QD] (awa. Sl. af)o. BMIATV Haf)aTVE:): VA,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
50

Wl od. oxalwom 226-0 mmud eV mafles  @PAIMGalaflel.

BRDHHIMNE” M® BVEBLIN D CRRNMIWIWV] I BRAIMBlalHs3HWIeM.

226. In clause 9 (1), add the word “ State” after the word
“ Kerala” .

W1BaHHOM]EIS8 MVACNHG EalG1@3 M0Qo AUGBOMIWIGNE. Kerala
Goods and Service Tax-m” KGST ag)an” 06:050m. @@ aflejm mla:]
MOAOHIHA 2 JBHOGA|0I6M. @RYBHBHSOHWEI0 AMAVI@3  ER@INOSB® .
@D HIENS” o®Ied  State  ag)amogss] DS GaldOD. UO1BaUDHOM] @I
20g1loslejo OSHO1M3 MoQ1YgIel @M MIa0MIMeals HAMIA O, AOBTWON3
2eNE1BH6M 2" MVflH00 MIVISB8 GEBRLMIWINM.  BMOOOTM 6IMEBBUS DT
momﬂaﬂ. S0199@3L8ST MO QANWIHNHAMM UYL, af)o. 20201M° OO0
M@GHHWIM. 09" 6RO I1HUY TVf1dhalasanlel.

o). e9d:  MIa0RIMeals @1 GRAIMAIa{la] 226-00 MM 6ERLM
BV634001H CRRULMIWIV] aVE @R 1M 1aflolds3m0.

1. (BTO6T)_I@Q53 0013, afl. @RA®Glafly] 227, 232 agaml maud

GRAVM U3 MR MTIB012{101H63a0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
51

O@Joan. @RYMIE" 2000TVM MBBU EPAUMGIa(la] 228-%0 MIUG EREL®]
e MIEIHH0]aflalas3am.
Wl afl. afl. VRIB®B ERA®GIa{la] 230, 231 agyam1 maud B3V 1&:U3
Ve M1RIB012[161H80M0.
W ag)@eE0aV" ail. &:MafI8s1ed GRAIMOIa(la] 233-00 MaUA GBI
MR M1RIM0]2[1G1H6M.
W ago. 9023 @ERA®a(ls) 234, 235 agyam1 mmMIB ceBRV™1B:U3 Ve
M1OIBH 01 afld1H630M0.
CRBLM] §alQ (@JHIVASS 9-%0 QG| nieflond  BIWAIHHIMOA
@O
@RABLNA63MAIA. . ... ...
@G Nasamala..........
GRB3OM] §2IQ @)H0088 9-00 Alda] MNLNOR BINMIGHEMHAAD @Jugo
Ve @01 @1a).
CRRNMI] 1Y) (@JHI0NBS 9-20 Qldsq | nileflond cowmowl.

al®®O0 Qldsal’




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
52

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment:

236. In clause 10(1), for the words “ fifty lakh” the words 'one hundred
lakhs' shall be substituted.

Shri V. K. C. Mammed Koya : Sir, I move the following amendment:

237. In clause 10(1), for the words “ fifty lakh” the words “ seventy
five lakh” shall be substituted.

@, 1. agaul sl mielload alomio Aldsa(loel 80Mlo Daldldsq {3
composition levy mluaolaesm@lm” onoomo aflgaieal” 50 elato (@l
af)M88®” 75 EldHo @Bal af)MMIGHT  OVWAOMEMHAMMIAN  af)M1HS
A 10QIN8BO).

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment:

238.  Clause 10(1)(a), shall be recast as follows:

“ (a) those also opt composition levy must purchase from registered
firms/Individual only” .

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments:

239. In clause 10(1) (a), the words “ in State” shall be deleted.

241.  In clause 10(1)(b), the words “ in State” shall be deleted.



242.

240.

244.

249.

252.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
53

The proviso to clause 10 (1) shall be deleted.

Shri V. D. Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment:

In clause 10(1)(b), for the words “ two and a half per cent” the
words 'two per cent' shall be substituted.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments:

13

In the proviso to clause 10(1), the words “ or decrease” shall be

inserted after the word “ increase” .

In clause 10(5), the words “ proper officer” shall be substituted
with the words “ officers under section 3” .

In clause 10(5), the words “ to be fixed” shall be inserted after the
words “ a penalty” .

M@, af)EAIGBo GB3OMIBHUE POI' H21QYAN oD alOoQMD. &l.ag)au.sl.

HMMAVILIM” M@GCD M CRRVMI 6210003 @Towmﬁ)omog@%z. aM6B3U3 EI@®)]

DTN HAUQO® AW14g) af) EMYSS. @R® NIaOMIMalg QD 1HB0 BROTWIo.

@R@ODHIMNE" MIa0NIMOals M19HA@ Yol §aIQYIT A, 616BRUY  MOIHS

DA1H0%0. D@ GOi” ©21Q)d M@ oa‘mogg%. @) af)o. 2003 MEIDCalISL]

al01[1S06M" $H00L6BBU3 A lOQAND. @REROOMIM” Galdejo ol 6a1QOM

HYlQaniel



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
54

ol. aV1E9HAB: MVERINEEBRUD ) TN GRRVMIMRHUI NINGM2? BRDE:INE”
RAI” ©.21Q6Mo.

Shri Hibi Eden : Sir, I move the following amendment:

245. In the proviso to clause 10(1), for the words “ fifty lakh” the words
“ hundred lakh” shall be substituted.

Shri S. Sarma: Sir, I move the following amendment:

246. In the proviso to clause 10(1), for the words “ fifty lakh” the words
“ seventy five lakh” shall be substituted.

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O.lc@ard@f] (aw9. Sl af)o. EGMINAV" HaIVS): VA,

Wl ail. a&. V). 20®” 6HIW ERAIMGIA(la] 237-00 MMIA GRELMIYL UY).
ag)aV. vodom @RAIMANafla] 246-00 MMUB GRBO® B3 GBIMIVEMEToW)”
MBS alolwl 50 eidHo @al@Iad Mlan” 75 eloHo (BalWIHBDH
af)NBBMIGM .  BRDHHINS O NS cs@ecnasﬂce;go M &olasa.  yl. ail.
alfl. VRIBMB al0MODDEa ORI MAGH NI@NIV] DVWBOMING HY1WILl.  alesH
OIVMSD B A ldAVIGOIV@IMEUaHo 2].af)TUS]. HDEMIVIG3 @R 75
EldHo (BnlWIV] 2VACmIWIgMmE. BRDOHHIME" MNIaONIMAa]g HAMUABRIA

AI0DEaIOL]  CHO8OMIHM  Mleaemlad 75 eldHo  (Galwow]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
55

GMISIONAOW”  al@lW]l  QIoo. M1BBUS D@ 2020018103
AMAV1LNW]EHIM00.  EHMBOMINMW 6210501 Mo ERVEAIINL! aldhGOm]
AUYHVEE] HalIQD. DDCaIOL! GRMIININL 0  GAMEISOD  MSeOHA IGMOMNSE"
alead QeINACIM” aN@RLAIVW]T MTVWAe A ldAVIGHIMW  HYlwlel. leX
¢e3LM1HU3 MV flaalassaniel

o). 1e9d: @l. ail. &d. AVl PG’ EHOW ERAUMGIa(la] 237-00 Mm@
BRI U], af)aIV. 0de BRAIMGIa(la] 246-00 MU cRRVMIYL aLE
@01 01 afl01H530M.

W af). all. @MIA3 =008 ERAU®Glafls) 236 -00 MMUAB 6E3L®I LB
M0 01 2{101H630M0.

9(@Jonn. @RYMIE" 2006V ®6BUWS ERAIMElafla] 238-00 MMIAB RBVM]
MR M1RIM0]2[1G1H6M.

W ag)o. 93 ERAUGGa(la) 239, 241, 242 agam1 maud 6_3L®1H:u3
e MIEIH0]aflalas3aM.

Wl afl. Wl auoelwad GRAIMGIa(ly 240-00 maud 6e3L®1 Ve

M0 01 2f101H630M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
56

Wl al afl. wRIBMB GRAIMO1a{la) 244, 249, 252 agan1 maud

GRBLMIHU3 MR M1QIGO1.2f1A1H630.
@) 98a0ml MOWM BRAUMAlafla] 245-00 mMIB GO aLE
M0 01 2{101H630M0.
¢eELM] ©121Q]HI0NBS 10-00  Qisa]’ niellond  BOWAISHMSOAN
@JROOD
@RaBLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
¢RI §21QYEJHIVABS 10-00 aidaf nfeleod BIWAISHIMHOAN (@JUQo
aTE @ooW 1 @la).
RV §21QJ00088 10-00 aldaf mileflond cowmowl.

al®1oMOMo0 Qldhal”

Shri M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendments:

253. In clause 11(1), insert the word “ Central” before the word
“ Government” .

256. In clause 11(2), insert the word “ Central” before the word
“ Government” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
57

Shri V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments:

254. In clause 11(1), delete the words and symbols in between
“ sotodo” and“ by notification” .

13

258. In clause 11(2), delete the words and symbols in between “ so to

do” and “ by special order” .

262. In clause 11(3), for the words “ one year” substitute the words
“ six months” and for the words “ as if it had always been the part
of the first such” substitute the words “ from the date notified in
the gazette” .

Shri K. S. Sabarinadhan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

257. In clause 11(2), add the word “ absolutely” after the words “ it

2

1S

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment:

260. In clause 11(2), add the words “ in writing” after the word
“ order” .

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.

263. In clause 11(4), after the words “ Any notification” add the words
“ applicable to the State” .

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O.Io@aqd@f] (@awa. Sl. afo. EMIDAV” Haf)aVS): AV,

GRBVLMIHUIJ (Tufloe;(o%es;mﬂ%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
58

ol. a1l @ Wl ago. 9003 @RAUMGIafla] 253, 256 agan1 maud

GRBLMIHU3 MR M1QIGO1.2f1A1H630.
Wl all afl. @B @pAaGGlafla) 254, 258, 262 agam1 maud
GRAVMIHHU3 MR MTAIB012{101H63a0.
W O, af)aV. MIAIMINM BRAIGGIa{la] 257-00 MG GR3L®I TVE
M0 01 2f1R1H630.
Wl afl. Sl e®aay” @rAmOlafla) 260-%0 maud ee3w®] auve
M1OIBH 01 afld1H630M0.
W 2am80@:9] @rell GrAMGlafla] 263-20 mMUA B3V aULE
M0 01 2{101H630M0.
11-00 aldqf mNeloag BIWVAISHEMHAMM @JURHOID
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
11-00 aimaf mNefload 8oWaIBHEMORA @Ju3o MVE @RoV1d:G]a).

11-00 almqf enNefload cowmowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
59

al@éne%0 Qldsal

Shri K. Suresh Kurup: Sir, I move the following amendment:

265. In clause 12 (4), for the words “ supply of vouchers” the words

* issuance of vouchers” shall be substituted.

WM HIBYNJo HWQo O_ltﬂagd@’] (awa. Sl. afo. EMIDAV” Haf)VD): AV,
¢RI MV fl&alasamlel.

ol. 1e9d @ @l k. MYeoad &*Qal @RAI®Glafla] 265-00 ®mMA

GRBVLMI MERWHS BRMADMIGWINS afladaleilsflalsassan.

12-00 aidaf mNefload owaIHHeamHRIN (@JUIHOD
@MLINAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®1ZBeilasamald..........

12-00 aldqaf mefload caVISHEMERAM (@JUgo TVE @U@ 2).

12-00 i@ mNefload 20wadwl.

al®1aNIo QAldsa |

(63L& BRAIM®a 106 SIEL)

ol. 199a@: 13-00 aldaf mlelloag BIWAIBHMEOAM (JUROHO




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
60

@R BLINAEB3MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
13-00 aimqf miefload c0WMILHMHAM (@Jugo MVE BRoW KA ).
13-20 aidqf mileflod cowaowl.

al®1MOeINo Aldsaf

Shri K.S. Sabarinadhan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

268. In the proviso to clause 14, for the word “ four” substitute the
word “ seven” .

WMH00Y0J0 HWQo Qg QD] (awa. Sl. afo. EMINAV” Haf)VD): VB,

¢e3L®] qfldalasanlel.
o). 1698 @ @l . af)aTV. VMIATMILNM BRAIMGIa{la] 268-00 MMIA
GR_BLMI MVE M1RIM 0] 2[1G1H6M.
14-00 aida| mNeload cIVMIHHEMHAMM (@JUIOOD
@MLINAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®1Zeilasamald..........

14-00 Qidsqf MNENoO] LOWRILHMOHAM @0 MVUE BRoW1H:@).
[y 0 m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
61

14-%0 aimaf enNefload cowaow.

al®1MeIdo QAldhal

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments:

269. In clause 15(1), after the words “ the sole consideration for the
supply” add the words “ or services” .

273. In Explanation (a)(iv) to clause 15, for the words “ twenty-
five” substitute the words “ forty nine” .

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment:

271. In clause 15(2)(e), the words “ State Governments” shall be
substituted with the words “ State Government” .

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments:

272. In clause 15(5), insert the word “ Central” before the word
“ Government” .

274. In Explanation (b) to clause 15, for the word “ legal”
substitute the word “ judicial” .

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O.lc@ard@f] (aw9. Sl af)o. EGMINAV" HaIVS): VA,

GR_BVLMIHUI (mﬁ@a(zﬂoe@(m"l%.

o). e9ad @ @ afl. afl. WRIBM ERAIMEa{la] 269, 273 agam1 mmud




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
62

GRBULMIHhU3 MVER M1VIBHO12{1B1H6300.
W) 0OMBIoH:Y]l @rell @A®MOlafla)l 271-00 maud c_L®1 auve
MIEIHH 0] 2fla1H630M0.
W ag)o. 2003 BRAIMANa{la) 272, 274 agan1 mmud ceBLMIB:u3 Ve
M0 01 2{1@1H630M0.
15-20 almqf milefloagd BIWAIBHEMEOAMM @JUROOID
@RaBLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
15-00 aigqf milefload cowasneMmeam @Jugo ME @MW 1d:01 ).
15-20 aimqf nflefload cowmowl.

al®1M9I09%0 Aldsal

Shri V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment:

275. In clause 16 (1), after the words “ or both to him” insert the
words “ within the period, as may be prescribed” .

Shri S. Sarma: Sir, I move the following amendments:

2776. In the second proviso to clause 16 (2) (d), after the
words “ further that” insert the words “ where
the supplier fails to file returns in time showing the



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
63

output tax and” .
278. In the third proviso to clause 16 (2) (d), after the words
“ made by him” the words “ or due to be made as

agreed with the supplier” shall be inserted.

Shri M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendment:

279. After clause 16 (4), the following sub clause shall be added

“ (5) a registered person, having any unutilized tax to his credit
which was paid under a law relating to tax subsumed under the
Goods and Services Tax levied under this Act, shall be

entitled  to set off such tax paid against tax payable under
this Act” .

WMHIY0Jo HWQo moes%j@pﬁ (awa. Sl. afo. EMIDAV Hag)aVS): AVAE,
CRBVMIHU3 MV lHTlasanlel

o). aeed @ @ all. afl. WRIBM ERA®Ga(ls) 275-00 MMUB 6BLM]
MR M1RIMH0]2[1G1H60M.

W af)aV. B ERAUGGIafla) 276, 278 aan1 MmaUA EBEOL®1G:U3 Tue
M0 2{1@1H630M0.

W)l  afo. 9m3 @AMGlafla)  279-00 maud 6BV  ave
MIOIB 0] afldlHs30M0.

16-20 aigqaf mNeflond BINMILHEMHDAM @JUIOOID



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
64

@R BLINAEB3MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
16-00 aimaf mlefload cIWAISHEMHRAM (@JUGo MVE @U@ 1),
16-20 aitaf eefload gowaow.

al®1GMPI0 Aldsal

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments:

280. In clause 17 (4), the words and symbol “ including a non-
banking financial company,” shall be deleted.

284. In clause 17 (5) (b) (iii) (A), for the word “ notifies” the
word “ determine” shall be substituted.

Shri Abdul Hameed. P : Sir, I move the following amendment:

283. In clause 17 (5) (b) (1), the words and symbol “ health
services,” shall be deleted.

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment:

285. In clause 17 (5) (b) (iii) (A), after the words “ any law” the
words “ or rule” shall be inserted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo moegc%;l@ﬁ (awI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

GRBVLMIHUI Vv j’]cea@’lcesmn’l%;.

o). 16938 : ). afl. afl. RIB®M ERAGGA{la) 280, 284 agam1 maud



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
65

GRBULMIHhU3 MVER M1VIBHO12{1B1H6300.
@1 @B 0016% afl @RAI®EIa{la) 283-00 mMUd 6B3L® LB
MIEIHH 0] 2fla1H630M0.
@1 @EPMAR  TVIBO®  BRAIMGIafla]  285-00 MMIB  GRBLM®T  aVE
M0 01 2{1@1H630M0.
17-20 altaf afleflond coWRISHIMHRIN (JUIHOID
@RaBLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
17-00 aidqf enilefload owaosnemeaa @jugo e @Row)1d:d1a).
17-00 qidqf anflefload cowmol.

al®1omMgo0 QAldsal’

Shri V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

289. In clause 18(1)(a), for the words 'thirty days' substitute the
words 'forty five days'.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo moegc%;l@_@ (awI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,
¢_3L®1 MV lHalesanlel

o). o3 @ @), ail. awl. V1M BRAIMEafla) 289-00 MMUAB GREL®]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
66

ME MIEIB0]aflalas3am.

18-20 aldaf mNelload cOVMILHEMHAI (JUIODOID
@RaBLNH63aMAIA. . .. ......
@J®1Zeilasanald..........

18-2%0 aidaf milgloag 8OVMIBHEMHAMM (@JUgo MVE BP0 1e:@1a).

18-%0 algaj mieNload sowmow.

al®OMIMal®I0 Adsal

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment:

290. In clause 19(6), for the words 'a period of three years' substitute
the words 'a period of two years'.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moea%!@)’l (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

GR_AULMI m)ﬂ(ﬁ;(o%e@(m"l%.

2. e9d : @l af). all. EMI@IHEN0E GRAUGGIafly 290-00 maud

GR_BVLMI MVE M1RIM0]2[1G1H6MMD.
19-20 altaf alleflond oWRIGHIMHRIN (JUIHOID
@R BLINA6B3aMAIA. . .. ...

@®ZGelasamala..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
67

19-00 aidsqf mnilefload cowadBnMeEnM o MVE @RoW1d:d14).
19-00 qigqf milefload sowmowl.

D @Bal®i0 Aldsal’

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendment:

291. In clause 20(1), after the words “ distribute the credit of”
insert the following words “ central tax as central tax” .

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments:

292. In clause 20(2)(d), the words “ a State or turnover in a
Union territory”  shall be substituted with the words
“ the State” .

293. In clause 20(2)(e), the words “ a State or turnover in a
Union territory”  shall be substituted with the words
“ the State” .

294, In the explanation (a)(i) to clause 20(2), the words “ their
State or Union Territories” shall be substituted with the
words “ the State” .

295. In the explanation (a)(i1) to clause 20(2) the words “ their

State or Union Territories” shall be substituted with the
words “ the State” .

WMSO0I0J0 HVQo Al ]AD] (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" af)TVH): VB,

GRBULMIHUI Vv j’lce;moeszm1%|).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
68

o). 1898 @ Wl ag)o. 9003 BRAGEa{la] 291-00 MmaUB BBV aVE
M1OIBH 01 afld1H630M0.

W, 2aOB0B:¢] @Rl GRAIMGIa(ls] 292, 293, 294, 295 agam1 maud
GRAVMIHHU3 MR MTAIB012{101H63a0.

20-% Qial mlelond 8IWMIHHIMONAAD @JUIO DI
(W] [¢] m

@®ZeNasamala... ...
20-00 Qidqf nilellond @WaIHHIMORAM @Jugo MG BRoW1d:A2).
20-20 aidqf milefload cowmowl.

DH@BalO®M] 80NJo QAldsal

Shri P.T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment:

296. In clause 21, after the words 'with interest' add the words,

'charged for Saving Banks Account from time to time'.

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O.lc@ard@f] (aw9. Sl af)o. EGMINAV" HaIVS): VA,

GR_BILMI anj‘loe)moe@mﬂ%.

ol. V198 @ @ afl. Sl. eIV’ BRAIMGa[la] 296-00 MmMIB G_EL®]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
69

ME MIEIB0]aflalas3am.

21-00 Qigaf amlefload BINAIBGHIMHDIM (@JUIO O
@RaBLNH63aMAIA. . .. ......
@J®1Zeilasanald..........

21-00 aidsqf milefload owAIBHIMORIM @0 TVE @RoW 1A .

21-00 aidaf mNefload 20wmow.

D @BalOM1 6NBJ0 Qldsal’

Shri Abdul Hameed. P. : Sir, I move the following amendment:

299. In the proviso to clause 22(1), for the word “ ten”
substitute the word “ twenty”

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moea%!@)’l (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

¢_3L®] MV lsclasanlel.
ol. 1993 : @1 @MIUD 200137 afl @OIDCIa{ls] 299-00 MMIB ce3O]
Ve M1RIM012[1a1H80M0.
22-20 aldmqf mleNlond BIVMIBHIMHAID (JUROGI
@R BLINA6B3aMAIA. . .. ...

@®ZGelasamala..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
70

22-%0 Qidaf MileflHad GoWacaneMmeam @j@o M8 @RoW1d:dla).
22-% aidq milefload sonmowl.

D BalO®M1QaNIo Adsal

(6e3LW™ @GRAI®Gq {le06aq SIel)
23-00 Qi@ MNeload BIVMILHEMOAAM (@JUIOOID

@R BLINA63aMAIA. . .. ...

@®ZeNasamala... ...
23-00 aidqf mefload owRILHEMORIM @JWo VB @RoU1d:@1a).
23-00 almaf nNefload cowmowl.

D BalOMIMILIO0 QAldsal’

Shri Abdul Hameed. P: Sir, I move the following amendment:

302. In clause 24(x), the word “ electronic” shall be substituted
with the word “ Online” .

Shri I. C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

303. In clause 24 (xii), after the word “ Government” insert the
words “ from time to time in the Official Gazette” .

WMSO0I0J0 HVQo Al ]AD] (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV” af)TVH): VB,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
71

¢_BLMIBU3 MV lHdlasamlel
ol. aVeead : W amesm@uﬁ 20013 afl @RAIMA)afla] 302-00 maUAB 3L
MR MIEIMH0]afldlas30M.
@ 0ag). AVl I0LIGHHM @RAIMGa{la) 303-00 MMIA ce3L®] aLE
M0 01 2{1@1H630M0.
24-20 aldaf mleflond BOWAISHIMHAIN (JUIHOID
@RaBLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®1&ellasanala..........
24-00 Qidqf nilefload onadHnaMmenm @Jjygo M8 @oow1d:d14).
24-20 aidof mNefload 80waowl.

D @BalOM1@RMII0 QAdhal

Shri Hibi Eden: Sir, I move the following amendment:

305. In the proviso to clause 25(1), for the words “ five days” the
words “ seven days” shall be substituted.

Shri M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendment:

306. In clause 25(1), the explanation after the proviso shall be
deleted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
72

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments:

307. In clause 25(1), the explanation shall be recast as follows;
“ In the case of a supplier from the territorial waters of

India, registration shall be obtained in the State, if it is the
nearest  point of the baseline” .

308. In clause 25(4), the words “ One State or Union Territory or
more than one State or Union Territory” shall be

substituted with the words “ the State or in another State or
Union Territory” .

309. In clause 25(5) the words “ a State or Union Territory”
shall be substituted

with the word “ the State” .

Shri V.D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment:

311. In clause 25(10), for the words “ such period” the words
“ within thirty days” shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo mdaagd@)"l (aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aV): VB,

GRBLMIHUY CTUﬂ(ﬁa(o']oG{BO’Tﬂ%IU.

2. 16938 @ Wl. 99aomil MW BRAMEa{la] 305-%0 MMUG c_RV®I

MR M1RIM0]2[161H60M0.

W)  ago. 92m3 GPA®Glafly] 306-00 ®md eV  auve

M1EIB 01 2fld1Hs30M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
73

W) neOMBoo:Y]l @rell erAmGlafla) 307, 308, 309 agpanl maud
GRBLMIHU3 MR M1QIGO1.2f1A1H630.
Wl al. Al eRA®Clafla)  3ll-00mud  ee3L®1  ave
M0 01 2{101H630M0.
25-00 Qida MNEeNload BINMIHHEMOAM (@JUIOOD
@R BLINA63aMAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
25-00 Qidsqf MNENO0] BINAIBHMOAM @JWo VB @R lE:G] ).

25-%0 aigqf milefloag conmow.

D BalOMTWIN0 Qldhal’

(ee3w@lel)
26-20 aidaf Mmielloag BIVAIGHEMEOAMM (@ JUREGID
@RABLNH6B3MAIA. . .. ......
@MZeNasamala... ...
26-%0 it MiElOd BIVRIHHAMOAA (@JUgo MVE BRI 10 ).

26-20 aldaf anileNond cowmowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
74

HBalOMNICWPIo QAUdsal

Shri A.P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment:

312. In clause 27 (1), for the words 'ninety days' the words “ one
twenty days” shall be substituted, wherever it occurs.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo m&(g‘d@j‘ (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

¢_3L®] MV IlsHclasamlel.
2. o8 @ Wl af). all. EPMIG &n38 @RAUGGafla) 312-00 mauA
GR_BVLMI MVE M1RIM 0] 2[1G1H6MMD.
27-2 almaqf mileload BINMIGHEMHAMM @JUIOO
@R BBLINA6B3aMAIA. . .. ...
@®ZGelasamala..........
27-%0 aldqf Miefload RIVDIHHIMORA (@Jugo MV G101 a).
27-% aimqf amilefond cowmowl.

D @BalOMIHWSI0 QAldsal’

Shri P.T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment:

316. In the second proviso to clause 28 (2), the words “ in
person” shall be inserted after the words 'being heard'.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
75

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_Iceaqd@f] (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

GR_ALMI aV ﬁcﬁ:(fﬂcﬂ@(ﬁﬂ%.

ol. o8 @ W afl. Sl. eIV’ @RAIMAla{la) 316-00 MMIB 6E3LMI

Ve M1RIB012[161H80M0.
28-00 it MNefload 0WAISHEMHAID (@JUIHDD
@R BLINA63aMAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
28-00 aidqf MNeNlog IVAIGHEMHAM (@Jugo MVE BRoV 1G] ).
28-00 almaf nNefload cowmowl.

@Bl OMIMal®i0 Qldsal’

Shri I. C. Balakrishnan:  Sir, I move the following amendment:

317. In clause 29 (2), delete the words “ including any
retrospective date” .

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%;!m@’l (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" Haf)TVH): VB,

GR_3ULMI AV j’loeamoesacrm%.

ol. 898 1 Wl &ag). AV MLl U@ @RAI®dlafla] 317-20 maud

BRI VB MBIBO]2[1B1H63aM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
76

29-20 aldqf mlelloag BINAIBHEMHAMM (@ JUYEOI
@MLINAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®1Zeilasamald..........

29-20 almqf Neload BIVMHNMOAAM (@JUo TV @GR &0 a).

29-90 At mefload cowmow.

Qa|®90 Qld:al

Shri Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment:

322. In the proviso to clause 30 (2), the words “ in person”
shall be added after the word “ heard” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moeug;l@@ (awI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,
¢_3L®] MV lHalasanlel.
o). a16ed : ). quem1 GRIAVaL’ GRAIMGa{la] 322-00 MaUA EBEL®I
MR MIEIMH0]afldlas30M.
30-00 Qi@ MmNefload 0WAILHEMHOAD (JUIHOID
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@G LNasamala... ...

30-00 aidqf mgfload BOWMISHEMHRAM @JuRo MVE @R 1d:G1a).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
77

30-% almqf miefload cowawl.

AalOMI8NI0 Aldsal

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment:

323. The Proviso to clause 31 (1) shall be recast as follows;
“ Provided that every category of goods or supplies notified
by the Central Government or State Government within
such time and in such manner as may be prescribed, shall
have tax invoice” .

Shri V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments:

324. In clause 31 (3) (a), for the words “ one month” substitute
the words “ fourty five days” .

326. In clause 31 (3) (b), for the words “ two hundred rupees”
substitute the words “ five hundred rupees” .

328. In the proviso to clause 31(3) (c) for the words “ two hundred
rupees” substitute the words “ five hundred  rupees” .

Shri M. Swaraj: Sir, I move the following amendment:

327. In the proviso to clause 31 (3) (c), after the words
“ registered  person” , the following words shall be
inserted “ other than a supplier of cooked food” .

WMHHIO\QJo HWQo Ao la@] (GaWI. Sl ag)o. EMIAAV eIV ): VA,
S es af) af)

GRBVLMIHUY <mﬁoe;(o"loesamﬂ%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
78

). aVleed : @l 2amE8e::¢] @rell GrAmGlafly) 323-00 maud

RV VB MBIBO12[1B1H63aM0.

Wl al afl. WR@B GRA®ONa{la] 324, 326, 328 agpaml maud

GRAVMIHHU3 MR MTAIB012{101H63a0.

W ago. VIR @RAUGGlafla] 327-00 MG  GRBLM]  AVERYES

@RMAMNCWINS afladalell aflalasamn.

31-00 alga Mo BIVMIGHEMHAMM @JUIOOD
@MLINAEB3aMAIA. ..........
@J®1Zeilasamald..........

31-00 aimaf mNelload BOWMISHEMOHAM @Ju3o MVE @RoV 1G],

31-20 At mNeload cowmwl.

Qoo M0 Qldsal

Shri S. Sarma: Sir, I move the following amendment:

329. In clause 32 (1) after the words “ registered person” the

words “ or a registered person opted composition under
section 10” shall be inserted.

WMSO0I0J0 HVQo Al ]AD] (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV” af)TVH): VB,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
79

¢_3L®] MV lHalesanlel
o). V1898 @ Wl af)aV vodan ERAUGGIA{la) 329-00 MMUAB BBV aLE
MIEIHH 0] 2fla1H630M0.
32-%0 Qida MNeload IWAILHEMHRAT (@JUIODOD
@RABLNA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
32-00 Qldsq] milefload BoWMIBHEMEA @Juo MVE @R 1d:@]a).
32-% aldof mNefload cowaowl.

Qo1 Moo Qldsal

(ee3w™lel)
33-20 aldqf Mmielloag BIVAIBHEMHAM (JUROGI
@R BLINA63MAIA. . .. ...
@®ZeNasamala... ...
33-00 Qldqf MiEflOad BIVAILHMHAM (@Jugo MV GRoU1H:O] ).
33-20 aidaj mileflond cowmowl.

Qa]OmIMILIdo QAldsal’




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
80

(63L& U3 BRAIGa {1806 qSIEL)

34-20 alda] mielload —OVMIHHEMHAID (JUIO DI
@RaBLNH63aMAIA. . .. ......
@J®1Zeilasanald..........

34-00 aigmaf MNENlo BOWAISHEMHAI @JWo MVE @RV 1d:G1a).

34-00 aldaf mNeload cowmwl.

Da]OMI@RIIo Qdsal”

Shri Abdul Hameed. P.: Sir, I move the following amendment:

13

332. In the last proviso to clause 35 (1), the words “ or in
physical” shall be inserted after the word “ electronic” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moea%!@)’l (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

¢_3L®] MV lsclasanlel.
ol. 1693 1 @1 @ENJU3 000167 afl. @OIMG (1) 332-90 MMIB ¢e3O®)]
Ve M1RIM012[1a1H80M0.
35-20 aldaf mleflond BIVAIBHEMHAM (JUREOOID
@R BLINA6B3aMAIA. . .. ...

@®ZGelasamala..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
81

35-%0 aigqf milefload cIWAISHEMOAAM (@JUGo MVE @U@ ).
35-20 aldaf mileflond cowmowl.

Da]OMIERY00 Adal’

Shri Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment:

334. In clause 36, for the words “ seventy two months” , the
words “ sixty months” shall be substituted.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moea%d@"l (aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV Aaf)V): VB,

¢e3L®1 qufldclasanlel.
o). 1e9ad : ). @MAUAR TVIBRCL @RAIMAIaflsl 334-00 MMIB GREVL®]
MR MIOIB0]afldlas3aM.
36-20 aldaf MNelond BINMILHEMHAIM @JUIODD
@RME:LNAsBMAIA. (... ......
@J®1Zeilasamald..........
36-00 Qldsq] milefload 0WaSHEMEOA @JWo MVE @R 1d:G1).
36-00 Qb mNefload 0waowl.
(37-00 Qmaf’)

afl. 17.08.2017 enN.ail/oe=2.221. -2
1.00-1.10.rh



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
82

AalO®1oB 90 Qldsal

Shri. K.S. Sabarinadhan: I move the following amendment.

337. In the proviso to clause 37 (1), for the word “ eleventh” |,
substitute the word “ fifteenth” .

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.

338. In clause 37 (2), after the words “ shall stand” , substitute the
words “ shall also stand” .

WMI0Y0Jo HVQo Al Aa] (awa. Sl. af)o. BMIAMV HafVD): VB,

¢RBLM1HO8IMo  TVflB:00 00
o). 1e93: @) Od. af)aTV. VoNIAIMILLM ERAUMGIa{la] 337-00 maud
683WM] AVE M10IHE1,).
Wl 280 &9l @rell ERAIMOIafla) 338-00 MmMUB 6BV ave
m1coooe)(o”lad.
Dalomlag$9oo Qldal mIeload BWAILHIMHAIM (@JUIODD
@RABZBLINASBMAIA. . ............
@®ZBelasamald............

Da]o®la@®do Qe Mmofload  BIWAMISHEMONAM  @JUQo LR



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
83

(GTboUﬂcﬁa(Zﬂ%J.

Da|o®lag®lo Qlda | nilefloa f0nadwl.

Qalo™1ag)S00 Qldsal’

Shri Hibi Eden : Sir, I move the following amendment.

339. In clause 38(2), for the word 'tenth', substitute the word
'fifteenth'.

Shri Abdul Hameed. P : Sir, I move the following amendment.

340. In clause 38(2), for the words “ tenth” and “ fifteenth” |,
substitute the words “ fifteenth” and “ twentieth”
respectively.

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HWQo mceargd@W (@aWa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ HaGMVBy): VA,
CRBMIHOBIMMo  MVI1HI0 AL
o). 1898 ). H9a0mil MOW ERAIMAa{la] 339-00 MMIA GREVL®)
e M1EI:@1).
. (mmé(da a0018%all  ERAI®Glafla] 340-00 mmud es3L®1 aULE
M1 @1 5.
Da]om]ag)So0 Qs miefload BIVMIGHMAIN @JUIODID

@MZLINA8B3aMAIA. ..............



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
84

@®gellasamala............
Qo |0®1ag)300 Aldq MIENHG BINAIGHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE @BRoW1B:@]2).
Dalomlag)§oo Qldsa | milefload owadwl.

AaloMI8MBal®9o Qldsal

Shri Anwar Sadath :Sir, I move the following amendment.

343. In clause 39(2), for the words “ eighteen days” , the words
“ twenty days” shall be substituted.

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendment.

344. In clause 39(3), for the words “ ten days” , the words
“ fifteen days” shall be substituted.

Shri Sunny Joseph : Sir, I move the following amendment.

345. In clause 39(4), for the words “ thirteen days” , the words
“ fifteen days” shall be substituted.

Shri P. T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment.

347. In clause 39(5), for the words “ seven days” , the words
“ ten days” shall be substituted.

WMSO0I0J0 HWQo Al ]AD] (aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV” Haf)MVB>): VA,

CRROMIHOBOMMo  MVflHI0 2Ll



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
85

o). eod: @l @RMAUAR TVIBO ERAMGIA(la] 343-00 MMIA RRVMI
e M@ .
@l all. afl. wR1I@M  @RAMGlafla) 344-00 mMIB GV aLE
M1 5).
@ aueml eRaVan” @RAIMGlafla) 345-00 MMIA GREO®T  aULE
M@ 9.
W1l afl. sl e®nay eGrAmGlafly] 347-%0 mmud ee3L®]  ave
M@ 2.
Do ]O®1830Bal®do Qldal MmO BIWAIHHIMOAND @JUIO O
@RABLNBEB3MAIA. . ............
@J®1eilasanala............
Do |ODIBMWBal®o  Aldsaf el  BIWAISHIMODAN  @JyQo VB
@01 @1).
Do |O®1BMal®Io Qldsq | nilefload fonmwl.

MIMa|®” Y@ MITo|OM1ZIN” AUNHOQYSB Al q|HhUd

(63O &HU3 el



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
86

ol aV1693: MIa @ A®@  MITIONIYAN” QIHOWSBS  Qldho U3

nielload f0MaIEnaIMOHAM @JUIOHDID
@RABLNHEB3MAIA. . ............
@J®eilasamala............
MITW]®"  JO@  MIG|OBIPAN™  AUGOWSS  Aldhq|Hhud  milefloag
BOWMISBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BN 1B014).

MIG | Y@ MIG |TH]PAN” AIOOQRSH Qldsq |HUd milelond Gowacwl.

MM a|OMIMILII0 Qdhal”

(ee30™] @GRAI®a{laflel)

2. W1e9d: M@ |OBIMoLo  Aldsaf mileflom  BoWAIHHIMORI

@JUIOOD
@RAZBLINAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............
MM |OIMoLNo  Aldsaf  melload  BIWAIGHIMOAAN  @JyQo VB

@aowﬂceaaﬂgd.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
87

MIB3a |ODIMOLI00 Qldsq | mileload 2owmowl.

MIB3a |60 Qdsal”

(ee30® @GRAI®a{laflel)
2. 169B: MO |ODERII0 Qldsq ] MOl BONAIBLHMOAIM (@JUIODD
@RABBLINASBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamald............
MIMa |OME@Ido  Qlhaf Mefload  ROMAMIBNEMOAIM  @JRo VR
@01 @1).
MI@3q |OME™Id0 Qldsa | milefloagd sowaow.

MO a|O®MI000 Qldsal’

(6eB3L®] @RAIMGa{1afle))
2. 1H9B: MO D00 Qldha| MLl BIVAIBHIMOHAN (@JUIO D
@RAZBLINAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............
MA@ |TMOI0 Qldsa| L1603 BOVAIGHEMORIM (@JUgo TVE BRoWN1H:@1a).

MI@3q |OMO0 Qldsq | nileflond @owmowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
88

MIL|COMPIo Qldhal

Shri. Roji M. John : Sir, I move the following amendment.

354. In clause 47(1), for the words “ one hundred” substitute the
words “ two hundred”

Shri. V.D.Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

355. In clause 47(1), for the words “ five thousand” substitute the
words “ ten thousand”

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HWQo O.lc@agd@f] (@aWa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ HafMVBy): VA,
CRBMIHOBIMMo  MVI1HI0 AL

ol eed: @) 60022l ag)o. GR0M @RAIMOIafla]  354-00 mauAd

6B aVE M1EIHW1).
@l all. AWl au®lvomd ERAU®GIafla] 355-00 maud eV auve
M@ 5.
MILIEGOMPIo Qldhsa| MIE1O03 BINAISHEMORIM (@JUIOTD
@MZLINH8B30MAIA. ..............
@J®1Zeilasamald............

MIL|BOMI0 Al MIBN1Oa3 BINMIGHEMORIM (@JUo MVE BRON1B:@1a).
[QY) o} m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
89

MILIBO®PI0 Qldsq | milellond 2owadwl.

MIMalOMGIo Adsal

(ee3L®) el
2. 1693: MIBa|OOMFI0 Aldsa | Milellaad BIVAIGHMOAIN @JUIODID)
@RABBLINASBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamald............
MIMa|@@MZo0 Qe  miefload  RIVMIGHMOAM  @JUgo VR
@01 @1).
MI@a |H@MZ00 Qldkal mileflond conmowl.

MIL|O OMIMWal®i0 Aldsal

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendments.

357. In clause 49(5)(a), the words and symbol “ or as the case
may be, Union Territory tax,” shall be deleted

358. In clause 49(5)(e), the words “ or Union Territory tax”
shall be deleted

360. In clause 49(5)(f), the words “ or Union Territory tax”
shall be deleted

362. In the Explanation (b)(i) to clause 49, after the word



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
90

“ Act” , the words and figures “ or under the Central
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 (Central Act 12 of 2017)”
shall be inserted

Shri. A.P.Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment.

361. In clause 49(8), for the word “ or” the word “ and” shall
be substituted

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil : Sir, I move the following amendment.

363. In the Explanation (b)(ii) to clause 49, for the words “ Act
or’ the words “ Act and” shall be substituted

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HhWQo moeag:(l@ﬁ (@aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV’ HafMVB>): VA,
CRRNMHOBIMMo  AVHOQYME].

o). 1e93: U, RMBI0d:¢1 @Rel @RAIMGIafls] 357, 358, 360, 362
af)aMT MMIAB BEBBVMIB:U3 VB MRG0 1).

W1 ag). afl. EEMIT &208 GRAIMGIa{la] 361-00 maUB ee3L® ave
M@ 5.

@), ag)@EBIAY" afl. &:Ma{1881@3 @RAIMEla{la] 363-00 MMIB 6EEVMI
e mmooe)(o”l%g.

MILOODIMaI®I0 Qldsa | MO BOWMILHEMHAAM (@JUIH DO
Yy 0 m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
91

@RABLIAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............
MILIPOMIMWal®Io  Qldsaf ilelload  BIWAILHMHOAN  (@JUQo VB
@00 1>01.
MILIPOMIMWaI®Io Qldsq| nilefload cowmwl.

@R al®9Io Qdhal

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

365. In clause 50(1), delete the words and symbols “ ,not
exceeding eighteen per cent,” .

369. In clause 50 (3), the following words and symbols shall be
deleted “ ,at such rate not exceeding twenty four per cent” ,.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

366. In clause 50 (1), for the word “ eighteen”  substitute the
word “ twelve” .

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments.

368. In clause 50(1), after the words “ by the” insert the word
“ Central” .

371. In clause 50 (3), after the words “ by the” insert the
word“ Central” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
92

Shri. K. S. Sabarinadhan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

370. In clause 50 (3), for the words “ twenty four” substitute the
word “ eighteen” .

2. aeed: 367-00 mmId ee3w®l 366-00 MM GRAROL®IBY

@eINNIV®IMIT BRAIM G {IeHoME@IEl.

WMHIBY0Jo HWQo mceargd@j (@aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ HaGMVBy): VA,

CRBMIHOBIMMo  MVI1HI0 AL

o). leed: Wl all. afl. @B ERAI®Glafls) 365, 369 agam1 maud
GBBVMIHUY AVE MIVIBA14).

O@Joan. ERYMIE" 2006V ®EBRUS BRAIGE[la] 366-00 MMIB GE3VLMI
e M@ 2.

. 2SI ERAMGa(la] 368, 371 agyam1 MaUB EREL@;UE aLE
M@ 5.

W . 2V 0onIRTMINM BRAIGGafla) 370-00 MMUAB BV aqVE
M@ 2.

@RMaI®Io Qldsq| MNilelload BONMIGHMOAIN @JUIODID



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
93

@RABLIAEBMAIA. . .. ..........

@®1gellasamala............
@03 I®I0 Q| MIL1603 BOVMILHEMORIM (@JUgo TV BRoW ™A1,
@RMal®Io Qldsq | nilefload @owmowl.

@R M alOm] 8MIo Qldhal

Shri. K.M. Shaji: Sir, I move the following amendment.

372. In clause 51 (1) (a), for the words “ a department”  the
words “ a Department” shall be substituted.

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment.

373. In clause 51 (1) (a), after the words “ State Government”  the
words “ or Union territory” shall be inserted.

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments.

375. In the proviso to clause 51 (1), for the words “ a State or
Union territory” the words “ the State” shall be
substituted.

376. In the proviso to clause 51 (1), the words and symbol “ or, as
the case may be, Union territory” shall be deleted.

Shri. Hibi Eden: Sir, I move the following amendment.

377. In clause 51 (2), for the word “ ten” the word “ fifteen”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
94

shall be substituted.

Shri. Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

378. In clause 51 (4), for the words “ five thousand” the words
“ ten thousand” shall be substituted.

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo m@a%@W (aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ BBy ): VA,

CRBMIHOBIMMo  MVI1HI0 NL.

o). e98: @l 0. af)o. a0zl ERAIMGlafla] 372-00 MMUB GEEVLMI
e M@ 4.

@l all. afl. avR1@B ERAUGGIa{la] 373-00 ®maUd B3V aqULE
M@ 5.

W MBIl @AUGafla) 375, 376 agam1 MMUB BV IB:UE qVE
M@ 2.

@1 00c0mil oW  @AMAlafla] 377-00 MM 63V qULE
M@ 5.

@l ePMAd aqLIBE GRAIMGlafly] 378-20 ®mmud es3LY®] ave
M@ 5.

@R IO 80M0 Qldsa| M08 BINAISHEMOHNIM (@JUIODD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
95

@RABLIAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............

@RMWalo®] BNl Adsaf mlellom  [INAIBHEMOAIM  @JUo VB

@aowﬂce;«ﬂgd.

@PMalOm] 80Mo Aldsq | mileflond fonmowl.

@R M alOM106M200 Qldsal’

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment.

379. In clause 52 (3), for the word “ ten” substitute the word
“ fifteen” .

Shri . Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.

380. In clause 52 (5), for the word “ December” substitute the
word “ October” .

Shri . Shafi Parambil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

381. In clause 52 (13), for the word “ fifteen”  substitute the
word “ twenty” .

Shri . P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

382. In clause 52 (14), for the words “ twenty-five”  substitute
the word “ ten”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
96

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O.lc@agd@f] (@aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV” HafMVBy): VA,

CRBMIHABIMMo  MVI1HI0 AL

o). 1eead: @l afl. afl. VRIBMB ERAGGIa(la] 379-00 MOUB BBV

e M@ 2.
@ aueml EROMal @RAIMAIafla] 380-00 ®mmud eesL®  ave
M@ 9.
@1  adafl alomN@ ePAU®GIafla)  38l-00 ®maud c_L®1 ave
M@ 2.
Wl ofl. Sl eV @RAI®GIafla) 382-00 mMaUd Ge3V™]  auve
M1 5).
@R IO 106N200 Qldsa | MIEfHad BIVAISHIMOAAM (JUIOHDD
@RABBLINAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@OZeNasamala............
@PMalO®MI0M2o0  Aldsal Miefload  BIVAISHMOAAN  @JUgo LR
@01 @1).

@RMa IOM1M=0 Qldal mileload owaowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
97

@R M al@®1QaNIo Qldhql

(6e3L™) el

2. 169@: @RMBaIO®IGaNI0 Aldsa | MIEH BIVAISHIMOAAM (@ JUIOHDD

@RABLNBB8MAIA. . ............
@J®1eilasamala............
@RMalOMIPaMoo  Aldhaf milefload  BIMAIBHEMOAIM  @JRo  AVE
@01 @1).
@M OGN0 Adsa| milelload owadwl.

@R M alOMIMILII0 Adsal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

384. The proviso to clause 54 (1), shall be recast as
follows: “ Any person claiming refund of any tax and
interest, if any, paid on such tax or any other amount paid by
him, make an application before the authority at any time.” .

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments.

385. In item (i1) of the first proviso to clause 54 (3), after the
words “ by the” add the words “ Central Government or
State” .

387. In clause 54 (6), after the words “ notified by the” add the



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
98

words “ Central Government or State” .

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HhWQo moeag:(l@ﬁ (@aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV’ HafMVB>): VA,

GRBNMIHOBIMM0  TLI13HI0 M.

ol. aNeead: Oefoan. GRMIE" 20000VM ®EBUW ERAIMANa (s 384-00

MMIB ¢B3VM] AVE MIEIHE1a).
. 2B @Ll GRAIMGafla) 385, 387 agyam1 Mmaud 6REL®1&k:U3
e M@ 2.
@M IO IMIL0 Qldsq | MINLN1H08 BOVAILHEIMHAIM (@JUIOHOID
@RABLNHEB3MAIA. . ............
@J®1Zeilasanala............
@RMalOIMILNo  Aldal  mileflom  BIWAIHHIMOAID  @JRo VB
@001 @1).
@RWaIO®IMoLIN0 Qldsq | milellond 8owadwl.

@R M 1O 1@R M0 Aldsal

(ee3L®) el

2l.  ay1e9d@:  ERMalom]@ReMI00  Aldsaf  Mmilefload  BIWAIHHIMOHRIM




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
99

@JROOD
@MZLINH8B30MAIA. ..............
@J®1Zeilasamald@............
@RMa oM@ Qldsa]  Mieflond  RIVAIGHAMOAM  (@JUgo  AVE
@001 @1a).
@R IOM]@RNI0 Qldsal miloflond B0nmawl.

@R M alOM1@RY0Io Qdhal”

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran : Sir, I Move the following amendments.

389. In clause 56, the words “ not exceeding six per cent” shall
be deleted.

392. In the proviso to clause 56, the following words shall be
deleted: “ not exceeding nine per cent” .

@RHNEBREI03 000  ABODHWIOLINN” aMEBUIHS @PROIWIo.  «lddg]
MLEIABMo MSAHSBEMIIUT MANUI HHISINV0 MVNIA ENIQBBDEa 10OLI BR6B1R. (UY.
@M@ QR WNeyal] HHIOOIlg B3 OIS0 anafles
MO EBMMDEAIHLIWIEM M MII@3. MEBBUY af)ADa INATINILJo @REBI3° BRD®

@RoUTHBTIABHWEL. H206Mo  22l.af)MVIS]. HDeMBaV1LNeI8s MI@BAIMo AI@EA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
100

enailes MSo PABHYQSS. MDD GBI amId ol 6.21Q)aM.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendments.

390. In clause 56, the words “ six per cent” shall be substituted
with the words “ nine per cent” .

393. In the proviso to clause 56, for the words “ nine per cent”
substitute with the words “ twelve per cent” .

Shri. Roji M. John : Sir, I move the following amendment.

391. In clause 56, for the word “ Six” substitute the word
“ Nine” .

Shri. V.D. Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

394. In the proviso to clause 56, for the word “ nine” substitute
the word “ twelve” .

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo moea%_J@W (awa. Sl. af)o. BMINANV HafIVD): VB,

CRBMIHABIMMo  AVI1HI0 AL

o). 1e93: B@fian. @RYMIE" 2000TVM ®EBUWS ERAIMGa(ls] 390, 393
af)aMT MMIAQ BBBNMIH:U3 VB M1RIB:Q1).

@l 6001 aglo. 6RO @PAMGlafly] 391-00 moUB eE3L® aLE

m’](OOcG)(O']_'}J.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
101

@1l all. AWl aw®1®d GRAMGlafly) 394-00 maud celV®1 auve
M@ 2.
@R IOM]@Y00 Qldsal MO BINAILHEIMOHAIM (@JURODTD
@RABLNBB8MAIA. . ............
@J®1eilasamala............
@RMWalOM]I@Y0%0 Qe mefload  ROWAMILHHEIMONAM  @JyQo  AVE
@01 @1).
BRMaIO®I@YO0I0 Aldsal milellond cowadwl.

@R M alOM1aB®00 Qldsal’

Shri. [.C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

395. In clause 57 (c¢), for the word “ monies” the word
“ amounts” shall be substituted.

WMHHIOVY0Jo HhWQo moe;%j@ﬁ (aWI. Sl. af)o. EGMINAV” Haf)MVB): VA,

c¢e3L®1 qUfld;:o0 0el.

ol. a1e9d: @ eag). AUl MIdLIGHM @RAIMGIa{la) 395-00 mmIA

GR_AULMI VR m1<aooe)«>’lgd.

@RMalOM]a@ 9o Qldal MIL1Oad BONAILHEIMORAM (@JUIODD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
102

@RABLIAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............
@GRMWaloM]la@9oo  Aldkal milefload  BIVAIBGHEMOAIM  @JWRo VB
@aowﬂceaaﬂgd.
@PMa oMol 9o Qldal milefload cowaowl.

@R M alOM1ag)§90 Qdsal”

(ee30™ BRAI®Ea{laflel)

2l. a1e9d:  @RMWBalomlag)g0o  Qldsaf  milefload  RIVAISHEIMOHAIM
(@JROOD
@RABLNBEB3MAIA. . ............
@J®1eilasanala............
@RMalom]ag)g0 Qe Mmieflond  RIWAISHEIMONIM  @JRo  AVE
@01 @1).
@RMalo®1ag)§l0 Qldsq | nilefloag fonawl.

@R Ml OMIMal®Io QAd:al

(ee3L™) el



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
103

2l. V1993: ERMWaIOOMIMWal®o Aldsal nefload BIVAILHEMOAAN

(@JUROOD
@RABLNH63MAIA. . ............
@J®1Zeilasanala............
@R IHOMIMBal®o  Qldsqa| mMiefload  RIWAIHHEIMONAM  @JyQo VR
@001 @1).

@M IHOMIMWaI®o QAldsa| milelload sowaowl.

@RQal®mlo Qldhal’

Shri. A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment.

397. In clause 60, for the word “ proper” substitute the word
“ authorised” wherever it occurs.

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil : Sir, I move the following amendment.

398. In clause 60(1), for the word “ ninety” the word “ sixty”
shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

399. In the proviso to clause 60(3), the words “ or Deputy
Commissioner” shall be inserted after the words
“ Additional Commissioner”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
104

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, [ move the following amendments.

401. In the proviso to clause 60(3), after the words “ four years”
the words “ in aggregate” may be inserted.

402. In clause 60(5), after the word “ interest” the following
words shall be inserted.

“ at such rate as may be specified by the Council”

WMHIBY0Jo HWQo mceargd@j (@aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ HaGMVBy): VA,

CRBLMIHU3 VMG 2El.

o). aV1e9d: Wl af). all. EMIGE &20d @RAMAlafls) 397-00 maud
GRBUL®] e m%oooe)(obd.

©). a)@EEIAVY" all. &:Me[1881@3 BRAIGEa{la] 398-00 MM GREVL®I
e M@ 2.

O(@Joan. @RYMIE" 2006V MBBUS EPAUMOIa{la] 399-00 MmMIB GERV®I
e M@ 2.

@l afl. afl. WRIB®M ERAMG1a{la) 401, 402 agyam1 maud 6_ELE1H:U3
e mmooe)(o”l%g.

@RQaIMI0 Qldsq | Mleflead BOVNMIBGHMOAIM @JUIODD)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
105

@RABLIAEBMAIA. . .. ..........
@®1gellasamala............
@RQaIMI0 Ao MINLNH3 BOVAIBHIMHANM (@JUWo VB momﬂce;(zﬂgd.
[QV] (0] m
@RQal®Io Qldsal nilefloa covnmowl.
[QV] [¢]

@RQalO™]1 80NJo Qldsal’

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

403. In clause 61(1), for the word “ registered” the word
“ authorised” shall be substituted.

WMHIVY0Jo HWQo moeaqd@ﬂ (@awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV’ HaGVBy): VA,

¢e3L®1 aVlHo0 00l

o). e9d: e@loan. @RMIE" 2000V MBS ERAIMGIa(la] 403-20
MMIB GBI VR CT)1(OOCB)(O’]1}J.
@RQAIOM] 0M0 Qldsal M908 BINAIBNEMHAIM (@JUYODD
@RABLINABMAIA. . ............
@®1eilasanala............
@RQaIOM]  8MMJo  Aldhaf Mefload  BIVAISHEMOAIM  @JRo  AVE

momoe;(zﬂgd.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
106

@PQa IO 80M0 Aldsa | milellend cowadwl.

@R QalOMI1AMBI0 AUdaal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

405. In clause 62 (2), for the word “ thirty” the word “ sixty”
shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HhWQo Qloea%d@ﬂ (@aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV’ HafMVB>): VA,
e MUfl:;:o0 0el.
9(@Jonn. @RYMIE" 2000TVMW ®EBUWY BRAIMGIa{ly 405-00 MaUB eE3LMI
e M@ 4.
@RQAIOM106N200 Aldsa | MIE(HF BIVAISHNMOAAM (@JUIHDD
@MZLINS8B30MAIA. ..............
@J®1Zeilasmmala............
@RQaIOMI0N2o0  Aldsaf milefload  BIVAISHIMOAAN  @JWQo VR
@001 @1a).
@RQaIOMI06N20  Qldal milefloag a0,

@RQalO™m1aNIo Adsaql

Shri K. S. Sabarinadhan : Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
107

407. In proviso to clause 63, the words “ in person” shall be
added at the end.

WMSO0I0j0 HWQo Al ]AD] (BaWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV” Haf)MVB>): VA,

e MUfld;:o0 06!,

W O, af)aV. womIEIMILOMd BRAIMEafla] 407-00 MAUG GRBL®] aVE

M@ 9.
@RQAIOMIPaMI0 Qldsa| MIEN1O03 BINMILHEIMORIM (@JUIODD
@MZLINH8B30MAIA. ..............
@J®1eilasamald............
@RQaIOMIPaMo  Qldsaf  milefload  BIWAIHHEMOAAM  (@JUQo
@001 @1a).
@RQAIOMIPaM0  Qldsa | mileflond Bonmawl.

@RQaIOMIMILIdo Qldsal’

Shri Hibi Eden : Sir, I move the following amendment.

408. In clause 64(1), for the word “ proper” the word

“ authorised” shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendments.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
108

410. In clause 64(1), the words “ or Deputy Commissioner”
shall be inserted after the words and symbol “ Joint
Commissioner,” .

411. In clause 64(2), the words “ or Deputy Commissioner”
shall be inserted after the words “ Joint Commissioner” .

2. aleed: 409-00 mud eesu®l 408-20 mMIB  6RBL1HY

@PISNIV@1MIT BRAIMGq {leHomzmel.

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HWQo O.lc@agd@f] (@aWa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV’ HafMVBy): VA,

CRBMIHOBIMMo  MVI1HI0 AL
Wl 06e0ml MOWM @AUGGIafla) 408-00 mmd G_3VL®] avE
M1 5).
9(@Jonn. @RYMIE" 2000TVMW ®EBUWY ERAIMGIa{ly 410, 411 agaml maud
683WM1HU3 TVE MO,
@RQAIOIMOLI0 Qldsa| MIE(lHad BIVAISHAMOHAAN (JUIHDD
@MZLINH8B30MAIA. ..............
@J®1Zeilasamald............

@RQaIOIMOLN0  Qldsa]  milellom  BIVAIGHMOAAN  @JyRo  AVE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
109

(mao(n%e)aﬂ%.

@PQa IO IMIL0  Qldsa| milellond 2owadwl.

@R QIO 1@R Mo Qldsal”

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment.

412. In clause 65(3), for the word “ fifteen” substitute the word
ten”

13

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

413. In clause 65(4), for the word “ three,” substitute the word

13 b1

S1X

Shri P. T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment.

415. In clause 65(4), the words “ and should be verified by
Commissioner” shall be added at the end.

Shri Sunny Joseph : Sir, I move the following amendment.

416. In clause 65(6), the word “ thirty” shall be substituted with
the word “ fifteen” .

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HhWQo moeag:(l@ﬁ (@aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV” HafMVB>): VA,

GRBVMIHABIMM0  TLI1H00 Ml

@1 ERMAR MIBCM GRAUMAlafla] 412-00 maUd G_BV® AV



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
110

M1 @1 5.
OJonn. @RYMIE" 2000TVM MEBBUY ERAMGIafla 413-00 MMIB GEEVL®]
e M@ .
@1 afl. Sl cmaay” eramalafly 415-00 mME G_BV™ aue
M@ 5.
@ aveyl eRoMald @RAI®Alafla] 416-00 MU BBV aLE
M@ 5.
@PQa IO @600 Aldsq | MINLN1908 BIVAISHIMHAIM (@JUIOH DI
@RABLNHEB3MAIA. . ............
@J®1Zeilasanala............
@RQAIOMI@6M00  Aldsaf Milefload  BIVAILHEMOAIM  @JyRo  AVE
@001 @1).
@RQa IO @600 Qldsa | milellond @owadwl.

@R QalOM1@Y 020 Adhsal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, [ move the following amendments.

417. In clause 66(1), the words “ Assistant Commissioner”
shall be substituted with the words “ Deputy



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
111

Commissioner” .

418. In clause 66(2), the words “ Assistant Commissioner”
shall be substituted with the word *“ Deputy
Commissioner” .

419. In clause 66 (5), delete the words “ and such determination
shall be final” .

WM HIBYNJo HWQo moesfgd@ﬁ (awa. Sl. af)o. EINAV Ha)TVD): VA,
¢ 1HU3 MV l:Ho050el.
o). 1e9ad: Otoan. @RYMIE 2000aVM @6EBUW  @RAIGGIa{la 417, 418,
419 aaml mmIB cEBOIHUY Ve MO0 4).
@RQAIOM] @Yo Aldsq] MO0 BIVMILHEMOAIM (@JUIOOD,
@RMZLNH3aMAIAE. .. ......
@Jzelasmmald............
@RQalO™]  @YOJo Qdsa] melload  BIWAIHHIMOAIN  @JRo VB
@001 @1a).

@RQAIOM] @Yo Aldsq] ileflond BonmWI.

@BRQaIOMICWPIo QAldsal

Shri. Shafi Parambil : Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
112

420. In clause 67(1), for the word “ proper” substitute the word
“ authorised” .

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, [ move the following amendments.

421. In clause 67(1), the words “ Joint Commissioner” shall be
substituted with the words “ Additional Commissioner” .

423. In clause 67 (2), the words “ Joint Commissioner” shall be
substituted with the words “ Special Commissioner” .

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendment.

422. In clause 67 (1) (b), after the word “ State tax” insert the
words “ or may himself” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_loeaq‘:!@f] (awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV Haf)TVD): VA,
CRBLMIBHU3 MV1H0 00l

o). aW1e98: @l aHoall alomlad ERAI®Ela{ls) 420-00 MMIA 6REL®)]
e m1coooe)(o”l%r_].

9(@Jonn. BRYMIE" 2000aVM ®EBUWY BRAIMGafla] 421, 423 agam1 maud
683VM1HU3 TVE MO,

@l all. afl. wRIBB @RAMGlafls) 422-00 MmaUB 6ERV® aLE

CTﬂ(OOcB)(OfI%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
113

@RQAIOMIGVYIo  Qldsq] MLlO0d BIVMILHMAIM (JUIOOD),
@RMZLNHB3aMAIAE. ... ......
@J®zelasamald............
@RQA IO 1GWPIo Qdal  milefload  BOWMIHHIMORAAD  (@JUdo
@001 @1a).

@RQAIOMIGWYIo Qldsal niloflond BoVMWI.

@R QalOM1HWS20 Qldhal”

(ee3L@ el

@RQA IO 1O®WSI0 Aldsa| Mol BIVAISHMSAIN @JROOD),

@RMBLH63aMAIA. . .. ...
@J®elasamald............
@RQA IO 160 Adal  milefload  BIWAIHHIMORAM  (@JUdo
@001 @1).

@RQa IO 1O®WS0 Aldsa| milefload sowaowl.

BRQaIHOMIMal®O0 Qldsal’

Shri. T. A. Ahammed Kabeer: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
114

426. In clause 69(1), for the word “ aperson” the words
“ a person” shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo mcea%:!@pﬁ (awa. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Hag)VH): VA,

@l QL af). @RaoME" &HMIE @PAMGlafla] 426-00 MU  Ge3V®]
@RoUY1DHO1H63aM.
ol. 160d: @ Gl af). GRa0ME” A ERAIMGIa{ls] 426-00 MMUA
GRBL®I] Ve (momﬂoe;(o"lgj.
CRBLM] ©alQ @HOYBB  BRQRAICH]IOVWIMI®Io  Aldsaf mileflond
BINAMOAHEMHAM (@JRODOD),
@R BLIA68MAIA. . ... ...
@J®&Gelasmmald............
CRRLM]  ©alQ (@HI0ABB  BRQAIOMIOWIMI®Io  Qldsqaf  milefload
BIAIHNEMOAAN (@JUQo LR (emocn"]ce)m%i.
CeBLM] 0alQ (@HMHOYBB  BRQRAITTHINWIMI®Io  Aldsaf nilelload

QONMIW.

af) al®9o Qdhal’

(ee3@ el



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
115

af)gal®do Qldha| MLl IWAISHIMOHRAM JUIOHE,
@RMZLNHB3aMAIAE. ... ......
@J®zelasamald............

af)gal®do Qldal mIelload BIMAIHHIMOHNIM @JRRo VB @'oom“]ce;(ohd.

af)gal®do Qldkaf milefload conaowl.

af) § ol @MIMNI0 Qldsal’

Shri. Roji M. John : Sir, I move the following amendment.

428. Clause 71(2)(v1), shall be deleted.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_loeaq‘:!@f] (awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV Haf)TVD): VA,
HEEIOlO QM Ela)uT=TR

o). 1eed: @l 60l  ago. 6moeMd  @ERAUMOIa{la] 428-00 mauAd

BRI Ve m1(oooe>(o1nd.
af)§alOOMOMI0 Aldsq | MINEOHd BIVAILHIMOAAN (@JUIOHDD,
@RMBLIB8aMAIA. . .. ...
@Q®ZGeNasamald............

af) §alnH@™MIaMNI0 Qe el WAIBHIMOAIM  @JyQo  aVE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
116

(mao(n%e)aﬂ%.

af)$alH@™IaMI0 Aldhal milefload sowadwl.

af) §alOM106ME00 QAldsal’

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

429. In clause 72(1), delete 1) the words and symbols * |
Railways, Customs,” 2) The words “ officers of central tax

and officers of the Union territory tax” .

72(1) -@3 “ all offices of Police, Railways, Customs,” * officers of
central tax and officers of the Union territory tax” . ag)ememmosm” letss
MVoMNIMEBBRE]NL!  OEBLOWTVOBAIESI BH@@ MVASHIB  OEBLIVAIVNEOICSI
S08WA  92IYPIM®, HAVABSM  VAINBOAG DEBLONIVOMOSEVWI  QYeM1Wad
9S01501 9EBPWIVOTHSEAGLI) MVoMVOIM  TVBHHIVIM” 8@ BRWIHI00a1e].
OO MO ]G3 DI SW Ol [W) oy af) MM’ 00)0; @O

a M3 I016UIWISSMM @ 1M EAIMEIQYBB® M af) D3 GBROM].

Shri. V. D. Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

430. In clause 72(2), for the words “ proper officers” substitute
the words “ authorised officers” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo mcesgd@’l (awa. Sl. af)o. EINAV Ha)IVD): VA,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
117

(309)@(0('1]6“66)0%0 MoLNIM wmmﬁ@n%o Mo QAMAIW] alloléasam
MG WIEM . MVEMLOIMOM]OOZ emMalgss ml@semomleleldom
HH00YMIOEMBMG 0B BRM eoh@walemeaaglm”  explicit @] mlaEsul
MBBBOS  HOO Y0 CS(T)O(ﬂGﬂ(%Cﬁ@O% af)aM’ A lOGINEHISOM 1B SBAN@IEM .
@BRDOGIMNE alel TVMBARMBBSILlo  HOMOOD DI czce;@mmaﬁevogcsecgowm@
VoMLNIM mmaﬁaag@eéommmomgo ule) MoMNIMEBRE 1A
DEBLOUOMVNBBNIQo  BRYUVAINMINWo MseEMME] QIG3o.
CRBIM1HOBIMMO TVI1HOO L.

ol. aVlend: Wl 06m8Iod:¢] @oeil @RAIMAlafla) 429-00 maud

GRBVLMI aVE (Tﬂ(OOoG)((ﬂ%J.
Wl al. awl auoelvdd GRrAMOIafls] 430-00 mMId celY™] aue
M@ 5.
af)§alO®10N=00 Qs MINE1Had BOVAILHEMOOAN (JUIOHDOD,
@RMZLNHB3aMAIAE. ... ......
@J®Zzelasamald............

af)§alom 106200 Qdsq  milellom  BIWAIGHIMOAAN  @JyQo VB



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
118

@001 @1).
af)Qalom1oenzdo Aldsal milefload sowadwl.

af) §alO®M1g Mo Qldsal

Shri. I.C. Balakrishnan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

431. In clause 73 (9), for the words “ ten per cent” shall be
substituted with the words “ five per cent” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo Qlceagd@’l (awa. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Ha)IVD): VA,
¢_3L®1 V10 00l

ol. ae98: @l ©ag).aVl. MdLIGHHM  @eaI®@lafls) 431-00 mmIA

GRALMI VR (Tﬂ(OOoG)((ﬂ%J.

af)§alO®1QMio  Aldsa | MIEflHad BIWVAISHNMOAMN JUIOHOD,

@RMBLIA8aMAIA. . ... ...
@Q®&Geasmmald............
af) o lom1gaMIo Qe mlelload  cIWAIEHMOAAN  @JyQo  AVE
@01 @1).

af) §a 1O 1gaMI0 Aldsa | milefload sowadwl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
119

af) §al@®1MILIdIo0 Qldsal”

Shri. A.P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment.

433. In clause 74 (5), for the word “ fifteen” the word
“ twenty” shall be substituted.

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil : Sir, I move the following amendment.

434, In clause 74 (8), for the words “ twenty five” the word
“ thirty” ' shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

436. In clause 74 (11), for word “ thirty” the word “ sixty”
shall be  substituted.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moeagd@’l (awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV Haf)TVD): VA,
CRBLMIBHU3 MV1H0 00l

ol. aW1e9d: ). ag).afl. @MITIBH00A3 @RAIMA)afla) 433-00 mauAd

BRI Ve m1(oooe>(o1nd.

W af)@3ea0aV” all. B:Ma(I8slad  @AU®Elafla) 434-00 MMIB eBLM
e M@ 4.

9(@Joan. @RYMIE" 2000V MBBUS  BPAIMEa{la] 436-00 MMUAB GERRV®I

aoe m’l(oooeaco’lgﬂ.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
120

af)§alO®IMILDo Al MNEfload BIVAILHMOAAN (JUIOHDOD,

@RMZLNHB3aMAIAE. ... ......
@J®zelasamald............
af)§alomIMOILIdo Q]  miefload  ROWAIHHIMONIN  @JyQo VR
@001 @1a).

af) §alOIMILD0 ldsqf nileflond c@owmawl.

af) §alO®1 @P6MIJdo Qldsal’

Shri. K.S. Sabarinadhan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

438. In the proviso to clause 75 (5), for the word “ three” the
word “ two” shall be substituted.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo mcesgd@’l (awa. Sl. af)o. EMINAV Ha)IVD): VA,

¢_3L®1 aLIlHo0 R0l
o). e98: @1, Od.af)aTV. voeIEIMILNM  GRAIMAlafla] 438-00 mauAd
EDOIRUVERON (LI EYR
af)§alO®] @REMId0 Qldal MIL1Ha BIWAIHHIMOAMD (@JROO,
@RMBLIA6B8aMAIA. . ... ...

@®&Gelasmmald............



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
121

af)galO®] @R  Qldal mMIefload  RIVAIGHMOAM  @JWRo  AVE
@01 @1).
af)§a 1O @REMId0 Aldsa | mileflead owadwl.

af) §alO®1 @020 Adsal

Shri. V.T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment.

439. In clause 76, for the words “ proper officer” the words
“ authorised officer” shall be substituted wherever it
occurs.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_lcesqd@f] (awa. Sl. af)o. EINAV Ha)TVD): VA,
¢_3L®1 MLI1HI0 R0l
o). aeed: @l ail.sl. miadnde  @AIMAla{ls] 439-00 MmMIB RV
e M@ 2.
af)§alO®] @RYOJo Aldal MI1LlOa BIVAILHIMORAM (@JROTD,
@R BLIA6B8aMAIA. . ... ...
@®Igelleasamald............
af)§alO®]  ®@Y0Jo  Qldal milefload  RIVAIGHMOAI  @JWRo  AVE

@aowﬂceaaﬂgd.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
122

af)Qalom] @RYOJo Qldsq | nilefload fonmIwl.

af) §alOM1CWPIo Adhal

(ee30® @GRAI®a{laflel)

ol aV1HHA3B:  af)galOm]EcWIo Ao nilellom B oWadIaneMeHAM
a [OV) (o]

@JROO,
@RMBLIA68aMAIA. . .. ...
@Q®&Geasmmald............
af)QalOMICWPIo  Aldkal  Mmiolload  BIWAISNMOAAN  @JWRo LA
@01 @1).
af) §a 1010 Oldsa | milefload owadwl.

af) §alOM16WS%0 Adsal

(ee30™ BRAI®R)a{laflel)

ol aV1eHad:  af)alom1HWsdo Q| milelload  f0MaIBeneMeOAM

(JUROHO,

@RMBLNH83aMAIA. . .. .....

@J®elasamald............



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
123

af)§alOIOWS0  Aldsaf  Mmiefload  BIMAIBHEMOAIM  @JRo VR

mom"]ceam_r}J.

af) §a 101000 Qldsa | milefloag owaow.

af) §alOMIMal®Io Qdsal”

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

443. In clause 79 (1), for the words “ the proper officer”
substitute the words “ authorised officer” wherever it

OoCcCurs.

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.

444, In clause 79 (1) (f), delete the following words, figures and
symbols “ Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code
of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (Central Act 2 of 1974),” .

CH@ MG o)A @AM  @RSERIWIMaMILjo  MAiles
mleamldamieme MSEOIM  R.af)auisl. NVOAODIM™ MIDWHAL]  af)aMNIEM’
af) §@1VISBB®. BHMBWAUMIOAFIOAF MIWRo MYHS  NIIWEHDE] af)aI” alOWOND
MLIWTHBMMND af)6BBOMWIEM; BRDEGHIMNE” MDD aMNaldIGUIWIBNHMEOAANIM’

af)MN1HD A l0WINOSBB®.

WMSO0I0j0 HVQo Al ]AD] (6aw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV” Haf)TVH): VB,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
124

csoe)omﬁqy%ommm @PEOOZHAMGIT @O  MOMOAMITE  MVMVLNIMETBOHS
mw1oe>0(o6)o£|§m1@1§6ng“. @D HIMBIGM” HEBROHMEOHWIM clause mazﬂggg(m‘i
6L 1HU3 MV l:H0050el.
o). a1e938: H@Joan. ERMIE" 200V @RS  ERAIMANa{la) 443-00
MMIB ¢B3VM] AVE MIEIHE1a).
. nOMBIoHY]l @rell  EPAUMGIafla] 444-00 MU G_3L®T aLE
M@ 5.
a)$a1O@MIMBal®Io Qlda | MNNLflOad BINAIBLHIMOHAM (@JUIODOD,
@RMBLNH83aMAIA. . .. .....
@J®elasamald............
af)§alOOMOMal®Io Qe Milefload  BIWAIGHIMODAN  (@JUWQo VR
@001 @1).
af)$a10@MIMBa IMIo Aldhal milefload conmwl.

af) Mal®Io Qldsal”

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

446. In clause 80, for the words “ twenty four” substitute the
word “ twelve” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
125

W00 SHWQo A |AAD] (awa. Sl af)o. CMINAV" Haf)MVD): VA,

e qUfld;:o0 0Ll
o). 1eead: eawo. af)o. O, OMIB GRA®EIa{la] 446-00 MaUB GBBL]
e M@ .
af)eNBal®do Qldal MIEload BONAIHHIMOHAIM (JRODD,
@RMBLH63aMAIA. . .......
@J®elasamald............
af)sNBal®o Qld:q | MIENOG BINAILHIMOHRIM (@JUQo TVE @oW1B:@]2).
af)Nal®Io Qldal milefloa conawl.

af) M alOM1 MM~ H@ @3 af) Mol of)S” AUHOWSBS Qldsald U3

((EEEDIOI: R [=1))
0l. AV1HHAB: ag)eNMaldm] BaN MBI af)eMalO®] af)S QUHOWBSB moea%doa;uﬁ
nelond BonaIEnMHAIM @JUIOOD),
@RMBLIB8aMAIA. . .. ...
@Q®ZGeNasamald............

af)aMalO®] B8aM D@3 af)MalOD] af)S QAUHOWYBS O_lcea(g;lce)aa snfleleoad



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
126

BORISHEMHOAMN (@JUgo VR @Taocn"lce)m%.

af)aMalO®] B8aM D@3 af)MalO®] af)S" QAUHOWYBS O_loesgdce)(fa enflelead

QIWMOWI.

af) M a1 8MWal®0 AUdsal

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

448. In clause 89(1), delete the following words, figures and
symbol “ Notwithstanding anything contained in the
Companies Act, 2013 (Central Act 18 of 2013).

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_lcesqd@f] (awa. Sl. af)o. EINAV Ha)TVD): VA,

@Wl. 2amBod¢l @l @HIeMaVIqNad’ @T@Qﬂg@g OIVMST @R’
QLAUOMSOM  alOaOmIFENS.  MVIWIREMU®1WVI@3 BOMALISMHWIGLID  GH((3
pllwhlQoilealk) alosmm 1512l 00)0 Mo MLNIM pliwhlgolen
QIG1HWIHEMEH; 1103 @Iwadlo AmMW&:@ @PMNIB0  QIXE@BEMo.  alGdhH

@®10a3  BRYAUUIAIEI AN @1BRIMAPMBIWVIZME.  OG"  MVoTLNIMEBBOS

@01 2f1gnms"
HElElOlO QU Eol ] uTaTR

ol aWeed: Wl neomEled¥]l @pell  @RAMGIafly 448-20 maud




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
127

683WM] AVE M10IHE1a).
af)Na O] BWal®o Qs mML1Had BIVAILHIMHAIM @JUIOHE,
@RMBLH83aMAIA. . .. ...
@J®elasamald............
af)iMBalO®] SMBal®o Qldal Mellod ‘IVMIGHMOAM  (@JUdo VR
@001 @1).

af)eNa O] BWal®o Aldsa| milelaad sowaowl.

OMIGRAI0 Qldsal

Shri. V.D. Satheesan : Sir, I Move the following amendment.

449. In the second proviso to clause 90, for the words “ one
month” , substitute the words “ forty five days” .

WM HIBYNJo HWQo moesfgd@ﬁ (awa. Sl. af)o. EINAV Ha)TVD): VA,

e MUfld;:o0 0el.

o). leed: @l all.awl. 10 ERAIMElafla] 449-00 MaUB GREVL®I
e M@ 4.

OH@®IGNOI0 Qo au’l%l)’lamg BOWAISHMOAAN (JUIOHDI,

@RMZLNH3aMAIAE. .. ......



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
128

@®gellesamald............
O@®IGNOI0 Qo] Gm’l%’lmg BIWMIBNEMHAAN (@JURo VR mOmoe)(o’l%J.
AMIGMO%0 Ao milellond sonmowl.
6119 oL o]

O®IRQ1 8MN” A @ O IGRQT @RI AIOAWSS Aldhq]d> U

(eeB3L®HHgel)
0l. aV1eea@: 6)@06)‘3)@9’1 BsaN° O ©3 6)@0%91 @aI" QIHOWSs O.Io@zqdcﬂa(fa
nelond BONAIBHEMHAIM (@JUIOOD),
@RMZLNH3aMAIAE. ... ......
@J®zelasamald............
@@o%g”l BSaN~ QG a@o%gﬁ @aNI" QIHOQYBR Qloe;qﬂceaua enflelead
BOWRIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BN 1B>014).
6)@06)‘3)@91 BSaN° ™ ©3 @@0%91 @RI QIHOWSBs3 Qlcﬁa((gqlcﬁa(fa enfleflead

COUNMIW.

s)@oumq‘l @020 QAdsal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I Move the following amendment.

450. In clause 96 (1), the word “ State” shall be inserted after the
word “ Kerala” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
129

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I Move the following amendment.

452. The proviso to clause 96 (1) shall be deleted.

Shri. A.P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I Move the following amendments.

454. In clause 96 (2)(i), the words “ not below the rank of
Additional Commissioner” shall be inserted after the word
(14 taX”

455. In clause 96 (2)(i1), the words “ not below the rank of
Additional Commissioner” shall be inserted after the word

tax”

(13

o). aVleed: 451-00 mud@ cesu®l 450-0 mmId e=rV @S’

@PIYNIV@1MIT BRAIMGq {leHoemzmel.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_lceygd@f] (awa. Sl. af)o. EMINAV Ha)IVD): VA,

CRBLMIHU VMG 2El.

ol. aWeed: e@Joan. @RYMIE" 2000V ®6BBUWY @AIMAIa{ls] 450-20

MMIB ¢B3VM] AVE MIOIHE1,).
W) 260m8%0:Yl erell @RAMOlafls] 452-00 mIUd G_RL®T aLE
M@ 5.

W  af).all. GRM@IH008 @RA®Glals) 454, 455 pam1 maud



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
130

GRBUVMIMHUI VLR (Tﬂ@()cﬁa((ﬂ%i.
O@®IMA] @YOJo Aldrq MIlE1HG BOVAILHEMHRIN (JROTI,
@RMBLH83aMAIA. . .. ...
@J®elasamald............
6@0%91 @QY0Jdo  Qldsa] mﬂ%ﬂ@ag BOWAISHIMOAAN  @JRPo VB
(maocn"lce;m%.

O@®IMA1 @O0 Qldhqf milefload oMW

O@OG&Q’I aB®90 Qldal”

(ee3w@lel.)
ol. Ve a@: s)(o)oqrn@gl a@$90 Qldsq | Mo B0MAIBHEMHAIM @JUIOOD,
@RMBLIB8aMAIA. . .. ...
@Q®ZGeasamald............
O@IMAT a0 Qldof  MILlead  BOVAILHEMORAD  @JUWGo  ALE
@01 @1).

O®IeMAT a®do Qldrq | milgfload sowaowl.

O®IRQT 0f)g90 Qldhal




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
131

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil :Sir, I move the following amendment.

456. In clause 98(2), the words “ in person” shall be inserted
after the words “ authorised representative”

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moeagd@’l (awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV Haf)TVH): VA,

¢_3L®1 aVlH0 00l
o). le9d: Wl  af)@3e30aV” all. BMafI8glad  GRAIMO1a{la] 456-%
MMIAB GBI VR M1 @1 2.
@@o%g’l af)5% Qldsaf milefload BOVRIGHMAIM JUIOTD,
@RMBLIH83aMAIA. . .. ...
@Q®ZGeasamald............
amo%g’l af)3% Qlda mlellead  BIWAIHHEMOAI  @Jugo LR
(maom"lda;mgd.
6)(6)06;an@%)1 af)§%0 Qldkal milefload cowaow.

O®IPQ1 8Wal®Oo Adsql

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : Sir, I move the following amendment.

459. In clause 99, insert the word “ State” after the word
“ Kerala” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
132

Shri. K. S. Sabarinadhan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

461. Clause 99(11) shall be recast as follows.
“ Commissioner of State Tax or Principal Commissioner or
Chief Commissioner of State Tax” .

2. aeed: 460-00 mud ee3w®l 459-00 md  GRARVL®IBY

@eINNIV®IMIT BRAIM G {IeHoME@IEl.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo O_lceu'{)d@f] (awa. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)TVH): VA,

CRBLMIHU3 VMG 2El.
o). 1693 O@ian. @RMIE" 200eTVM ®eEBUW  GRAUIMOIa(la] 459-%
MMIB GBI VR M1 @1 2.
W 9. af)aTV. 0MIAINILNM BRAIMElafla] 461-00 MG ceB3V®] aqUVE
M1 @1 5.
6)@06)‘3)@91 BMal®o Qldsaf 6m’l%16m§ BORISHEMHAAN (@JUIOHDOD),
@R BLIA6B8aMAIA. . ... ...
@®Igelleasamald............
O™l BWalmIo  Aldrqf MEO BIVAILHEMOAM  (@JWBo VB

@aowﬂceaaﬂgd.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
133

9@®IMA1 3MWal®Io  Alda] MilEHa3 BINAIWI.

Q0o Qdsal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

462. In clause 100 (2), for the word “ thirty” substitute the word
“ sixty” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo m@(zd@ﬂl (aWI. Sl. af)o. EMINAV Aaf)VH): VB,

¢ MLflHo0 06l

o). 1e93: e@foan. @RYMIE" 2000aVM @BV GRAIMGafla 462-20

MMIA B3VM] AVE MIOIHE1,).
090%0 Qldsa| MNLlOnd BONAIBNEMHAIM (@JUIODD
@RMLNH83MAIA. (... .......
@J®&elasamald...........
Q00 Qldsa | MIE(OM BIVAILHEMHAM (@JUgo MVE BP0 1@ 1a).
000 Qldsq| mileflond B@0nmawl.

®Q1 8aNJo Qdral

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
134

464. In clause 101 (2), for the word “ ninety” substitute the word
“ sixty” .

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo moegc%;l@_@ (awI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)aV): VB,

HEElOlOI QM Elc)uT=TR

o). e9d: e@Joan. BRMIE" 2000V @BV @AU®Glals) 464-2

MMIAB GBEN®1 MVE M1VIB014).
Q1 8020 Qldal MIL1Oa3 BINAIHHEMHAMM (@JURODD
@RMBLINBB8aMAIA.. .. .......
@Q®GZGeNasamald...........
Q1 800 Aldq MIENHG BINAIGHEMHRID (@JUo TVE @RoW 1 @].).
MQ1 8aM0 Aldkal milefload sonaowl.

Q1 OMBIo Aldsal’

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

466. In clause 102, for the word “ six” substitute the word
“ nine” .

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendment.

467. In clause 102, for the word “ six” substitute the word
“ three” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
135

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%;!m@’l (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" eIV ): VB,

¢e3LM1HU3 MV fl®Ho0s0el.

o). 1e9d: e@llan. @RYMIE" 2000V ®EBUS ERAIMGIA(la] 466-20

MMIA B3VM] AVE MIOIHE1,).
Wl all. afl. WRIBB GRAMONafla] 467-00 ®mIUB ce3L®] aVE
CT)f](OOoS)(O’]%J.
Q1 M=o Aldsa | MILOHa BIVAISHIMOAAM (@JUIOHD
@RMBLINAB8aMAIA. . .. .......
@®gGelaonanala...........
Q1 @300 Al MIEH3 BOVMIBHEMSORAM (@JUo TVE @RoW 1 @14).

Q1 @M=00 Aldsal milelload owaowl.

Q1 aaM” M@ Q1 BRYO” AUNOQYSBB Qldsq|HUd

(ee3L™) el

ol. aVleed: Q1 gan’ @@ ™Jl ERYO” AIOOWVSS O.lo@u'{:do@a(fa enfleflead
BOWNAIHHEMHDAN (@JUYO T

@RMZLNH830MAIA. ...........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
136

@Q®ZGeasamald...........
™l  gan” @@ @™QFl @Y AUOOWVSS O_IcBchB)Ua enflefload
BOUNMIGHEMHAAD (@JUgo VB mom"]ce)m%i.
Q1 AN’ Y@@ G BRYO” AUHOWVBS O.Ic@u}dcﬂa(fa enflefleoad conmowl.

®Q1 a@®l0 Qdhal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendments.

469. In clause 107(1), for the words “ three months” substitute the
words “ one year” .

478. In clause 107(13), for the words “ one year” substitute the
words “ six months” .

Shri. Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.

470. In clause 107(1), the words “ and duly acknowledged” shall
be added at the end.

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment.

471. In clause 107(1), the following shall be added at the end:

“ And the Appellate Authority may permit the filing of appeal,
if it 1s satisfied that, there was sufficient cause for not filing
within the period.”

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
137

472. In clause 107(2), for the word “ request” substitute the word
“ direction” .

107(2)-@8 ©rvads@d Sods” @oleHad MUoNIM  &HoATaHEMIS” AdhIay”
921NN BRSITVOIMADIGLID af)ANIM” GO |SODNWISSI®.  BROM6S
O1GITY af)M 2 lBOD]1Mald:00 AWWOBHUM o) MMMIWIBIHB0  B:0.2J2ST MEID.
@RI’ BalaH|@3.

Shri. Shafi Parambil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

473. In clause 107(4), after the words “ as the case may be” add
the words “ after recording the same” .

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

474. In clause 107(6)(b), for the word “ ten” substitute the word
“ twenty” .
Shri. V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendment.

475. In clause 107(8), the words “ in person or his authorised
representative” shall be added at the end.

Shri. V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

480. In the proviso to clause 107(13), for the words “ one year”
substitute the words “ six months” .

Shri. I. C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
138

481. In clause 107(14), the words “ by Regd Post with A/D” shall
be added at the end.

2. aleed: 479-00 mud cedu®l 47820 mmId 6e_3L®IE

@PISNIV®1MIT BRAIMGq {lesoenzmel.

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo moea%!@)’l (). Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Aaf)V): VB,

IOl L RO el \uTaTR

o). aW1e9a8: eloan. @RMIE" 2000TVM ®eBUWY BRAIMGla{la] 469, 478

af)aMT MMIAB EBBVMIB:U3 VB M1RIB0 ).

@l aueml eROMVan’ @RAIMAlafla) 470-00 MmMId 6RO  ave
M@ 5.

@1l al. afll. VRIBB @RAMGlafla) 471-00 ®mIUd es3L®] ave
(Tﬂ(bf.)cﬁn((ﬂ:}i.

Wl MBIl @Rel @RAUGGIafla) 472-00 maud eesV®] aue
M@ 5.

@  axoafl alom@ ePA®GIafla] 473-00 ®maud celV®1 auve
M@ 5.

Wl all. sl mm0de @AUMGIafla) 475-00 maud 3L aVE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
139

M1 @1 5.
Wl al. Wl auoelad GrAMOIa(ls] 480-00 mMIB GRBVL®I aVE
mmooe)(o”lgd.
@) &ag). aUL MILIGHHMB @RAIMGIa{la 48l-00 MMIB eV aLE
M@ 5.
M1 a0 Qldal MIelOad BONAISHIMHNIM (@JUIODD
@RMBBLIABMAIA. . .. .......
@®Igelleasamala...........
MG a@®0 Qldq] MIENH BINMISGHEMSOAM (@JURo TVE @0 1B:01).

Q1 a@3¥oo Qldal milefload cowaowl.

Q1 af)s" A®@ Q] alO®” AUHNOQYBB Qldha|dhUd

(6_3L™] el

2l. aY1e9d: Q1 af)g” A®@ M@F] ol 01OOWSS O_Iceaq‘;lcﬁn(ﬁ enflefload

BINAIBNCIMNHAAN (JUQ6)(D10)

@RMBLNH8B3aMAIA. . .........

@J®elasamald...........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
140

™Il o) QO@ @Il Al  AHOWSS mcea%jce)uﬁ enflefload
BIWNAISNEMOAN (@JUQo LR @T@om%ea(ohd.
™1 af)§ A®@3 Q] Al 0IHOQYBS maasc%;loeaufs enflefload conmadwl.

Q1 al®1OMOIMIo Adhal

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

482. In clause 111 (1), after the words “ The Appellate Tribunal”
insert the words “ as referred in section 109 of the Act” .

483. In clause 111 (2) (f), after the word “ representation” insert the
words “ after hearing the appellant”

484. In clause 111 (2) (f), after the word “ representation” the
following words shall be inserted “ for reasons to be

recorded in writing or” .

WMHHIO\0Jo HWQo Ao lA@D] (GAWI. Sl af)o. EMINAV eIV ): VB,
S x

CRBLMIBU3 MV fl:Ho0 00l

o). e9d: @l ail. afl. VRIBMB GRAIMGa(la) 482, 483, 484 agaml

MMIA ¢EBOMIHU3 AVE MI0IHE1a).
Q1 al®1OMIMMI0 Aldsa | MINEOHF BIVAISHIMOAM (@JUIOHDID

@RMBLINH83aMAIA. . .. .......



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
141

@Q®ZGeasamald...........

Q1  al®1OMIMIo  Aldal milelload  BIVWAIBHMOOAN  @JUgo VR

@01 @1a).
Q1 al®1OMIMI0 Aldsa | milefload cowawl.

Q1 al@6m_lo Aldsal’

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment.

485. In clause 112 (1), the following words and symbols shall be added
at the end: “ or permit the filing of appeal, if it is satisfied that
there was sufficient cause for not filing within the period” .

WMS00L0J0 HVQo Al ]AD] (aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aV): VB,

¢ MLflHo0 el

o). aVleod: @yl afl. ail. WRIBMB GRAIMONa{la] 485-00 MG EEL®]

aoe m’l(oooe;m%.

M1 al@®eN=0 Qldsq | M6 BIVMILHMOAIM (JUIODOD
@RMZLNH830MAIA. ...........

@J®Zzelasamald...........

MYl al@e=00 Qe  milellead  BIWMILHMHOAAN  (@JUgo  AVE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
142

@001 @1).
Q] al@®eNRo Aldsaf milelload sowaowl.

Q1 al®1gando Qdkal

Shri. A. P. Anil Kumar: Sir, I move the following amendment.

488. In clause 113 (1), after the word “ heard” the words “ in
person” shall be inserted.

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

489. In the proviso to clause 113 (2), for the word “ three” the
word “ two” shall be substituted.

Shri. P.T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment.

491. In clause 113 (5), the words “ by Registered Post with
A/D” shall be added at the end.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo mdaagd@)"l (awI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aV): VB,
¢ 1HU3 MV l:Ho050el.

o). 1e9d: Wl ag). all. GRMIG &00d ERAUGGafla 488-00 mauA@

EEDOIRUVERON (LI YR
@ af)@e3MV” all. &::Mafl8s1ed GRAImGlafla 489-00 MIUG GEBV®I

aoe m’l(oooe)(o’lgﬂ.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
143

W1l afl. Sl eomonay’ @RAMGlafls) 491-00 ®maud es3L® ave
M@ 2.
Q1 al®1gano Qldsq | MIEO0d BONAIBHEMHAIM (@JUYODD
@RMBLNH83aMAIA. . .. .......
@J®gelasamald...........
MYl al®IgaMio Qe milellom  RIVMIGHMOOAN  @JyPo  AVE
@01 @1).
Q1 al®1gando Qldsa| milellod 2owadwl.

Q1 al®1MILID0 QAdsal

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.

492. In clause 114, the words “ a State” shall be substituted
with the words “ the State” .

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

493. In the proviso to clause 114, after the words “ authority to
delegate” , the words “ after intimating the council” shall
be added.

494. In the proviso to clause 114, the words “ of the State
Bench or Area Benches” shall be deleted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
144

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo O_Iceaqd@f] (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)V): VB,

CRBLMIBU3 MVIlH0 00l

o). 99a3: Wl BB @REN @RAIMAa(la] 492-00 MMUAB GRBVL®I

e M@ 2.
Wl ail. afl. WRIBM ERAGGa{la) 493, 494 agam1 mMIB EREVL®1E:U3
e M@ 4.
MQ1 al®1Moeo Aldaf milefloag BoWAISHIMOHRID JUIO O
@RMZLINH8B30MAIA. ...........
@J®Zzelasamald...........
Q1 al®IMoeo  Aldkal mellom  BIWAIHHIMOAID  @JRo VB
@001 @1a).
Q1 al®1Moeo Qldal milelloag fowaowl.

MQ1 al®IMeMIo Aldsal

(6e3L™) el

2. 109@: QG al@IMe@Id0 Qldsa ] MIENOE BINAIGNEMHAIM (@JUIODD

@RMBLINH83aMAIA. . .. .......



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
145

@Q®ZGeasamald...........
™l al®IMando  Aldsal  mlelload  BIVAISNMOAAN  @JRo  dUVE
@01 @1a).
Q1 al®IMemdo ldsa | milefload owadwl.

Q1 al®1MI0%0 Adsal

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

495. Clause 116 (2) (d) shall be deleted.

13

497. In the proviso to clause 116 (2)(d), for the words “ one
year ” substitute the words “ three years ”

Shri. P.T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendments.

496. In clause 116(2) (d), for the words “ two year” substitute the
words “ three years”

498. In the proviso to clause 116 (2)(d), for the words “ one

3

year” substitute the words “ two years” .

Shri. K.S. Sabarinadhan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

500. In clause 116 (3) (c), add the words “ or misappropriation
of Government money” after the word “ misconduct” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo m&(g‘d@j‘ (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)aV): VB,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
146

CRBLMIBU3 MV lHo0 00l

o). e93: 1. afl. all. WRIBM @AUGGa{la) 495, 497 agam1 maud

BBBVM U3 AVE MIVIBO1 4.
Wl all. Sl. ey’ @A®Elafla) 496, 498 agam1l mmMId 6EEL®IB:U3
e MA@ 2.
W 9. af)aV voaIEIMILLM @AUDEa(la] 500-00 MmMUE ceBY®] aqVE
M@ 5.
Q1 al®IMI0J0 Aldsal MLiload BIWAIBHEMOAAN (@JUIODD
@RMBLNH8B8aMAIA.. .. .......
@J®&elasamald...........
™Y1 al®IMINdo  Qldq| mMefload  BIWAIHHIMORAN  @JyQo  AVE
@001 @1).
Q1 al®IMI0J0 Alda | nilefload fonadwl.

Q1 al®IEGMPI0 Adsal

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

502. In the proviso to clause 117 (2), the words “ and valid” shall
be inserted after the word “ sufficient” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
147

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%;!m@’l (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" eIV ): VB,

¢e3L®1 MLflHo0 el

o). ae9d: @l. afl. sl eIV’ @RAIMA1a{la] 502-00 MMUA @BELMI

e M@ .
MQ] al®IeMPIo Aldsal MLlOad BINAIBHEMOAAN (@JUIODD
@RMBLNHB3aMAIA. . .. .......
@J®elasamald...........
Q0%  al®IEMPIo  Qldkal Mo B[INAIBNEMOAIM  @JyQo LR
@001 @1).
0% al®1EMPIo Qlda | nilefload fonadwl.

MQ1 al®1OMS” AM@ Q1 MHWBaIOMISAN” AUHOWSBSB Aldsald U

(ee3L®) el

2l. W19938: Q1 aIDIOMS YD @ 1G] Mo ICMIBSIM” QIHOVSS O_Iceagqlo%(fa

nileload B0NMIBHEMEOAAN (@ JUD DI
0L [¢] @m
@RMBBLINAB8MAIA. . .. .......

@®Zelasmmald...........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
148

QI al®lOMg” @@ QY] M@WaIOMISIN” AUHOQYSS O_lceagdcﬂ)(fa enflefload
BOUAIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRoNTB:01).

™I al®1OMg @@ 1PQ] DMGBaIOMIBAN” AUOOWSS mce;%;lce;u% enflefleoad
BOWMOW.

Q1 H@BalOMIOMN2I0 Adhal

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

505. In clause 122 (1) (iv), the words “ three months” shall be
substituted with the words “ sixty days” .

Shri. V. P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendments.

507. In clause 122 (1) (x) after the words “ with an intention”
insert the word “ wilfully” .

Shri. Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.

508. In clause 122 (1) (xi), after the word “ registration” add the
words “ within the specified time limit”

Shri. Shafi Parambil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

509. In clause 122 (1) (xiii), after the words “ of his” insert the
words “ Lawful” .

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
149

510. In clause 122 (1) (xv), after the word “ suppressess” insert
the word “ wilfully” .

Shri. V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendment.

511. In clause 122 (1) (xxi), for the words “ ten thousand”
substitute the words “ twenty five thousand” .

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%!@’l (@awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV" eIV ): VB,

CRBLMIBHU3 MV fl:Ho0 00l

o). 1e9d: @loan. @YMNE" 20000VM ®6EBUWE ERAIMElafla] 505-%

MMIA B3VM] AVE MIOIHRE1,).

Wl all. all. WRI@MB GRAMGlafla) 507-0%0 ®maud 3L ave
M1 5).

@ aueml EROMal @RAIMGIafla] 508-00 mmud eesL®  ave
M@ 5.

@1  adafl alom@d eRA®Elafla] 509-%0 ®maud cesL®1  auve
M@ 2.

@1 afl. Sl emaay” eramalafla) 510-00 maud ee3L®  aue

m’](OOcG)(O']_'}J.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
150

@1. afl. Sl. MIE0o @RAI®G]afla) S11-00 MMA EEEVL® MVE MO ).
Q1 D@BaIOD]06MN20 Qldsq | MINLNOHAR BOVMIGHIMOAIM (JUIHDID
@RMBLNH63aMAIA.. .. .......
@J®&elasamald...........
MYl OTBaIOMIOMNR0  Qldsaf MINLO BIVAISNHEMOAIM  @JUo VR
@001 @1).
Q1 H@Ba IR0 Aldsa | milellond 2owadwl.

Q1 D@BalOMIPaMI0 Qldsal

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

513. In clause 123, for the words “ one hundred” the words
“ two hundred” shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo mdaagd@)"l (awI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aV): VB,

¢RI V10 M0

o). le9d: Wl afl. Sl eIV @RAGGIa{la) 513-00 MU 6_3LMI

ave m%oooe;«ﬂ%.
Q1 M@aIOMIPaN0 Qldsa] MILN1OAF BONAILHEIMOHRIM (@JURIO DT

@RMZLNH830MAIA. ...........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
151

@Q®ZGeasamald...........
Ml MBVBaIO®IGINIo Aldal milelload [IVAISHEIMOAIM  @Jydo dVE
@bomﬂceamgd.
Q1 MGBalOMIPaN0 Qldal milefload cowaow.

Q1 H@BalO®MIMILI‘0 Aldsal

Shri. Roji M. John: Sir, I move the following amendment.

515. In clause 124 (b), for the words “ twenty five” the word
“ fifty” shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo moegc%;l@_@ (awI. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Haf)aV): VB,

HEElOlOI QM Eo ) (uT=TR

o). e93: . €091 ag)o. @2R6M BRAIMAlafla] 515-00 MMIB 3L

ave m1(oooe>(o"I%J.
Q1 MBI IMOL0 Aldsaf MO BIVAIHNEIMOAN (@JURIOOID
@RMBLINHB8aMAIA. . .. .......
@Q®ZeNasamald...........
Q1 O@WaIO®IMOLNo Aldsaf MINElOad BIVAIGHIMOOAN  (@JUgo TLE

momoe;(zﬂgd.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
152

Q1 H@BaIO®IMLI0 Aldsq| milelload cowmowl.

Q1 H@BalOMI@OMII0 QAdsal

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

516. In clause 125, the words “ twenty five thousand” the words
“ fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo mdaagd@)"l (aWI. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aV): VB,
¢RI V10 M0

o). a1e9d8: @yl afl. Sl emonay” GRAIMElafla] 516-2%0 MmaUA 6ERVL®I

e M@ 4.
Q1 M@BaIOM1WeI0 Qldha| MO BIVAIBHIMOHAM (@JURIO D
@RMZLNA830MAIA. ...........
@JZelasamald...........
Q1 DBalOMIWeIdo Aldsaf Milelload fINAIBNEMOAIM  @JRo VB
@001 @1a).
Q1 MBalOMIWeI0 Qldhal milelload fowaowl.

Q1 M@BalOMIBRYOJ0 Ad:al”

Shri. V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
153

517. In the explanation (a) to clause 126 (1), for the word “ five”
substitute the word “ ten”

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

518. In clause 126 (2), after the words “ giving him” insert the
words “ or his authorised representative” .

WMHHIO\0Jo HWQo Ao lA@D] (GAWI. Sl af)o. EMINAV eIV ): VA,
S x

CRBLMIBHU3 MV fl:Ho0 00l

o). e9d: 1. al. awl. V1M @A Ea(la] 517-00 MaUB EBELMI

e M@ .
@1 afl. Sl @V @RAU®MAlafla] 518200 ™M e_3L®  aue
M1 5).
Q1 M@ IOMIWIN0 Qldsal MILNO03 BINAISNHEMHAIM (@JUIODD
@M BRI AB8MAIA. . .. .......
@Q®ZGelasmmald...........
Ml DWBalOMIWINlo Qldaf Mmelload RINAIGHIMOAIM  (@JUQo VR
@01 @1).

Q1 M@BaIOM1WIN0 Qldal milellod cowaowl.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
154

Q1 D@BalO®] aB®0 QAdsal’

Shri. I. C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

519. In clause 127, for the words “ proper officer” substitute the
words “ authorised officer” .

WMHIOY0Jo HWQo m&(g‘d@j‘ (). Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Aaf)V): VB,

HEElOlOI QM EelG)ul=TR

ol. aleed: ). ©ag). AUl I0LIGHHD @RAIMGIafla 519-00 mMId

EDOIRUVERON (LI EYR
Q1 MBaIODa@Pdo Qldhaf MILflHad BIVAISHIMOAMM (@JUIOHDD
@RMBBLIAB8MAIA. . .. .......
@®ZGeasamald...........
Q1 OTBalOWIaBP9lo Qldhal mellond [INMAIGHIMOAIM  (@JUyQo aUVE
@aomﬂcea(oW%J.

Q1 MBalOM]a@Pdo Qldhal milefloag cowaowl.

Q1 D@BalO®agf)S20 Adsal’

(6_3L™] el

Q1 M@BalOM]ag)o0 Adsqf MOl BIVMILHMOAIM (JUIODOD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
155

@RMBLIAB8MAIA. . .. .......
@®gelleasmmala...........

Q1 DBalO®Iagf)3oo Qldkal Milefload BIVAIBGHEMOAIM  @JRo VB

@aowﬂce;«ﬂgd.

Q1 M@Balom]ag)glo Qldsq] mileflond 20naawl.

Q1 DRBalOMIBWal®90 QAdsal

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendments.

520. In clause 129 (1) (a), for the word “ two” substitute the
word “ three” .

525. In clause 129 (4), after the word “ concerned”  insert the
words “ or authorised representative” .

Shri. A. P. Anil Kumar: Sir, I move the following amendment.

521. In clause 129(1) (b), for the words “ twenty five”
substitute the word “ fifty” .

Shri. Eldose P. Kunnapillil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

522. In clause 129 (1) (b), for the word “ less”  substitute the
word “ higher” .

WMSO0I0J0 HVQo Al ]AD] (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" af)TVH): VB,




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
156

CRBLMIBU3 MV lHo0 00l

o). aeed: @l. afl. Sl e®oaay” @RA®GIafla] 520, 525 agam1 maud

GRBVMI1:HU3 VB M1 @].2.
W af). all. EEMIG #2088 GRAIMAIA{la] 521-00 mMUB B3V aVE
M@ 5.
W af)@e3MV” all. &:Malgsgled @RAIMOlafla) 522-00 MIUG GRRVMI
e M@ 2.
Q1 DBaIOD1BMBal®Io Aldsal MILlload BIWAISHEMOAAN (@JUIOOD
@RMBLNH8B8aMAIA.. .. .......
@J®&elasamald...........
Q1 DBIODIBMWBal®o Qldhal MILlOR BIVAISHIMOAM @JWRo VR
@001 @1).

Q1 DB IOD1308a 10 Aldsal milefload sowaowl.

Q1 Qal®0 Adsal

Shri. P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

528. In clause 130(4), the words “ or his representative” shall be
inserted after the word “ person” .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
157

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moea%;!m@’l (Baw. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV" eIV ): VB,

¢e3L®1 MLflHo0 el

o). 1e9d: @), all. Sl. e®IAMY” @RAMAlafls] 528-00 MAUAB GBBLM]

e M@ .
Q1 Qa|®o Qldsq | MNENOad BONMIGHIMOAIM (JUIOHDID
@RMBLNHB3aMAIA. . .. .......
@J®elasamald...........
Q1 Ba|®0 Ald:q | MIENOHG BINAILHIMHRAM (@JUo TVE @oW1B:@]).

M™Q1 Qa|®%0 Aldsq | mileflond 2@onmawl.

Q1 Qa]OMIB8MMI0 Adsal

(ee3w@ el
ol. 99@: 131-00 aldqf melHng BOVAIBHICRINWID  (@JUIHOID
@RMZLINA8B3aMAIA. ... ...
@ &zelasamald.......

131-00 aidq mileNlong BOVMIBHIMAOAM (@JWBo TVE @0 d:0 a{lalasM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
158

131-20 i@ mileNond onmlalaso.

Q1 QalOMIOMBI0 Adsal

Shri. Hibi Eden: Sir, I move the following amendment:

530. In clause 132 (1) (g), the word “wilfully” shall be inserted after the
words “of his duties”.

Shri. Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment:

531. In clause 132 (1) (1) (i), the words “with a fine of hundred lakh
rupees” shall be inserted after the word “imprisonment”.

Shri . V.P. Sajeendran: Sir, I move the following amendment:

532. In clause 132 (1) (1) (ii), the words “of rupees fifty lakhs” shall be
added after the word “fine”.

Shri. Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment:

533. In clause 132 (1) (1) (iii), the words “of rupees fifty lakh” shall be
added at the end.

2. a169ad: MiIg0MIMea|g AlMIaRAd, c3VMIHhU3 AV !hI0yMIEEM?

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo mceargd@W (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : AVA,
¢_3LM1HU3 MV flHo0s0el.

o). WH93: Y. HHa0mil MOW BRAIMA)a{la) 530-00 MmMIA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
159

GRARVMI1 MR MIBIBO1.2[101H63aM.

U @R3NIA MVIBGD BPAIMA]a[la) 531-00 MAUAB GRBV®I
M1EIB012fl01HBs30M0.

@ afl. afl. WRIB® BRAGGIa{la] 532-00 MMIA GRRVLMI] LA
M0 01 2f101H68300.

©1. Ve GRIMVan” BRAIMG]aflaf 533-00 MMIA GV MVE

M1EIB012fl01Hs30M0.

132-%0  aldqf mNeloag GOVRISNIGRINW (@JUIAOI)

@RMBLNH63MAIA. . ... ..
@J®1elasamald.......
132-00 aidaf  enflefload BOUNMISHEMHAAN @JUQo aos
@0 1H 01 afl@1Hs30M0.

132-% aldsqf nNeloag cowndwclasan.

™Q1 Ba|o™Igan” A @ Q1 Aa|EMTWIO” AUNOQSSB Qldsq|HUd

(ee3w®lel)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
160

. aeed:133  ago@ 136 awowss Qs | nieNsaad

BOUMIHHIGRIHWAN (@JURODD
@RMBLNH63MAIA. . ...
@J®1&elasamald.......
133 oyo@3 136 aipoass Qg |03 MNL{OMG RONAILHEMHRA @G0 V-
@RoUlH 01 2[1@1H6M0.

133 go@3 136 aivoss Qa8 Meflod cownoalesm.

Q1 QalO™af)®20 AUdsal

Shri. Shafi Parambil: Sir, I move the following amendment:

534. In explanation to clause 137 the following may be inserted wherever
it occurs after the word “firm” business, house establishments,
agency, office bureau, enterprise or other associations or individuals”.

o). a169ad: MiIg0MIMe g A1MIARA@, R3O ALf™hI0 MIEEM?

WM HIVNJo HhWQo O_lo%gd@f] (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : VA,

RV ML lH0 0Ll

@ a2all alomil@d ERAUMOa(la) 534-00 MMUA GRBVL®I MVE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
161

M0 01 2f1@1H68300.

137-00 it mNefload G01MIHHIERIHWM (JUROGI
@RaBBLINAE3MAIA. . .. . ..
@J®geNasamald.......
137-20 Qo]  milefload  BOVMILHEMOHAAN  @JWQo VA
@0 1012 [1@1H630M0.

137-20 aidsaf’ mieNoag conaalesam.

Q1 Aalo™ag)§” A®@ Q1 MIGa|®” AUNOQYBB Q] Ud

(EEEOOt W) [=1))

. aleed: 138 ao@ 140 awouss Qe |03 nfeNsaad

BORISHICAIOWAN (@JUIO DD
@RMBLNH63MAIA. . ...
@J®Belasamald.......
138 o3 140 awowss Qg |03 B0} RINAILHEMHA (@JWRo
VR BP0 B0 afld1Hs3aM.

138 oyo@d 140 aivowss Qi |00 Meflod cownoalesan.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
162

Q1 MIMa|OMISaNIo QAldsal’

Shri.P.T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment:

535. In clause 141(1), for the word “six” substitute the word “nine”.

Shri. V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment:

536. In the first proviso to clause 141(1), for the word “six” substitute the
word “nine”.

Shri. Roji M. John :Sir, I move the following amendment:

539. In the first proviso to clause 141(2), for the word “two” substitute the
word “three”.

Shri. V. D. Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment:

540. In clause 141(3), for the word “six” substitute the word “nine”.

Shri. I. C. Balakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment.
541. In the first proviso to clause 141(3), for the word “two” substitute the

word “three”.

. 169d: MIg0MIMe g AMIARAE, GREOMIHUE TVNGHI0IMNICENI?

WMS00L0J0 HWQo Alda]AQD] (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : AVAE,

CRBVMIHU3 MVlHI0 00l

@ afl. Sl. @MV’ @RAIGEIA{la] 535-00 MMIA BR3V®] LA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
163

M0 01 2f1@1H68300.

@ afl. Sl. MIT30%0 ERAIMANa{la] 536-00 MMIAB GREL®I aVE
M1EIB012fl01HBs30M0.

Wl 60oZ=] af)o. GRIM @RAUMAlafla] 539-00 MAUB GR3LM] aULE
M0 01 2f101H630M0.

Wl afl. Al av®lvom@ @RAIMAIa{ls] 540-00 MmUd eGe3V™] auve
M1EIB0]af101Hs30M.

@1 ©ag). AUl MILIGHHMD @POIMCa{la] 541-00 MU GV aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

141-00  aldqf mMNeNO0] BIVAIGHIGRINHWAD (@ JUIEOTD)

@RMBLNH63MAIA. . .. ...
@J®1&elasamald.......
141-00 Qe miefload  BIWAISHEIMHAIM  (@JWQo VB

@RoW1H01afl@1As30M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
164

141-90 aldqf mNeNloag cowadwIa@lHsan.

Q1 MIMo|OMIEML" AO® MQT MIMa|OM1SMWal® AUHOWSS
M&H&@

(ee3v@1lel)

ol. aeed: 142 ao@ 149 awowss OJCB?'Q;!cBJUa enflefload

BOUMIHHIGRIHWAN (@ JUROBD
@RMBLNH63MAIA. . ...
@®ZBelasamald.......
142 pov@d 149 awowss Qa3 MABNOG BONMISHIMODM @JURo
VR BP0 B0 afldAs3aM.
142 poa@3 149 amoqss Qg |03 aileflond cowacwldlesm.

Q1T EOMIMIo Qd:al

Shri. P.T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment:

542. In clause 150 (1) (c), for the words “value added tax or sales tax or
state excise duty or” substitute the words “SGST or CGST or IGST”.

ol. 199 d: MIg0MIMea]g BIMIARAE, GEEND@HUY VNG00 MOEEMI?

WM HIVL0Jo HWQo Adha @] (GAWI. SI. af)o. EMINAV Haf)TVS) & VA,
S x




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
165

e 1HU3 MV fl:Ho0i0el.

W1l afl. SlL c®mav’ @eaI®mdlofla) 542-00 MMIB  GRBV®  aVE

M1IB0]afl@1Hs30M.

150-20 aidaf mleload BonmIenIGRINWIM (@ JUHD
[y o} (4]

@R BLIAE3MAIA. . .. ...
@J®1gelasamald.......
150-00  aigq] mileNloag BonaIsHMEAMM @Jyo Ve
@RoU 1012 f1@1H6800.

150-% aiaq] mileNloag sonaowlalesamn.

Q1 GRMWalOMIB8MNI0 Adsal

Shri. V.P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendment:

544. In clause 151 (2), after the words “call upon the concerned” insert the
word “registered”.

2. 19 d: MIa0MIMeq]g A1MIRAE, REW®I MV E:I0yNIEEMI?

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moe;%ﬂ@ﬁ (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : AVAE,

RV ML I1Ho0 0Ll



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
166

Wl all. ofl. wRI@MD  ERAIMGa(la] 544-00 MOUB GREVL®]  aULE
M1 012f101H630M0.

151-00 Qi@ neload GIWAISHICRINHWN (@ JUIOOID

@RMLlasamMaId.......
@ &elasamald.......
151-00  aldqf anfleflond GOVaIBHIMHAID (@JyRo TVE
@RoU 012 [1@1H6800.

151-00 almaf nfleflond cowmolalesmo.

Q1 GRMalMIEME” A®OGI Q] GRQAI®” QAUHOWS8S O.Ic93<g;_|,c0303
(ee3v@1lel)
ol. ale9d: 152 gov@d 160 alvowss Qg 0D milefload
BOMOIBHICRINHWAD (@ JUIO DD
@R BLNA63MAIA. . ...
@®Gelasamald.......
152 po@d 160 apowss Qs |00 MINL{OM3 RINAISHAMOA @JUgo

MR BRoWTdA1 210186300,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
167

152 po@d 160 awowss Qg 03 niE{log RONNIVIBIES.

Q1 GRQaIOMIBaNI0 Aldsal

Shri. Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following amendment.

545. In clause 161, after the word “Central” insert the word “Goods”.

161-@3 "by an officer appointed under this act or an officer appointed
under the Central Goods and Services Tax Act" agam” calemo.
@®1@d 'Goods’ el

o). 169@: MIa0MIMe g AMIARAE, GREVM AVGHIOYMIGCENI?

WM HIOL0Jo H®Qo Qldsa |A@)] (GAWI. Sl. ag)o. ECMIAANV” Haf)MVD;) : VA,
3 % af) of)

W. DB @REN AU Ga{la] 545-%0 MaUB B3VL®1 VB0

o). 1e93: Uy DeMBI0B:¢] @REN UGG {la] 545-90 mauad

GRRULMT VR BP0 1A 12{l01H63aT0.
GREV®] 6aIQa)H00ass 101-00 aldsq | milefload
BINAOIBNIGRIOHWAM (@JUIHDOD
@R ZBLINA6BOMAIA. .. ...

@J®1gBelasamala.......



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
168
CRRULMI 621Q(JHI0NBS 161-00 qida] enfefload onaIeneImMeOnaM
@JUgo VB BRoW1B@12fl@1H830M.

CRRVMI §21Q (JHIVABS 161-00 Qigmaf enielload c0wnIw1dlesam.

MQIERQaIO™] A" B3 1YQIERQAIOM] @M AUHOWYBB Aldsald U3

(ee3v@lwler)

ol. alend: 162 nomad 165 alvowss Qg |03 milefload

al. a4y 1690
BONMIGHIGDIOWAD (@JURETI)
@R BLINA63MAIA. . ...
@®gGelasamald.......
162 no@d 165 awoss Q03 NEIOG RINAISHIMONAN (@Jy3o
MR BRoWTHA12[101H630TM0.
162 oo@d 165 aiposs Qra |03 Milefload 20naWIalesM.

®Q1ER QIO @YOJo Aldsal

Shri. P.T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment.

546. In clause 166, for the words “comprised in one session or in two
successive sessions”, substitute the words “comprised in one session
or in two or more successive sessions”.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
169

Shri. T. A. Ahammed Kabeer : Sir, I move the following amendment.

547. In clause 166, the words after “immediately following the session or
the successive sessions” shall be deleted.

ol. e9d:  MIg0MIMqg AIMIARAE, GEBEN@IHU3 TLN:I0MIEEMI?

WMHI0Y0Jo HWQo mceaq:l@j (@awa. Sl. ag)o. IRV’ HafIVS) : AVAE,

e 1HU3 MV flHo0s0el.

o). 1693 : @l afl. Sl. @AV BRAIMA)a{la] 546-00 MMIAB GREVW®]

MVE M1EIH 01 aflalas3aM.

@) Ql. ag). @Ra0ME" HMAAQ @PAIMAIa{laf 547-00 MMIA GREVLD] AVE

M0 01 2f101H68300.

166-20  aidqf MmileNlong BINAIGHICRIHWAD (@JUIODD

@RMBLNA63MAIA. . ... ..
@J®1gelasamald.......
166-20 Adaf Mmeload  BINMILHEMOAAN  @JQo  aUE
@0 1B 012 f1@1Hs30M0.

166-% aigq] milefloa) cowaowldlesmn.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
170

MQA1@R QoI a¥", ®WQ1ERQaIO™] af)§~ QldaldHUd

(ee3v@1lel)
ol. alead: 167, 168 ogamT Qg |03 MNBOG BOVMIHHIEANWAD
(RO
@RMBLNA63MAIA. . ...
@J®ZGelasamald.......
167, 168 agyan Qldsq 03 IBIHG RONAISHEIMONIN (@JyGo TVE
@R 012[1@1880.

167, 168 agyan Qo |03 Miefload conaowlalesan.

RQIERQAIOMISMWal®Io Qd:al”

(6n120m0MBa]s @oWwo a1gleNeld®1@am@1mnom3 (elelhlof
@RAIM @ [laflel.)
oll. 693: 169-20  alda mieflond GonmIHnIERINWAN (@JUHGEID
@RMZLINA8B3aMAIA. ... ...
@ &zelasamald.......

169-00  aima| mileleoad BOVMIGHMHAMM (@Jugo TVE
oL 0 m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
171

@0 101 af101H630M0.

169-20  aigq] milefloag cowaowldlesan.

MQ1 af)Qal®Io Qd:al

(eezv@1lel)

o). 1e9d: 170-00  Ald:a] milellond onaIsnIcaIn®an @JuRHOI

@RMBLNB63MAIA. . .. ...
@J®1elasamald.......

170-00  Qigma| melod @aWMIGHIMOAID @Judo TVE
)Y o} [$0]

@01 01 af101H530M0.

170-20  aidq] anilefload conwaowlalesao.

Q1 af) QalOMIBANI0 Aldsal’

Shri. V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment:

549.

In clause 171(1), for the words “commensurate reduction in prices”
the words “an exactly equally amount of reduction of prices” shall be
substituted.

Shri. V. K. C. Mammed Koya : Sir, I move the following amendment:

550.

In clause 171(2), the following sub-clause shall be inserted and
renumbered accordingly:-

“(3) The Authority shall cause to constitute State Level Authority in
each State to ensure the benefit of reduction in the rate of tax on any



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
172

goods or services or both is passed on to the recipient by way of
reduction in the price.”

ol. 1e9d: MiIg0MIMq]g AIMIARAE, GEBEN@IHU3 TV 1d:I0MIEEMI?

WMHIBY0Jo HWQo m@aH@W (@awa. Sl. af)o. EBIOAV’ HafTVD) : AV,

e 1HU3 MV fldHo0 0el.

ol. We9d: . afl. Sl. MIa3ndo BRAIGA1a{laf 549-00 MMIB RV

MVE MIOIB 01 afldlss30M.

W afl. . AVl 000E" 63 ERAIMGA (1) 550-00 MMIA GREV®]

MR M1RIMHE]2[1@1H60M.
171-00  aldqf enNeflond 0VaIenIEMINWAM @JUIOOD
@RMLlasaMaId.......
@ &elasamald.......
171-00  aidaf nNefload 80WaILHEMHRID @Jugo VB
@RoU 012 [1@1H6800.
171-00  aldaf enfeflond ovnowliclesmo.

MQ1 af) alOMIEMEIo Qdsal




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
173

Shri. A. P. Anil Kumar : Sir, I move the following amendment:

552. In proviso to clause 172(1), for the word “three” the word “two” shall
be substituted.

Shri. P. T. Thomas : Sir, I move the following amendment:

553. Clause 172(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid before the State
Legislature during the session immediately succeeding the issuance
of the order.”

2. W1693@: MIa0NIMealg ATNIANE, GERVDIHHU3 aV ﬂc@aO(OAO(%TDO?

WMHHIOVJ0Jo HWQo O.lo@agd@f] (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : VA,

e 1HU3 MV flHo0 0el.

@ ag). alfl. GRMI@H:008 @RAGGA{la] 552-00 MMIAB BEEVL®] MLE
M0 01 2f101H68300.
@ afl. Sl. GO0V @RAIMAIa{la] 553-00 MMUA BEEVLM] AVE

M1EIB012fl01HBs30M0.

172-20 Qi enfefload f0nMIBEHIGRIHWAM (JUIOHDID

@RMBLNB63MAIA. . ...



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
174

@J®gGelasamald.......
172-20  Qidq] milefload conaisnsmeanam @Jue MVE
@RoW 101 af101H630M0.
172-20  aldqf amileNon) cownowlalesan.

Q1 af) $al@®1ganIo QAldkql

Shri. M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendment.

554. Clause 173(iv) shall be deleted.

. a169d: MiIg0MIMe g A1MIARA@, R3O ALf™hI0 MIEEMI?

WMS0030J0 HWQo Alda]AQD] (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : AVAE,

GR3VDI ML IlH0 0Ll

W ag)o. 9003 @ERAIMAa(la] 554-00 MMIAB GRBVL® MVE
M1 01 2f1@1H68300.

173-20  aima| milelond BoAISHIERINWAD @JUIS DTN
[QY] [e] m

@RMLlasmMaId.......
@ &elasamald.......

173-920 Adaf  mieload  BIWMIGHMHRIM  @JWo (VB
[QV] (e} m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
175

@0 1B 01 afl@1As30M0.
173-% aldaf mNeload cowaowlclasan.

Q1 af) QalOMIMILII0 Qldhal”

Shri. M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendment:

555. In clause 174(3), insert the words “Travancore-Cochin” before the
word “Interpretation”.

174(3)(1)-00 imafl@d, Interpretation and General Clauses Act,1125
(Act VII of 1125) agamoem” al1000d8u0)aflS88®". 0D @rd;1oa) E1wIw
Gal®AMIM? HAVMBSE @YGHINeM®BIG @@ 1897 amem. eayg” Gr@6m”

00

OERWIHBMMOMELIT ER®INAG  VOIVWIW  Gal®  SIAIMZEB  O*aflad
DMB@JEFUM @RYAF RMOM GHIAVAV @R, 1125 @rem. af)ead ce3v®]
af)MValOQMN®, M®IT  Gald” AQOIB 0laflglel. B3 SONIMWBZ:Q @Y
03»02flB  a)AN’  Cal@HHEMo.  HDAUNOWYBB  GRBOWMIGINLI  @RElI M.
DfHSOHWIM HITYIM B2a0” celd ome. mmlad Kerala adaption of laws no. 2
order 1957. @®1@3 whereas section 120 of states reorganize an act 1956.
The state government are empowered by order to make such adaptions and

modification of certain laws, whether by way of repeal or amendment as



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
176

may be necessary or expedient for purpose of facilitating the application of
such laws in relation to the state of Kerala. Now, therefore in exercise of
powers conferred by the said section, the Government of Kerala hereby
making following order namely,

1. These order may be called Kerala Adaption Laws order no.2, 1957

2. General Clauses Act 1897 applies for interpretation of this order, as
it applies for the interpretation of Central Act.
HAVMS@ @Y AVfHOIBBMO@ &> 1@3 1897 agam” alo@emo. @6aE"
DO alOOMISBB®” RMOT  EHOIAVAV @Y, 1125 agamosem’. =2momd
GHOTVIV” @R 1125 @reemenla 6miaflad @RS SIAM&:A af)an” @G
G2l@HNEMo. ENOWILje @RAIN®S 8aM” MVfld01Ga) alQ. BNV 108 O af1ad
@03 S20IMZEB af) M’ Gal@HHEMo. @ROLIBIT RMOT BJOMVAV GBRYH;1©3
QIBatto  MIEQEMEB@ENE. D EISEo 1125 agamoem” @rslsfigsso: 1125
@YOME1M3 M1LINfeI8B8®” Ol SI0IMBZE@ RMOD BRIV BRYRIEM.
HIVMS@ @Y MIRINITIABEMIND ORIl SI0IMBEB @Y™ MV1H0186I03

HEIQEA 2f)HAMI@W G2l0B3J0 HSIWENE. ERDOHIMNE” HAVIIST @BIYHINEMEH 13



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
177

125 agan@” mocqememoem’. @pmel 1125-0e1 @rya00me@d 9@:0a{108 @rag”
S00IMZEB@ @R  TU1BH0laemo.  @RERT MO  AUIHOlHB6R0  MEIGWI

af)ANDIM” af)H @103 0.

2. V1993 NIa0MIMalg AMIINAE, eV AV 1>0030066MI?

WMHIBY0Jo HWQo O_|093Q‘:!@1 (@awa. Sl. af)o. EDIDAV afTVS) : VA,

U2 0NIMO)]|S @Roo AUBO  UWDOAUECDOINIES Q(TT)@f]%] @JURDIVDE HI6NZo

DOWQo AUdR1H06Mo MDIH1VWDHHHIMNZo 6MINT  MTVA moea(gdmocoﬂ aflengo
NINWOQS. 0D @R100 Cald”  mileflod uonggg@@oJoaemam@om‘i
@BRDHIMNE GRANMI1 GAINMBAMINM @1@MIMo.

oll. Y1993 : NIEOMIMq|S @ooWo GEREOM @JTV §aIQYMDEE=0?

©l. ag)o. 2o0@: V@, ATNIANAE TVI1HHO1LSANILINOVWAN” A I0ED®

CHSIEL MO CaldUd BRYNINDd YDA ]S,

GAWI. Sl. ag)o. EMIDAV af)AMVEs: SIAUMED 3HIaflMB ag)dM® arflengo

CRRLM] §21QY" @Y Gald 091@1%6113“. @RMIEM” WILNIBMNY o O INGAIME]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
178

Gal0ud @RQIvel.

@W).  afo. 9003: VG, |MOM GRONV @R  MLINTIHBEMIOU3

@RALIATaHM @R, MENU3 MV1B012] MUAI®1ES SINIMBEAQ @YZ” O a[108 @Y’
MU RHA1HHIMB 2 ldFEMNZI; NI GaldUd @RYNAIUD IO |SAT.

(MVBIOWIEBBRUB @O |0WO ()00 GRS GO |SOM].)

@RaBLNBs3MAIAR
1) W amml@cfa 203" all.
2) W aI00HH®3 @M6N| 553
3) ©. BRMIE" 20000V ®6BBUY
4) W1 QL. af). @O &6NnrlAd
5) . DeMBIoB:$] @A
6) W) ag). all. GEMIG3 S:003
7) W1 @MY’ cRaMI’
8) @. GRAAIR NI
9) @, ©ag). V. MIOEIGHMD

10) @) afl. Q1. mIdno



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
179

11) W af)@BEETV" afl. &:0Ma (188103
12) W, ®9a0mil MDA

13) W sl. ail. mEnjoadlo

14) ©. aVl. mogs)

15) W Od. af)o. MIEM]

16) GAWI. af)o. . OMIA

17) U1 af)@. ag). ONENLBAN”
18) W1 EGAUD” & alanIomel

19) W1. @021 agf)o. GR06M

20) W . 2V VOMIAIMILND
21) W afl. afl. 1B

22) W1 afl. awl. cv®1voad

23) W1. aH2a0l alom@3

24) U1, Va1 GROAVAL

25) W1 afl. Sl. emoaay”

26) ). af)o. SONA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

180
@J®1eilasanald
I W O, ail. (GTO6T)_I§U3 01033
2) W af. (zmméoqo”lonﬁ
3) @12 afl. GRWIHUI Galdg]
4) U1 @RYAGENT G206
5) D@Jian. Od. Q). RN
6) ). . NI
7) W] M. o)V nileFlecnoud
8) W M. 21QBEUNIOD
9) W . B0V
10) @l il al. ezaImyl
11) W, af)@CRBI af)EJa0do
12) W1 9. nil. NEeMaH’ &M@
13) W WI®I NIl
14) . eRIBX af)o. CMIRM

15)

GAWI. . Sl. 2el1od



16)
17)
18)
19)
20)
21)
22)
23)
24)
25)
26)
27)
28)
29)
30)

31)

W

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
181

. R’ DO

. . all. ROWOIRM

. BRI HaNB@EMIMNBAV’

. 0. HoHWBHS]

. afl. . AUl 0@ GHIW

. af)o. af)o. mem]l

. HXW. 009\31

Wlam] oR. caYlasgiEnon

W

Wyl

W

af). AVl ©20QYIa3

. 00g] OaldeME
. VUL ©dh. MIGM

. af)o. MMaHI3’

. @. @YA. @J3)al’

af). @J3)al’ 5003

Odh. Wl (@JEaLVMd

W™ Q. @J®18 a0



32)
33)
34)
35)
36)
37)
38)
39)
40)
41)
42)
43)
44)
45)
46)

47)

W

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
182

. aJ@aUM Hselansl

. all. Sl ag). 0a0lo

. af)o. PIREUIAIILING

. ©002IBM HSMNa|8S]

. Odh. O, OINAIAA MIWVWA

9l all. EONGUD

@Joan. V. aN@moLe’

. af)aV. VORI

. af). Od. VU@

. VL. od. VU1A30d

. all. &, vowol

. ®ag). mil. VO laH’

. 2. MWIH0M

. afl. ag)anv. ayM1G3 H:00A@
. Odh. MYCOaH &Qa

. af)o. MV1EIL"



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

183
48) W1 all. ®eenomand
49) W. eIV 2106NE]
50) GAWO. Sl. af)o. BMIATV Haf)aTVBs”

51) @ all. @)
52) W1 . ail. ol
53) W1 M. O, aNRW
MaYHHU® o 10elasmald - @r@alel.
o). e938: Y. ag)o. 2003 BRAUMAIa(la] 555-00 MMUAB c_RBVL®IOHW
@meNasanald- 26
eJo@eNasanaid- 53
MaYBHHUD al0elasamald- ERy@AIE].
Wl  afo. 9203 @RAUMGlafla]  555-00 ®mmud  es3L®]  aLE
M1EIB0]2fl01Hs30M.
174-20 Qighaf anflefload BanNAIHHICRINWAD (JUIO DI
@RABLNH63MAIA .........

@J®1Zeilasamald .........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
184

174-20 Qe  enflefload BONMOBHEMHAAN @JUQo aos
@010 af1@1H630M0.
174-20 aigqf anflefload conmowlalesan.

B000 O6NZ0 al5lddUd

(eeBL@IWIEI)
ol. 1093:1-90 2-90 alSldd0d nelond BONAIBNICA af)aM (@JUIOHED
@RABLINAEBMAIA .........
@®1elasamald .........
l-90  2-90 alGl®:0d  MNElOad  BINMISHEAMHAAN  @JROOD  TVR
@RoU 1012 f1@1H8M0.
1-90 2-90 aISldd0d milefload onmW1@lHsamn.

QA0 alglds

Shri. C. Mammutty: Sir, I move the following amendment.

556. In schedule III 3(c), for the words “a State Government” substitute the
words “State  Government”.

0. 199 d: MIa0MIMea]g BIMIARAE, GEBEN®I MVE:I0yNIEEMI?

WMHIY0Jo HWQo moea%d@ﬂ (@awa. Sl. ag)o. BNV’ HafIVS) : AVAE,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
185

e &0 0el.

o). leed: Wl al. aegs) @RAMGIafla] 556-%0 MMUB ceBL®] aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.
BaNoo algld MIEfload BOVAILHIGRI af)aIM (@JUIODD
@RABBLINASBMAIA .........
@®ZGelasamald .........
PaMIo algld nilefload fonmIW1alesmo.

B0M0 Qldsalo afloldhQo Gal@o

Shri. M. Swaraj: Sir, I move the following amendments:

107. Inclause 1 (3) (a), the figure “10” shall be deleted.

108. In clause 1 (3) (b), for the words and figures “Sections 6 to 9, 11 to
21” the words and figures “Sections 6 to 21” shall be substituted.

Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendment:

109. In clause 1 (3) (c), the words “such date” shall be substituted with the
words “appointed day”.

Shri. Anoop Jacob: Sir, I move the following amendment.

110. In clause 1(3) (c) insert the word “Kerala” before the word“Gazette”.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
186

ol aVlend: oMl aloQan  HHIMEIBBIGI e GRBUVM1HUY

@AM Olq [lesnan®Iel. 106-20 GO UBIBHUBO RIS, (DD(JHI00LL.
111-00 ee3w®] 110-00 ee3OL®1es” @elynIV@IMIT GRAIME {leanmamlel.
MIg0MIME g BIMIYAE, GRENVMIH:UY AV E:I0YM0EeMI?

WM HIBY0Jo HWQo O_Iceagqj@q (awa. Sl. af)o. BMINAV HafMVH): VA,

CRBLMIBHU3 MV fl:Ho0 00l
o). 1698 . ago. VIR ERAUGGIA{la) 107, 108 mmid c_B3V®1B:U3
MVERWHS BRMAMICWINS alladalell s flolsas3amn.
Wl  afo. omd @RA®MGla{la] 109  ®moud  ee3wE  aue
M0 01 2f101H630M0.
Wl  ePMal emkevm’ erAmalafla) 110 maud  eesw®l  avs
M0 01 2f101H6300.
I-00 Qldhq o af1015:Qo Gal@o MO BINAIHHIGAI af)IM (JUIODOD
@MLINA8B30MAIA .........
@J®1Zelasamald .........

I-20 Qldhq o aflloldh Qo Gal@o enilefload BINMIGHEMHAMN (@JUdo aVE
[QV) [e] m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
187

@0 1B 01 afl@1As30M0.
1-20 Qldhq o a0l Qo Bal@o milefload c0nndIalasa.

QMo QDM

WMSO0I0J0 HWQo Ao QD] (awa. Sl. af)o. EMINAV” HafMVS): VA,

2017-0e1 308 21068 cTAIM M@ MAGE aIdARIGHMHAMM (JEOWo NI
@RI Do {lo6a0.

&oH] moea(g;l@W (W. af. agaV” M@ HM0AB): VA, MIM (JCHWSDD

aflamosaao.

W . ag)o. ML AVE, 2].ag)aV.Sl. MSa(ldd AUBMEMIFL:ST alellw

M0QA06M” MERES  AVMIBPLISMEY” AUBIND®.  MIEOAIMO]g  WMHIQ
moeacg:j@)’lmg@s 908HA1LIOM I@1HUd EaldQdh@IM . MAYNS MVMIBPLISMEY”
@ME"  @AIMo  QI8Aa] &lgo. @G MaYOS MI&:®1  AUGBAIMOYo
®132J@0WIg0  aldRUleneMo. MLl GH@ Mle:®m] MYaEE8o  BMBal®
TMLoMOIM MG MYNEB8o  HACX" @mg@@)omﬁ” 8380 MGl
20010101885 em” (One  Tax). @nesem 00Qeminud ®132j@oe  aflel

GOCRENZMIENM. alCGAhHU @R IMaldh0o MAeS aflel &GS, (@JIVEMAIHWIT3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
188

Ala@o  MNI20MIMOQ]S B8@ EIOT®M MAMOS €aldB1la|Gqa]oUd MIaONIMOQ]S
D@D alosm®, aflel MYAED]ENIMW MAPSH  TVIWIAL], BRD CH@BOmIBE MIan
QI@BAN FVIWMAINEMANIEM. af)Lldo CH@BOMIB3 MIMDo QAUBAN AVLIWMAIGEMD;
210@Po Mildlwoemlase aflel MOAE@1H9HI3 MVIWISHIGEL; BR® BH@3O1G3
MIaN”  AUBAN@ICEMI;  BRER[IUB  MIaONIMelS A@D] «l0M®  VOIVEI.
maflos@as aflel MO@1EN03  AVoLOIM  VABENITTIM”  aJBMAIW
@OWI1HRMNS". n0LIEJERIWVISB8 MSalSldud TU1e:01lesamMeNIE; 1@ malles aflel
SHOQIQYIN@IEM. ala]d001es30I100 aflel 9EMIA1E8HWINM. af).MUl., EMI6ND
af)-aVl.  Ga0IS@  BHUMEBUWGH 18  GEIMMEM” SOg;.  BHUIME IO
DHIMZGaI0WILlo 18 vommImMo SO ODHIFHNEMo. BRD® 2WAIM MIOBHIEM.
@RI HE) &HOQeMo. 2. ag)av-.sl.-1e3 M1 Q1eloom
O@a |MEBBUIHBGAIRjo OfleISHONIeM. afleead, GIVIaf, SO c‘aqu)\g‘, 210
o)V BSHIMo  Rl.a)aUisl. el aleHH  aflel HOQIY01EsE:WIem.
Z].af)aUiS]. AIOMHAIMMSB8 Galdl@d £21.ag)aV.Sl. MO MVIWMEEBUILBEA IR0
MEa Y™ MEl ®oa0eemaas M1elY” alfda00lsud  aflel ce;@c(goe)cn)oam”.

2. ag)aV.sl. ©G6N2D SDLIGWI o)’ aldQIa ]S TVIWIVEMANIVIW RMEBBUIHN



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
189

@ROTWIAL afLld MVOWMEEBUBBRe aflel AIBRLMAINNM. BERVOBH:IME BaOIFMI
Mla®l  mlelled 2089q|SEMANd  ERMAGIWILIOm  @RAAIMM TGO
MV@BIWo  MUfldh@la]  Ca0ISRILSIMGal0ejo 2agaUISL.  EHDSIHBM.
Qflalem1w1@d @sacu%@oe)omg” NAIIMOAY VANV MSalSIhud MVflHalHneMo.
@RAI®R0W afleldd®go MO 1HHIM8 1VAINIOHAT HAHIMNOT Da IOV BHEMo.

8@ @ogemdduw’  emezo0lead  aler  1,07,000/-  @eioi@mlan’
1,17,000/- @al1wow TGl EYN 10,000/- @au AUBEV1a). B@ Hals] dagaulm”
14.50  vomaomoml@mlan” 18 wom@0mad®l Sogs. af)eld  MVOWMEBBUIGE0
D(@JH000 B0I0IK 01O aflel aldevmal” OMBIWIgNE. BR® alfi@o 3@
HI0MAIAILNO®WoeM”. @AY  ZHl.afaUisl.-Qaow] 8@ miawaalel.
@R@ODHIME"  WAle3OAd” DB oJ((ﬂ(BUOO(lﬂad@o@:OGTTQU ailel M@ 1690088
RAMAIW MSalSldhUd af)SHNeMo.

MGa00d MIBMIBIWHHAE MAVISINVOIMAHIMT  B060MD@  JaN~  @QIEM
0legam  ALAABa[leneMeaNao  QABHOMIA 8@  Blalvo  AMI@Mo  Olegend
MV2GBa [lEHeMeHRMMoe  @RATQAT.  QI§a1d01;:U3 af)BGANIS A0, G@RD)

WE1IWIEEMI  af)dIMMIsnollel. 37 olegpemsslele 8@ QIY2aI00]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
190

MDA [IEHEMHAAMIEMN”  CHISWHO® ST QI0aldd]  ag)BANIS’  alOTND.
@REBOM DO B  alGlEUIW]ENeMo. MEOMIOSGH MASBH  OlLlddy’
D2lGQENE VAo  Gh¥lemIdlasao. 2l.agavu.sl. @ One Tax avlayo
AUGBINEDIFES] af)BI0  BHIQYEBBo  QAUBOO  af)Ba|AIHMD.  BEREDISAUTWI o
01egemINa3 300y0:S] @REE aldleuoowlsnsmoe. 30 eldto 01§06 I0G]HB6M
MCa P @leely’ HsmmaAGBM®. 80 eldHo  01y0a1d01®:B6M”  MINOS
MoMOIMODBB®. @Y M1LIY” AILlOWI@ MIQo MoRANBBIM. alEHH GRMINN]
aDPlo RMEBBUILH BRADEBAIGAIBLAIHEMo.

£a10D00000Do  OZIEIRAHO  Aldhq |A@] (W) 2. WIGBEM): aV3,

@633 2 106a0MGA 003 af) MOOHI@3 @YUV BB AN D QI
G21031883HH@I6M. MAfOS M VDAIMo MVIMIAN | AUSBB 2 |QENBIG:HAANIEM”
@681~ al0QIND®. @RE® TVAWo Aflel AIBRUIABIM ag)dMo al0QAT. TVIMIMITYH)
QAIBABa| DENBIHEMONGHIT D@ |IBM  AIBRLMAOJZS]  GalMAEGLID.  &21.ag)au.sl.
oB3B0SODIMNDODRHIME"  af)BBOHMWIGM D@ loBM  AUBRRLMAT  DMBIBINGY,
SO0  aflel 93O AUIBREMIIWE  IRMIAN@  &ZGO@  aleMo  &1go.

@RMIGEMI MVIMIAN | QAUBABa] ) ANDOGHIMNE @RER™ DEIUINABIND; @REA|IUI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
191

2MEBU3 2100]000lGEl; MODIAN” AILHDAIHHIGRI?

Wl 0. afo. MMl aVd, X.ag)av.sl. QSG%W@@@%@Q%L DD

MSq{lenwl geanog QIMBEMIOU3 AVMIBDIJOINNE” ENE" YO@AIMo AIBB ) &1g0.
UMIBDILINNO  ASGBEMNIWE  ®1B2JVIQe  AMBAIMo  &SIGLl.  AyeM QYOS
QABRIMOJo  NVBHNITING  AUBAIMOJo  &Go. QAULBDMIQYS QAUBAIMo  LHFEMIOUI
NS NNODI03 NVBEHIBTIHG AUBAOIMOJo &Go. @Y GRAMNOOMILIIEM 6D
alOAOM@.  MIaONIMea]g QD] aMINT  AlOOMH® WOIVWIW  BRAMNOTIG3
AMAYILIHHEMo ) MPRI@ED al0QAMSS. 80 eldto Q100 10G1BHE6M° D
coaleloleelQ” QBN 2. o)V sl. MSa [1eINEBME®IFL:S]
ANeIN@@1E8mM@IMN88 MSalsl WAIMHNAZ" af)SODISIE] af)IM  &HI0IOM1©3
QO(@MI6MM” wmmﬁaaéomﬂ af)Moe”  @REIEJIW  Qy®IOIVAS3®.  Oflel
NNO@SBAMNMOINB8 MSalSlgs] 90m2&:103 R.ag)avu.sl. abela)3n0W]
MSa [leN@G:EMINME RMEBOHS  MVoMITWIofISGOMIBo  @RAIRLH  AIROWIT
@YUMV W]DTS830. BRDOHINE BRMINAF  aJBMNAIV (@JEWIRMo MAPSS
H15eMONSBHIT  VABHHIBTIOAG  HAHINOIZS] VMO M16BBEMo  af)aM

@RE(JOVWEOMIFES] aMIOMHF QAUIABHUY BRAITVIM]a [lH60M.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
192

@J®lalauem®aol’ (. 6aw” aalamlomel):  aud, =).afau.sl Moo

\%

aim@”  'One Nation One Tax' agan aflam 9seLISOO®IOR  aneINdWIg
®OMMWIM. MAIOS MGNHH CGAGE MG 2JAODDWBD af)ANBB @RSTTVLOIM
@@INOM” 2oV SL-QYBB@.  af)IMI@  HONHGHBo  AUYIaNGHBo  0UdS]
MIaHEMEJBHBo 221.af)TVU.S1.-PEALIS8 RMEBBBOS BERLEND AYDOLIFABHWIEM.
QY M@ Qo af)HOGIV MG:@ Qo AG” BREME:0 M1B:MIh8o GalBMIWIGCBD
Z.ag)aVsl.-@" aaBal aflel MW L[IBN®.  DO®EP  GalBAMM88 B9
ME®1WIW] @ HIQEMIIUI TLIWMEBBBOS aflel G:0WMBIWI@N, A lGHH
S0 1OLIN” 20@02el 1000 GREANTE AIGRUIABI of)ANSI®IEM”  af)0(3
80NINOO GaldW108. EMRINOO® Gald1ad;, aflel S0WeMeamm QUTY® aailes
al@1ladB@emno] @RS1N01660|SHWIEM. a9 MU
MeimIdom1eHsnime” @QIQYEA®3 arlengo MHm] 2JDOID) HWIEM .
@EBOMWIEM”  aflel MO@endd  &HY1Iem  afllwe  QIGRUI4J0IGIN@.
2. o)V SL.-QOS Galdl@ af)o.@RYAB.all. allel &gl AGIABHWIEM. TVIWMo
AN@EBEMINWE Q10 lddlan”  elflasam MIadaseaad  aflnge M1

QAUBINE®IFS] £].af)TU-SL-QOS ERADNVOD @OAN DLI®IGH0. D AIBHO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
193

ODOAMONWVT @RYERNNEHNME (@JUadem:. 2].af)aV.Sl. MSq{leNnenlo®1oad
Galol@d aflel &50ma88 M1EOOmIE MIAM” QAIY2adO1HU o llIQHHWleelamo
MURHHIB  EDSHAISHAANAEM  6NIaOMIMIMIW WMDY QB 1QOS
@MONMHE8 MM AaMLRO®. alEd®IHW MG Qldsq{load
GaNW VNN  @BRAIGEIDAW §2lQeMEOAINIM QD]  alOs. aoads’
GaDOgMOo  dhMIYSQo  MEIIDD OMY HOMNAHUHAIMSHNIOD  TVIWIVEMHNIA
af)6BBOMWIEM MODd @RAIGLIIA’ 6.21Q)c; @RAI@ M aflel aldevmal’
Ma01HHEMHAAMIGEMI  A@H1QYWHS Al1dBo? MILNAOOD  GaldW1aF; aloo®]
1510 HSHBITI o IBIGUDIWM MSAMHAANIEM MIaOAIMO]]  WMEHIDY
moe;cgd@”l al@MUEMABMOMI@3  al0aMIB1SEB30MD). af) @ alEI®] &Sl
@OMICM@  ag)a®» MSalslIem” AUMG:O1a® af)an” QUYSMAIBHEMo. 95
HSHSID al@1GUIWM MSOM] af)aMNIEM” MIRLINEBRSILINS BGRATWIM &h¥la® .
@REMINS MM alBlGUIIWMI MSalSIdhud mmmomWQJJ(smo; @P®El DMIWo
al@lGUOWM  DNBIH:CAI;  BRWIABHMBHIM HSHSIM3  aflel  &50ajo0GMO
aowmeEBUl AN@ssmMm®? 101 9@3e|aMEBUWGS” aIGIMILIO VMRIMo A3

@00 @AIMo AN MIBHG] HOBIZMNS. af)MDAUT E3I¥1V05]] D@3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
194

GaldGHO™ A0 Aflel B0WeMo. al®IMILI0 @AIMAIVTGBAN 21896008 M1
DCAIU3 aJERIMIEM, af)ANIB B8 Bal Galdejo HosOMISIEl, ec®IMI®W afleiw”
ag¥1as»IeM”  2fleoea] aflel Deqajoud @oejo d0mIgME. 87 Bl 609
aQ1eels1m3 1019 |SODMIENBWo  a)aANIEM” AAD] A lOTHOY, 87 Bl @]
@O @HIYl Qo d@IOWMIM™  QIY0a NB1HUB A lOMD). BREVIIN DD
Gal01ag; V100 Q14001000VNIa IMBBS1T3 M@0El TVABHHNIA
me@emomleiss ndealell  e¢awidlelo aflel ARV a[IG1EsM. TV ICH0
83805910103 n0calell 9@3a |IMEEBBLINOD MIEMYIalCWIW TVIWMEBUSS aflel
MUW1EHIM YWV SHBYale DOMBAN AVONAICHI af)o.(A]. @OAN HY1a0D
31010 al@IVEIASMODIB al00R.  CGIVIANBAIVAE o DHNT NSHAHITDD
DD BAWo  §2IQI oJCQ))CTTﬂ%I) af)ANIEM” QI NATHUE  alOQAND.
@RYOID®IW]  af)MBH alOWIMMBB®, AVIWIVEMSHNINIW  Da IGRIGMIBNUY
@RMRAUABAN HBHIBBLINEOM IHNM®IHO MAHH BaMNo §2I1QYINY HF1WIDOHE3aT
a)MB8®  IVI01QIVOW  (@JUR0EM.  S@ §21ARIMo MIEI" BRoVIEBRBASS
Z.af)VU-S]. BRE®IOIFIWIM” CHMB@RIOMIG3 MHDAIW] MNITWea S aleI®YHud

al@1la0E1H8B30MO). GR@IM@®INY AWVOHAB |RMOT  Blal  CAVaOWIBAW,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
195

oglm’low“ GG, MVoMLNIM  ®LI]G3 oglcmo(n“ GGl ag)amlaiQens”
MHAIWIM OalERISMIAUIM” HOBHNIC0ME AIEIHB0AI MVoRAINHBMMIEGNE) )N’
ANeII@BEOMME®. M@ af)an @@ MIeI0fled QId3o; af)6BReMWIV101H630
@JICWINH@ARIOMITI AUBIND af)MMVEES] AUYHMAIHNEMo.  aBLIAMIW], aflel
HSOLINW] af)SOMIGE MVoVNIM crg]cmocn” SHoNG11@3 am%lgce;ggoq»’l aleO®]
DHIFANI0. BRANIV 0 Odh. af)o. MEMINVIB MANHS oJNE1HBNITMN LoD
oM@ el qyc@mgm@‘, »HI06Mo, @RAINeS MIao (3(68093’]9’1%0
CMVaO0WIBW” HoGlEs0 Qflge. QAN Y@@ @YO™ MOMVo AUOD MV alEI®1HUI
@ﬂ@%@am%ﬁo@mmomﬂ af)SHBo af) MBI’ mag@@oam“. 2J@BHH o 0601203 90
@al oNeIQss 8@ MIWMOMIM” 2].af)aV Sl AIMEUaHo @aaIsandoad 100
@l Ae1]1S0M3 9alERIGMINT alvw mﬂ%o a]®1W mﬂ%o rgHsHla)’ Qla @RYQ
MOMo alO®IQYNIW]  HWOlwloerl mMSsesHemo. Mo MLNIM LI 1E)o
c3wlomeiomlejo MH®IMEAMEIQS8  H1Q15H03  (BalldH0laflSIel  aganoem”
DEaOUWd  AMAYIENGHIMW  HYTH®,  DEHIVYOADEBO]gjo  MI2OMIMES
O_Ioesgd@'] AYBO® AU@BOMEMo.  Kl.af)aV.SL.-@1@3 af)aD1OMIOHH M1

BS910108916WI, @RMIOMINAES ailel &San VI 1WIEM” TVOMVNIMOD AN’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
196

$6MIM  HEIQYM®. CHIFIBRBo ala|an0ldso aflel &S], RGNl A alel
rLoOWmMeBBUlBs3o aflel &Sl @RYUAY 10-moem” 2. ag)any’.s. (mo*omxﬂ%:.]@g @YY

01636M3» U3 Q1Y 1B1HUBHH MDICHENED . JBANAOMIT DD (@JICWIN]HAIW]

MSEPHBAN  AVI02IQYAODIT A lLIOEONIRABS  MNYRU1RZHU3  2RMEBBUD
@PMBONHBIN.  DalGBIGMIGHUBBBo  QIJ0aNAlHWBEB0  MB:MIOHWVWHB01283

@REMD®, QIIGBIZAM oeaaﬁau%o’laagg @RVEM®, Ol JaWo &Sl QAUBEMIIUI

OMHO®  BRMIVAUIOIo @DSEIMIM TVIRLID. SHD@TVoMNITWIS 22100
NIaONIMA ]S Qo |aQD] QY AN QAUBODEMHANND’ Qklen)
@R YA HBHWIO

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo m@a%@W (aWa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV” adVB:): AVAB,

2].a)aV.sl. MSqa{leNasemioud  TVBHNIB AMMVIB QIWEHNME  (@JWIMDalS
HBOLIHOBAB0120aM"  MANOS @D alBHUEN®INJo AW WMHIOYAAD]
@1 Od. af)o. MOEMIQYo MoMVIRLL®. GRMIG QIBHO VWDVOAINWISSS (@JUYo
lelsn VIO af)sBBOM MTVWAD1HNINAMDIEM.  ENOCOD alO6ID &HI0Y68BU

MIM  BRYAUADBBMMIEL.  MB:®] &Hoamlge aflel aldeLles. O@IM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
197

$006Mo, CMACOMVBS af)DNRIV” MH®IQo 0g” alel cmcea«sﬂoe)go enfeflod
Mol cmocomsss VAT-@3 mlanss  aIdrLMAWISIeM”  mil@3
CMIABEMIOUY  DalGBIAMINJo MHITNMMD. @RI aflel aldrUlaflasmmalm”
MM TVMBARo BRAINVERIGHT MIQIA3  QIJIa I0TIHEBWVo Qo M0 HBAND).
@@;O@H@ogtﬂ;goomm«ﬁ Do ®EBBBOS L10BNIWIBHHIECS af)s3s3
Mlelaldslensem.  M@IeEs  EH@BIVAEHNICIN3  Mlelalds’ @R (000
@®1BaHWIBAONIEM.  DSENo AD@ EHOBo MD®IOHG BRAIHSOW IR aflE®s
agensliigens. af)MI@ MIVAo A lAVIABIM  GAUSWIM A@A6M” @RYAJ]
6J0a01g0lot)”  GHIMIOMBR088  @RoW1:h0o  &l.af)aU.sl. HDEMAVI@3
MElO®.  CHMB DANGEIMIATH: ERONALINVQo 2Qo BRIV O HM
af)@1BEBHWo  H2IQYIFNS.  DEaJogo BREZAOOMINM MIElaldS” QUG IR
@REEBOHM AMAYILIOMEININSWo QY@M GRETJIWEBEBIHSQAEM” OV 303
GRONU MBI HBHIMNZAUMD.  BRDOEHIENZMHAM malleos  mMIa0MIMea ]S
@RoWEERU3  MVoMVIBT D  Galdel, @DJIGVINTIHRAIVW  alfl  &HIQLEBBO
OO TN HOD6NE. H¥laom  Rlafauisl.  sHvedavlelod aflelsn@Qo

@BSHUNIHEMAN0 GR@IGM” a@Qjo QLN (@JUIOBAMo TVOMLNIMEBBBIEM” MO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
198

@RE1NANHO1CHHMNBOMMMo @RV IMIGE  HABUWM  MSalSl  af)SANEMHAINo
CH0Bo  VAMAIW] QAIIB1EBHQMROW]. BI®IOM @SBIN” GR®1OHA] 215683UD
@00 1®:0la).  alEHH BS@ AlBdNo MVoMLNIMEBUS MSalSl WMER U af)IHNIMD
aldslel ag)am  AWIYILNVI@BMD. EHMB DEBLOVAVNCIEJ  CHMBMVABHITIEjo
@REEBOHMHWIB 2 lAMNINTWITMSI®. @RAIQ IO MIOWEBBU3 @RSINNIM
a0I®ROM, DMals BHWIG &Hlgo AN’ GRAMEAICEBIAIB®IM  OHAVATQosmId
MOVMIBE0, @RGAJIGY® aflel &0QAN  (@JAIeM® m«ﬂcemg@g. @OIM  QMBal
MSalS1OWGHBM®  VEIVEI af)AMIEM’ GRAIG alOaD® MIdWo.  (B0laldHo
MVoMNIMEBBGB0 BHBJo BDBRIWVIAUNDIBE MDD MLlaldSoem” MVfld0la|® . A0laf
QE12|®" NI1a0I0SHNABB MVoMVLNIMEBBBIVIGBMN. BRI BIAHIW QY@ §OaMVo
oMV IBANIEl.  aleHH  0IW1eQE  2QAIBHHNIBHHIW@N. CH@BO@]
QIJAITNVI  MVeRISMGHAS AllSla] a1  af)o.@RYA.all.-W1@ AN COINIGI
MH@YIgal”  2MRIV®IHA  GRSINVOIMOMIT  BI6E0  OBa MO 1Mo
af)o.@RA@.afl.  &HOYWeMo  af)IMIAUN YD |SEMAAMMIVIBAN  CHOSOM1HY
Wl20ad.  af)aMIT EP®IMVEaIILjo EH@BAVABHNIAB QOQ’;I(G)(OOO% ®Qooowlel.

@REEBOMYBB BT BRYHHHIPMING TVAlaINAIM” MHNIQLAMITI BHH@3NVAHHIA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
199

av floe;(a’l%ﬂ;g@@@“. @BRDHHINZIEM EMOCOMYYBB af)o.BRYA@.all., MIE:IYIgal”
af) @I,  BARIOBNLII0 oflgg ®18MIBNEH0  af)M@1H3  BRSINVOIM D@3
aJ®I®  af)o.@AB.all. a)aMIA  @®QYI0IHH] @RSO  MVEIABMOD® 1G3

OHISHNEMOAAMo Aflel SOWITMHDOHINS @RSIVWAN10NIW] DSHA ISEMEAIDo
@RYAIUYHNA]SIM BHOBo M1BWAIM)OY. MO  al01NGYHUIH3838313
MIAMHHIMNE" CH@BATVBHHNIVICM@ VHMAIW TVINABZ0 HalEJOMlo. QS
af)o.@RA.all. 0NLICWENIUB &Zg®®3 AllelY” af)olOserWes1Ljo DMIq |IMEBBUD
AUNDBABMDIW]T aBODE1EJo DaIBRIGMINU" alRI®] HBHISOMIG @R 1CADG
MYRa 10001 MSalsl QO NG EeTaTole ) efNnod onesIs]
Wla joB302ad1omeenImngo ?Qo MIWIH80, @O U118, Va3
VDTN ¢V QDT(HO@%@(T%O le} cmooﬂwomemgo 90 16WIVaf” OM@Io|MEBBUI
Mioaflel” aNmesd af)MMMBB®IM” MVABENIB aBQ0jo  (@JWIMMNIWo
DaIBQEMBD®. af)o.@RYA.all. ANeIVILNOD OB |MEEBUWILS oaf)a® aflelQ”
QI06813GOMI @R 1CMHNIUY A afleig” 210801563 06ms”
Q@3eHHME0I@o.  af)o.@YAB.adl.  ANeIQYBB@IOMINSED MG WI8AI”

o) @QIHEMAMBB®  MASHOIWI0.  ER@OHIMNRIEM  MII0N@ MV’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
200
Wlaod50n03" 9@ |MMEBUWles  aflel  &:04J0em”  AlDMEBIN® af)MOSI
aloVjo GHDMINIQo OBHIFABAN®. aflel TVoARISMB:Bo  aflel  ERYBHBo
DDCalINL] alOAVLEEBUY  HHIFHBANENE.  HANOOD) allelso@qom1eag
alUDDOMLIOMIG3, D  3IGMHNILID  Hald@AIMOaN V@YWV 0Ll
DSOISO3 HIM@  NAMAISBM@IM™  TVAHHIB @ 1WBRIMofIgens’.  ad
QIBHCODBNIUI HZBSDD D @R 1VEAIME] mce)®1@m1@1%m”. MVRWI1®3
2182 ©21Q) HHO0L68BU3 MO AfleNgo ERYAIBOTIBBANIEL.

QA8OO  ODOAICNOIV  (@JUIOODMHBOJIeM”  MIa0MIMeqlS NS
CNMISHMIo  MANHS  ALoMVIA] 2. AVAHHI@ BN HTI G
M@HMDIWBNHB0. G1B5MHOS MVoMITWlaf MIa0AIMOlS . af)o.
206mMT aYalla{lE8HQM20W]. @R @RSITLNIMOAOT®REM. B@ O0legemd
DO@EAWSS. @PAIA allg TVIWMEBEeHS allel HMIMIW] DABEAUOWIAY
@RSHN0 @RSV BHHMEINIMo. MM IOHMWIEM  01ESM AN alOQAND.
80600 2. ag)av.sl. mmielejo @AIA agIs8s®’  BRaIGRIW'

9aleQEINIBo. BT AI0a0A1  ANODIOMW  HEMBH B151H9F 1D

QAOERIO®ING  HNES” cﬁ:(T)_légOOGﬂ)v HEMANIABIMN®.  af) 210010



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
201
aflomlead HEMAS AINISH6M3E103 BIGRIBOMWo Q1063310
6306500001990 oe;cm%g@ RMGOY" 2IYAN@IAM. @I 21.0g)aV.s].
(@AR)-0emE" af)AMAIOQAND. M@ 0NZo HIS1HNFIAMMIGI BOIUB  af) (@)
DHIGHANEMo,  @RAINVIMo MG  af)@ afMBI® B9E50000199HIW]
SHM égooe;m" BMEOY” @mc%m@”. HAMBB BWa [0S~ @RSTNVNIMOOT®AIEN,
c800N0I® B@ 0165 AMIWIGHo.  @RYWAY MVOTIeLl  221.af)aV.sl.
(@RA.)-a8aM”" MVOG1GHHME®° HAVATYoMIA MOTVOIYILINET. GRDAUNOCW
ML2AWYSS. @RV 2OMVODI@ B@W MB:@1Qo AAM1HLIE103 MVBENITBEHUI
@@ 1vaWwI1end:o. BRD@OGIME" D AlUdBEI0UMERAHBINMMO GAIMNE, A0Taf
@RAIMBOS A@Ba|M af)@, @RAIAB QIERIWER U8 §RHISOM ML af)@,
DOl H:0af M@WIOIMANS8 VO], eagdAag (mfl) alsf M&®]

@OSYIMSBS TLIOIHHIUOQME.

@l. ofl. al. av@lvoad: avd, enflelload ERAImEMEAI8WIC3 MM

QAllaH®o MMM DAMMWIBBHQYMNBIW]. BRMIV®, BT @YADY OlB56NJ
@RSHNo B@ QAlBaHo 37 o’lczgmooeagmg“. @RCa [0go @B HDMHANWIM’

alOaOm®. alGdH 2.afAV.Sl. Gl MDAIND o@aﬂ).lég(ﬂ@a Dlegiey



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
202
921QISlEl. DO BJIWIo BRYSEMMINMYMI” MHAN MD FAN” O1EZMB®:Bo
@RSWEHNME]  QIMo.  oJBMAIWo  Hl.af)U.Sl.  G@JoWIo MIelal@d
QAUM®IMEaHo allelGa]od MM ganleom SaMIVT &:0YId alQo. alGHH
G@JIYWIo MYINISHITD TVIA02IQLOMIT B@ QABaHo DEaouwd 36+1= 37

016g6MH U3 @OINEEl Melne)ssc?

GAWI. Sl afjo. G@INAV  9af)Vdh:  AVE, M®IOA  G@oWIo

HOWIWOWISIE]  af)MBBDOHHIMNBIEM  @RYWOAY  MTVODI@  Olegend
OMIGEHNMB®ILL,  20laf” O©aValQoeud 20-° 0legam  O®HISOMITI
n@o@an” @AM 2lAlE8M@. WEapwd @R@Iead teething trouble
shooting mMsaMeOBNIMENDNHBHWIM. TVAWo BRYB:MMNDIM” AUBOHO AMT”
@O GHMINIQo HOWIWIG:HAMMBB®IN 2].af)aVU.Sl. M@HAN  DOal.
GRDONHIMNE"  MEa[oUd OlE3M  HHIFEHNMEMILL. D@ MMWals SOy’
HBHIFOMISBBDO®IMNE GNEBBUIGH M@ MIB®]  eISlaflgms,  mI0es]
MUABHNIBTIMIEM” ag)aMIEM” BRAIAB A IOQRAND. HDINIW HMNEBHU3 G165
QABEMIUWE  BMIBRBo.  BRD@ODHIMNE  AflalGlE8ME@ Qe mjevlgsgiel

MNIaOMIMAalS M  HOMIBAIMWo  alOAOO® VATV,  M®IGI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
203

@OCWINTHRIW]  WIIBo  (JUIEBBo  ERYUWVBRVQBRSBAENS.  alBHH

\%

Zl.agauisl.  angQlemaEndud  e1rejonloleso. 0109 QMG 0Vl @
aa1ensEndd mvowleslenwl@an. @an;  Qlj0aldEles’ a8als
2f)OMIHEMAN HOIAIQo @ROIWI0. BRYHHHQBBOY, MVoMNIM O 1HG
@MIAO®] Aflg" aJOO® ALoMLOIMDMIM HHISABMDIM” MG@IWIsal
2I1S1HsaMHQINT8B®IGM. 6N MV T aHeM eI [29]p0) alo®am
@)6’030.0%094@0’\)1%, af)aMI@3 (@JIGVIWTBHRIW] aflel BRYUWEBPQ BRSNS,
@O DML HHINB6M MVAHNIA AGAMIFBAIIBHAND).
W1HUIMSalSldhSo 2Qo af)SEsaMIel, 00laf OIBODIEBD  af)MOSS
qalalmadem”  Aufle:@laflg8s®. @REEBOM  QI§0al0A%H8OSOHWEI0
MaOHOMEAMIFES], aDRIE)320W] @ MSaPHNINT  HFIQWHAINION”
H BN D). OH® 1603 @RS 1NN @3, M Mo

A I0AVIGH MM ORI @PE §AMC]HSBaT.

. aeed: 2017-ee1 6HO8 210683  eIvAIM M@l miod

aldMVIBHIMAADN (@ JECAXE)DND)...........
av

@RMBLNHABMAIA. . ..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
204
@J®1&Belasamala@............

@JGO®o MVER BRoWTdA12[1A1H6B3M.

en@3 mo%omﬂm‘lmm.

(®2@@o)



