al®OeIoe a8 MlWnrve

almylnoalde TUEIMBMo

ausnfmdy” doalg) 010e08E" 0ty piasngan 2025-oai annp Sswd

amovleng) esanaiul (sssna) Mg essnmi emosioy”

dl@ai@lGosino
Dr. M. K. Muneer :
104.  In the long title the word “further” shall be deleted.
Shri P, K. Basheer :
105.  In the long title the word “further” shall be deleted.
Shri K. P. A. Majeed :
106.  In the long title the word “further” shall be deleted,
Shri N. A.. Nellikkunnu :
107.  In the long title the word “further” shall be deleted,

afldle

Shri N. Samsudheen :
108.  inthe Preamble the word “further” shall be deleted.
Shri P. Ubaidulla :

109. In the Preamble the word “further” shall be deleted.
Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

110. In the Preamble the word “further” shall be deleted.-

1075/2025.




Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

111.  In the Preamble the word “further” shall be deleted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

112,  In the Preamble for the words “for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;” the words “for the following purposes;” shall be
substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

113. In the Preamble for the words “for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;” the words “for the following purposes;” shall be
substituted.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

i14. In the Preamble for the words “for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;” the words “for the following purposes;” shall be
substituted.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

115.  In the Preamble for the words “for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;” the words “for the following purposes;” shall be
substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

116, In the Preamble for the words “purposes hereinafter appearing;” the
words “objectives mentioned later” shall be substituted.

80000 Mdhaf
Shri Mons Joseph :

117. Inthe marginal Heading of clause 1 for the word “commencement”
the word “inception” shall be substituted.



Shri Mons Joseph :

118.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) This Act shall take effect immediately.”

Shri N. A, Nellikkunnu :

118.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall come into force on the day of notification in the
Gazette,”

Shri P. K. Basheer :

120.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall come into force on the day of notification in the
Gazette.”

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

121, Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall come into force on the day of notification in the
Gazette.” i

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :
122, Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:

“(2) It shall come into force on the day of notificatior in the
Gazette.”

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar :
123.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:

“(2) This Act shall come into force on such date as the
Government may, by notification in the Gazette, appoint,”

DRI Yl
Shri Mens Joseph :

124, In clause 2 for the words “hereinafter referred to0 as” the words
“hereinafter called” shall be substituted.




Shri P. P. Chitharanjan :

125,  In section 2(a) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(i), the word “appellate” shall be deleted.

Shri Kadakampally Surendran :

126.  In section 2(a) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(i), the word “appellate” shall be deleted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

127.  In section 2(a) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
9(i) for the words “authority under,” the words “authority as under”
shall be substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

128.  In section 2(da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(ii) for the word “Compounding” the words “Adjudicating” shall be
substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali:

129.  In section 2(da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(ii) for the word “designated,” the word “appointed” shall be
substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

130.  In section 2(da) proposed to be jnserted in the principal Act by clause
2(ii) for the word “designated,” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

131.  In section 2(da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
2(i) for the word “designated,” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted. ’

Shri N. Samsudheen :

132, In section 2 (da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by




5

clause 2 (ii) for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall
be substituted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

133.  In section 2 (da) proposed to be inserted ini the principal Act by
clause 2 (ii) for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall
be substituted.

Smt, U. Prathibha :

134.  In section 2 (da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 2 (ii) for the word “designated” the word “empowered”
shall be substituted.

Shii C. K. Hareendran :

135.  In section 2 (da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 2 (ii) for the word “designated” the word “empowered”
shall be substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

136. In section 2 (da} proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 2 (ii) for the words “designated by the Government” the
words “appointed by the Gowvernment by notification in the
Gazette” shall be substituted.

Shri K. Babu (Thripunithura) :
137.  In section 2 (da) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 2 {ii) after the words and figures “section 17D” the words

and figures “for the purpose of acquitting the offences under
section 17B” shall be inserted.

~

ADJo Qldhal
Shei. V. Joy :

138. Clause 3 shall be deleted.




Shri. T. 1. Madhusoodanan :

139,  Clause 3 shall be deleted.

Shri. Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan

140. Secton 13 of the Principal Act Shall be recast as follows :-

“Mode of recovery of money due from persons liable under this
Act: (1) Any amount due from any person except coir workers and
self employed persons under this Act, including penalty or fines,
may be recovered with interest, as applicable as an arrear of public
revenue due on land, in accordance with the provisions of the
Kerala Revenue Recovery Act, 1968. (2) No such recovery shall be
made before giving the person a demand notice and an opportunity
to be heard, unless otherwise prescribed.”
mo o Ol

Shri Mons Joseph :

141.  Tnsection 14 of the principal Act for the words “priority to all other
debts” the words “shall take precedence over all other liabilities”
shall be substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

142.  Clause 4 shall be deleted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

143, Insection 14 proposed to be amended in the principal Act by clause

4 after the words “subject to” the words “the provisions under”
shall be inserted.

Dr. N, Jayaraj :

144 .  In section 14 proposed to be amended in the principal Act by clause
4 for the word “Interests” the word “Interest” shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalarmkuzhi Ali :

145.  In section 14 proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4, for the word “Interests” the word “Interest” shall be substituted.




Prof. Ahid Hussain Thangal :

146.  In section 14 proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4, for the word “Interests” the word “Interest” shall be substituted,

Shri H. Salam :

147.  In section 14 proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4, for the word “Interests” the word “Interest” shall be substituted.

Smt. O. S. Ambika :

148.  In section 14 proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by clause
4, for the word “Interests” the word “Interest” shall be substituted.
Reepby ok
Shri P. Nandakumar :

149.  In section 17(1) of the principal Act for the word “extent” the word
“extend” shall be substituted.

Shri T. P. Ramakrishnan :

150.  Insection 17(1) of the principal Act for the word “extent” the word
“extend” shall be substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthaparam :

151, In section 17(1} of the principal Act for the words “three months™
the words “one month” shall be substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

152. In section 17(1) of the principal Act for the words “three months”
the words “one month” shall be substituted,

Shri Kurukkeli Moideen :

153. In section 17(1) of the principal Act for the words “three months”
the words “one month” shall be substituted,
Shri A. K. M Ashraf :

154.  In Section 17(1) of the principal Act for the words “three months”
the words “one month” shall be substituted.




Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

155.  In Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(i) after the words “liable to” the word “pay” shall be
inserted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

156.  In Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clanse 5(i) for the words “liable to a penalty of double the amount
due by him” the words “punishable with & penalty equal to twice
the amount payable” shall be substituted.

Shri Sunny Joseph

157.  Tn Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(i) for the word “double” the word “thrice” shall be
substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

158. In Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(i) for the words “double the amount” the words “one and a
half time * shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed:

159.  In Section 17(1) propased to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(i) for the words “double the amount” the words “one and a
half time ” shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

160.  In Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by

clause 5(i) for the words “double the amount” the words “one and a
half time ” shall be substituted.

Shri N, A. Nellikkunnu :

i61.  In Section 17(1) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(i) for the words “double the amount” the words “one and a
half time * shall be substituted.




Shri M. Noushad :

162.  In section 17(1), proposed to be amended in the mrincipal Act, by

clause 5(i}, for the words “double the amount due by him under this
Act”, the words “fifteen thousand” shall be substituted,

Stri D. K. Muraii :

163.  In section 17(1), proposed to be amended in the principal Act, by
. clause 5(1), for the words “double the amount due by him under this
Act”, the words “fifteen thousand” shall be substituted,
Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :
164,

In section 17(2), proposed to be amended in the principal Act, by
clause 5(ii), after the words “liable to”, the word “pay” shall be
inserted.

Shri E. Chandrasekharan :

165.  In section 17(2), proposed to be amended in the prineipal Act, by

clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of”, the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand mpees” shall be substituted.
Shri E. K. Vijayan:

166.  In section 17(2), proposed to be amended in the principal Act, by

clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of”, the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri P. 5. Supal :

167.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by

clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of” the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri E. T. Taison Master :

168. In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by

clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of” the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted,
1075/2025.




10
Shri G.S. Jayalal :

169. In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “pemalty of” the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri V. Sasi:

170.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause S(if), for the words “penalty of” the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri Muhammed Muhassin :

171.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of” the words “penalty which
may extend upto twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri V. R. Sunil Kumar :

172 . 1In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the Principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “penalty of” the words “Penalty which
may extend up to twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Smi. C. K. Asha ;

173.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the Principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words © pemalty of” the words “Penalty which
* may extend up to twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri P. Balachandran :

174,  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the Principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “ penaliy of” the words “Penalty which
may extend up to twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Shri C. C. Mukundhan :

175.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the Principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “ penalty of” the words “Penalty which
may extend up to twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



11
Shri T, V. Ibrahim :

176. In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the Principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “twenty five” the word “ten™ shall be
substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

177.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5 (ii) for the words “twenty five” the word “ten” shall be
substituted.

Shri N. Samsudheen :

178. In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5 (3i) for the words “twenty five” the word “ten” shall be
substitated.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

179.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5 (ii) for the words “twenty five” the word “ten” shall be
substifuted,

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

180.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5 (ii) for the words “twenty five” the words and symbol
“twenty-five” shall be substituted.

Shri Anwar Sadath :

181.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clanse 5 (i) for the words “ewenty five” the word “thirty” shall be
substituted.

Shri P. C. Vishnunadh :

182.  In section 17(2} proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
) clause 5(ii), for the word “twenty” the word “thirty” shall be
substituted.




12
Shri 1. C. Balakrishnan:

183.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “twenty five” the word “forty” shall be
substituted.

Shri M. Vincent :

184.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the word “twenty” the word “forty” shall be
substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

185. Tn section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “twenty five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri. Roji M. John :

186.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “twenty five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Smi. Uma Thomas :

187.  In section 17(2) proposed to be amended in the principal Act by
clause 5(ii), for the words “twenty five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted. 7

BRSO Nl

Shri V. K. Prasanth :

188.  In the marginal heading of secrion 17A proposed to be inserted in
the principal Act by clause 6 before the word “before” the words
“for being heard” shall be inserted.

Shri Sebastian Kulathunkal :
189. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 the word “Coir” occuring before the words “Project
Officer” shall be deleted.




i3
Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal

190.  In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “Department” the word “Development”
shall be inserted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

181, In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Ace by
clause 6 for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted.

L]

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

192,  In section 17A 'proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted.

. Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

193.  In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clanse 6 for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted,

Shii A. K. M. Ashraf ;

194.  In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “designated” the word “authorised” shall be
substituted.

Smt. K. K. Shailaja Teacher :

135, In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause & before the word “Gazette” the word “Official” shall be
inserted.

Shri P. Mammikutty :
196. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act hy

clause 6 before the word “Gazette” the word “Official” shall be
inserted.




14
Smt. K. K. Rema :
197. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
- clause 6 after the word and symbol “penalty,” the words “shall hear
and” shall be inserted.
Shri Mons Joseph :
198. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 for the word “opportunity” the words “Notice and
hearing” shall be substituted.

Shri M. Rajagopalan :

199.  In section 17A. proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 hefore the word “concerned” the words “or persons” shall
be inserted.

Shri M. M. Mani :

500. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “concerned” the words “or persons” shall
be inserted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

201, In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 for the words “aforesaid relevant provisions” the words
“provisions of the said section” shall be substituted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunni:

502.  In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
ghall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

203. In section 17A proposed t0 be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

%




Dr. M. K. Muneer :

204, In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

205. In section 17A proposed to be inseried in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

206. In section 17A proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “with the direction” the words “with the
above direction” shall be substituted.

Shri Eldose P, Kunnappillil :

207.  In-section 17A proposed be inserted in the principal Act by clause
6, the following provisio shall be inserted.
“However, defaulis committed by any employer, dealer, producer
or exporter before the cormmencement of this Act shatl not be
eligible for relief under section 17A.”

Shri Sajeev Joseph :

208.  In section 17A proposed be inserted in the principal Act by clause
8, the following provisio shall be inserted.
“However, defaults committed by any employer, dealer, producer
or exporter hefore the commencement of this Act shall not be
eligible for relief under section 17A.”

Shri A. C. Moideen :

209. In section 17B(L) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “pay” the word “remit” shall be substituted.

Shri ¥. Ansalan :

210.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “pay” the word “remit” shall be substituted.




16

Shri P. Balachandran ;

211.  In section 17B{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause G, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri C. K. Asha :

212.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri C. C. Mukundhan:

213.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri V. R. Sunil Kumar :

2i4.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri Muhammed Muhassin:

215. In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause §, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri V. Sasi:

216.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri E. T. Taison Master :

217. In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri G. S. Jayalal :

218,  In section 17B{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “s0” shall be deleted.



17
Stui P. S. Supal:

219. In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri E. K. Vijayan :

220.  In section 17B(1} proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the word “so™ shall be deleted.

Shri E. Chandrasekharan :

221, in section 17B(1) propused to be inserted in the principal Act by
‘ clause 6, the word “so” shall be deleted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

222, In section 17B{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Shri N. Samsudheen :

223, In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

224, In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

225.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “ninety” the words “one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted. K
Shri Mons Joseph :

226.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “ninety days from the date of receipt of the”

the words “within ninety days of receiving a * shall be substituted.
1075/2025,




18
Shri E. Chandrasekharan :

227.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted. -

Shri E. K. Vijayan :

228.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri P. S. Supal:

229.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shii E.T. Taison Master:

230.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri G.$. Jayalal:

231.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clayse 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri V. Sasi;

232.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri Muhammed Mubassin :

233,  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shii V. R. Sunilkumar :

234, In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted,




19
Smt C. K. Asha :

235, In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri P. Balachandran :

236.  In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Shri C. C. Mukundan :

237.  In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, the words “copy of the” shall be deleted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

238.  In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “order” the words, figure and letter “under
section 17A” shall be inserted.

Smt K, K. Rema :

235.  In Section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by

clause 6, the words “imprisonment for a term which may extend to
six months and with” shall be deleted,

Shri Kurukkoli Meideen :

240, In section 17B{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “double” the words “one and a half time”
shall be substituted.

Shri U. A. Latheef :

241.  In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “double” the words “one and a half time”
shall be substituted,

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

442.  In section 17B(1} proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “double” the words “one and a half time”
shall be substituted.

1075/2025.




20

Shri. Najeeb Kanthapuram :

243 . In section 17B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “double” the words “one and a half time”
shall be substited.

Shri C. R. Mahesh :

244 Tn section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the words “previous sanction” shalt be deleted.

Shri Arvadan Shoukath :

245 . Tn section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, the wards “previous sanction” shall be deleted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

246. In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “authorized” the word “designated” shall be
substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

247 . In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “authorized” the word “designated” shall be
substituted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

748. In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “authorized”, the word “designated” shail be
substituted.

Shri K. P. A, Majeed :

949, In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “authorized”, the word “designated” shall be
substjtuted. '

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

250. In Section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by




21

clause 6, for the word “fine” the word “penalty” shall be
substituted.

Shri P, Manjalamkuzhi Al :

251. In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “fine”, the word “penalty” shall be
substitred,

Smt, K. K. Rema !

252.  In section 17B(3) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “fine”, the word “penalty” shall be
substituted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

253.  In section 17C(1} proposed to be inserted in the principal act by
clause 6, for the words “an officer”, the words “the officer” shail be
substituted.

Sri. N. Samsudeen

254.  In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “designated”, the word “authorised” shall be
substituted.

Sri. T. V. Ibrahim

255.  In section 17C(1) proposed io be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “designated”, the ward “authorised” shall be
substituted.

Sri. P, Abdul Hameed

256.  In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “designated”, the word “authorised” shal] be
substituted.

Shri B Ubaidnila :
257.  In Section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Act by

clause 6 for the word “designated”, the word “authorised” shall be
substimted.




22
Shri K. P. Kunhammed Kutti Master :

258, In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act bsr
clause 6 for the word “designated” the word “empowered” shall be
substituted.

Shri 1. K. Murali :

259.  In section 17G(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “designated” the word “empowered” shall be
substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

260. In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, before the words “after holding”, the wards “shall hear the
person concerned and” shall be inserted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

261,  In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, before the words “holding an enguiry in the manner as
may be prescribed” the words “conducting an enquiry in ihe
prescribed manner” shall be substituted.

Shri K. V. Sumesh :

262.  In section 17C(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “enguiry” the word “inquiry” shall be
substifuted.

Dr. Sujith Vijayanpillai :

263.  In section 17C{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
dause 6 for the word “enquiry” the word “inquiry” shall be
substituted.

Shri Saneeshkumar joseph :

264, In section 17C{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
© Qause 6, after the word “prescribed” the words “and the person
concerned shall be given a written notice specifying the provisions of
the law violated and the final deadline for payment of the penalty.”

shall be inserted.




23
Shri T. J. Vinod :

265.  In Section 17C(1) proposed be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “prescribed” the words “and the person
concerned shall be given a written notice specifying the provisions
of the law violated and the final deadline for payment of the
penalty.” shall be inserted.

Shri K. N. Unnikrishnan ;

266.  In Section 17C(2) proposed be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “enquiry” the word “inquiry” shall be
substituted wherever it occurs.

Smt. Daleema :

267.  In Section 17C(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “enquiry” the word “inquiry” shall be
substituted wherever it occurs.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

268.  In Section 17C(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the words “such enquiry” the symbol “,” shall he
inserted,

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

268.  In Section 17C(2) proposed tobe inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “satisfied”, the words “by examining the
documents” shall be inserted.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

270.  In Section 17C(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “ satisfied” the words “by examining the
documents” shail be inserted.

Shri A. K, M. Ashraf :
271.  In Section 17C(2) proposed to be inseried in the principal Act by

clause 6, after the word “ satisfied” the words “by examining the
documents” shall be inserted.




24

Shri U, A. Latheef :

972, In Section 17C(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
dause 6, after the word “ satisfied” the words “by examining the
documents” shall be inserted.

5mt. K. K. Rema :

273.  In section 17C{(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6, after the word “satisfied”, the words “on the grounds of
the proofs or evidences” shall be inserted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj :

274,  In section 17C(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the words “that the person”, the word “concerned”
shall be inserted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

275, In section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “thirty” the words “Forty Five” shall be
substituted.

Shri N. A, Nellikkunou :

276.  In section 17G(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “thirty”, the word “fifty” shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

277, Tn section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “thirty” the word “fifty” shall be subsiituted.

Dr. M. XK. Muneer:

278, In section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “thirty” the word “fifty™ shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

279.  1In section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the principat Act by
clause 6, for the word “thirty” the word “fifty” shall be substituted.




Shri P. Ubaidulla :

280. In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the word “thirty”, the word “fifty”
shall be substituted.

Shri T. V. Tbrahim :

281.  In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the word “thirty”, the word “fifty”
shall be substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

282.  In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6 for the word “thirty”, the word “fifty”
shall be substituted,

Shri Aryadan Shoukath :

283.  In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, after the words “entertain the appeal” the
words “within fifteen days” shall be inserted. .

Shri N. Samsudheen :

284. In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the word “thirty” the word “fifty”
shall he substituted.

Shri A. K. M., Ashraf :

285.  In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the words “in time” the words “due
time” shall be substimted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

286,  In the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the words “in time,” the words “due
time” shall be substituted.




26

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

287. Tn the proviso to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 6, for the words “in time,” the words “due
time” shall be substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

288. In provisio to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6 for the words “in time” the words “due
time” shall be substituted.

Shri A. Prabhakaran :

289, In provisio to section 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6 for the words “in time" the words “within
thirty days” shall be substituted.

Shri C. H. Kunhambu :

290. In provisio to seciion 17C(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6 for the words “in time” the words “within
thirty days” shall be substtuted.

Shri C. €. Mukundhan :

291.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “may” the symbol «,” shall be inserted.

Shri P. Balachandran:

29D, In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri Muhammed Mubhassin:

293.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri V. R, Sunil Kumar.

294 In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “may” the symbol *,” shall be inserted.




27
Smt. C. K. Asha ;

295.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri V. Sasi ;

296.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri G. 8. Jayalal :

297.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted,

Shri E. T. Taison Master :

2§B. In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted,

Shri E. K. Vijayan :

299.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri P. S. Supal :

300.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol “,” shall be inserted.

Shri E. Chandrasekharan :

301.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “may” the symbol *,” shall be insetted,

Smt. K. K. Rema :
302.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6, after the word “fii” the words “as per the sections of this
act” shall be inserted.

10752025,




28
Shri Mons Joseph :

303.

Tn section 17C(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6, for the words “conforming, modifying or setting aside the
order appealed against within a peried of” the words “either
confirming, varying or cancelling the order under appeal within”

shall be substituted.
Shri K. P. A. Majeed:

304.  In section 17C(4) proposed 1o be

dause 6, for the word “sixty”

substituted.
Shri N. A. Nellikkumm :

305.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be
clause 6, for the word “sizty”

substifuited.
Dr. M. K. Muneer :

306,  In section 17C(4) proposed to be
dlause 6, for the word “sixty”

substituted.

Shii P, K. Basheer :

307.  In section 17C(4) proposed to be
clause 6, for the word “sixty”
substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

308. In section 17C(5) proposed to be

inserted in the principal Act by

, the word “ninety” shall be

inserted in the principal Act by
, the word “ninety” shall be

inserted in the principal Act by
, the word “ninety” shali be

inserted in the principal Act by
, the word “ninety” shalk be

inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6, the word “received” shall be deleted.

Shri G. Steephen :

308.

Tn section 17C(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 for the words “Consolidated Fund of the State” the words
«The Kerala Coir Workers’ Welfare Fund Board” shall be

substituted.




29
Shii M. S. Arun Kumar :

310,  In section 17C(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “Consolidated Fund of the State” the words
“The Kerala Coir Workers’ Welfare Fund Board” shall be
substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

311,  In section 17C(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “State” the words “at the earliest” shall be
inserted.

Prof, Abid Hussain Thangal :

312,  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “an Officer” the words “a Compounding
Officer” shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

313.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “Coir” the word “Develapment” shall be
Inserted.

Shri K, Babu (Nenmara) :

314.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “Gazette” the word “Official” shall be
inserted.

Shri N.K. Akbar :

315, In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “Gazette” the word “Official” shall be
inserted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

316. In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “on payment of seventy five per cent of the
amount of fine provided” the words figures and symbel “upon
payment of 75% of the maximum fine ‘prescribed” shall be
substituted.




30
Smt. K. K. Rema :

317. In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri A. K. M. Ashrat :

318. TIn section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri P, Ubaidulla :

319. In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clanse 6 for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

320.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clanse & for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

321. In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted,

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

322.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

323.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substifuted.




31
Shri N. Samsudheen :

324.  In section 17D{}) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

325.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause § for the words “seventy five” the word “fifty” shall be
substituted.

Shri G. S. Jayalal :

326.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri V, Sasi :

327.  In sectien 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri Muhammed Muhassin :

328,  In section 17D(1) proposed te be inserled in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri C.K.Asha:

325, In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri C. C. Mukundhap :
330.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.




Shri P. Balachandran :

331,  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituied.

Shri P. S. Supal :

332, In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substitted.

Shri E. T. Taison Master :

333,  In section 17D(1) proposed (0 be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri E. K. Vijayan :

334.  In section 17D(1) proposed to e inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
subsiituted.

Shri F. Chandrasekharan :

335.  In section 17D(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Shri V. R. Sunil Kumar :

336.  In section 17D{1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, for the word “provided”, the word “imposed” shall be
substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

337.  In section 17D(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the word “Where” the word “the” shall be inserted.




3
Shri A. Raja:

338.  In section 17D(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “compounding” the words “an application
for” shall be inserted.

Shri K. Premkumar :

339, In section 17D(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the word “compounding” the words “an application
for” shali be inserted,

Shri I. B. Satheesh :

340.  In section 17D{4) proposed to be inserted in the priticipal Act by
clause 6 before the words “compounding of an offence” the words
“application for” shall be inserted.

Smt, Santhakumari K :

341, In section 17D{4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 before the words “compounding of an offence” the words
“application for” shail be inserted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

342.  In section 17D(4) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after the word “acquitted” the words “from the said offence”
shali be inserted.

Smi. K. K. Rema :

343.  In section 17D(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 the word “received” shall be deleted,

Shri Murali Perunelly :

344, In section 17D(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 for the words “Consclidated Fund of the State” the words
“The Kerala Coir Workers Welfare Fund Board ” shall be
substituted,




34.

Shri M. Mukesh :

345,  In section 171(5) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by

- clanse 6 for the words “Consolidated Fund of the State” the words
«The Kerala Coir Workers Welfare Fund Board ” shall be
substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

346.  In section 17D(5) proposed to be ipserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 after word “State” the words “at the earliest ¥ shall be
inserted.

DR. Mathew Kuzhalnadan :

347.  In section 17D proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clanse 6 the following provisio shall be inserted
«However, in cases where any employer, dealer, producer or
exporter repeats the offences punishable under Section 17, the
offences shall not be compounded.”

Shri T. Siddique:

348. In section 17D proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6 the following provisio shall be inserted
“However, in cases where any employer, dealer, producer or
exporter repeats the offences punishable under Section 17, the
offences shall not be compounded.”

Smt. K. K. Rema:

349.  In section 17E proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 6, after the words “amount due” the words “as fine or

penalty” shall be inserted.
em0@ TIDAGOED eauigegoleg; aang. ofyMd. @} S2od,
almanNimalos, SO

2025 aeqomid 04.




